
June 29 - July 5, 2017 S.G.V. EXAMINER B1

The San Gabriel Valley            Examiner

• Legal Notices • Legal Notices • Legal Notices • Legal Notices •
Starting a New Business?  Three Ways to File - Mail  Fax  Email

While we try to accommodate
all potential advertisers,
The San Gabriel Valley

Examiner does reserve the
right to edit, refuse, reject or
cancel any ad, at any time.

All ads are subject to approval
prior to publication.

We are not liable for losses or
expenses resulting from

publication errors or
omissions.

Advertisers are responsible
for checking their ads for

errors upon the first
publication and our errors or
omissions will be corrected
in subsequent publications.

Notice to all that file a
D.B.A. with us.

The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner supplies all who

wants to file a Doing
Business As (DBA) with

INSTRUCTIONS FOR
COMPLETION OF STATEMENT
form. We are not responsible

for any delays from the L.A.
County Recorders office due
to mistakes our clients make.

Advertising rate cards are
available from any sales

representative.
Ads are subject

to the rate in effect at the time
they are placed.
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Publication

Policy

June 8, Start
CNBB231701TC FILE NO.2017125882
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: R &
A TRANSPORT 443 E 75TH ST LOS ANGELES
CA 90003. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
OTTO RENE ARRIOLA 443 E 75TH ST LOS AN-
GELES CA 90003. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/16/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner    CNBB231701TC

CNBB231702TC FILE NO.2017126071
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
YANES TRANSPORT 17561/2 ORCHARD AVE
LOS ANGELES CA 90006. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) EMMA M YANES SANCHEZ 1756 ½
ORCHARD AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90006. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing:  06/
08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Val-
ley Examiner     CNBB231702TC

CNBB231703DC FILE NO.2017125582
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: JH
DESIGNS 2436 HOUSTON ST APT 8 LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90033.  Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
JOSE FRANCISCO HUERTA AYALA 2436 HOUS-
TON ST APT 8 LOS ANGELES CA 90033. The
business is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing:  06/
08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Val-
ley Examiner     CNBB231703DC

CNBB231704DC FILE NO.2017125580
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as JC
ANGELES 2436 HOUSTON ST APT 8 LOS AN-
GELES CA 90033. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JOSE CARLOS GARCIA ANGELES 2436
HOUSTON ST APT 8 LOS ANGELES CA 90033.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231704DC

CNBB231705MU FILE NO.2017125866
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
O.D.G EXPRESS TRUCKING 134 W 86TH PL
LOS ANGELES CA 90003. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) OSCAR OBED DELGADILLO 134 W.
86TH PL LOS ANGELES CA 90003. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231705MU

CNBB231706MU FILE NO.2017126222
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LUIGIS CUSTODIAN SUPPLIES 5044 ½ SANTA
ANA ST CUDAHY CA 90201. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) LUIS ALBERTO ANDRADE
CARDENAS 5044 ½ SANTA ANA ST CUDAHY
CA 90201. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231707MU

CNBB231708MU FILE NO.2017126048
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MAIN EVENT PLANNING 3746 E. 58TH ST MAY-
WOOD CA 90270.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JUAN BAUTISTA VIGIL 3746 E 58TH ST
MAYWOOD CA 90270. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/16/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business

under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231708MU

CNBB231709SN FILE NO.2017126616
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WHITE DIAMOND CLEANING 1106 E. ½ 65TH
ST INGLEWOOD CA 90302. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) MARIANA GUZMAN SALAZAR
1106 E. ½ 65TH ST INGLEWOOD A 90302. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 04/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231709SN

CNBB231710DC FILE NO.2017126427
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
STARGO GUATEMALA ;STARGO GLOBAL COM-
MUNICATIONS TM NETWORK SOLUTIONS 1371
WEST 38TH STREET SOUTH GATE CA 90280.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ELIAS MOR-
ONES ROMERO 3155 CENTURY BLVD SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/16/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2015. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner        CNBB231710DC

CNBB231711OZZY FILE NO.2017127000
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CIVIC GARAGE & GATE REPAIRS 3816 FOS-
TER AVE BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) DAN AMIR 3816 FOSTER
AVE BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231711OZZY

CNBB231712OZZY FILE NO.2017127326
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
POPEYE'S HANDYMAN 130 N. ALEXANDRIA
AVE APT #303 LOS ANGELES CA 90004.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ADOLFO RAMIREZ-RIV-
ERA 130 N. ALEXANDRIA AVE APT 3303 LOS
ANGELES CA 90004. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231712OZZY

CNBB231713OZZY FILE NO.2017127613
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PETITE TACO BAR 624 NORTH HAZARD AVE
LOS ANGELES CA 90063. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JESUS C. PEREZ 624 NORTH HAZ-
ARD AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90063. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231713OZZY

CNBB231714OZZY FILE NO.2017127796
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PERFECTION AUTO REPAIR 22632 NOR-
MANDIE AVE UNIT A TORRANCE CA 90502.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) OSCAR MA-
CIAS 22632 NORMANDIE AVE UNIT A TOR-
RANCE CA 90502. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 01/2008. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231714OZZY

CNBB231715OZZY FILE NO.2017127567
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CORREA'S AUTO REPAIR 6465 CLARA ST BELL
GARDENS CA 90201. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) JOSE ALFREDO CORREA DAMIAN ;
BLANCA ESTELA GONZALEZ GARCIA 6465
CLARA ST BELL GARDENS CA 90201. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231715OZZY

CNBB231716JEN FILE NO.2017127471
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: PC
ISLAND 12029 FIRESTONE BLVD NORWALK
CA 90650. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
KHALEEL S A ABUSHMMALEH 12029 FIRE-
STONE BLVD NORWALK CA 90650. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 02/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231716JEN

CNBB231717TC FILE NO.2017127314
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: 247
TRUCKING SERVICES 1365 N SHIRLMAR AVE-
NUE SAN DIMAS CA 91773. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ABDUL ALA AHMED 1365 N
SHIRLMAR AVENUE SAN DIMAS CA 91773. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the

County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231717TC

CNBB231718TC FILE NO.2017127695
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as) JC
TRAINS LOGISTICS 1250 W. ARTESIA BLVD
COMPTON CA 90220. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) RAY -E HOLDINGS INC 1250  W ARTE-
SIA BLVD COMPTON CA 90220.The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231718TC

CNBB231719TC FILE NO.2017127187
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: J
CUBED FINANCIAL ADVISERS 4915 N. WIL-
LOW AVE COVINA CA 91724. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ROBERT T. MCKNIGHT 4915 N.
WILLOW AVE COVINA CA 91724. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/17. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231719TC

CNBB231720IF FILE NO.2017127312
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JLR REAPIRS 10060 VALLEY BLVD APT 43 EL
MONTE CA 91731. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JOSE LEOPOLDO RODRIGUEZ-CENTENO
10060 VALLEY BLVD APT 43 EL MONTE CA 91731.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231720IF

CNBB231721IF FILE NO.2017127559
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FAMILY PROFESSIONAL HAIR CUT 629 GLEN-
DORA AVE LA PUENTE CA 91744. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) LUCY RENDON 5112 LAN-
DIS AVE BALDWINPARK CA 91706; RAMON DE
LA ROSA 19548 E CYPRESS ST TRL 27 COVI-
NA CA 91724. The business is conducted by: CO
PARTNERS . I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above on
. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB231721IF

CNBB231722IF FILE NO.2017127771
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as the
) MEDINA'S CARPET CLEANING 846 W 80TH
ST #11 LOS ANGELES CA 90044. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MARIO MEDINA  846 W
80TH ST #11 LOS ANGELES CA 90044. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 01/2012. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231722IF

CNBB231723MU FILE NO.2017127762
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HASHTAG PROMOTIONS 10330 PIONEER BLVD
SUITE 250 SANTA FE SPRINGS CA 9070. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ALL OF US PRO-
MOTIONS LLC 10330 PIONEER BLVD STE 250
SANTA FE SPRINGS CA 90670. The business is
conducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/12/17. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231723MU

CNBB231724MU FILE NO.2017127763
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BOTTOMLINE TRANSPORTATION 6010 BRYN-
HUST AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90043. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) HENRY ALEXANDER
SMITH JR 6010 BRYNHURST AVE LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90043. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231724MU

CNBB231725JL FILE NO.2017127431
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
C.A.R. FURNITURE MFG. 1902 DOREEN AVE A
SOUTH EL MONTE CA 91733. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) CATALINA ESTALA ;RIGOBERTO
PERAZA 1902 DOREEN AVE A SOUTH EL MON-
TE CA 91733. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 04/
2014. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231725JL

CNBB231726JL FILE NO.2017127707
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as;
WINSTAR DONUTS 11326 LONG BEACH BLVD
LYNWOOD CA 90262;PO BOX 327 SOUTH GATE
CA 90280.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) WIN-
STAR COFFEE INC 11326 LONG BEACH BLVD
LYNWOOD CA 90262. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION.I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of

itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231726JL

CNBB231727JL FILE NO.2017127601
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ARIB COSMETICS 25652 RIMGATE DR 3G LAKE
FOREST CA 92630. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) LISA JOHNSON 25652  RIMGATE DR 3G
LAKE FOREST CA 92630. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231727JL

CNBB231728JL FILE NO.2017127595
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as SIR
RUDY'S FOR MEN 2787 E DEL AMO BLVD COMP-
TONT CA 90221. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) RODERICK R. BELL SR. 2787 E DEL AMO
BLVD B-15 COMPTON CA 90221. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231728JL

CNBB231729JL FILE NO.2017127768
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KID'S PLACE 816 E 9TH ST LOS ANGELES CA
90021. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) BARCA
PACKING INC 816 E 9TH ST LOS ANGELES CA
90021. The business is conducted by:  A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB221728ED

CNBB231730ERIKA FILE NO.2017127972
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WEIMAN REAL ESTATE GROUP 29 HORSESHOE
LN ROLLING HILLS ESTATES CA 90274.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) WADE WEIMAN 29
HORSESHOE LN ROLLING HILLS ESTATES CA
90274.The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231730ERIKA

CNBB231731PS FILE NO.2017126899
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MAURICIO HANDYMAN SERVICES 8449
CEDROS AE #17 PANORAMA CITY CA 91402.Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) MAURICIO NEL-
SON CUELLAR SIBRIAN 8449 CEDROS AVE
#17 PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231731PS

CNBB231732PS FILE NO.2017122243
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
HIMI 5415 SANVICENTE BLVD APT # 9 LOS
ANGELES CA 90019. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MOHAMMAD REZA ANGORANI 5475 SAN
VICENTE BLVD APT #9 LOS ANGELES CA 90019.
The business is conducted by: A INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 05/11/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231732PS

CNBB231733PS FILE NO.2017127303
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
FAST STOP SMOKE SHOP SMOKE SHOP 14419
SHERMAN WY VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) HAKOB SHROYAN 9444
HENOLRIX LN NORTH HILLS CA 91343. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2016. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/17/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231733PS

CNBB231734ED FILE NO.2017127206
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as )
DEXPRESS COURIER SERVICES 17050 CHAT-
SWORTH STREET SUITE 222 GRANADA HILLS
CA 91344. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 04/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing; 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231734ED

CNBB231735ED FILE NO.2017127645
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JACKPOT GOODS 5318 E 2ND ST # 578 LONG
BEACH CA 90803. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CECILIA WARDEN 820 REDONDO AVE
LONG BEACH CA 90804; SHEM WALKER 335
N. JUANITA 305 LOS ANGELES CA 90078. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing:; 06/
08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Val-

ley Examiner     CNBB231735ED

CNBB231736EL FILE NO.2017143397
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BABY EINSTEIN'S FAMILY CHILD CARE 6060
FULCHER AVE NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91606.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) GOHAR JANNA
QUAKMYAN 6060 FULCHER AVE NORTH HOL-
LYWOD CA 91606.The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231736EL

CNBB231737OSCAR FILE NO.2017127221
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BORREGO AUTO REPAIR 7750 SEPULVEDA
BLVD #8 VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) FERNANDO ROMERO 7750
SEPULVEDA BLVD # 8 VAN NUYS CA 91405.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231737OSCAR

CNBB231738OSCAR FILE NO.2017119213
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
UNITED AUTO EXCHANGE 11485 VENTURA
BLVD STUDIO CITY CA 91604. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) VARUJUAN JOHN SULTAN-
YAN 7923 VAN NOORD AVE NORTH HOLLY-
WOOD CA 91605.The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/09/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231738OSCAR

CNBB231739NQ FILE NO.2017127361
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as) T &
A'S GRILL 7251 MILWOOD AVE APT #216 CAN-
OGA PARK CA 91304. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) TURQUOISE MICHELLE MAXWELL; AN-
DREW RIGO GOMEZ 7251 MILWOOD AVE APT
#216 CANOGA PARK CA 91304. The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231739NQ

CNBB231740NQ FILE NO.2017127362
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ONE WORLD TOURS 20757 SKOURAS DR
CANOGA PARK CA 91306. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ONE WORLD TOURS LLC 20757
SKOURAS DR CANOGA PARK CA 91306. The
business is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 03/
29/17. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231740NQ

CNBB231741NQ FILE NO.2017127307
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
SPICE STATION; SPICE STATION SILVER LAKE
1146 N. MARIPOSA  #7 LOS ANGELES CA 90029.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) PETER BAHLA-
WANIAN 1146 N MARIPOSA #7 LOS ANGELES
CA 90029. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
10/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB231741NQ

CNBB231742NQ FILE NO.2017127770
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LUCINDA ORGANICS 16348 MARYLYN DR
GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/17/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231742NQ

CNBB231743OZZY FILE NO.2017129358
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SUPER 8 2360 SUPULVEDA BLVD TORRANCE
CA 90501; 17918 PIONEER BLVD SUITE #212
ARTESIA CA 90701. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ANMOL 13 LLC 2360 SUPULVEDA BLVD
TORRANCE CA 90501. The business is conduct-
ed by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231743OZZY

CNBB231744OZZY FILE NO.2017129348
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
COMFORT INN 588 S. ATLANTIC BLVD
MONTEREY PARK CA 91754; 17918 PIONEER
BLVD SUITE #212 ARTESIA CA 90701. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ASHNA INC 588 S ATLAN-
TIC BLVD MONTEREY PARK CA 91754. The busi-
ness is conducted by:  A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231744OZZY

CNBB231745OZZY FILE NO.2017129397
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The

following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BEST WESTERN 7615 LANKERSHIM BLVD
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605;17918 PIONEER
BLVD SUITE #212 ARTESIA CA 90701.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) SHRUJA HOSPITALITY
INC 7615 LANKWERSHIM BLVD NORTH HOL-
LYWOOD CA 91605. The business is conducted
by:  A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231745OZZY

CNBB231746OZZY FILE NO.2017129361
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SUPER 8 7541 LAUREL CANYON BLVD NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91605;17918 PIONEER BLVD
SUITE #212 ARTESIA CA 90701. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) SALONI INC 7541 LAUREL
CANYON BLVD NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231746OZZY

CNBB231747TC FILE NO.2017128845
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANCORE SOLUTIONS 1; EVER FIRST 312 W.
8TH STREET LONG BEACH CA 90813. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) CHRISTOPHER ELIEMU
DICKERSON 312 W. 8TH STREET LONG BEACH
CA 90813. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
Commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
17. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231747TC

CNBB231748GM FILE NO.2017128603
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
LINKNOLOGY;HOMEY TECHNOLOGY 17800
CASTLETON STREET SUITE 170 CITY OF IN-
DUSTRY CA 91748;P.O. BOX 183 UPLAND CA
91785. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) GLOPO
INC 17800 CASTLETON STREET SUITE 170
CITY OF INDUSTRY CA 91748. The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231748GM

CNBB231749GM FILE NO.2017132537
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MONTE MARIA EXPRESS;M M EXPRESS 1346
W. 220TH ST TORRANCE CA 90501. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MONICO GONZALEZ
MOTA 1346 W. 220TH ST TORRANCE CA 90501.
The business is conducted by: AN IDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231749GM

CNBB231750IF FILE NO.2017128079
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
DURAN INSURANCE SERVICES AND AUTO
REGISTRATION 8040 ATLANTIC AVE CUDAHY
CA 90201. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ANTONIA DURAN 10231 KAUFFMAN AVE
SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 02/2014. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231750IF

CNBB 231751IF FILE NO.2017128380
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BELLA ROSE 3239 MALABAR ST LOS ANGELES
CA 90063. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
GEOVANNI A FLORES 3239 MALABAR ST LOS
ANGELES CA 90063. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/18/2016. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB231751IF

CNBB231752IF FILE NO.2017128643
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANGELS BEAUTY SALON 4106 SAN FERNAN-
DO ROAD SUITE G GLENDALE CA 91204. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) GRISELDA SOLIS
7700 CLEON AVE SUN VALLEY CA 91352; AMY
JAMILETH SALAZAR 4044 ½ VERDUGO ROAD
LOS ANGELES CA 90065.  The business is con-
ducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP . I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 07/2012 . NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231752IF

CNBB231753JL FILE NO.2017128575
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CONCEPTOS RESIDENCIALES PUNTA BUFA-
DORA 7313 ALONDRA BLVD PARAMOUNT CA
90723. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) 5 VI-
SION CAPITAL & LOGISTICS INC 7313 ALON-
DRA BLVD PARAMOUNT CA 90723. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)  NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231753JL

CNBB231754JL FILE NO.2017128312
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
VICTORIA'S BARBER & BEAUTY SALON 11109
GARVEY AVE EL MONTE CA 91733.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) VIRGINIA MARTINEZ HER-
NANDEZ 11109 GARVEY AVE EL MONTE CA
91733. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 THE San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231754JL

CNBB231755RM FILE NO.2017129180
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SECURITY GUARD PROS 20361 PRAIRIE ST
SUITE 1 CHATSWORTH CA 91311. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ABRAHAM RAMZAN 20361
PRAIRIE ST SUITE 1 CHATSWORTH CA 91311.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231755RM

CNBB231756RM FILE NO.2017129104
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WORLDS COLLIDE 18110 NORDHOFF ST UNIT
C NORTHRIDGE CA 91325. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) GREEN TEA CONSULTING INC
8700 RESEDA BLVD #113 NORTHRIDGE CA
91324. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231756RM

CNBB231757NQ FILE NO.2017129216
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LOVE MARC ENTERPRISES ; BEAUTY MORE
3950 LAUREL CANYON BLVD # 1070 STUDIO
CITY CA 91604. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
NATASHA MARK 3950 LAUREL CANYON BLVD
# 1070 STUDIO CITY CA 91604. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231757NQ

CNBB221758EL FILE NO.2017129461
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
TREJO'S CANTINA PASADENA 37 SOUTH EL
MOLINO AVE PASADENA CA 91101. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) PLAYHOUSE RESTURANT
GROUP LLC 37 S EL MOLINO AVE PASADENA
CA 91101. The business is conducted by: A LIMIT-
ED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names
listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/
29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231758PS

CNBB231759PS FILE NO.2017129315
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: H
AND K ELECTRONICS 404 SOUTH GENESEE
AVENUE LOS ANGELES CA 90036. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) SAFAK OMER HORTUM 404
SOUTH GENESEE AVENUE LOS ANGELES CA
90036. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231759PS

CNBB231760ED FILE NO.2017128433
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FIRST CHOICE HOME CARE 10549 NORTH-
VALE RD LOS ANGELES CA 90064. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JOSE MARIE BEARLESS ;
JOYCE T. HUBERMAN ; TRISTAN VIOLA; NON-
ALYN BARLES 10549 NORTHVALE RD LOS
ANGELES CA 90064. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231760ED

CNBB231761ED FILE NO.2017128732
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AAA A/C REPAIR 7112 WOODMAN AVE STE 208
VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) AMIRAN TABAGUA 7112  WOODMAN
AVE STE 208 VAN NUYS CA 91405. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/12/12. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231761ED

CNBB231762ED FILE NO.2017128733
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
REIABLE CARE 7112 WOODMAN AVE STE 208
VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) YERGENIYA TABAGUA 7112 WOODMAN
AVE STE 208 VAN NUYS CA 91405. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/01/2012. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231762ED

CNBB231763ED FILE NO.2017128760
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time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231789ERIKA

CNBB231790GM FILE NO.2017131886
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
KATHMANDU TREASURE 411 E. BROADWAY
#09 SAN GABRIEL CA 91776. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) SUAN MAHARJAN 411 E BROAD-
WAY # 09 SAN GABRIEL CA 91776. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/22/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 01/2014. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231790GM

CNBB231791TC FILE NO.2017131612
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
MEDIA WEB SOLUTIONS 10121 BUFORD AE
#28 INGLEWOOD CA 90304. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ELVIS J CARCACHE MORENO ;
RAFAEL ENRIQUE FONSECA BLANDON ;CAR-
LOS AUGUSTO RODRIGUEZ BLANDON 10121
BUFORD AVE #28 INGLEWOOD CA 90304. The
business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above on
2013. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231791TC

CNBB231792TC FILE NO.2017110481
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: EL
SIPOTE 2530 E ALONDRA BLVD COMPTON CA
90221;1103 S ATLANTIC DRIVE APT 1 COMP-
TON CA 90221. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
LETICIA MOLINA RIVERA 2530 E ALONDRA
BLVD COMPTON CA 90221. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231792TC

CNBB231793RM FILE NO.2017131358
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
VALLEY SPINAL DECOMPRESSION CENTER
5363 BALBOA BLVD #430 ENCINO CA 91316.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) BRUCE SHAN-
NAHOFF 7869 TEXHOMA AVE NORTHRIDGE
CA 91325. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 01/
2006. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing:06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231793RM

CNBB231794RM FILE NO.2017131541
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
BRANDLYNC ;EPEKDATA ; MEDIA HOUSE 12950
CULVER BLVD STE 180 PLAYA VISTA CA
90066;12950 CULVER BLVD STE 180 PLAYA VIS-
TA CA 90066. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MEAD HOLDINGS GROUP INC 12950 CULVER
BLVD STE 180 PLAYA VISTA CA 90066. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231794RM

CNBB231795PS FILE NO.2017125724
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SOBER THAT 4625 SYLMAR AVENUE #208
SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) GREGORY DUANE JOHNSON
4625 SYLMAR AVENUE UNIT 208 SHERMAN
OAKS CA 91423. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/16/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231795PS

CNBB231796 FILE NO.2017131201
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HEAVEN SENT ELDER COPANIONS 18375 VEN-
TURA BLVD # 57 TARZANA CA 91356. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) LAQUANDRA TAGOAI
18375 VENTURA BLVD # 57 TARZANA CA 91356.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231796

CNBB231797PS FILE NO.2017131320
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AMAZING MIND AND BODY 10061 RIVERSIDE
DRIVE # 106 TOLUCA LAKE CA 91602. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ELIZABETH NEFF 10061
RIVERSIDE DRIVE #106 TOLUCA LAKE CA
91602;OLGA AVEDISSIAN 22A PALOMA AVE
VENICE CA 90291. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/22/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231797PS

CNBB231798PS FILE NO.2017131841
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
MANDALAY BAY CONSTRUCTION 8013 WEAT-
LAND AVE SUN VALLEY CA 91352. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) EUGENE MARTIN SNYDER
8013 WHEATLAND AVE SUN VALLEY CA 91352.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five

years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB23198PS

CNBB231799PS FILE NO.2017131850
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BLUE LAGOON INDUSTRIES; LIBERTY ESSEN-
TIALS 1521 REEVES ST LOS ANGELES CA 90035.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DANIEL ZABLEN
1521 REEVES ST LOS ANGELES CA 90035. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231799PS

CNBB2317100ED FILE NO.2017131287
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROBERT E LEE MUSIC 14622 VENTURA BLVD
STE 102 #564 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403.  Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) LEELAN INC 14622
VENTURA BLVD STE 102 # 564 SHERMAN OAKS
CA 91403. The business is conducted by: A COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on01/
2011. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317100ED

CNBB2317101ED FILE NO.2017131283
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CREATIVE STUDIOS LOS ANGELES 14622 VEN-
TURA BLVD STE 102 # 564 SHERMAN OAKS CA
91403. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LEELAN
INC 14622 VENTURA BLVD STE 102 # 564 SHER-
MAN OAKS CA 91403. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 04/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/
29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317101ED

CNBB2317102ED FILE NO.2017131285
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE BRAND GALS 14622 VENTURA BLVD STE
102 # 564 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) LEELAN INC 14622 VEN-
TURA BLVD STE 102# 564 SHERMAN OAKS CA
91403.The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION . I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 01/
2013. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317102ED

CNBB2317103ED FILE NO.2017131456
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DANIEL'S REGLAZE SPECIALIST 5219 ½ VIR-
GINIA AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90029. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) DANIEL ISAAC TUPUL
CHIROY 5219 ½ VIRGINIA AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90029. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317103ED

CNBB2317104EL FILE NO.2017130912
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
RESIDENT IT 720 W HOWARD ST PASADENA
CA 91103.Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
NICHOALS WALTERS 720 W HOWARD ST PAS-
ADENA CA 91103. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317104EL

CNBB2317105EL FILE NO.2017131545
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SQUIRREL CHASERS DOG WALKING 330 N
SCREENLAND DR 3 204 BURBNAK CA
91505.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) RACHEL
KATHERINE LIPARI 330 N SCREENLAND DR 3
204 BURBANK CA 91505.The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/22/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/20/17. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2317105EL

CNBB2317106EL FILE NO.2017131793
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
INSIGHT DEALS 24103 DEL MONTE DR UNIT
430 VALENCIA CA 91355. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JULIA YE 24103 DEL MONTE DR
UNIT 430 VALENCIA CA 91355. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/22/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2317106EL

CNBB2317107EL FILE NO.2017131817
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
"GAG " ECO QUALITY 14007 VANOWEN ST #
205 VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ANAHIT REZYAN 14007 VANOWEN
ST #205 VAN NUYS CA 91405. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/22/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement

does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317107EL

CNBB2317108OSCAR FILE NO.2017130940
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MVR FLOORING 13890 SAYRE ST # 116 SYL-
MAR CA 91342. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MVR FLOORING INC 13890 SAYRE ST 116 SYL-
MAR CA 91342. The business is conducted by: A
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317108OSCAR

CNBB2317109OSCAR FILE NO.2017130939
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
COPTERPILOT 16700 ROSCOE BLVD VAN NUYS
CA 91406. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LOS
ANGELES AERIAL CIMEMATOGRAPHY INC
16700 ROSCOE BLVD VAN NUYS CA 91406.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317109OSCAR

CNBB2317110OSACR FILE NO.2017131657
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PAPO'S MOBILE GROOMING 15232 FOOTHILL
BLVD #121 SYLMAR CA 91342. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) FELIX MIGUEL CASTILLO
RODRIGUEZ 15232 FOOTHILL BLVD 3121 SYL-
MAR CA 91342. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/22/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317110OSCAR

CNBB2317111PS FILE NO.2017129832
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROSE CITY MOTORS INC 2111 E. COLORADO
BLVD PASADENA CA 91107. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ROSE CITY MOTORS INC 2111
E. COLORADO BLVD PASADENA CA 91107. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317111PS

CNBB2317112ED FILE NO.2017130082
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AMALGAMATED ARTS 4804 LAUREL CANYON
BLVD #333 VALLEY VILLAGE CA 91607.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) LUCIA LUCENTE 4804
LAUREL CANYON BLVD #333 VALLEY VILLAGE
CA 91607. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
19/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317112ED

CNBB2317113ED FILE NO.20171130502
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TEA PARTY AND LOVE 8685 WILSHIRE BLVD
SUITE 10 BEVERLY HILLS CA 90211.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) STERLING PROVIDER
SERVICES INC 8685 WILSHIRE BLVD STE 10
BEVERLY HILLS CA 90211. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/19/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2317113ED

CNBB2317114ED FILE NO.2017129994
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BLOW & GLOW NAILBAIR 12512 VICTORY
BOULEVARD UNIT B2 NORTH HOLLYWOOD
CA 91606;12512 VICTORY BOULEVARD UNIT
D NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91606.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) BLOW GLOW AND GO LLC
12512 VICTORY BOULEVARD UNIT D NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. The business is con-
ducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)  commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317114ED

CNBB2317115EL FILE NO.2017130152
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: S N
J PRODUCTION 204 G CHESTNUT ST GLEN-
DALE CA 91205. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SONYA JANUELYAN 204 E CHESTNUT ST
GLENDALE CA 91205. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/19/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have)  commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 03/2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/
29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317115EL

CNBB2317116EL FILE NO.2017130231
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ESP CONSTRUCTION 7053 FULTON AVE #1
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605; 1479 E CALI-
FORNIA AVE GLENDALE CA 91206. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) EDUARD SAYADYAN
1479 E CALIFORNIA AVE GLENDALE CA 91206.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT  com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name

Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317116EL

FILE NO.2017122494  CNBB2317117GM
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: APA COMM WIRELESS LATINOS
MULTI SERVICES 14137 PRAIRIE AVE HAW-
THORNE CA 90250 Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) AUGUSTO B. CACERES 3139 W. 148 ST
TORRANCE CA 90504. The business was con-
ducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious busi-
ness name referred to above was filed on 03/17/
2016. Original File # 2016065806. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/11/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317117GM

FILE NO.2017122332 CNBB2317118PS
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: CRESTWOOD CONSULTANTS 1840
SILVER LAKE BLVD UNIT A LOS ANGELES CA
90026 Full name of registrant (s) is (are) PETER
JASON ABRAHAMS 1890 SILVER LAKE BLVD
UNIT A LOS ANGELES CA 90026. The business
was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The ficti-
tious business name referred to above was filed
on 10/13/2016. Original File #2016251437. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
11/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing:06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317118PS

FILE NO.2317119PS CNBB2317119PS
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: BENTLEY ACCEPTANCE 1890 SIL-
VER LAKE BLVD UNIT A LOS ANGELES CA
90026 Full name of registrant (s) is (are) PETER
JASON ABRAHAMS 1840 SILVER LAKE BLVD
UNIT A LOS ANGELES CA 90026;ROBERT ABRA-
HAMS 23721 MARINER DR # 18 DAN POINT CA
92629. The business was conducted by:  A GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. The fictitious business name
referred to above was filed on 07/27/2016. Original
File # 2016188370. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/11/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317119PS

FILE NO.2017124019 CNBB2317120JEN
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: HAPPY DONUTS 1242 E FLORENCE
AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90001 Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) DIEP LOY 5945 WALNUT AVE
LONG BEACH CA 90805. The business was con-
ducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious busi-
ness name referred to above was filed on 11/21/
2012. Original File # 2012233037. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/15/2017.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB2317120JEN

FILE NO.2317121DC CNBB2317121DC
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: CINTHIA'S SNACK BAR CAFÉ 573
E. PICO BLVD #2 LOS ANGELES C 90015 Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) HUMBERTO ES-
TRADA-DIAZ 573 E. PICO BLVD #2 LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90015. The business was conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious business name
referred to above was filed on 02/06/2015. Original
File # 2015033829. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/15/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317121DC

FILE NO.2017124151 CNBB2317122OSCAR
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: ROYAL CLEANERS 9514 RESEDA
BLVD UNIT 8 NORTHRIDGE CA 91324 Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) GALEST SANESYAN 348
MILFORD ST #6 GLENDALE CA 91203;EDUARD
HAZUTYUNYAN 1120 ELIA AVE APT H GLEN-
DALE CA 91205. The business was conducted
by:  A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. The fictitious
business name referred to above was filed on 06/
13/2016. Original File # 2016147302. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/15/2017.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB2317122OSCAR

FILE NO.2017125636 CNBB2317123TC
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: SYNDEY NAILS 617 S FIRST AVE
ARCADIA CA 91006 Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MINDY MONTERROSO 6211 OAK AVE TEM-
PLE CITY CA 91780. The business was conduct-
ed by:  AN INDIVIDUAL INDIVIDUAL. The ficti-
tious business name referred to above was filed
on 05/06/2015. Original File # 2015121044. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
16/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317123TC

FILE NO.2017125612      CNBB2317124ED
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: ZEENVOR 1050 SPAZIER AVE #5
GLENDALE CA 91201 Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) RENE KARIMYAACE 1050 SPAZIER AVE
#5 GLENDALE CA 91201;DVIN APELIAN 9520
VIA SALERNO BURBANK CA 91504. The busi-
ness was conducted by:  A GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. The fictitious business name referred to
above was filed on 06/04/2014. Original File #
2014151930. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/16/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317124ED

FILE NO.2017125884 CNBB2317125ED
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: WALESKA JUMPER 14524 ARCH-
WOOD ST VAN NUYS CA 91405 Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MIRNA A. ESPINAL 6461
KESTER AVE VAN NUYS CA 91411. The busi-
ness was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The
fictitious business name referred to above was
filed on 10/28/2015. Original File # 2015275635. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ART CONSULTING 431 N WILSON AVE APT 4
PASADENA CA 91106. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) ARTOUR GABRIYELYAN 431 N. WIL-
SON AVE APT 4 PASADENA CA 91106. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 04/18/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 01/01/2014. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB231772EL

CNBB231773EL FILE NO.2017129420
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EQUISITE BEAUTY 13542 VENTURA BLVD
SUITE 7 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) YAHAIRA VIANNE SAN-
DOVAL 117 W. 18TH PL LOS ANGELES CA 90061.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231773EL

CNBB231774OSCAR FILE NO.2017129421
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
CALIFORNIA BASKETBALL ASSOCIATION; LOS
ANGELES BASKETBALL ACADEMY; CALIFOR-
NIA BASKETBALL ACADEMY; LA WATTS SUM-
MER GAMES; PAC-6 CONFERENCE; WATTS
SUMMER CLASSIC  2046 HILLHURST AVE #23
LOS ANGELES CA 90027. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) LOS ANGELES COLLEGE PREP 2046
HILLHURST AVE #23 LOS ANGELES CA 90027.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231774OSCAR

CNBB231775OSCAR FILE NO.2017128818
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: HB
RAINGUTTER SEAMLESS 6651 BECK AVE APT
6 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91606; HERNAN-
DO BARTOLO HERNANDEZ 6651 BECK AVE
APT 6 NOTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91606.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) HERNANDO BARTOLO
HERNANDEZ 6651 BECK AVE APT 6 NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231775OSCAR

CNBB231775NQ FILE NO.2017128655
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CHIROPRACTIC HEALTH CLINIC 4113 MAIN
AVE BALWIN PARK CA 91706; 5404 WHISETT
AVE P O BOX 88 VALLEY VILLAGE CA 91607.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) STEPHEN
SOONG HEALTH CENTER 13641 CALIFA ST VAN
NUYS CA 91401. The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing:06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB23776NQ

CNBB231777NQ FILE NO.2017128765
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DESIGNER ATM 7655 WINNETKA AVE #2214
WINNETKA CA 91396.  Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) STEPHEN R PIZZA JR 7655 WINNETKA
AVE #2214 WINNETKA CA 91396.  The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 01/10. NOTICE-The Ficti-
tious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231777NQ

CNBB231778NQ FILE NO.2017128791
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ZONEBRITE SOLUTIONS 17412 VENTURA
BLVD. #626 ENCINO CA 91316. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MICHAEL SAFAII 5440 LIND-
LEY AVE #110 ENCINO CA 91316. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231778NQ

CNBB231779NQ FILE NO.2017129201
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DAVMASH DIAMOND 706 S HILL ST # 840 LOS
ANGELES CA 90014. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) VOSKAN ZARATSYAN 706 S HILL ST # 840
LOS ANGELES CA 90014.  The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/
29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231779NQ

CNBB231780AC FILE NO.2017129750
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MATH & SCIENCE DESIGNS 13402 COLD-
BROOK AVE BELLFLOWER CA 90706. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) JOSE MANUEL ROD-
RIGUEZ 13402 COLDBROOK AVE BELLFLOW-
ER CA 90706. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San

Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231780AC

CNBB231781AC FILE NO.2017130098
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
C L U B I N T E R N A T I O N A L D E M A -
DRESSOLTERASENACCION;  CLUBINTERNA-
T I O N A L D E M A D R E S S O L T E R A -
SENACCION.COM.  7181 LUXOR ST DOWNEY
CA 90241. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
RODOLFO GARCIA LOPEZ 7181 LUXOR ST
DOWNEY CA 90241. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/19/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231781AC

CNBB231782AC FILE NO.2017130089
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VIDASALUD4YOU; VIDASALUD4YOU.COM
2834 ARDMORE AVE SOUTH GATE CA 90280;
OLRUD; OLRUD.COM; OLRUD4YOU;
OLRUD4YOU; SALUDDINERO4YOU;
SALUDDINERO4YOU.COM. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) OLGA RENTERIA ; RODOLFO
GARCIA LOPEZ 2834 ARDMORE AVE SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. The business is conducted by:  A
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP .I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 05/19/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names
listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/
29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231782AC

CNBB231783AC FILE NO.2017130620
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DULCET MUZIC 5668 CLEMSON ST LOS AN-
GELES CA 90016. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CHRISTOPHER GOMEZ 5668 CLEMSON
LOS ANGELES CA 90016. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/19/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231783AC

CNBB231784TC FILE NO.2017130146
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GRUPO HONDURENO INFANTIL CINCO ES-
TRELLAS 1138 S LA CIENEGA BLVD 7 LOS AN-
GELES CA 90035. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) DILCIA ELIZABETH MUNOZ 1138 S LA
CIENEGA BLVD 7 LOS ANGELES CA 90035. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231784TC

CNBB231785CH FILE NO.2017130233
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NATURE'S BLEND COLLECTIVE 2911 S CEN-
TRAL AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90011. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) NOAH'S JOURNEY COL-
LECTIVE 2911 S CENTRAL AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90011. The business is conducted by: A COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing:06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231785CH

CNBB231786JEN FILE NO.2017129965
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VETERANS FOR VETERANS CONSULTING; V
& V SHARPSHOOTERS 609 ½ N OCCIDENTAL
BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90026. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) RAYMOND GARCIA 609 ½
N. OCCIDENTAL BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90026.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNB231786JEN

CNBB231787JEN FILE NO.2017130220
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANGIE'S FASHION & BRIDAL 7021 PACIFIC
BLVD SUITE A HUNTINGTON PARK CA 92005.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MARIA ANGEL-
ICA MIRANDA 3163 SPRING GARDEN ST RIV-
ERSIDE CA 92501. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/19/2017 The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231787JEN

CNBB231788ERIKA FILE NO.2017130385
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROBERTS CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT
GROUP 5725 WHITTIER BLVD LOS ANGELES
CA 90022. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ROBERTS CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT
GROUP LLC 5725 WHITTIER BLVD LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90022. The business is conducted by: A
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/19/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB231788ERIKA

CNBB231789ERIKA FILE NO.2017130429
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EMONT 5727 RAVENSPUR DR APT 201 RAN-
CHO PALOS VERDES CA 90275. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MILAN FRANETA 5727
RAVENSPUR DR APT 201 RANCHO PALOS
VERDES CA 90275. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/19/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
USA T-SHIRTS 7655 MELITA AVE NORTH HOL-
LYWOOD CA 91605. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ARMEN ISKANIAN 7655 MELITA AVE
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/18/2017. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231763ED

CNBB231764ED FILE NO.2017128784
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MEAO 26009 ALIZIA CANYON DR #D CALABA-
SAS CA 91302. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MATTHEW AZIZ 5551 PATTILAR AVE WOODLAND
HILLS CA 91367;ERIK O BRIEN 26009 ALICIA
CANYON #D CALABASAS CA 91302. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231764ED

CNBB231765ED FILE NO.2017129203
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CREST LAW OFFICES 6454 VAN NUYS BLVD
SUITE 150 VAN NUYS CA 91401. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) STEPHANIE OBIOHA 6454
VAN NUYS BLVD SUITE 150 VAN NUYS CA
91401. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB231765ED

CNBB231766ED FILE NO.2017129219
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
N3LEWA 4075 LOS NIETOS DR LOS FELIZ CA
90027. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
STEPHANIE OBIOHA 6454 VAN NUYS BLVD VAN
NUYS CA 91401;JANE OKAFOR 936 S OLIVE
STREET LOS ANGELES CA 90036;DANIELLE
MAYNARD 4075 LOS NIETOS DR LOS FELIZ
CA 90027;KINGI KINGIBE 3650 BARHAM BLVD
APT T319 LOS ANGELES CA 90068. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231766ED

CNBB231767ED FILE NO.2017129288
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
A&J RANCH 15728 LEADWELL STREET VAN
NUYS CA 91406. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ARTHUR BEKKERMAN 15728 LEADWELL
STREET VAN NUYS CA 91406. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/18/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 04/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB231767ED

CNBB231768EL FILE NO.2017128662
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MARBELLA COMPANY 24307 MAGIC MOUNTAIN
PKWY #347 VALENCIA CA 91355. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) POLERO LLC 24307 MAGIC
MOUNTAIN PKWY #347 VALENCIA CA 91355.
The business is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231768EL

CNBB231769EL FILE NO.2017129188
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
GRAND CUSTOM RUGS 10929 VANOWEN ST #
156 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) SAMUEL MARTIROSYAN
1339 N. HABART BLVD APT 4 LOS ANGELES CA
90027. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231769EL

CNBB231770EL FILE NO.2017128812
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KILKEA DESIGN 1510 BASSO TERRACE GLEN-
DALE CA 91202.Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
KIRA PERSON 1510 BASSO TERRACE GLEN-
DALE CA 91202. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/18/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB231770EL

CNBB231771EL FILE NO.2017129190
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GAZAN PUBLIC SERVICE'S GPS 725 FOOT-
HILL RD BEVERLY HILLS CA 90210.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) GAZAN INC 725 FOOT-
HILL RD BEVERLY HILLS CA 90210. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
18/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB231771EL

CNBB231772EL FILE NO.2017129189
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information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
16/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317125ED

FILE NO.2017127195 CNBB2317126MU
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: PAYCON COMPANY 3152 BANDINI
BLVD VERNON CA 90058 Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) RASHTI ALI 10 JUNIPER IRVINE CA
92612. The business was conducted by:  AN IN-
DIVIDUAL. The fictitious business name referred
to above was filed on 05/17/2017. Original File #
2015303544. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/17/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317126MU

FILE NO.2017127604 CNBB2317127ED
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: HEY CUBA 13421 HUBBARD ST #
106 SYLMAR CA 91342 Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) ROSE MARRERO AVILA ; RAFAEL
CERON 13421 HUBBARD ST # 106 SYLMAR CA
91342. The business was conducted by:  A GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. The fictitious business name
referred to above was filed on 01/30/2017. Original
File # 2017024700. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/17/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317127ED

FILE NO.2017127265 CNBB2317128PS
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: FAST STOP SMOKE SHOP 14114
SHERMAN WAY VAN NUYS CA 91405 Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ARMAN SARGSYAN 14114
SHERMAN WAY VAN NUYS CA 91405. The busi-
ness was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The
fictitious business name referred to above was
filed on 01/23/2015. Original File # 2015019605. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
17/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317128PS

FILE NO.2017132793 CNBB2317129AC
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: BRIANAS FLOWERS 1256 N EDGE-
MONT #1 LOS ANGELES CA 90029 Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) EFREN PRADO 1256 EDGE-
MONT NO. 1 LOS ANGELES CA 90029. The busi-
ness was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The
fictitious business name referred to above was
filed on 06/04/2012. Original File # 2012108274. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
23/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317129AC

FILE NO.2017132457 CNBB2317130JL
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: LOS ALEX'S PROPERTY INVETORS
439 W. 87TH PL LOS ANGELES CA 90003 Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) MORENA E. VE-
LASQUEZ BARRERA 439 W. 87TH PL LOS AN-
GELES CA 90003. The business was conducted
by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious business name
referred to above was filed on 02/21/2017. Original
File # 2017043058. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/23/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317130JL

CNBB2317131DC FILE NO.2017132086
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GILBERTO CONSTRUCTION 564 W. 2ND
STREET SAN PEDRO CA 90731. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) GILBETO AMBRIZ 564 W.
2ND STREET SAN PEDRO CA 90731. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317131DC

CNBB2317132TC FILE NO.2017132768
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GOALD MYND 19314 ENSLOW DR CARSON
CA 90746. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
BRANDEN L FOMBY 19314 ENSLOW DR CAR-
SON CA 90746. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317132TC

CNBB2317133GM FILE NO.2017132738
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: I&R
CONSTRUCTION 11152 ANTWERP ST # 506 LOS
ANGELES CA 90059. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ISIDORO RIVERA VARGAS 11152 ANTW-
ERP ST # 506 LOS ANGELES CA 90059. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT  com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317133GM

CNBB2317134GM FILE NO.2017132844
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JAZZY'S THREADING B BOUTIQUE 3088 W
TEMPLE AVE POMONA CA 96621; 6062 WEST-
ERN AVE APT 11 BUENA PARK CA 96621. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) SALMA CASPER
6062 WESTERN AVE APT 11 BUENA PARK CA
96621. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/

2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317134GM

CNBB2317135LD FILE NO.2017132071
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: IN
STAFF 19745 COLIMA ROAD 1# 283 ROWLAND
HEIGHTS CA 91748 Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) LAVA DS LLC 19745 COLIMA ROAD 1#283
ROWLAND HEIGHTS CA 91748. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2012. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2317135LD

CNBB2317136LD FILE NO.2017133354
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: IN
STAFFING 19745 COLIMA ROAD 1#283 ROW-
LAND HEIGHTS CA 91748. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) LAVA SCS LLC 19745 COLIMA
ROAD 1#283 ROWLAND HEIGHTS CA 91748.
The business is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2012. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317136LD

CNBB2317137RM FILE NO.2017132448
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
INNOVATIVE KITCHENS 8600 MASON AVE WIN-
NETKA CA 93104; 17830 MERRIDY ST #211
NORTHRIDGE CA 91325. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) STEPHEN C HUGHES 17830 MER-
RIDY ST #211 NORTHRIDGE CA 91325. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317137RM

CNBB2317138RM FILE NO.2017132592
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DISCOUNT MEDICAL PHARMACY; MEMORIAL
MEDICAL PHARMACY 2716 GRIFFITH PARK
BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90027; 1510 S CEN-
TRAL AVE # 110 GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) GLENDALE MEDICAL
ARTS CENTER PHARMACY INC 2716 GRIF-
FITH PARK BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90027. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 1985. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317138RM

CNBB2317139PS FILE NO.2017133074
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AAA JEWERLY ART 8442 OSWEGO ST SUN-
LAND CA 91040. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ARTAK AMIRYAN 8442 OSWEGO ST SUN-
LAND CA 91040. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317139PS

CNBB2317140PS FILE NO.2017133004
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
IBUILT MEDIA MARKETING 6916 AMIGO AVE
RESEDA CA 91335. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) LIMITLESS HOLDINGS LLC 6916 AMIGO
AVE RESEDA CA 91335. The business is con-
ducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317140PS

CNBB2317141ED FILE NO.2017133208
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MAKING ALL CASH COUNT RECORDS 5748
WILLOWCREST AVE NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA
91601. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DE
ANDRE LOVE HINTON 5248 WILLOWCREST
AVE NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91601. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317141ED

CNBB2317142ED FILE NO.2017132266
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NICK'S EXQUISITE JEWERLY 6425 DENNY AVE
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MARIANNA GRIGORYAN
KHACHATRYAN 6425 DENNY AVE NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/22/2017. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2317142ED

CNBB2317143EL FILE NO.2017132524
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
POWER AL 13935 VANOWEN ST APT 1 VAN
NUYS CA 91405. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ALEXANDRU PLACINTA; ELIZAVETA RUP-
PEL 13935 VANWOWEN ST APT 1VAN NUYS
CA 91405. The business is conducted by: A GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed

above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317143EL

CNBB2317144EL FILE NO.2017132956
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BEST CHOICE DENTAL STUDIO 19231 VICTO-
RY BLVD SUITE 205 RESEDA CA 91335. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) INNA KLENINA
19231 VICTORY BLD SUITE 205 RESEDA CA
91335. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317144EL

CNBB2317145EL FILE NO.2017132987
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: LIL
TWERPS SHOP 229 N. GRIFFITH PARK DR
BURBANK CA 91506. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) ALESSANDRA MONTANARO 229 N.
GRIFFITH PARK DR BURBANK CA 91506. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/23/17. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317145EL

CNBB2317146EL FILE NO.2017133062
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SCHOLASTIC FILMS 1615 W ALAMEDA AVE APT
220 BURBANK CA 91506. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) LARRIN BAKER 1615 W ALAMEDA
AVE APT #220 BURBANK CA 91506. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/29/2012. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317146EL

CNBB2317147EL FILE NO.2017133244
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PRECISION REPAIR 15353 WEDDINGTON ST
AT A206 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91411. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) NIKOLAI DOVGULICH
15353 WEDDINGTON ST APT A206 SHERMAN
OAKS CA 91411. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317147EL

CNBB2317148EL FILE NO.2017133301
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EARTHQUAKE RETROFIT LA; EARTHQUAKE
RETROFITS LA 11883 ROCHESTER AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90025. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ABIEL STRUCTURAL INC 11883 ROCHES-
TER AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90025. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317148EL

CNBB2317149OSCAR FILE NO.2017132374
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JETCARD 7352 RUFFNER AVENUE VAN NUYS
CA 91406. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) IAN
STEWART TAYLOR 7352  RUFFNER AVENUE
VAN NUYS CA 91406. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing:  06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317149OSCAR

CNBB2317150OSCAR FILE NO.2017132675
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HIGH TECH COMMUNICATION 18848 ROSCOE
BLVD NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) IGNACIO MARIO RAMIREZ
HERNANDEZ 18848 ROSCOE BLVD
NORTHRIDE CA 91324. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing:  06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317150OSCAR

CNBB2317151OSCAR FILE NO.2017132882
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: MJ
MANAGEMENT 713 E WINDSOR RD APT C
GLENDALE CA 91205. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) JEMMA MKHITARYAN 713 E WINDSOR
RD APT C GLENDALE CA 91205. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 08/2012. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing:  06/ 08; 06/
15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2317151OSCAR

CNBB2317152NIDIA FILE NO.2017134477
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MANDOS TEST ONLY 8101 MAIN ST UNIT D
LOS ANGELES CA 90003. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) MANDO'S TEST ONLY LLC 8101 MAIN
ST UNIT D LOS ANGELES CA 90003. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 10/
2012. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that

time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317152NIDIA

CNBB2317153JL FILE NO.2017134692
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SCF DESIGNS 8205 S. COMPTON AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90001. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SCF DESIGNS CORP 8205 S COMPTON
AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90001. The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/24/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317153JL

CNBB2317154JEN FILE NO.2017134515
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SUPER 8 BUILDER 1342 GALEMONT AVE HA-
CIENDA HEIGHTS CA 91745. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) WILLIAM H. CHAN 1342 GALEM-
ONT AVE HACIENDA HEIGHTS CA 91745. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 03/1989. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317154JEN

CNBB2317155JL FILE NO.2017133874
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANDEAN CONSTRUCTION 824 NORTH VER-
DUGO ROAD APT #A GLENDALE CA 91206. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) VICTOR MARTIN
PINEDO CHOMBA 824 NORTH VERDUGO
ROAD APT #A GLENDALE CA 91206. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/24/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317155JL

FILE NO.2017114574  CNBB2317156EL
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: TAT STONE & MARBEL 8528 SAN
FERNANDO RD SUN VALLEY CA 91352 Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) MATAN GRIGORY-
AN 9305 CRYSTAL VIEW DRIVE TUJUNGA CA
91042. The business was conducted by:  AN IN-
DIVIDUAL. The fictitious business name referred
to above was filed on 08/13/2014. Original File
#2014224863. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/04/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 &
06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2317156EL

CNBB2317157IF FILE NO.2017134536
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CARS & CARS 12028 CENTRALIA RD D-1 HA-
WAIIAN GARDENS CA 90716. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) AJMAL ALADROSS; NADEEM
AWAN 12028 CENTRALIA RD D-1 HAWAIIAN
GARDENS CA 90716. The business is conducted
by: CO PARTNERS. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317157IF

CNBB2317158AC FILE NO.2017133863
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PEREZ'S MOTOR & TRANSMISSION USED 9610
½ LAUREL ST LOS ANGELES CA 90002. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) JUAN PEREZ-GA-
VIA 9610 ½ LAUREL ST LOS ANGELES CA 90002.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 08;
06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2317158AC

CNBB2317159AC FILE NO.2017133785
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ACB TOYS 230 E WINSTON ST STE 1 LOS AN-
GELES CA 90013; 968 WHITE KNOLL DR #1
LOS ANGELES CA 90012. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) EDGAR ANIBAL GRAMAJO LOPEZ
968 WHITE KNOLL DR #1 LOS ANGELES CA
90012. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317159AC

CNBB2317160AC FILE NO.2017133783
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AVDA PARTY SUPPLY 230 WINSTON ST STE 20
LOS ANGELES CA 90013;968 WHITE KNOLL
DR #1 LOS ANGELES CA 90012.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) EDGAR ANIBAL GRAMAJO
LOPEZ 968 WHITE KNOLL DR LOS ANGELES
CA 90012. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 08; 06/15; 06/22 & 06/29/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2317160AC

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017118767
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NINI'S TOUCH OF BEAUTY, 5746 WEST AD-
AMS BOULEVARD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90016.
Mailing address if different: 113 1/2 S. MATHEWS
ST., LOS ANGELES, CA 90033. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: SONIA ARREOLA, 113 1/2
S. MATHEWS ST., LOS ANGELES, CA 90033.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: SONIA ARREOLA,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/09/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new

fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA343254.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017119390
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
STUDIO 1DASH1 VR, 6525 LA MIRADA STE.
113, LOSANGELES, CA 90038. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: FERNANDO FIGUEROA, 1518-1/2 19TH ST.,
SANTA MONICA, CA 90404, RICARDO VELAS-
CO, 5328 CANDACE PL, LOS ANGELES, CA
90041, JOSÃƒÂ‰ FONACIER, 6525 LA MIRADA
113, LOS ANGELES, CA 90038. This business is
conducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: FERNANDO
FIGUEROA, PARTNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 03/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/09/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA343416.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017120027
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CHEF ARTHUR J, 21200 KITTRIDGE ST 3194,
WOODLAND HILLS, CA 91303. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ARTHUR JACKSON, 21200 KITTRIDGE
ST 3194, WOODLAND HILLS, CA 91303. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ARTHUR JACKSON, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/10/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA343512.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017120666
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CONTRERAS EL SINAI, 1423 E ROSECRANS
AVE, COMPTON, CA 90221. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: CONSUELO CONTRERAS, 1423 E ROSE-
CRANS AVE, COMPTON, CA 90221. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CONSUELO CONTRERAS, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
03/14/2012. This statement was filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/10/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA343705.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017120910
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. AESTHETICA LA, 2. LA HAND INSTITUTE,
7301 MEDICAL CENTER DR SUITE #208, WEST
HILLS, CA 91307. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: AR-
EZOU YAGHOUBIAN, 24912 VISTA VERENDA,
WOODLAND HILLS, CA 91367. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: AREZOU YAGHOUBIAN, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business names listed above on
(date): 01/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
05/11/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA343750.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017121011
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. YOU ARE WHAT YOU GIVE, 2. GIVE TO
LIVE, 539 E. VILLA ST NO. 25, PASADENA, CA
91101. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: KATHLENE
KELLER, 539 E. VILLA ST NO. 25, PASADENA,
CA 91101. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: KATH-
LENE KELLER, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business names listed above on (date): 02/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/11/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA343766.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017121706
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
QUICKPICKERS, 3223 SHEFFIELD AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90032. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
DAVID PETZOLD, 3223 SHEFFIELD AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90032. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
DAVID PETZOLD, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/11/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA343893.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017121756
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. THE HIGHWATCH, 2. THE HIGH WATCH, 3.
HIGHWATCH, 4. HIGH WATCH, 1172 E. 45TH
WAY, LONG BEACH, CA 90807. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ERIC M. MCKENDELL, 1172 E. 45TH WAY,
LONG BEACH, CA 90807. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ERIC M. MCKENDELL, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business names listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/11/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA343903.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017121880
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: S
& N HOME CLEANING, 1415 E 125TH ST, COMP-
TON, CA 90222. Mailing address if different: 1415
E 125TH ST, COMPTON, CA 90222. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: SANDRA G
FIGUEROA, 1415 E 125TH ST, COMPTON, CA
90222. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: SANDRA G
FIGUEROA, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/11/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA343939.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017122327
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:

MAISON DE BIOSAH, 14030 LEMOLI AVENUE
APARTMENT 41, HAWTHORNE, CA 90250. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: AKPOVIRORO LINDA BIO-
SAH, 14030 LEMOLI AVENUE APARTMENT 41,
HAWTHORNE, CA 90250. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: AKPOVIRORO LINDA BIOSAH, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/11/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA344031.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017122810
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. SHIRTS DONE RIGHT, 2. SDR, 722 CIENGE-
GA AVE, SAN DIMAS, CA 91773. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: DOMINIC C. VINCIGUERRA, 722
CIENGEGA AVE, SAN DIMAS, CA 91773. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: DOMINIC C. VINCIGUER-
RA, OWNER. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business names
listed above on (date): 03/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/12/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/
2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA344141.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017123361
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AUTHENTIC SILK SCREENING, 13448 TRACY
ST UNIT M, BALDWIN PARK, CA 91706. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: OMAR TELLEZ MORALES,
13448 TRACY ST UNIT M, BALDWIN PARK, CA
91706. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: OMAR TELLEZ MO-
RALES, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 06/2018. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/12/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA344275.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017124760
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MR.CLEAN SCUBA, 4625 CARDWELL ST., LYN-
WOOD, CA 90262. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JESUS
A. TOVAR, 4625 CARDWELL ST., LYNWOOD,
CA 90262. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JESUS A.
TOVAR, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/15/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345282.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017125941
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MODA ITALY FASHION, 38718 LAURIE LN 38718
LAURIE LN, PALMDALE, CA 93551. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: FARSHID FRED MAGH-
SOUD, 38718 LAURIE LN, PALMDALE, CA 93551.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: FARSHID FRED MAGH-
SOUD, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/16/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345537.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126029
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NOONEY GREEN, 637 E. 8TH ST #6, LONG
BEACH, CA 90813. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: DES-
TINY PHILLIPS, 637 E 8TH ST 6, LONG BEACH,
CA 90813. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: DESTINY
PHILLIPS, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 04/2016. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/16/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345557.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126053
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. BROADWAY GARAGE CREATIVE, 2. BGCLA,
38718 LAURIE LN., PALMDALE, CA 93551. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: FARNAZ MAGHSOUD, 38718
LAURIE LN., PALMDALE, CA 93551 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: FARNAZ MAGHSOUD, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business names listed above on
(date): 05/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
05/16/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA345565.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126132
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AMK ENTERPRISES, 1750 S BENTLEY AVE STE
102, LOS ANGELES, CA 90025. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ASLAN RYAN HOTKO, 1750 S BENTLEY
AVE STE 102, LOS ANGELES, CA 90025. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ASLAN RYAN HOTKO, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/16/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA345597.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126265
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
EL TALISMAN, 4433 SOUTH ALAMEDA STREET
A-6, LOS ANGELES, CA 90058. Mailing address if
different: 2464 PALM PLACE, HUNTINGTON
PARK, 90255. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: LILIANA VAZQUEZ, 2464 PALM PLACE,
HUNTINGTON PARK, CA 90255. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: LILIANA VAZQUEZ, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/16/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office

of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA345634.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME 2017126611
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of
the fictitious business name(s): PARAMOUNT
FOODS, 7243 JACKSON ST, PARAMOUNT, CA
90723. The fictitious business name(s) referred to
above was filed on: AUGUST 10, 2015 in the
County of Los Angeles. Original File No.
2015207965. Full name of Registrant(s): ALAN
HERNANDEZ, 7243 JACKSON ST, PARAMOUNT,
CA 90723, ALBERTO HERNANDEZ, 7243 JACK-
SON ST, PARAMOUNT, CA 90723, HORTENSIA
HERNANDEZ, 7243 JACKSON ST, PARAMOUNT,
CA 90723, VANESSA B. AVILA, 7243 JACKSON
ST, PARAMOUNT, CA 90723. This business is
conducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true,
information which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: VANESSA B. AVILA,
OWNER. This statement was filed with the Los
Angeles County Clerk on 05/16/2017. Publish: 06/
08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE
SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345716.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126620
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PARAMOUNT FOODS, 7243 JACKSON ST., PAR-
AMOUNT, CA 90723. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: VAN-
ESSA B AVILA, 7243 JACKSON ST., PARAMOUNT,
CA 90723. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: VANESSA
B AVILA, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/16/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345720.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017127049
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
VALIANT SHEET METAL, 18025 SOUTH HOBART
BLVD. UNIT B, GARDENA, CA 90248. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ANDREW RUNNETTE, 18025
SOUTH HOBART BLVD. UNIT B, GARDENA, CA
90248, JOVANI BRAVO, 18025 SOUTH HOBART
BLVD. UNIT B, GARDENA, CA 90248. This busi-
ness is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ANDREW RUNNETTE,
PARTNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/2010. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/17/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA345765.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017127794
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. LADY MARMALADE, 2. LADY MARMALADE
SKIN AND WAX BAR, 3. LADY MARMALADE
BEAUTY BAR, 4. LADY MARMALADE SUGAR
SHOP, 1507 S DUNSMUIR AVE, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90019. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MONIQUE
MARTINEZ, 1507 S DUNSMUIR AVE, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90019. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MONIQUE MARTINEZ, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business names listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/17/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345967.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017128180
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
IM PAINTING, 7425 SEPULVEDA #24, VAN NUYS,
CA 91405. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ANGEL ISRA-
EL MIRELES ESCOBAR, 7425 SEPULVEDA #24,
VAN NUYS, CA 91405. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ANGEL ISRAEL MIRELES ESCOBAR, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/18/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA346026.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017128931
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NOCHEBUENA'S FRESH PRODUCE, 11755
GILMORE ST 304, N. HOLLYWOOD, CA 91606.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: CARLOS NOCHEBUENA,
11755 GILMORE ST 304, N. H., CA 91606. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: CARLOS NOCHEBUENA,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 01-24-1996. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/18/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA346187.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017130401
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MARTINEZ'S TOOLS, 1159 VENICE BLVD, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90015. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
LORENZO MARTINEZ CRUZ, 749 S. HARVARD
BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90005. This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: LORENZO MARTINEZ CRUZ, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/19/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA346490.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017131154
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CLEAR PICTURE COACHING, 8608 HOLLOWAY
DR APT 123, WEST HOLLYWOOD, CA 90069.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: DANIEL ZIMMERMAN, 8608
HOLLOWAY DR APT 123, WEST HOLLYWOOD,
CA 90069. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: DANIEL
ZIMMERMAN, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 03/2016.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/22/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346601.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132232
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LM CAD SERVICES, 9819 BEACHY AVENUE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 91331. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: LUIS A MAURICIO, 9819 BEACHY AVE-
NUE, ARLETA, CA 91331. This business is con-
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ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: LUIS A MAURICIO, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
01/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/23/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA346854.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132780
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ROSA'S HOUSE CLEANING, 5549 FULCHER
AVE. APT. 1, NORTH HOLLYWOOD, CA 91601.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: ROSA MARINA SANCHEZ,
5549 FULCHER AVE. APT. 1, NORTH HOLLY-
WOOD, CA 91601. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ROSA MARINA SANCHEZ, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/23/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA348529.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017133141
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CLIFTON PLUMBING, 9328 MAYNE ST., BELL-
FLOWER, CA 90706. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: KEN-
NETH LLOYD CLIFTON, 9328 MAYNE ST., BELL-
FLOWER, CA 90706. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
KENNETH LLOYD CLIFTON, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/23/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA348653.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017134061
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
COVENANT VISAS, 6649 SAN VINCENTE
STREET, PARAMOUNT, CA 90723. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: WILLIAM JOSEPH SENIOR,
6649 SAN VINCENTE STREET, PARAMOUNT,
CA 90723. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: WILLIAM
JOSEPH SENIOR, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348823.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017134933
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ADALYNN'S, 7025 WOODLEY AVE APT #221,
VAN NUYS, CA 91406. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
ADRIANA DEL CA MURILLO RUELAS, 7025
WOODLEY AVE APT#221, VAN NUYS, CA 91406.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ADRIANA DEL CA
MURILLO RUELAS, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349062.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135010
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. KINKY KONTROL, 2. KINKY KONTROL
RECORDS, 974 S GRAMERCY PL 202, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90019. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
KEVIN P. SMITH, 974 S GRAMERCY PL 202,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90019. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: KEVIN P. SMITH, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business names listed above on (date): 01/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349071.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135239
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
EL SAUZ TACOS 2, 470 W COLORADO ST, GLEN-
DALE, CA 91204. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MAN-
UEL MARTINEZ, 663 W WILSON, GLENDALE,
CA 91203, MARIA G MARTINEZ, 663 W WIL-
SON, GLENDALE, CA 91203. This business is
conducted by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MANUEL MARTINEZ, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349106.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135337
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
IMEC HOSTING, 311 SOUTH 5TH ST. #E, BUR-
BANK, CA 91501. Mailing address if different: PO
BOX 4131, BURBANK, CA 91503. Articles of In-
corporation or Organization Number:
200717810347. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ARMENIANMATCH.COM, LLC, 311 SOUTH
5TH ST. E, BURBANK, CA 91501 (State of Incor-
poration/Organization: CA). This business is con-
ducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: HELGGE MINASSIAN,
PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 05/2007. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/25/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/
2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349119.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135446
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TLC PAK N SHIP, 11524 SLAUSON AVE, WHITTI-
ER, CA 90606. Mailing address if different: 11733
E SLAUSON AVE, SANTA FE SPRINGS, CA
90670. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
FRANCISCO A. FIGUEROA, 9626 SCHOOLING
RD, PICO RIVERA, CA 90660. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: FRANCISCO A. FIGUEROA, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 05/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)

05/25/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349144.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135518
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TLC PACKING & SHIPPING, 11733 E SLAUSON
AVE, SANTA FE SPRINGS, CA 90670. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: TLC PACKING AND SHIP-
PING, INC., 11733 E SLAUSON AVE, SANTA FE
SPRINGS, CA 90670 (State of Incorporation/Or-
ganization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
FRANCISCO A. FIGUEROA, PRESIDENT. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
06/2006. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349153.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135721
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
DORIS HOME OF COMPASSION, 8921 SO. MAN-
HATTAN PL., LOS ANGELES, CA 90047. Mailing
address if different: 3119 W, 81ST., INGLEWOOD,
CA 90305. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
DORIS J GORE, 3119 W. 81 ST., INGLEWOOD,
CA 90305, CRAIG D CARR, 3119 W.81 ST., IN-
GLEWOOD, CA 90305. This business is conduct-
ed by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CRAIG D CARR, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349181.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME 2017135864
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of
the fictitious business name(s): LULAROE WITH
ALEXANDRA KNAUB, 10215 VARIEL AVE UNIT
26, CHATSWORTH, CA 91311. The fictitious busi-
ness name(s) referred to above was filed on:
MARCH 8, 2016 in the County of Los Angeles.
Original File No. 2016055582. Full name of
Registrant(s): ALEXANDRA KNAUB, 10215 VA-
RIEL AVE UNIT 26, CHATSWORTH, CA 91311.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true,
information which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ALEXANDRA KNAUB,
PRESIENT. This statement was filed with the Los
Angeles County Clerk on 05/25/2017. Publish: 06/
08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE
SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349211.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135877
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SPOOL AND SLEEVE SOLUTIONS, 355 BONITA
AVE, POMONA, CA 91767. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: 5138 MAYWOOD CT, RANCHO CU-
CAMONGA, CA 91739. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: KEITH DOW, 5138 MAYWOOD
CT, RANCHO CUCAMONGA, CA 91739. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: KEITH DOW, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
MARCH 1, 2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
05/25/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349214.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017136232
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LOLLY VEGAS PUBLISHING, 205 S. BROAD-
WAY SUITE 905, LOS ANGELES, CA 90012.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: ROYALITY STREAM, LLC,
205 S BROADWAY SUITE 905, LO ANGELES,
CA 90012 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: LIMITED LIABILI-
TY COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: BREN-
TON L. HORNER, MANAGING MEMBER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349299.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017136985
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. THE CORNER STUDIO, 2. THE CORNER
PHOTOGRAPHY, 5924 S PACIFIC COAST HIGH-
WAY UNIT 6, REDONDO BEACH, CA 90277.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: MARIA BEAN, 5924 S PA-
CIFIC COAST HIGHWAY UNIT 6, REDONDO
BEACH, CA 90277. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MARIA BEAN, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business names listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349468.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137360
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE LIGHT SHOP, 1110 S. BEDFORD ST #2,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90035. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: TYLER KINDRED, 1110 S. BEDFORD ST
#2, LOS ANGELES, CA 90035. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: TYLER KINDRED, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA350149.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137395
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RMV PROFESSIONAL GROUP, 4951 CLARA ST
SUITE A, CUDAHY, CA 90201. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: RMV INC, 4951 CLARA ST SUITE A, CUD-
AHY, CA 90201 (State of Incorporation/Organiza-
tion: CA). This business is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: RAUL
MEDINA JR, PRESIDENT. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA350212.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017136155
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
EXPONENTIAL RESOURCES, 17632 REVELLO
DRIVE, PACIFIC PALISADES, CA 90272. Mailing

address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation
or Organization Number: 200436510230. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: HUMANITY FUND,
17632 REVELLO DRIVE, PACIFIC PALISADES,
CA 90272 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: LIMITED LIABILI-
TY COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: BARBARA
KRUTCHKOFF, MANAGER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 12/2016.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA350521.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137518
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
OAKTREE PR, 1113 CALLE MONTANA, MONTE-
BELLO, CA 90640. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ADAM
ROBLES, 1113 CALLE MONTANA, MONTEBEL-
LO, CA 90640. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ADAM
ROBLES, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/26/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA350859.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017131855
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ACID QUEEN JEWELRY, 4427 W ROSE HILL
DR, LOS ANGELES, CA 90032. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ALEXANDRA CAMACHO, 4427 W ROSE HILL
DR, LOS ANGELES, CA 90032. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ALEXANDRA CAMACHO, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
01/2016. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/22/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA350959.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137844
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PANDA CHEF'S CHINESE FAST FOOD, 944 W.
FLORENCE AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90044.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: KIMHONG GOV, 2520 EL
PASEO, ALHAMBRA, CA 91803, LEAKHENA
TECH, 2520 EL PASEO, ALHAMBRA, CA 91803.
This business is conducted by: MARRIED COU-
PLE. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: KIMHONG GOV,
HUSBAND. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351001.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138013
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
STUDENT FITNESS EXPERTS, 840 18TH ST #7,
SANTA MONICA, CA 90403. Mailing address if
different: 323 N. ALMONT DR #204, BEVERLY
HILLS, CA 90211. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: KURLY FITNESS, LLC, 840 18TH ST#7,
SANTA MONICA, CA 90403 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CA). This business is conduct-
ed by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: KAREN JASHINSKY, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351034.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138033
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AMERICAN SMOG CHECK CENTER, 4732 MAN-
HATTAN BEACH, LAWNDALE, CA 90260. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ALI SORAYAZADEH, 21003
LADEENE AVE C, TORRANCE, CA 90503. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ALI SORAYAZADEH, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351039.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138035
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PURE CLEAN, 1011 N. BENDER AVE, COVINA,
CA 91724. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: VERONICA
RENNER, 1011 N. BENDER AVE, COVINA, CA
91724. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: VERONICA REN-
NER, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 04/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351040.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138174
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ARC EXPRESS, 8561 DE SOTO AVE UNIT 247,
CANOGA PARK, CA 91304. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ANTTON RAY CONWAY, 8561 DE SOTO
AVE UNIT 247, CANOGA PARK, CA 91304, VALE-
RIA CONWAY, 8561 DE SOTO AVE APT 247,
CANOGA PARK, CA 91304. This business is con-
ducted by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ANTTON RAY CONWAY, HUSBAND. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351066.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138396
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ID SIGN, 4780 WHITTIER BLVD, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90022. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: RUBEN
CENTENO, 4780 WHITTIER BLVD, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90022. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: RUBEN
CENTENO, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-

les County on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351130.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138924
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
OLIVARES PAINTERS, 1589 1/2 W 29TH ST, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90007. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
CARLOS DAVID OLIVARES CARRILLO, 1589 1/
2 W 29TH ST, LOS ANGELES, CA 90007. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: CARLOS DAVID OLIVARES
CARRILLO, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351237.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139167
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FRAMEAUDIO, 400 N. HOLLYWOOD WAY #210,
BURBANK, CA 91505. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
DARYL FRAME, 400 N. HOLLYWOOD WAY
#210, BURBANK, CA 91505. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: DARYL FRAME, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351280.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139197
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
DM'S LIVE SCAN AND SERVICES, 1930
WILSHIRE BLVD SUITE 204, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90057. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: WALTER MAR-
TINEZ, 2710 QUEEN ST APT 1, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90039. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: WALTER
MARTINEZ, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2014. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351284.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139330
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GORDON LEE DECOR, 2066 GLENCOE WAY,
HOLLYWOOD, CA 90068. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: 2066 GLENCOE WAY, HOLLYWOOD, CA
90068. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
GORDON LEE SCHROEDER, 2066 GLENCOE
WAY, HOLLYWOOD, CA 90068. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: GORDON LEE SCHROEDER, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 05/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
05/31/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351307.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139334
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TADEVOSYAN MOVING SERVICES, 1132 E CAL-
IFORNIA AVE APT 8, GLENDALE, CA 91206.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: BAGRAT TADEVSOYAN,
1132 E CALIFORNIA AVE APT 8, GLENDALE,
CA 91206. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: BAGRAT
TADEVSOYAN, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351309.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139371
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BUTLER'S NAIL BOUTIQUE, 500 N. WILLOW-
BROOK AVE P4, COMPTON, CA 90220. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: LAMICIA BUTLER, 500 N.
WILLOWBROOK AVE P4, COMPTON, CA 90220.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: LAMICIA BUTLER,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351316.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139532
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CFB CONSULTING, 1098 S. SYCAMORE AVE.,,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90019. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: RYAN CARSON, 1098 S. SYCAMORE AVE.,,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90019. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: RYAN CARSON, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA351352.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139543
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TPA SOLUTIONS, 1128 ALAMEDA AVE #4, GLEN-
DALE, CA 91201. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: TIGRAN
ALEKSANOVICH PETROSYAN, 1128 ALAMEDA
AVE #4, GLENDALE, CA 91201. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: TIGRAN ALEKSANOVICH PETROSYAN,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351357.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139564
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:

1. DOG JOG, 2. DOGJOG, 3727 COLONIAL AVE.,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90066. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: JUDY-LYNNE REGINA DEANE, 3727 CO-
LONIAL AVE., LOS ANGELES, CA 90066. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: JUDY-LYNNE REGINA
DEANE, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351363.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139851
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MARINA NAILS SPA, 2570 LINCOLN BLVD, VEN-
ICE, CA 90291. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MINH TO
NGUYEN, 4203 ARTESIA BLVD, TORRANCE,
CA 90504. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MINH TO
NGUYEN, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351444.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139979
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HEARTLINE CARE, 17138 WITZMAN DR, LA
PUENTE, CA 91744. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LILIA
R. DEL ROSARIO, 17138 WITZMAN DR, LA
PUENTE, CA 91744. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
LILIA R. DEL ROSARIO, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351487.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017140822
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
VALENCIA EYECARE, 25172 RYE CANYON
ROAD, VALENCIA, CA 91355. Mailing address if
different: 28732 CALLE PLATA COURT, VALEN-
CIA, CA 91354. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ANTELOPE VALLEY FAMILY OPTOME-
TRY, 2720 E. PALMDALE BLVD. SUITE 133, PALM-
DALE, CA 93550 (State of Incorporation/Organi-
zation: CA). This business is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: PAUL LIN,
PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 11/2005. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/
2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351607.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141044
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TOSHACC, 1080 ELKGROVE AVENUE, VENICE,
CA 90291. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: GONZALO AGU-
IRREGOMEZCORTA, 1080 ELKGROVE AVENUE,
VENICE, CA 90291. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
GONZALO AGUIRREGOMEZCORTA, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/01/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351646.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141426
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SHANRA, 3640 S SEPULVEDA BLVD APT 339,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90034. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ARSHAN SAMNEJAD, 3640 S SEPULVEDA
BLVD APT 339, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ARSHAN SAMNEJAD, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351733.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141611
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RAPID SIGN INSTALLATION, 12311 TELEGRAPH
RD., SANTA FE SPRINGS, CA 90670. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: BLUE SAND INC., 12311 TELE-
GRAPH RD., SANTA FE SPRINGS, CA 90670.
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: YASMIN MELENDEZ,
PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 03/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/
2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351774.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME 2017142507
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of
the fictitious business name(s): PALETERIA Y
FRUTERIA CANCUN, 12012 PARAMOUNT
BLVD, DOWNEY, CA 90242. The fictitious busi-
ness name(s) referred to above was filed on: 09-
23-2016 in the County of Los Angeles. Original
File No. 2016235265. Full name of Registrant(s):
PALETERIA Y FRUTERIA CANCUN, INC., 12012
PARAMOUNT BLVD, DOWNEY, CA 90242. This
business is conducted by: CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true,
information which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: SANDRA C. CORO-
NA, PRESIDENT. This statement was filed with
the Los Angeles County Clerk on 06/02/2017.
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351788.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142296
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. PACIFIC COAST CONSTRUCTION & ROOF-
ING, 2. C & HOSPITALITY GROUP INO, 939 S.
WILTON PLACE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90019.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: JAY RHEE, 939 S. WILTON
PLACE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90019. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: JAY RHEE, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business names listed above on (date):
6/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).

Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351789.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142297
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. THE T SHIRT MOVEMENT, 2. THE TSM, 1814
9TH ST. APT. 5, SANTA MONICA, CA 90404.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: DAMON TAYLOR MUR-
PHY, 1814 9TH ST. APT. 5, SANTA MONICA, CA
90404, DOROTHY BEAZER, 1814 9TH ST. APT.
5, SANTA MONICA, CA 90404. This business is
conducted by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: DAMON TAYLOR MURPHY, HUS-
BAND. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business names list-
ed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351790.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143274
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: A
D ELECTRIC, 12648 SOUTH ST, CERRITOS, CA
90703. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: A D SOLAR INC,
12648 SOUTH ST, CERRITOS, CA 90703 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: ANTHONY EMMANUEL, OWN-
ER/CEO. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/16/17. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351792.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141776
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. STARBURST REALTY, 2. STARBURST INVEST-
MENTS, 3. STARBURST INSURANCE, 4067
HARDWICK STREET #509, LAKEWOOD, CA
90712. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: DEEXTREME INC,
4067 HARDWICK STREET #509, LAKEWOOD,
CA 90712, DALIDA LIM, 4067 HARDWICK
STREET #509, LAKEWOOD, CA 90712. This busi-
ness is conducted by: COPARTNERS. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: DALIDA LIM, CO-PARTNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business names listed above
on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/01/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351837.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142778
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ULA CONSULTING, 9827 BURGEN AVE., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90034. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
URSZULA EISEN, 9827 BURGEN AVE., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90034. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
URSZULA EISEN, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351977.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143123
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FACE OF COLORS, 1839 1/4 CORDOVA STREET,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90007. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: SILVIA HERNANDEZ, 1839 1/4 CORDOVA
STREET, LOS ANGELES, CA 90007. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: SILVIA HERNANDEZ, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA352051.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143211
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. SOLOMAC, 2. SOLOMAC MARKETING, 449 S.
KINGSLEY DRIVE APT 101, LOS ANGELES, CA
90020. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ADAM SOLOMON,
449 S. KINGSLEY DRIVE APT. 101, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90020, YUMI KANG, 449 S. KINGSLEY
DRIVE APT 101, LOS ANGELES, CA 90020. This
business is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ADAM
SOLOMON, PARTNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352077.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144350
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BEAUTIQUE, 27 W MAIN STREET UNIT C, AL-
HAMBRA, CA 91801. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JO-
SEPHEEN MUI TSAN, 133 FANO STREET, AR-
CADIA, CA 91006. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
JOSEPHEEN MUI TSAN, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA352087.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144106
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. B2RE WESTSIDE, 2. B SQUARED REAL ES-
TATE WESTSIDE, 12409 WALSH, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90066. Mailing address if different: N/A.
Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number:
C3995170. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
B2RE CORPORATION, 12409 WALSH, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90066. This business is conducted
by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MICHAEL CRAIG BROOKS, CFO. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business names listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352088.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME 2017144177
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of
the fictitious business name(s): 1. TLD LAW, 2.
TLDLAW, 3900 KILROY AIRPORT WAY SUITE

240, LONG BEACH, CA 90806. The fictitious busi-
ness name(s) referred to above was filed on: 01/
20/2016 in the County of Los Angeles. Original
File No. 2017144177. Full name of Registrant(s):
MARK C. DOYLE, 2010 MAIN STREET, SUITE
1000, IRVINE, CA 92614, DANIEL R. GOLD.,
2010 MAIN STREET, SUITE 1000, IRVINE, CA
92614, SHANNON M. JENKINS, 2010 MAIN
STREET, SUITE 1000, IRVINE, CA 92614, JEN-
NIFER N. SAWDAY, 3900 KILROY AIRPORT
WAY SUITE 240, LONG BEACH, CA 90806, JEN-
NIFER A. LUMSDAINE, 3900 KILROY AIRPORT
WAY SUITE 240, LONG BEACH, CA 90806, MAT-
THEW L. KINLEY, 3900 KILROY AIRPORT WAY
SUITE 240, LONG BEACH, CA 90806, ROY J.
JIMENEZ, 3900 KILROY AIRPORT WAY SUITE
240, LONG BEACH, CA 90806, MONICA GOEL,
3900 KILROY AIRPORT WAY SUITE 240, LONG
BEACH, CA 90806. This business is conducted
by: LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true, infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ROY J. JIMENEZ, MANAG-
ING PARTNER OF TREDWAY, LUMSDAINE &
DOYLE, LLP. This statement was filed with the
Los Angeles County Clerk on 06/05/2017. Pub-
lish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA352089.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144105
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HRACH LEVONI JEWELRY, 411 W 7TH STREET
#613, LOS ANGELES, CA 90014. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ARTSRUN OGANESYAN, 701 N 1ST
STREET, MONTEBELLO, CA 90640. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: ARTSRUN OGANESYAN, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA352090.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144179
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LUISA + SON BARBERSHOP, 2530 SANTA FE
AVE, LONG BEACH, CA 90810. Mailing address if
different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organi-
zation Number: 4009141. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: J YALA CORPORATION, 2530
SANTA FE AVE, LONG BEACH, CA 90810. This
business is conducted by: CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MARINAO SARMIEN-
TO JR, SECRETARY. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/
2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352091.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144104
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HYPERSPACE, 87 N RAYMOND AVE, PASADE-
NA, CA 91103. Mailing address if different: N/A.
Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number:
C3395385. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
ARGOWORKS INC, 87 N RAYMOND AVE, PAS-
ADENA, CA 91103 (State of Incorporation/Organi-
zation: CALIFORNIA). This business is conducted
by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
BRETT GORDON, CEO. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352092.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144178
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FANTASTIC HAIR AND NAILS, 15024 IMPERIAL
HWY, LA MIRADA, CA 90638. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: TOCHAU M DINH, 10582 SYCAMORE AVE,
STANTON, CA 90680. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
TOCHAU M DINH, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352093.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144507
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HOPE DISTRIBUCION, 5608 SOUTH SOTO ST
UNIT #3, HUNTINGTON PARK, CA 90255. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorpora-
tion or Organization Number: 821431046. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: HOPE STUDIO
INC, 5608 SOUTH SOTO ST UNIT #3, HUN-
TINGTON PARK, CA 90255 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CA). This business is conduct-
ed by: CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information which he or
she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ESPERANZA HURTADO, PRESIDENT. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA352101.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017118314
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
EIGHTSIXTYSOUTH, 860 S. LOS ANGELES ST.
MEZZ 2, LOS ANGELES, CA 90014. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: KELLY HOWARD CONSULT-
ING LLC, 860 S. LOS ANGELES ST. MEZZ 2,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90014. This business is con-
ducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: KELLY HOWARD,
MANAGING MEMBER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 10/2016. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/09/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/08/2017,
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA343172.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017119417
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
L.E.D. HANDYMAN SERVICES, 4023 ROSE-
MEAD BOULEVARD, PICO RIVERA, CA 90660.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: SHAUN GETTLER, 4023
ROSEMEAD BLVD, PICO RIVERA, CA 90660
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: SHAUN GETTLER, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/09/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
BD. Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017,
06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA343425.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017119433
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LBCINO, 2114 MYRTLE AVE, LONG BEACH, CA
90806. Mailing address if different: PO BOX 555,
MAYWOOD, CA 90270. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ALLAN J DIAZ, 2114 MYRTLE
AVE, LONG BEACH, CA 90806. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
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formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ALLAN J DIAZ, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/09/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/08/2017,
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA343430.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017120253
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ULTIMATE BRANDS GROUP, 23679 CALABASAS
ROAD SUITE 766, CALABASAS, CA 91302. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ROGER STEWART BLOX-
BERG, 22198 HIBISCUS HILL DRIVE, WOOD-
LAND HILLS, CA 91367, TODD JAY HELFSTEIN,
6135 BRYNDALE, KOA PARK, CA 91377. This
business is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ROGER
STEWART BLOXBERG, GENERAL PARTNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/10/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
BD. Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017,
06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA343555.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017120621
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GLOW!, 18319 OAKMONT DRIVE UNIT 840,
SANTA CLARITA, CA 91387. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MARLA B. JONES, 18319 OAKMONT DRIVE
UNIT 840, SANTA CLARITA, CA 91387. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: MARLA B. JONES, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/10/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA343694.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017122166
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TRIOME, 19360 RINALDI ST. #395, PORTER
RANCH, CA 91326. Mailing address if different:
N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization Num-
ber: 3299909. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: J8 INC., 19360 RINALDI ST. #395, PORTER
RANCH, CA 91326 (State of Incorporation/Orga-
nization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
TALJON DERUITER, TREASURER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/11/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). BD.
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA343997.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017122444
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
EXIT 8B ENTERTAINMENT, 1818 MICHEL TORE-
NA ST, LOS ANGELES, CA 90026. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: MICHAEL PAGE, 1818 MICH-
EL TORENA ST, LOS ANGELES, CA 90026,
JAMES BUSS, 1818 MICHEL TORENA ST, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90026. This business is conducted
by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MICHAEL PAGE, PARTNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/11/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). BD.
Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA344074.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017122732
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BONEFACE ENTERPRISES, 2601 E. VICTORIA
SP 407, COMPTON, CA 90220. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MARK GOINS, 2601 E. VICTORIA SP 407,
COMPTON, CA 90220. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MARK GOINS, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 11/2016.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/12/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/08/2017,
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA344115.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017123478
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ARTURO MEZA MONUMENTS, 4004 WHITTIER
BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023. Mailing address
if different: 201 E. HAMMEL ST. #G, MONTEREY
PARK, CA 91755. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: CAROLINE TINAJERO ZAVALA, 201 E.
HAMMEL ST. #G, MONTEREY PARK, CA 91755.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: CAROLINE TINAJERO
ZAVALA, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 01/1997. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/12/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/08/2017,
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA344303.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME 2017120282
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of
the fictitious business name(s): OGG TRADING,
1108 W. VALLEY BLVD SUIT 6 255, ALHAMBRA,
CA 91083. The fictitious business name(s) referred
to above was filed on: JANUARY 13, 2015 in the
County of Los Angeles. Original File No.
2015010012. Full name of Registrant(s): KA MING
DANNY LIT, 4911 BLEECKER ST, BALDWIN
PARK, CA 91706. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true, information which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) Signed: KA MING
DANNY LIT, OWNER. This statement was filed
with the Los Angeles County Clerk on 05/10/2017.
BD. Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017,
06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA343563.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017123405
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TUMBLE TYME ALL STARS, 20855 VENTURA
BLVD # 5, WOOD LAND HILLS, CA 91364. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: KRISTEN SEDGWICK, 5333
CAPTAINS PL, AGOURA HILLS, CA 91301. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: KRISTEN SEDGWICK, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/12/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). BD. Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017,
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-

LEY EXAMINER. AAA344283.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017123687
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NOAH'S ARK SERVICES, 469 EAST PROVIDEN-
CIA AVENUE UNIT D, BURBANK, CA 91501.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: DAISY RAE REYES, 469
EAST PROVIDENCIA AVENUE UNIT D, BUR-
BANK, CA 91501. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: DAISY
RAE REYES, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 01/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/12/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/08/2017,
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345018.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017124008
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE ORANGUTAN PROJECT - USA, 1508 BER-
KELEY ST UNIT D, SANTA MONICA, CA 90404.
Mailing address if different: 2461 SANTA MONICA
BLVD #828, SANTA MONICA, CA 90404. Articles
of Incorporation or Organization Number: 3014617.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ORANG
UTAN REPUBLIK FOUNDATION INC, 1508 BER-
KELEY ST UNIT D, SANTA MONICA, CA 90404
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CALIFOR-
NIA). This business is conducted by: CORPORA-
TION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: GARY L.
SHAPIRO, PRESIDENT. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): DEC. 22,
2016. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/15/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
BD. Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017,
06/29/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA345103.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017124595
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
&QUOT;JADE'S OUTLET&QUOT;, 1787 FIRE-
STONE BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90001. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: CATALINA PANTOJA AGUI-
LAR, 942 E 111TH DR., LOS ANGELES, CA 90059.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: CATALINA PANTOJA
AGUILAR, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/15/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/08/2017, 06/
15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345237.

June 15, Start

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAMES STATEMENT
2017 149606

The following person(s) is (are) doing business as
CAM’S DENTAL LAB, 240 W. BADILLO ST.,
COVINA, CA 91723, LOS ANGELES COUNTY,
1020 W. HAWTHORNE ST., ONTARIO, CA 91762.
Full name of registrant(s) is (are) CAMMY C. REED,
1020 W. HAWTHORNE ST., ONTARIO, CA 91762.
This business is conducted by AN INDIVIDUAL.
The registrant(s) has begun to transact business
07/2012 under the fictitious business name listed
herein. Signed: CAMMY C. REED, OWNER. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles on 06/09/17. NOTICE - THIS FICTITIOUS
NAME STATEMENT EXPIRES FIVE YEARS FROM
DATE IT WAS FILED FROM THE OFFICE OF
THE COUNTY CLERK. A NEW FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT MUST BE FILED
PRIOR TO THAT DATE.  The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(See Section 14411, et seq, Business and
Professional Code.) Publish: June 15, 22, 29,
July 6, 2017, San Gabriel Valley Examiner / / Ad
#F300

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAMES STATEMENT
2017 143871

The following person(s) is (are) doing business as
FRANK C. MEYERS COUNCIL #5271, 2024
ROUTE 66, GLENDORA CA 91741, LOS
ANGELES COUNTY, P.O. BOX 2072, GLENDORA,
CA 91740. Full name of registrant(s) is (are)
MICHAEL LAMBERTI, 254 N. GREENCROFT
AVE., GLENDORA, CA 91741, DOUG HARMAN,
119 W. RONWOOD ST., GLENDORA, CA 91740.
This business is conducted by A GENERAL
PARTNERSHIP. The registrant(s) has begun to
transact business 04/1962 under the fictitious
business name listed herein. Signed: MICHAEL
LAMBERTI, PARTNER. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles on 06/05/17.
NOTICE - THIS FICTITIOUS NAME STATEMENT
EXPIRES FIVE YEARS FROM DATE IT WAS
FILED FROM THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY
CLERK. A NEW FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT MUST BE FILED PRIOR TO THAT
DATE.  The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (See Section
14411, et seq, Business and Professional Code.)
Publish: June 15, 22, 29, July 6, 2017, San
Gabriel Valley Examiner / / Ad #F301

CNBB241701AC FILE NO.2017134055
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CHAPLIN SILKSCREEN 4377 S. HUNTINGTON
DR LOS ANGELES CA 90032. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ANDRES HERNANDEZ 4377 S.
HUNTINGTON DR LOS ANGELES CA 90032.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner    CNBB241701AC

CNBB241702MU FILE NO.2017133812
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BANKERS HOME LOANS 8060 FLORENCE AV-
ENUE SUITE 209 DOWNEY CA 90240. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ANTONIO AGUILAR 8060
FLORENCE AVENUE SUITE 209 DOWNEY CA
90240. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241702MU

CNBB241703MU FILE NO.2017133871
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: SR
WATCH REPAIRS & DIALS 412 W. 6TH ST STE
710 LOS ANGELES CA 90014.  Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) STEPHANIE REYNOSO 412
W. 6TH ST STE 710 LOS ANGELES CA 90014.
The business is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241703MU

CNBB241704MU FILE NO.2017134534
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
LAMPAC SPECIALTY 394 S. PROSPECTORS RD
UNIT #104 DIAMOND BAR CA 91765. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) YUEHCHU WANG LIN
394 S PROSPECTORS RD UNIT #104 DIAMOND
BAR CA 91765. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above

on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241704MU

CNBB241705JL FILE NO.2017134576
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KASH WHOLESALE 101 S MAIN ST POMONA
CA 91766; 3 LA SIERRA DR POMONA CA 91766.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JE GROUP
INCORPRATED 101 S MAIN ST POMONA CA
91766. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241705JL

CNBB241706ED FILE NO.2017134318
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NCR PROPERTIES 17345 LOS ALIMOS ST
GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) CAESAR RODRIGUEZ 17345
LOS ALIMOS ST GRANADA HILLS CA 91344.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241706ED

CNBB241707ED FILE NO.2017134074
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business
as:DOOR TO DOOR VAN LINES 21622 PLUM-
MBER ST #B CHATSWORTH CA 91311.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) LOGISTICS AGENT INC
21622 PLUMMBER ST #B CHATSWORTH CA
91311. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241707ED

CNBB241708ED FILE NO.2017134335
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: 3D
ARCHITECTUAL DESIGNS 1265 SPAZIER AVE
GLENDALE CA 91201. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) HAKOP TISHAKADJIAN 1265 SPAZIER
AVE GLENDALE CA 91201. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/24/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241708ED

CNBB241709EL FILE NO.2017133795
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BLUE ANGELS GARDENING 8217 HAZELTINE
AVE PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ANGLIZ SERVICES INC
8217 HAZELTINE AVE PONORAMA CITY CA
91402. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner        CNBB241709EL

CNBB241710EL FILE NO.2017133869
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MERCURY'S MEDICAL TRANSPORT SERVICE
3200 N. SAN FERNANDO BLVD STE 28 BUR-
BANK CA 91504. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) WHITE LIGHTING TRANSPORTATION SER-
VICE 6858 LANGDON AVE VAN NUYS CA 91406.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner  CNBB241710EL

CNBB241711EL FILE NO.2017113486
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as THE
MONINA'S SHOP 16833 SHERMAN WAY VAN
NUYS CA 91406. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) VERONICA RODRIGUEZ 16833 SHERMAN
WAY VAN NUYS CA 91406.The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/03/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241711EL

CNBB241712EL FILE NO.2017134254
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HOUSE OF TENS ; LA LA THE BRAND;DUO
5115 DOUGLAS FIR RD UNIT 1 CALABASAS CA
9102;25480 PRADO DE ORO CALABASAS CA
91302. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) BARRE
SOCKS LLC 25480 PRADO DE ORO CALABA-
SAS CA 91302. The business is conducted by: A
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/24/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 01/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241712EL

CNBB241713OSCAR FILE NO.2017133833
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ADENA'S GATE & RAILING 8239 LANKERSHIM
BLVD NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) JAN AMIRIAN 8239 LANK-
ERSHIM BLVD NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
24/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five

years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241713OSCAR

CNBB241714OSCAR FILE NO.2017134667
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SAPIR COSNTRUCTION 4808 DENSMORE AVE
ENCINO CA 91436. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) FARIN DESIGN LLC 4808 DENSMORE AVE
ENCINO CA 91436. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/24/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241714OSCAR

CNBB241715ED FILE NO.2017135803
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KALINKA GIFT SHOP 7771 SANTA MONICA BLVD
WEST HOLLYWOOD CA 90046. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) BAGGATI INC 7771 SANTA
MONICA BLVD WEST HOLLYWOOD CA 90046.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 04/10/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241715ED

CNBB241716ED FILE NO.2017136102
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
STYLE OF DESIGN; THE STYLE OF DESIGN
12430 MONTAGUE ST # 205 PACOIMA CA 91331;
1816 CLEVELAND RD GLENDALE CA 91202.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LNS GROUP
INC 1816 CLEVELAND RD GLENDALE CA 91202.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241716ED

CNBB241717ED FILE NO.2017135595
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
JONMART EXPRESS 1830 SIMSBURRY ST PALM-
DALE CA 93550. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MANUEL SANTOS MARTINEZ PEREZ 1830
SIMBURRY ST PALMDALE CA 93550.The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/25/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241717ED

CNBB241718OSCAR FILE NO.2017135476
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE DENTAL STUDIO 17175 VENTURA BLVD
ENCINO CA 91316; 14859 GREENLEAF STREET
SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) TSOLAR HOUSEPIAN DDS, INC
14859 GREENLEAF STREET SHERMAN OAKS
CA 91403. The business is conducted by: A COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/17. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241718OSCAR

CNBB231719EL FILE NO.2017136128
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: O.L
CONSTRUCTION 5031 FAIR AVE APT 536
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91601. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) OMER IZHAK LEW 5031
FAIR AVE APT 536 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA
91601. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on
2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241719EL

CNBB241720PS FILE NO.2017136213
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROYE SMALL FAMILY HOME 21016 BLYTHE ST
CANOGA PARK CA 91304. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) MARJORIE ANGELA ROYE 21016
BLYTHE ST CANOGA PARK CA 91304. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on . NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner CNBB241720PS

CNBB241721OSCAR FILE NO.2017136288
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as the
) LOS ANGELES TOWING DEPARTMENT ; LATD
6629 ½ FULTON AVE VAN NUYS CA 91401. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) GRIGOR KYABAB-
CHYAN 6629 ½ FULTON AVE VAN NUYS CA
91401. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT  commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241721OSCAR

CNBB241722EL FILE NO.2017135027
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AVILA POOL & SPA SERVICE 9160 AQQEDUCT
AVE NORTH HILLS CA 91343. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) ADRIANA AVILA 9160 AQUE-
DUCT AVE NORTH HILLS CA 91343. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name

Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241722EL

CNBB241723EL FILE NO.2017135715
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BLUEBURRY ROYALE FINE CUSTOM
CLOTHES 28623 N. PARKSIDE DR VALENCIA
CA  91354. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) RAVI
V. IYER 28623 N. PARKSIDE DR VALENCIA CA
91354. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241723EL

CNBB241724EL FILE NO.2017136077
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FATAMORGANA 12021 VENTURA BLVD STUDIO
CITY CA 91604; 2934 BEVERLY GLEN CIRCLE
SUITE 327 LOS ANGELES CA 90077. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ARALKA CORPORATION
2934 ½ BEVERLY GLEN CIRCLE SUITE 327
LOS ANGELES CA 90077. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241724EL

CNBB241725MT FILE NO.2017135346
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as;
LUXCIOUS DECORATING & STAGING 915C W.
FOOTHILL BLVD # 489 CLAREMONT CA
91711.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MARIA A
HYNSON 915C W. FOOTHILL BLVD # 489 CLA-
REMONT CA 91711. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL.I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241725MT

CNBB241726  FILE NO.2017135348
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: 818
RASPADOS 915C W. FOOTHILL BLVD #489
CLAREMONT CA 91711. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ALICIA HYNSON ; MELISSA HYN-
SON 915C W. FOOTHILL BLVD # 489 CLARE-
MONT CA 91711. The business is conducted by:
A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP . I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT  commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241726

CNBB241727JEN FILE NO.2017136306
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business GMI
6300 HOLMES AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90001.
SERGIO SURO 6300 HOLMES AVE LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90001. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
SEGIO SURO 6300 HOLMES AVE LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90001. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241727JEN

CNBB241728TC FILE NO.2017135847
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SEA LION REAL ESTATE;TAMMY LOU HOLDEN
64 PINE AVE # 193 LONG BEACH CA 90802;65
PINE AVE # 193 LONG BEACH CA 90802. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) EMMA J BAUSHER
, TRUSTEE OF THE JESRA COMPANY 65 PINE
AVE #193 LONG BEACH CA 90802. The business
is conducted by:  A TRUST . I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 12/2005. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241728TC

CNBB241729TC FILE NO.2017135145
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: ALL
SEASON CLOTHING 6605 FLORA AVE BELL CA
90201;6605 FLORA AVE BELL CA 90201.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) JAIRO FRANCISCO
RAMIREZ VALENCIA 6605 FLORA AVE BELL CA
90201;JORGE HUMBERTO RAMIREZ MAYEN
15208 LAMPLIGHTER CT LAKE ELSINORE CA
92530.The business is conducted by: CO PART-
NERS. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner  CNBB241729TC

CNBB241730MU FILE NO.2017135389
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
IYAN BRUCE ENTERTAINMENT 4843 RADNOR
AVENUE LAKEWOOD CA 90713.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) IYAN M. BRUCE 4843 RAD-
NOR AVENUE LAKEWOOD CA 90713. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 07/1995. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241730MU

CNBB241731DC FILE NO.2017135038
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as EL
SOLECITO BOTANAS 2748 WILLARD AVE UNIT
C ROSEMEAD CA 91770. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) SANTOS TAIMI GARCIA RAMIREZ
2748 WILLARD AVE UNIT C ROSEMEAD CA
91770. The business is conducted by: A INDIVID-
UAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above

on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241731DC

CNBB241732DC FILE NO.2017136060
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
ENM TRANSPORT 620 N JALAPA DR COVINA
CA 91724. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
EDUARDO ORIHUELA 620 N JALAPA DR COV-
INA CA 91724. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2016. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 02/
2010. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241732DC

CNBB241733AC FILE NO.2017135785
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as )
JORGE REYES SNACKS & CHILES 9616 REM-
ER STREET SOUTH EL MONTE CA 91733. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing; 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241733AC

CNBB241734GM FILE NO.2017135032
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
OSCAR LEMUS CARTS SERVICE 1119 GOLD-
EN WEST AVE SANTA ANA CA 92704. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) OSCAR MODESTO LE-
MUE GARCIA 1119 GOLDEN WEST AVE SANTA
ANA CA 92704. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing:; 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241734GM

CNBB241735GM FILE NO.2017135841
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FASION DEAL PRODUCTS ; DFASHIO ACCES-
SORIES 1308 BATEY PLACE HARBOR CITY CA
90710. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) FAH-
MEEDA P. KHAN 1308 BATEY PLACE HARBOR
CITY CA 90710.The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241735RM

CNBB241736JL  FILE NO.2017135869
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ATM TECH 12016 BULLIS RD LYNWOOD CA
90262. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DAVID
E. ESCALANTE; RAUL VICENTE ; GONZALO
ABSALON ESCALANTE III 12016 BULLIS RD
LYNWOOD CA 90262. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/25/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 03/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241736JL

CNBB241737JL FILE NO.2017135072
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AEROTRAVEL Y SERVICES 2338 E ANAHEIM
ST 101A LONG BEACH CA 90804. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JAVIER RAMIREZ 2338 E
ANAHEIM ST 101 A LONG BEACH CA 90804.The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2002. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241737JL

CNBB241738JL FILE NO.2017135130
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as) LA-
YY ;LEGENDS COLLECTOR;DEK PROT 13321
ALONDRA BLVD #K SANT FE SPRINGS CA
90670. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JANVI-
TY INC 13321 ALONDRA BLVD #K SANTA FE
SPRINGS CA 90670. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241738JL

CNBB241739ET FILE NO.2017136999
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LOUIS BURGERS #4 1311 W CARSON ST TOR-
RANCE CA 90501. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CHRISTINA MARANGOS 770 ROSWELL
AVE #6 LONG BEACH CA 90804. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241739ET

CNBB241740JEN FILE NO.2017137656
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
EXPIDITE MEDICAL BILLING 1645 KEYSTONE
ST SUITE #214 POMONA CA 91767. IYARE
ALLEN OGBEIWI 1645 KEYSTONE ST SUITE
#214 POMONA CA 91767.Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) IYARE ALLEN OGBEIWI 1645 KEY-
STONE ST SUITE #214 POMONA CA 91767. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The

filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 San Gabriel Valley Exam-
iner     CNBB241740JEN

CNBB241741TC FILE NO.2017137056
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: S
AND S AUTO REGISTRATION SERVICE 14731
GARFIELD AVE PARAMOUNT CA 90723. The
business is conducted by:  A CORORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 09/2006. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241741TC

CNBB241742TC FILE NO.2017136863
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
M.A. CAR TECH 1412 N. WILMINGTON BLVD
STE D WILMINGTON CA 90744. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MARCO ANTONIO VAZQU-
EZ VILLARRUEL ; ARMANDO GARCIA-CRUZ
1412 N. WILMINGTON BLVD STE D WILMING-
TON CA 90744. The business is conducted by: A
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 05/28/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names
listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/
06/17  The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241742TC

CNBB241743IF FILE NO.2017136994
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
LAVISHLY CHIC BROWS 14567 LEFFINGWELL
ROAD WHITTIER CA 90604; 3825 FOSTER AVE
BALWIN PARK CA 91706. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) KEVIN DORK 3825 FOSTER AVE BALD-
WIN PARK CA 91706 The business is conducted
by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB241743IF

CNBB241744IF FILE NO.2017137054
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
RCS FLOOR & CARPET CARE 229 W GLAD-
STONE ST SAN DIMAS CA 91773;PO BOX 4303
SAN DIMAS CA 91773.Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) ROBERT CROWLEY JR 229 W GLAD-
STONE ST SAN DIMAS CA 91773. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 09/2002. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241744IF

CNBB241745GM FILE NO.2017136565
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: RA
RA CO ; RA & RA CO 610 S BROADWAY # 306A
LOS ANGELES CA 90014. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) RAKHAMIM MOGHTADER 610 S
BROADWAY # 306A LOS ANGELES CA 90014.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241745GM

CNBB241746GM FILE NO.2017137036
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BLISSFUL MASSAGE 9024 SLAUSON AVE SPC
G PICO RIVERA CA 90660. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) RAFAEL ORNELAS HERNAN-
DEZ ; RUBI GARCIA 8348 TERRADELL ST PICO
RIVERA CA 90660.The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  NOT Commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241746GM

CNBB241747DC FILE NO.2017136902
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
YENNYSTYLES 4318 SANTO TOMAS DRIVE
APT C LOS ANGELES CA 90008. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) YENIFER JOSEPHY DU-
QUE AVILA 4316 SANTO TOMAS DRIVE APT C
LOS ANGELES CA 90008. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)NOT  commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241747DC

CNBB241748DC FILE NO.2017136421
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GRACE INSULATION 1288 N PNE NEEDLES CT
AZUSA CA 91702. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ADOLFO DELGADO ALVAREZ 1288 N PINE
NEEDLES CT AZUSA CA 91702. The business is
conducted by: AN IDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241748DC

CNBB241749DC FILE NO.2017137198
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
THE KING CRAB 4174 TWEEDY BLVD SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
EL REY FOOD INC 11537 GARVEY AVE EL
MONTE CA 91732. The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION . I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
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fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17  The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241768MU

CNBB241769MU FILE NO.2017140917
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
HERMAN THEREADING STUDIO 14561 TELE-
GRAPH RD LA MIRADA CA 90638. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) RENNA PREET KAUR DE-
HAL 14561 TELEGRAPH RD LA MIRADA CA
90638. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241769MU

CNBB241770MU FILE NO.2017141280
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: MK
MEATS 838 PINE AVE UNIT 206 LONG BEACH
CA 90813; PO BOX 565 LONG BEACH CA
90801.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MICAH
A. KIRTON 838 PINE AVE UNIT 206 LONG
BEACH CA 90813. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241770MU

CNBB241771MU  FILE NO.2017141572
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AUDREMO BARBERSHOP 2085 S. ATLANTIC
BLVD #A MONTEREY PARK CA 91754. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) GUILLERMO GONZALEZ
2085 S. ATLANTIC BLVD #A MONTEREY PARK
CA 91754. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241771MU

CNBB241772JL FILE NO.2017141523
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ALPHA GENERAL BUILDERS 9303 BALFOUR
ST PICO RIVERA CA 90660. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) FRANCISCO GAMA 9303 BAL-
FOUR ST PICO RIVERA CA 90660. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241772JL

CNBB241773JL FILE NO.2017140906
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: EL
PLEBE CAR WASH 4121 E FLORENCE AVE
UNIT C BELL CA 90201. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JOSE E JIMENEZ VENEGAS; ARACE-
LY BARRIENTOS 4121 E FLORENCE AVE UNIT
C BELL CA 90201. The business is conducted by:
A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241773JL

CNBB241774SN FILE NO.2017141882
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
BERNAL TRUCKING 2800 KANSAS AVE SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
EDWIN BERNAL 2800 KANSAS AVE SOUTH GATE
CA 90280. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
25/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241774SN

CNBB241775RM FILE NO.2017141713
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NEW AGE EMERGING MARKETS 13329 MEAD-
OW WOOD LANE GRANADA HILLS CA
91344.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) NEW
AGE STRATEGIES INC 13329 MEADOW WOOD
LANE GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241775RM

CNBB241776RM FILE NO.2017141661
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MOON WASH INC 7441 LAUREL CYN BLVD
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MOON WASH INC 7441
LAUREL CYN BLVD NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA
91605. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 04/
18/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241776RM

CNBB241777RM FILE NO.2017141878
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: AIR
CARE 7028 CHIMINEAS AVE RESEDA CA 91335.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LIDOR LEVI
7028 CHIMINEAS AVE RESEDA CA 91335.  The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241777RM

CNBB241778RM FILE NO.2017141880
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The

following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ALL GRANDE DOORS REPAIR 5333 AGNES
AVE #3 VALLEY VILLAGE CA 91607. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) OSHRI BENAIM 5333 AGNES
AVE #3 VALLEY VILLAGE CA 91607. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241778RM

CNBB241779RM FILE NO.2017141876
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
INNOVATIE KITCHEN & BATH 8600 MASON AVE
WINNETKA CA 91306. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) SANAM CHADROUZ 17830 MERRIDY
ST #211 NORTHRIDGE CA 91325.  The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/
06/17  The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241779RM

CNBB241780RM FILE NO.2017141735
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NEW AGE US MARKETS 13329 MEADOW WOOD
LANE GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) NEW AGE STRATEGIES
INC 13329 MEADOW WOOD LANE GRANADA
HILLS CA 91344. The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241780RM

CNBB241781RM FILE NO.2017141741
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NEW AGE BOND & DIVIDEND 13329 MEADOW
WOOD LANE GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) NEW AGE STRAT-
EGIES INC 13329 MEADOW WOOD LANE
GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. The business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01//2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17  The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241781RM

CNBB241782PS FILE NO.2017141522
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CRYSTAL WATER 322 SO. BROADWAY LOS
ANGELES CA 90013. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CARLOS QUAN 322 SO. BROADWAY LOS
ANGELES CA 90013.The business is conducted
by:  AN INDIVIDUAL.I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 03/01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241782PS

CNBB241783ED FILE NO.2017141064
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SHUYS JUST FOR KICKS SOCCER 8460
KELVIN AVE WINNETKA CA 91306. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JEFF SHUMAKER 8460
KELVIN AVE WINNETKA CA 91306. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  NOT commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241783ED

CNBB241784ED FILE NO.2017141163
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DIAMOND PET SALON 19936 VENTURA BLVD
WOODLAND HILLS CA 91364. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) JONATHAN A MAYEN 9051
LAUREL CNY BLVD # 24 SUN VALLEY CA 91352.
The business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241784ED

CNBB241785ED FILE NO.2017141694
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CAMINO DRAPE SHADE & BLIND CLEANERS
24101 VICTORY BLVD WEST HILLS CA 91307.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DANIEL B.
LEVY 24101 VICTORY BLVD WEST HILLS CA
91307. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241785ED

CNBB241786ED FILE NO.2017141772
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MID VALLEY MOVERS 1506 5TH ST GLENDALE
CA 91201. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
KAREN SARKISYAN 1506 5TH ST GLENDALE
CA 91201. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNB241786ED

CNBB241787ED FILE NO.2017141892
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VITA NATURE PLUS 117 OLIVE ST #C GLEN-
DALE CA 91206.  Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) HAYK NOVRAZYAN 117 OLIVE ST #C GLEN-
DALE CA 91206. The business is conducted by:

AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/01/2017 The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241787ED

CNBB241788EL FILE NO.2017140803
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FERROSIA 8110 GRAYSTONE ST SUNLAND CA
91040.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ARAYIK
TSARUKYAN 8110 GRAYSTONE ST SUNLAND
CA 91040. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241788EL

CNBB241789EL FILE NO.2017141338
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LOLA'S CHICKEN CAFÉ; LOLA'S CHICKEN
GRILL 14851 VICTORY BLVD SUITE C VAN
NUYS CA 91411. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MILAGROS TERESA VELA 26053 SALIN-
GER LN STEVENSON RANCH CA 91381. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241789EL

CNBB241790EL FILE NO.2017141791
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
EMERGE ATHLETIX 201 E ANGELENO AVE #319
BURBANK CA 91502. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) PAUL WILSON 201 E ANGELENO AVE
#319 BURBANK CA 91502. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241790EL

CNBB241791OSCAR FILE NO.2017141779
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
VCLA ENTERPRISES 7946 LOUISE AVE
NORTHRIDGE CA 91325. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) CESAR ANTONIO ALBANES ;VERA
LUCIA ALBANES 7946 LOUISE AVE NORTHRIDE
CA 91325. The business is conducted by: A CO
PARTNERS. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241791OSCAR

CNBB241792NQ FILE NO.2017141237
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DERRICK WILLIAMS ;D WILLIAMS PRODUC-
TIONS 7088 CHIMINEAS AVE RESEDA CA 91335.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DERRICK WIL-
LIAMS 7088 CHIMINEAS AVE RESEDA CA 91335.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 01/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241792NQ

CNBB241793NQ FILE NO.2017141833
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
WHITE OCEAN ENTERPRISES 16178 COSMO
STREET LOS ANGELES CA 90028; 1617 COS-
MO STREET APP 401 LOS ANGELES CA 90028.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) OSHRI ELMOR-
ICH 1617 COSMO STREET APP 401 LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90028. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241793NQ

CNBB241794MT FILE NO.2017142752
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
JJG TRUCKING 1549 LORANNE AVE POMONA
CA 91767. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
JAMES H. GAMBLES 1549 LORANNE AVE POMO-
NA CA 91767. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241794MT

CNBB241795JL FILE NO.2017143649
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VICTORY IN HIS NAME 13603 RUSSELL ST
WHITTIER CA 90602. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) MOSES ALAN ALCALA;RYAN MACALU-
SO  13603 RUSSELL ST WHITTIER CA 90602.The
business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241795JL

CNBB241796JL FILE NO.2017142016
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: JM
SUPPLY CO 2323 CHICO AVE #7 SOUTH EL
MONTE CA 91733. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) KHAMSANA JIMMY PHIMMASONE 3738
STRANG AVE ROSEMEAD CA 91770.  The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the

County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241796JL

CNBB241797JL FILE NO.2017142929
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MORENA ORG 3923 S HILL ST LOS ANGELES
CA 90037. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MOISES RENDON 3923 S.HILL ST LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90037. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241797JL

CNBB241798JL FILE NO.2017142521
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
PARAGON JANITORIAL 222 W MCKINLEY AVE
#16 POMONA CA 91768. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JOSE LUIS GRANADOS 222 W MCK-
INLEY AE #16 POMONA CA 91768. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241798JL

CNBB241799JEN FILE NO.2017142722
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: I
PATH TRANSPORTATION SERVICES 12016 OLD
RIVER SCHOOOL ROAD DOWNEY CA 90242.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) I PATH TRANS-
PORTATION SERVICES INC 12016 OLD RIVER
SCHOOL ROAD DOWNEY CA90242. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 03/2011. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241799JEN

CNBB2417100JEN FILE NO.2017142979
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CAREY REAL ESTATE; CAREY REAL ESTATE
INSTITUTE CAREY REAL ESTATE  AND LEND-
ING SERVICES; CAREY REAL ESTATE COM-
MERCIAL SERVICES; CAREY REAL ESTATE
HOME SALES AND LENDING SERVICES;
CAREY REAL ESTATE LENDING SERVICES ;
CAREY REAL ESTATE SERVICES 714 HOWARD
AVE CARSON CA 90746. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) CAREY REAL ESTATE INC 714
HOWARD AVE CARSON CA 90746. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 09/2013. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417100JEN

CNBB2417101GM FILE NO.2017143385
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FENIX EPOXI SYNTHETIC FLOORING 11121
ARLEE AVE NORWALK CA 90650. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) IVAN A RODRIGUEZ PARTI-
DA 11121 ARLEE AVE NORWALK CA 90650. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417101GM

CNBB2417102TC FILE NO.2017142905
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WNNY DESIGN COMPANY 2881 W VALLE BLVD
ALHAMBRA CA 91803. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) WEN SHI CA 91403.The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417102TC

CNBB2417103TC FILE NO.2017142970
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: J-
NISSI TRUCK & TRAILER REPAIR 4446 MET-
TLER ST LOS ANGELES CA 90011. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MARIO A. RODRIGUEZ
VARGAS 4446 METTLER ST LOS ANGELES CA
90011. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417103TC

CNBB2417104TC FILE NO.2017124212
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
COCARD 3700 WILSHIRE BLVD STE 955 LOS
ANGELES CA 90010.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) POPINION MS, INC 3700 WILSHIRE BLVD
STE 955 LOS ANGELES CA 90010. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION . I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/15/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417104TC

CNBB2417105TC FILE NO.2017142584
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EVELY'NS MARKET 6501 COMPTON AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90001.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JAQUELINA ORDUNA ALONSO 6501
COMPTON AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90001. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is

guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/17. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417105TC

CNBB2417106AC FILE NO.2017142513
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GUTIERREZ EXCAVATING & DEMOLITION 1505
E PHILLIPS BLVD POMONA CA 91766; 13654
MONTEVERDE DR CHINO HILLS CA 91709. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) JERONIMO GUTI-
ERREZ 13654 MONTEVERDE DR CHINO HILLS
CA 91709. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT  commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417106AC

CNBB2417107AC FILE NO.2017142795
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: K
BAKERY 1258 W TEMPLE ST LOS ANGELES CA
90026. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) TRIN-
IDAD ORTEGA 1258 W TEMPLE ST LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90026. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 01/
1986. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417107AC

CNBB2417108AC FILE NO.2017143600
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: VIP
TAX SOLUTIONS 8034 ATLANTIC AVE STE E
CUDAHY CA 90201. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) FABIAN PARRA CORTES 8034 ATLANTIC
AVE STE E CUDAHY CA 90201. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 11/2015. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417108AC

CNBB2417109DC FILE NO.2017143449
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE GUARDIANS GREEN TUFF.COM 641 E
118TH PL LOS ANGELES CA 90059; 641 E 118TH
PL LOS ANGELES CA 90059. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) RAUL MARTINEZ GOMEZ; NATA-
LIA SANCHEZ ORTIZ 641 E 118TH PL LOS AN-
GELES CA 90059. The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417109DC

CNBB2417110DC FILE NO.2017142048
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FRANCIS BEAUTY SALON 2936 TWEEDY BLVD
SOUTH GATE CA 90280.Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) FRANCISCA AVALOS ALVAREZ 2936
TWEEDY BLVD SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/1993. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417110DC

CNBB2417111SN FILE NO.2017142750
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: IN
AND OUT SMOG TEST ONLY 6356 NEWELL ST
HUNTINGTON PARK CA 90255. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) TAC QUY DO 9891 ASH-
FORD AVE WESTMINSTER CA 92683. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417111SN

CNBB2417113JEN FILE NO.2017139382
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GUZMAN GLASS 3617 WHITTIER BOULEVARD
LOS ANGELES CA 90023.Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) CARLOS GUZMAN 3617 WHITTIER
BOULEVARD LOS ANGELES CA 90023. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 08/2011. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417113JEN

CNBB2417114JEN FILE NO.2017139005
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TOO COOL PET STUFF 2311 PACIFIC AVE SAN
PEDRO CA 90731. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) FREDERICK L BRINKLEY 2311 S PACIFIC
AVE SAN PEDRO CA 90731. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417114JEN

CNBB2417115 FILE NO.2017139633
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: E &
I DEVELOPMENT CONSTRUCTION INC 7825
MORRIL AVE WITTIER CA 90606.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) E & I DEVELOPMENT CON-
STRUCTION INCORPORATED 7825 MORRIL
AVE WHITTIER CA 90606. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The

State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241759GM

CNBB241760GM FILE NO.2017141239
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ALMA'S SPORTS BAR & GRILL 3835 WHITTIER
BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90023. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JAZMIN DEL RIO LOMBRERA
; DANIELA TORREZ 3835 WHITTIER BLVD LOS
ANGELES CA 90023.The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241760GM

CNBB241761GM FILE NO.2017140841
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LG'S CLEANIN 1765 NEIL ARMSTRONG ST #104
MONTEBELLO CA 90640. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) STANLEY BRINKLEY 1765 NEIL ARM-
STRONG ST # 104 MONTEBELLO CA 90640. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241761GM

CNBB241762IF FILE NO.2017141002
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
INLINE SPORTS 2201 N LONG BEACH BLVD
A#21 COMPTON CA 90221;1516 E 68TH ST LONG
BEACH CA 90805. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) NORMA VALLEJO DE VICENTE 1516 E 68TH
ST LONG BEACH CA 90805. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241762IF

CNBB241763IF FILE NO.2017141404
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: IB
TRUCKS LINES 6218 MIDDLETON ST HUNTING-
TON PARK CA 90255. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) IGNACIO BARAJAS 6218 MIDDLETON
ST HUNGTON PARK CA 90255. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2012. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241763IF

CNBB241764JEN FILE NO.2017141374
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FIRST CLASS CAR CLUB 12927 SILVERBOW
AVE NORWALK CA 90650. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) MARK WILSON 12927 SILVER-
BROWAVE NORWALK CA 90650. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing:  06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241764JEN

CNBB241765DC FILE NO.2017141540
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AMOR LINGERIE #3 1716 W WESTERN AVE
LOS ANGELES CA 90006. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JORGE EMILIO MENDOZA 1716
SOUTH WESTERN AVE LOS ANGELES CA
90006. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB241765DC

CNBB241766DC FILE NO.2017141533
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AMOR LINGERIE 2808 A E WASHINGTON BLVD
LOS ANGELES CA 90023.Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JORGE EMILIO MENDOZA 2808 E
WASHINGTON BLVD SUITE A LOS ANGELES
CA 90023. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241766DC

CNBB241767MU FILE NO.2017141057
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NUTRICION GRACE 3410 E N CESAR CHAVEZ
AVE STE 1 LOS ANGELES CA 90022. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) XOCHILT GRACIELA VIL-
LASENOR 3410 E CESAR CHAVEZ AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90022. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241767MU

CNBB241768MU FILE NO.2017140492
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CHACHO HOLLYWOOD LUXE;
CHACHOHOLLWOODLUXE.COM 2618 EVELYN
AVE WEST COVINA CA 91792. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JUANA LUY 2618 EVELYN
AVE WEST COVINA CA 91792. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-

Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241750MU

CNBB 241751MU FILE NO.2017137397
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ALFARO'S MARKET 99 CENTS & UP 7522 PA-
CIFIC BLVD HUNTINGTON PARK CA 90255. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) CARLOS ALBERTO
ALFARO GUTIERREZ 7522 PACIFIC BLVD HUN-
TINGTON PARK CA 90255. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2016. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/
06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB241751MU

 CNBB241752AC FILE NO.2017137351
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CAMINOS TRANSPORT LOGISTICS ;CAMINOS
& SONS TRANSPORT;C & S TRANSPORT; C.T.
LOGISTICS  4437 BELL AVE BELL CA 90201. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) CAMINOS TRANS-
PORT CORP 4437 BELL AVE BELL CA 90201.
The business is conducted by: A  CORPORA-
TION . I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241752AC

CNBB241753JL FILE NO.2017137380
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WIRE & FRINGE; WIRE AND FRINGE 3020 LAS
HERMANAS ST RANCHO DOMINGUEZ CA
90221. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MOD-
ERNE DESIGN INC 3020 LAS HERMANAS ST
RANCHO DOMINGUEZ CA 90221. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have)  NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB241753JL

CNBB241754ET FILE NO.2017136681
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
BD23 MEDICAL SUPPLIES 2706 VANDERBUILT
LANE #F REDONDO BEACH CA 90278.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) RUSSELL SCHWAB 320
S PROSPECT #9 RODONDO BEACH CA 90277.
The business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  THE San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241754ET

CNBB241755JEN FILE NO.2017140978
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TREND MOTORSPORTS 739 E. HOLT AVE POMO-
NA CA 91767; 1732 E. COMMONWEALTH AE
#104 FULLERTON CA 92831.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ABEL SEGURA 793 E HOLT AVE
POMONA CA 91767. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241755JEN

CNBB241756GM FILE NO.2017141706
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ARELLABIS PARKING LOT SERVICE 7545 LIN-
DELL AVE PICO RIVERA CA 90660. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JOSE ARELLANO ROMERO
7545 LINDELL AVE PICO RIVERA CA 90660.
The business is conducted by: A AN INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB241756GM

CNBB241757JEN FILE NO.2017141910
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SALT LIGHT WORLD ; SALT LIGHT MISSION
5850 W 3RD STREET 186 LOS ANGELES CA
90036. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) TONG
JOSEPH JUN 5850 3RD STREET 186 LOS AN-
GELES CA 90036. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/01/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17  San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB241757JEN

CNBB241758JEN FILE NO.2017141672
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
MINERVA GROUP 6522 WASHINGTON AVENUE
WHITTIER CA 90601. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) THOMAS K. BEGIN 6522 WASHINGTON
AVE WHITTIER CA 90601. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) 05/2017commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB241758JEN

CNBB241759GM FILE NO.2017141641
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GOLDEN DIAMOND HOSPICE INC 11385 183RD
STREET CERRITOS CA 90703. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) GOLDEN  DIAMOND HOSPICE
INC 11385 183RD STREET CERRITOS CA 90703.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
01/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
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registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417115JEN

CNBB2417116DC FILE NO.2017140244
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DONEL & ASSOCIATES 3435 WHILSHIRE BLVD
SUITE 1840 LOS ANGELES CA 90010. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) LAW OFFICES OF BEN-
JAMIN DONEL INC 3435 WILSHIRE BLVD SUITE
1840 LOS ANGELES CA 90010. The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  NOT commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417116DC

CNBB2417117DC FILE NO.2017140242
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ACOSTA TRUCKING COMPANY 11365 MILL-
STONE LN POMONA CA 91766.  Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) RICARDO ACOSTA 11365
MILLSTONE LN POMONA CA 91766. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing:06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417117DC

CNBB2417118AC FILE NO.2017139586
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: 120
FILMS 4930 CLOUD AVE LA CRESENTA CA
91214. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) CHUN
MING HUANG 4930 CLOUD AVE LA CRESENTA
CA 91214. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417118AC

CNBB2417119AC FILE NO.2017139664
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LOUISIANA FRIED CHICKEN # 4050 4050
CRENSHAW BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90008.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LONG KUY LIM
4050 CRENSHAW BLVD LOS ANGELES CA
90008. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417119AC

CNBB2417120TC FILE NO.2017139271
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VITALI VIOLINS 7302 PIERCE AVE WHITTIER
CA 90602. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
FRANCISCO CHAVEZ ZAPATA 7302 PIERCE
AVE WHITTIER CA 90602. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing:  06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417120TC

CNBB2417121TC FILE NO.2017139605
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CANADA TREE CARE; CANADA TREE SER-
VICE 4035 PRESTWICK LN PALMDALE CA
93551. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MICHA-
EL JON BARKER 4035 PRESTWICK LN PALM-
DALE CA 93551. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 02/1993. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417121TC

CNBB2417122GM FILE NO.2017139615
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CARLOS AUTO REPAIRS 302 N BOWEN AVE
COMPTON CA 90221; 206 N BOWEN AVE COMP-
TON CA 90221. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
CARLOS ORLANDO PAZ 206 N BOWEN AVE
COMPTON CA 90221. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417122GM

CNBB2417123GM FILE NO.2017139119
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: A-
DRAINS PLUMBING AND ROOTER INC 2271
PAPAYA DR LA HABRA HEIGHTS CA 90631. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) A-DRAINS PLUMB-
ING AND ROOTER INC 2271 PAPAYA DR LA
HABRA HEIGHTS CA 90631. The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417123GM

CNBB2417124GM FILE NO.2017140235
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LIVE HEALTHY COUNSELING ; ANIMAL ASSIST-
ED PSYCHOTHERAPY 512 REDONDO AVE-
NUE SUITE A LONG BEACH CA 90814; 374 S
MIRALESTE DR UNIT 404 SAN PEDRO CA
90732.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LINDA
MONIQUE GALI 512 REDONDO AVENUE SUITE
A LONG BEACH CA 90814. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The

registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417124GM

CNBB2417125IF FILE NO.2017139200
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
J&D SAFETY TRAINING 5109 HEDDA ST LAKE-
WOOD CA 90712. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JOHN BERNARD JIMENEZ SALOM 5109
HEDDA ST LAKEWOOD CA 90712. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417125IF

CNBB2417126IF FILE NO.2017139656
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
APEX BOOT CAMP COVINA 1438 N HOLLEN-
BECK AVE COVINA CA 91722. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) ELDER JOEL MAZARIEGOS ;
PERLA MAZARIEGOS 1438 N HOLLENBECK
AVE COVINA CA 91722. The business is conduct-
ed by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417126IF

CNBB2417127MU FILE NO.2017139711
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MADERAS UNIQUE FURNITURE;CAR SHAPED
FURNITURE 4326 GAGE AVE BELL CA 90201.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JEHU SALAZ-
AR ; EINAR A. CHAVEZ 4326 GAGE AVE BELL
CA 90201. The business is conducted by: A GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/
06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417127MU

CNBB2417128MU FILE NO.2017139641
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PALMAS SERVICES 5600 S BROADWAY LOS
ANGELES CA 90037. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JOSE M PALMAS ; CARLA PALMAS 5600 S
BROADWAY LOS ANGELES CA 90037. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 02/2014. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417128MU

CNBB2417129MU FILE NO.2017139459
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GRIFFIN CROWD & CAPITAL 22632 GOLDEN
SPRINGS DR DIAMOND BAR CA 91765. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417129MU

CNBB2417130MU FILE NO.2017140179
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PREMIUM EXPRESS MOBILE WASH & DETAIL-
ING 6889 COACHELLA AVE LONG BEACH CA
90805. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MARIA
LUCILA JARAMILLO 6889 COACHELLA AVE
LONG BEACH CA 90805.  The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417130MU

CNBB2417131GM FILE NO.2017140025
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BELMONT SHORE BARBER SHOP 5108 E. SEC-
OND ST LONG BEACH CA 90803. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) LAURA MARIE HUGHES
9881 SPINNAKER DR HUNTINGTON BEACH
CA 92646. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417131GM

CNBB2417132GM FILE NO.2017139447
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ARCHI-LA TRANSPORT 938 E. 112TH ST LOS
ANGELES CA 90059. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MYNOR ARCHILA 938 E. 112TH STREET
LOS ANGELES CA 90059. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417132GM

CNBB2417133MU FILE NO.2017138987
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SUPER 99 PLUS 4531 WHITTIER BLVD LOS
ANGELES CA 90022. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) VANESSA SANCHEZ ;GERARDO PEREZ
ZARAZUA 4531 WHITTIER BLVD LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90022. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the

fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417133MU

CNBB2417134OSCAR FILE NO.2017142707
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROBERTO'S SERVICES 7507 SEPULVEDA BLVD
APT #11 VAN NUYS CA 91405.Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) DELIA AGUILAR SUY 7507
SEPULVEDA BLVD APT #11 VAN NUYS CA
91405. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417134OSCAR

CNBB2417135ED FILE NO.2017139563
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: E M
SCRAP METAL 25885 RAIL ROAD AVE SAUGUS
CA 91350.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ES-
MERALDA MONTESINOS 28319 TAMARACK LN
SAUGUS CA 91390. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB22417135ED

CNBB2417136RM FILE NO.2017139578
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SELS TRUCKING 18601 HATTERAS ST APT #135
TARZANA CA 91356.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SAMUEL MARKARI-DAVOODIAN 18601
HATTERAS ST APT # 135 TARZANA CA 91356.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 2003. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417136RM

CNBB2417137RM FILE NO.2017140074
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
RISEUP STRATEGIES INT 4400 SEPULVEDA
BLVD #104 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) HOUMAN NOSRATIFAR
4400 SEPULVEDA BLVD #104 SHERMAN OAKS
CA 91403. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above on
. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB2417137RM

CNBB2417138RM FILE NO.2017140072
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WRAPS N ROSES ;WRAPSNROSES 4400
SEPULVEDA BLVD #104 SHERMAN OAKS CA
91403. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) NORA
TAHVILI 4400 SEPULEVEDA BLVD 104 SHER-
MAN OAKS CA 91403. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417138RM

CNBB2417139RM FILE NO.2017139702
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SWAI CLOTHING CO. 263 W OLIVE AVE #214
BURBANK CA 91502. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) SCOTT THUNDERHORSE SHEPHERD
263 W OLIVE AVE #214 BURBANK CA 91502.The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417139RM

CNBB2417140RM FILE NO.2017140152
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DREAM BIG ENTERTAINMENT 11030 HART-
SOOK ST UNIT 102 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA
91601.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) BERN
BENOIT 11030 HARTSOOK ST UNIT 102 NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91601.The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417140RM

CNBB2417141ED FILE NO.2017139519
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
A2Z EVENT PLANNING 4952 WHITSETT AVE
SUITE 2 VALLEY VILLAGE CA 91607.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MARINE ABRAHAMIAN
4952 WHITSETT AVE SUITE 2 VALLEY VILLAGE
CA 91607.The business is conducted by: AN IN-
DIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2007. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417141ED

CNBB2417142ED FILE NO.2017139793
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JUICE BAR ( LA OAXAQUENA) 6025  SANTA
MONICA BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90038. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) GULLERMO
FERNANDO CRUZ 9355 SYLMAR SYLMAR AVE
PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/31/17. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County

Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417142ED

CNBB2417143ED FILE NO.2017139887
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JWD GONZALEZ CABINET 7317 VARNA AVE
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) FLORENCIA FUENTES ;
ISMAEL GONZALEZ 11515 CALVERT ST NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. The business is con-
ducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 03/21/2011. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417143ED

CNBB2417144ED FILE NO.2017139973
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
REVOLUTION WEIGHTLOSS 520 WEST ELK AVE
#105 GLENDALE CA 91204.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ADRIANA HAROUTONIAN 520
WEST ELK AVE #105 GLENDALE CA 91204. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417144ED

CNBB2417145EL FILE NO.2017139592
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FLORELLA DESIGN 121 N KENWOOD ST #210
GLENDALE CA 91206.Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) YERANUHI MKHITARIAN 121 N KEWOOD
ST # 210 GLENDALE CA 91206;LILY STONE 14630
WYANDOTTE STREET #111 VAN NUYS CA
91405. The business is conducted by: A GENER-
AL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417145EL

CNBB2417146EL FILE NO.2017139950
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JASMINE INDIAN FLOWERS 1333 VALLEY VIEW
RD APT #30 GLENDALE CA 91202. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ALFRED CHINNAPPAN 1333
VALLEY VIEW RD APT #30 GLENDALE CA
91202;JOSEPH CRUZ DURAI 965 ELLIS PARK-
WAY EDISON NJ 08820;CHARLES VICTOR 4
ALLEE LEON TOLSTOI NANTERRE FRANCE
92000. The business is conducted by: A GENER-
AL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/22/17. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417146EL

CNBB2417147EL FILE NO.2017140212
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ARIO ANTIQUE RESTORATIONS 19120 ERWIN
ST LOS ANGELES CA 91335. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ALIREZA TAGHINEJAD 19120
ERWIN ST TARZANA CA 91335. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417147EL

CNBB2417148EL FILE NO.2017138778
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MAKE IT RACK 6433 TOPANGA CYN BLVD CA-
NOGA PARK CA 91303. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ALEXANDRE SAM MILGRAM 22101
ERWIN STREET APT # P321 WOODLAND HILLS
CA 91367. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417148EL

CNBB2417149EL FILE NO.2017138951
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SHARA ACCOUNTING 1179 CHERRY ST GLEN-
DALE CA 91202. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SHARA SHAHIJANIAN 1179 CHERRY ST
GLENDALE CA 91202. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 02/2010. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/
06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417149EL

CNBB2417150EL FILE NO.2017139043
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WIRELESS MUNOZ 1028 S SANTEE ST SUITE B
LOS ANGELES CA 90042. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) SILVESTRE J MUNOZ VIZVAYA 445 E
ADAMS BLVD 4 LOS ANGELES CA 90011. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417150EL

CNBB2417151EL FILE NO.2017139045
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANGEL'S STORE 1900 BEVERLY BLVD LOS
ANGELES CA 90057. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MA. GUADALUPE RAMOS FIGUEROA 153
GLENDALE BLVD APT 303 LOS ANGELES CA
90026. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement

expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417151EL

CNBB2417152EL FILE NO.2017139278
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VERY VERY RICE CAKE STUDIO 3959
WILSHIRE BLVD UNIT B5 LOS ANGELES CA
90010. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) REX
PARK 155 S. OXFORD AVE #306 LOS ANGELES
CA 90004. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417152EL

CNBB2417153OSCAR FILE NO.2017139233
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GET THE LIGHT OUT 17803 WEST NESS DRIVE
UNIT 203 SANTA CLARITA CA 91387. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MARIANNE KRISTI PHIL-
LIPPS 17803 WEST NESS DRIVE SUITE 203
SANTA CLARITA CA 91387. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417153OSCAR

CNBB2417154OSCAR FILE NO.2017140069
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
G.B. TRUCKING 13802 CANTLAY ST VAN NUYS
CA 91405. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
GAGIK BAGHDASARYAN 13802 CANTLAY ST
VAN NUYS CA 91405. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417154OSCAR

CNBB2417155NQ FILE NO.2017139065
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: ALL
VALLEY FINISHED CARPENTRY  9000 ORION
AVE APT 16 NORTH HILLS CA 91343.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) VICTORS MARTINEZ
NEVAREZ 9000 ORION AVE APT 16 NORTH
HILLS CA 91343. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417155NQ

CNBB2417156NQ FILE NO.2017140071
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PROCESS SERVER EXPERT 12606 MOOR PARK
APT # 104 STUDIO CITY CA 91604.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MORDECHAI GOREN 12606
MOOR PARK APT #104 STUDIO CITY CA 91604.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417156NQ

CNBB2417157NQ FILE NO.2017140070
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
COURT FILE EXPRESS 12606 MOOR PARK APT
#104 STUDIO CITY CA 91604. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) MORDECHI GOREN 12606
MOOR PARK APT #104 STUDIO CITY CA 91604.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417157NQ

CNBB2417158NQ FILE NO.2017140210
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BASS/BARI MUSIC PROD/ WILL WHEATON/1ST
BASS/BARI MUZIK PLATINUM BASS RECOR
18017 CHATSWORTH ST # 131 GRANADA HILLS
CA 91344. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
BASS/ BARI INC 10370 CLARE AVE PORTER
RANCH CA 91326. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 08/06/2003. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/
06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417158NQ

CNBB2417159NQ FILE NO.2017140207
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROSE THRONES 1223 WILSHIRE BLVD NO112
SANTA MONICA CA 90403. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) AFSANGH AKBARI 1200 PICO
BLVD SANTA MONICA CA 90405. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417159NQ

CNBB2417160GM FILE NO.2017147075
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JOZEN 9615 BRIGHTON WAY SUITE 422 BEV-
ERLY HILLS CA 90210. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) SHINOBU NARUSE 9051 VIA VISTA DR
BUENA PARK CA 90620. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A

new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417160GM

CNBB2417161NQ FILE NO.2017139501
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: DO
YOU GOODY BOX ;
DOYOUGOODYBOX.COM18375 VENTURA
BLVD 361 TARZANA CA 91356;2828 COCHRAN
ST 117 SIMI VALLEY CA 93065. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ELLE FINE 2734 FOREST
GROVE LANE SIMI VALLEY CA 93065. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/31/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417161NQ

FILE NO.2017132856       CNBB2417162EL
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: INVICTUS  SIGNING SERVICES
9305 CRYSTAL VIEW DR TUJUNGA CA 91042
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) GOR GRIGO-
RYAN 9305 CYRSTAL VIEW DR TUJUNGA CA
91042. The business was conducted by:  AN IN-
DIVIDUAL. The fictitious business name referred
to above was filed on 08/11/14. Original File #
2014221354. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/23/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417162EL

FILE NO.2017132880       CNBB2417163OSCAR
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: ARSHO CATERING 1339 N. NEW
HAMPSHIRE AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90027 Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ARSHALUYS PY-
USKULYAN 1339 N. NEW HAMPSHIRE AVE LOS
ANGELES CA  90027. The business was conduct-
ed by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious business
name referred to above was filed on 02/22/2017.
Original File #2017044133. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 05/23/2017. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417163OSCAR

FILE NO.2017132881 CNBB2417164OSC
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: LEVGEN IT CONSULTING 1339 N.
NEW HAMPSHIRE BLVD LOS ANGELES CA
90027 Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LEVA
OGANYAN 1339 N. NEW HAMPSHIRE AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90027. The business was conduct-
ed by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious business
name referred to above was filed on 02/22/2017.
Original File # 2017044129. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 05/23/2017. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417164OSCA

FILE NO.2017140989 CNBB2417165IF
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: LUCY'S PET FOOD AND MORE,
LUCY'S PET FOOD & MORE;LUCY'S PET FOOD
& SPORT 2201 N. LONG BEACH BLVD A#21
COMPTON CA 90221 Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) NORMA VALLEJO DE VICENTE 1516 E 68TH
STREET LONG BEACH CA 90805. The business
was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The ficti-
tious business name referred to above was filed
on 03/21/2017. Original File # 2017070960. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner    CNBB2417165IF

FILE NO.2017139347  CNBB2417166IF
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name:  RODRIGUEZ PROPERTY MAINTE-
NANCE 11632 BALSAM AVE HESPERIA CA 92345
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JOSE R. ROD-
RIGUEZ 11632 BALSAM AVE HESPERIA CA
92345. The business was conducted by:  AN IN-
DIVIDUAL. The fictitious business name referred
to above was filed on 05/02/2014. Original File #
2014120184. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417166IF

FILE NO.2017139800  CNBB2417167MU
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: OMEGA GOLD 6908 PACIFIC BLVD
HUNTINGTON PARK CA 90255 Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) ENRIQUE ALVIZU ALVAREZ
8452 MADISON AVE SOUTH GATE CA 90280.The
business was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL.
The fictitious business name referred to above
was filed on 05/19/2016. Original File # 2016125942.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
31/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417167MU

FILE NO.2017138981   CNBB2417168MU
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: 97 DISCOUNT STORE 4531 WHITTI-
ER BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90022 Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JUANA G DAMIAN 4531
WHITTIER BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90022. The
business was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL
INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious business name re-
ferred to above was filed on 01/02/2015. Original
File # 2015000705. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/31/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417168MU

CNBB2417169RM FILE NO.2017137281
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HALTBEAR 5121 SHEARIN AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90041. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
BARBARA ANN ZUZOW-DER BOGHOSSIAN
5121 SHEARIN AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90041.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/

26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417169RM

CNBB2417170RM FILE NO.2017137180
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BEYWATCH EL 18017 CHASTWORTH ST # 245
GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) AUSTIN V. SHANKS JR 18017
CHATSWORTH CA 91344. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417170RM

CNBB2417171RM FILE NO.2017135221
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PASADENA EXPRESS  LUBE 850 S ARROYO
PKWY PASADENA CA 91105. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) VALLEY HAND SUPER WASH
INC 850 S. ARROYO PKWY PASADENA CA
91105. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417171RM

CNBB2417172RM FILE NO.2017137582
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE BEST CATERIN 1868 LOS ENCINOS GLEN-
DALE CA 91206. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) KARL AGHAJANYAN ; NADIA MARGARY-
AN 1868 LOS ENCINOS GLENDALE CA 91208.
The business is conducted by:  A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417172RM

CNBB2417173RM FILE NO.2017137350
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROBOT BUFFALO PRODUCTIONS 1601 PAR-
WAY DR GLENDALE CA 91206. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ROBOT BUFFALO LLC 1601
PARWAY DR GLENDALE CA 91206. The busi-
ness is conducted by:  A LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417173RM

CNBB2417174RM FILE NO.2017137442
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NOTARY REQUEST; NOTARYREQUEZT.COM
3001 N. BEACHWOOD DRIVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90068. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
EDUARDO ASTURIAS 3001  N. BEACHWOOD
DRIVE LOS ANGELES CA 90068. The business
is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417174RM

CNBB2417175RM FILE NO.2017136979
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LADY ANGELES 258 W. PALM DR ARCADIA CA
91007. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LADY
ANGELES LLC 258 W PALM DRIVE ARCADIA
CA 91007. The business is conducted by:  A
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417175RM

CNBB2417176 FILE NO.2017137599
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GOLDEN STATE CONCENTRATES ; CAL STATE
CONCENTRATES; CALI STATE CONCEN-
TRATES; CALIFORNIA CONCENTRATES; CAL-
IFORNIA STATE CONCENTRATES 11721 WHIT-
TIER BLVD # 268 WHITTIER CA 90601. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) RAYMOND GILBERT
MENDOZA 11727 WHITTIER BLVD #268 WHIT-
TIER CA 90601. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417176

CNBB2417177PS FILE NO.2017137455
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DARBAR INDIAN CUISINE 14611 ½ VENTURA
BLVD SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) BPB INC 14611  ½ VENTU-
RA BLVD SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403. The busi-
ness is conducted by:  A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/16/17. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417177PS

CNBB2417178PS FILE NO.2017137129
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EDVIN TRUCKING 10243 SAMOA ABE APT 101
TUJUNGA CA 91042. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) EDVIN AVANESYAN ADEGANI 10243
SAMOA AVE APT 11 TUJUNGA CA 91042. The
business is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
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26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417178PS

CNBB2417179ED FILE NO.2017137562
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CALLUS FOR MONEY; CALL US 4 MONEY 15416
DEVONSHIRE ST MISSION HILLS CA 91345.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) SIMPLE CAR
TITLE LOANS 15416 DEVONSHIRE ST MISSION
HILLS CA 91345. The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417179ED

CNBB2417180ED FILE NO.2017137107
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DESIGNIO FLUX 7560 DES SOTO AVE CAN-
OGA PARK CA 91303. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) MUHAMMAD IQBAL ; NOREEN
IQBAL7560 DES SPTP AVE CANOGA PARK CA
91303. The business is conducted by: A MAR-
RIED COUPLE. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417180ED

CNBB2417181ED FILE NO.2017137297
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KLEEN RIDE AUTO SPA 7941 LEDGE AVE SUN
VALLEY CA 91352. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) BELYNDA LOPEZ 7941 LEDGE AVE SUN
VALLEY CA 91352. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 01/01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417181ED

CNBB2417182ED FILE NO.2017132620
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
J.K. HAIR STUDIO 13271 HERRON ST SYLMAR
CA 91342. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
JULIAN SANCHEZ 13271 HERRON ST SYLMAR
CA 91342. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/23/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417182ED

CNBB2417183EL FILE NO.2017136890
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SIERRA DERMATOLOGY AND LASER; DERMA-
TOLOGY ASSOCIATES OF SIERRA
MADRE;DERMATLOGY AND LASER OF SIER-
RA MADRE  80 W. SIERRA MADRE BLVD SUITE
113 SIERRA MADRES CA 91024. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JC DERM PHYSICIAN AS-
SISTANT INC 80 W SIERRA MADRE BLVD SUITE
113 SIERRA MADRE CA 91024. The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417183EL

CNBB2417184EL FILE NO.2017136652
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EXCELLENT AUTO TRADERS 1717 N SAN
FERNANDO RD UNIT H LOS ANGELES CA
90065;433 PIEDMONT AVE NO 1 GLENDALE CA
91206. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) EXCEL-
LENT AUTO TRADERS INC 1717 S SAN
FERNANDO RD UNIT H LOS ANGELES CA
90065. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417184EL

CNBB2417185EL FILE NO.2017137045
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GAFORD 1138 S. CIRTRUS AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90019. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
GLENN ANGELO FORDE 1138 S CITRUS AVE
LOS ANGELES CA 90019. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 &
07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2417185EL

FILE NO.2017138394  CNBB22417186RM
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: S.S. FLOWERS 1271 BOYNTON ST
#22 GLENDALE CA 91205 Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) YEREMYAN ARTASHES 1271 BOYN-
TON ST #22 GLENDALE CA 91205. The business
was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The ficti-
tious business name referred to above was filed
on 04/29/2021. Original File # 2016104889. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
30/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417186RM

FILE NO.2017137236   CNBB2417187RAY
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: HOME SWEET HOME LOS ANGE-
LES 13441 BEACH AVENUE MARINA DEL REY
CA 90292 Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MEL-
ISSA CASEY 13441 BEACH AVENUE MARINA
DEL REY CA 90292. The business was conduct-
ed by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The fictitious business
name referred to above was filed on 11/19/2014.
Original File # 2014330404. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A

registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417187RAY

FILE NO.2417188EL    CNBB22417188EL
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME The following per-
son (s) has (have) abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious name: PACIFIC COAST TRANSPORTATION
SERVICES 7961 RHODES AVE NORTH HOLLY-
WOOD CA 91605 Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ROBERT KAZARIAN 7961 RHODES AVE
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. The business
was conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. The ficti-
tious business name referred to above was filed
on 05/26/2017. Original File # 22014320100. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
26/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417188EL

CNBB2417189EL FILE NO.2017137550
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SUBURBAN SUNWEAR 5424 NEWCASTLE AVE
ENCINO CA 91316. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JOHN JELONEK 5424 NEWCASTLE AVE
104 ENCINO CA 91316. The business is conduct-
ed by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 15; 06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2417189EL

CNBB2417190OSCAR FILE NO.2017136548
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JAY AND ANI PHOTOGRAPHY 421 WALTONIA
DR GLENDALE CA 91206. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) JASON PEREZ 421 WALTONIA
DR GLENDALE CA 91206. The business is con-
ducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417190OSCAR

CNBB2417191OSCAR FILE NO.2017136798
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BARBERSHOP MELY VIP 7545 VINELAND AVE
SUN VALLEY CA 91352. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) OLGA MARARI LOPEZ CHOJOLAN
7545 VINELAND AVE SUN VALLEY CA 91352.
The business is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
25/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB22417191OSCAR

CNBB2417192OSCAR FILE NO.2017137062
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: WE
TEND TO CARE ; BROOKS HEALTH FOUNDA-
TION 3730 W 27 ST 208 LOS ANGELES CA 90018.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) CYNTHIA WHITE
3730 W 27 TH ST 208 LOS ANGELES CA 90018.
The business is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/
26/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417192OSCAR

CNBB2417193OSCAR FILE NO.2017137063
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SCHOOL FOR BRILLANT THINKERS 6300 VA-
RIEL AVE UNIT 257 WOODLAND HILLS CA
91367. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
SHAQUANDA D JOHNSON 6300 VARIEL AE
257 WOODLAND HILLS CA 91367. The business
is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 01/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417193OSCAR

CNBB2417194OSCAR FILE NO.2017137399
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
OLD VILLAGE RESTAURANT 1100 S CENTRAL
AVE UNIT D GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) SEMEN ABRAMIAN 320 W
MAPLE APT 22 GLENDALE CA 91204. The busi-
ness is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 10/2011. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15;
06/22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2417194OSCAR

CNBB2417195OSCAR FILE NO.2017137400
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: AH
SERVICES 466 RIVERDALE DR APT 211 GLEN-
DALE CA 91204. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) HARUTUN ARAKELYAN 466 RIVERDALE
DR APT 211 GLENDALE CA 91204.  The business
is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/26/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 09/2006. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 15; 06/
22; 06/29 & 07/06/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2417195OSCAR

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126094
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CARE CONNECT, 44833 GADSDEN AVE, LAN-
CASTER, CA 93534. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: TE-
ODORA CAMBIADO, 44833 GADSDEN AVE,
LANCASTER, CA 93534, PAMELA HUMES, 44833
GADSDEN AVE, LANCASTER, CA 93534. This
business is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: PAMELA
HUMES, PARTNER. The registrant commenced

to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/16/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345573.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126207
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MG ELECTRONICS LA, 6910 HAYVENHURST
AVE 103, VAN NUYS, CA 91406. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: MARTIN GOMEZ, 13737 OXNARD ST #35,
VAN NUYS, CA 91406. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MARTIN GOMEZ, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/16/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345618.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017128734
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BROWN CLINIC FOR ATTENTION & RELATED
DISORDERS, 500 S. SEPULVEDA BLVD. SUITE
218, MANHATTAN BEACH, CA 90266. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: THOMAS E. BROWN, 500 S.
SEPULVEDA BLVD. SUITE 218, MANHATTAN
BEACH, CA 90266. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
THOMAS E. BROWN, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/18/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346142.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017128781
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BOMBSHELL BEAUTY BAR, 306 S EDINBURGH
AVE SUITE 10, LOS ANGELES, CA 90048. Mail-
ing address if different: 321 S HAMEL RD APT 3,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90048. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: SABRINA JOHNSON, 321 S
HAMEL RD APT 3, LOS ANGELES, CA 90048.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: SABRINA JOHNSON,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/18/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA346151.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017130425
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
DOWNEY SMOKE AND VAPE SHOP, 10313
LAKEWOOD BLVD, DOWNEY, CA 90241-2743.
Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incor-
poration or Organization Number: C4010835. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: 2 J CORPO-
RATION, 10313 LAKEWOOD BLVD, DOWNEY,
CA 90241 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: SAMEH R GERGES,
CEO. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/19/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA346498.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017129978
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MASLER CHIROPRACTIC, 13344 SOUTH ST,
CERRITOS, CA 90703. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization
Number: 3543072. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: MASLER CHIROPRACTIC, INC., 13344
SOUTH ST, CERRITOS, CA 90703 (State of In-
corporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: TODD MALSER, CEO. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 09/2012.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/22/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346510.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017130971
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SEP ESCROW, 1675 SARGENT COURT, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90026. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
DAXING ZHANG, 1675 SARGENT COURT, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90026. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
DAXING ZHANG, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/22/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346556.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017130994
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. CAMACHO & SONS, 2. CAMACHO AND SONS,
13611 CHARITY DR, SYLMAR, CA 91342. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: BRANDON CAMACHO, 13611
CHARITY DR, SYLMAR, CA 91342 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA), CLAUDIA
TORRES, 13611 CHARITY DR, SYLMAR, CA
91342 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: MARRIED COU-
PLE. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: BRANDON CAMA-
CHO, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): N/A. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/22/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346562.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017131231
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HOUSE KIT, 4052 VAHAN QT, LANCASTER, CA
93534. Mailing address if different: P.O. BOX 6266,
LANCASTER, CA 93539. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: NATHAN ISIAH DUARTE, 4052
VAHAN QT, LANCASTER, CA 93534. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: NATHAN ISIAH DUARTE, CEO. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/22/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under

federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA346612.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017131493
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MY ARTIST ARCHIVE, 16130 VENTURA BLVD.
SUITE 500, ENCINO, CA 91436. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: KATHARINE E. GATENBY, 16130 VENTU-
RA BLVD. SUITE 500, ENCINO, CA 91436. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: KATHARINE E. GATENBY,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/22/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA346671.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017131634
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LOS ANGELES CENTER FOR RELATIONSHIP
COUNSELING, 8075 W. 3RD ST. STE. 306, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90048. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization
Number: 3572676. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ERICA MARCHAND PH.D., PSYCHOLO-
GIST, APC, 8075 W. 3RD ST. STE. 306, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90048 (State of Incorporation/Or-
ganization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ERICA MARCHAND, PRESIDENT. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 05/
2013. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/22/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA346710.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017130514
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SCHOOL NUTRITION SOLUTIONS, 10808 VIC-
TORY BLVD APT 12, NORTH HOLLYWOOD, CA
91606. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: VICTOR CARRAN-
ZA, 10808 VICTORY BLVD 12, NORTH HOLLY-
WOOD, CA 91606. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
VICTOR CARRANZA, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 04/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/19/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA346930.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132417
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SWEET VALLEY HOME, 2650 COGSWELL ROAD
UNIT B, EL MONTE, CA 91732. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: VERONICA CEBALLOS, 2650 COGSWELL
ROAD UNIT B, EL MONTE, CA 91732. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: VERONICA CEBALLOS, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
04/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/23/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA347412.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132666
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SK88 LLC, 24812 WOODED VISTA, WEST HILLS,
CA 91307. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: SK88 LLC, 24812
WOODED VISTA, WEST HILLS, CA 91307. This
business is conducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: SEAN
KANE, CEO. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 05/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348492.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017134358
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
USAAA MOVING, 21044 SHERMAN WAY #224,
CANOGA PARK, CA 91303. Mailing address if
different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organi-
zation Number: C3747523. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ALPINE RELOCATION, INC.,
21044 SHERMAN WAY #224, CANOGA PARK,
CA 91303. This business is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: SHARON
TOLEDANO, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348886.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017134271
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
KENNEDY COACHING & CONSULTING, 1733
ARTEIQUE ROAD, TOPANGA, CA 90290. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: TRACY KENNEDY, 1733
ARTEIQUE ROAD, TOPANGA, CA 90290. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: TRACY KENNEDY, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA348978.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017136162
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AL ELECTRIC, 5721 E. BELEN ST., LONG
BEACH, CA 90815. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ALL
SAYH, 5721 E. BELEN ST., LONG BEACH, CA
90815. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ALL SAYH, PRESI-
DENT. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/25/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA349286.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017136592
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CAP AND LEO, 5545 PIERCY AVE., LAKEWOOD,
CA 90712. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JANN GUIREY,

5545 PIERCY AVE., LAKEWOOD, CA 90712 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA), JODIE
GUIREY, 5545 PIERCY AVE., LAKEWOOD, CA
90712 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA),
JOAN GUIREY, 5545 PIERCY AVE,, LAKEWOOD,
CA 90712 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JANN
GUIREY, PARTNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/26/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349381.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137195
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ENN CONSULTANCY, 24126 GILMORE STR,
WEST HILLS, CA 91307. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
EMMANUEL N NOBLE, 24126 GILMORE STR,
WEST HILLS, CA 91307. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: EMMANUEL N NOBLE, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349512.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137375
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LADY BALLS ENTERPRISES, 1318 N. MCCAD-
DEN PLACE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90028. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: CONI CONSTANTINE, 1318
N. MCCADDEN PLACE, LOS ANGELES, CA
90028. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: CONI CONSTAN-
TINE, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/26/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349987.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137299
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MOBILE PERIO SERVICES, 1944 MONTECITO
DR, GLENDALE, CA 91208. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: SHERYAR ASLAM, 1944 MONTECITO DR,
GLENDALE, CA 91208. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
SHERYAR ASLAM, PRESIDENT. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 02/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA350782.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138389
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SNAP-ON TOOLS, 11802 HOLLYVIEW DRIVE,
LA MIRADA, CA 90638. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization
Number: 3552229. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: UDELL ENTERPRISES INC, 11802 HOL-
LYVIEW DRIVE, LA MIRADA, CA 90638 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: LISA S. UDELL, SECRETARY. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
01/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351127.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138669
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NICC'S LITTLE ANGELS, 2313 S RIDGELEY DR.,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90016. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: NICOLE GREEN, 2313 S RIDGELEY DR.,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90016. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: NICOLE GREEN, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA351207.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141307
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FOOT & ANKLE CHAMPIONS, 4115 CENTRALIA
ST, LAKEWOOD, CA 90712. Mailing address if
different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organi-
zation Number: 3949144. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: FOOT & ANKLE CHAMPIONS
INC, 4115 CENTRALIA ST, LAKEWOOD, CA
90712 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MICHAEL CORPUZ,
PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351702.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141585
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. PANORAMA POINT VILLAS, 2. PANORAMA
POINT APARTMENTS, 3. PANORAMA APART-
MENTS, 4. PANORAMA APARTMENTS VILLAS,
14610 PLUMMER STREET, PANORAMA CITY,
CA 91402. Mailing address if different: 888 S.
DISNEYLAND DRIVE SUITE 103, ANAHEIM, CA
92802. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
TIVOLI CAPITAL, INC., 888 S. DISNEYLAND
DRIVE SUITE 103, ANAHEIM, CA 92802 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: LIMITED PARTNERSHIP. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: CLAUS DIECKELL,
GERERAL PARTNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): 12/1998. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351768.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135875
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
DRINKRAWALMONDS.COM, 2396 VENUS DR,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90046. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ALEKSANDR KANEVSKY, 2396 VENUS DR,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90046 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CA). This business is conduct-

ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ALEKSANDR KANEVSKY, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/01/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA351800.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143011
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FJ ENGINEERING+DESIGN, 600 W MAIN ST
SUITE 207, ALHAMBRA, CA 91801. Mailing ad-
dress if different: 2705 S FREMONT AVE APT D,
ALHAMBRA, CA 91803. Articles of Incorporation
or Organization Number: 201628010206. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: FJ
ENGINEERING+DESIGN, INC, 600 W. MAIN ST
SUITE 207, ALHAMBRA, CA 91801 (State of In-
corporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: FRANCISCO J. GARCIA, CEO. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
07/2013. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA352019.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144310
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GLENDALE LEASING & STORAGE, 1625 GLO-
RIETTA AVENUE, GLENDALE, CA 91208. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ALEXANDRA BORREGO, 12
NERVAL, NEWPORT BEACH, CA 92657. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ALEXANDRA BORREGO,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA352123.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144340
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
UNCLE BILLS PANCAKE HOUSE, 1305 HIGH-
LAND AVE, MANHATTAN BEAC, CA 90266. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorpora-
tion or Organization Number: 455616. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: TOKAY INC, 1305
HIGHLAND AVE, MANHATTAN BEAC, CA 90266
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This
business is conducted by: CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: JEANETTE VAN AM-
BURGH, SECRETARY. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 11/1963. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352127.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144400
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
IC COLLECTION, 3601 AVALON BLVD, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90011. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: CON-
NIES FASHION INC, 3601 AVALON BLVD, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90011 (State of Incorporation/Or-
ganization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
BRIAN KYE, PRESIDENT. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 05/2015.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352149.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144468
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CYNTHIA COHN & ASSOCIATES, 2515 LAKE
AVENUE SUITE 150, PASADENA, CA 91101.
Mailing address if different: 2515 LAKE AVENUE
SUITE 150, PASADENA, CA 91101. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: CYNTHIA COHN,
2215 LOMA VISTA STREET, PASADENA, CA
91104. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: CYNTHIA COHN,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA352163.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017140303
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MINDFUL YOUTH COLLABORATIVE (MYC), 215
E CHESTNUT AVE UNIT L, MONROVIA, CA
91016-3566. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: RACHEL HALL,
215 E CHESTNUT AVE, UNIT L, MONROVIA, CA
91016. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: RACHEL HALL,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA352852.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143265
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FLXN CO., 15154 1/2 SAN JOSE AVE, PARA-
MOUNT, CA 90723. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LUIS
RACILLA-CRUZ, 15154 1/2 SAN JOSE AVE, PAR-
AMOUNT, CA 90723. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
LUIS RACILLA-CRUZ, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA353808.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017145032
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GIFTBASKETS4PAWS, 23522 BROADWELL AVE,
TORRANCE, CA 90502. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
NANITA C. HILDERBRANDT, 23522 BROAD-
WELL AVE, TORRANCE, CA 90502. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: NANITA C. HILDERBRANDT, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 05/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/05/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-

ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA353925.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017145117
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
M BROS LIMO SERVICE, 3343 BAGLEY AVE
UNIT 19, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ISAAC MOUELHI, 3343 BAG-
LEY AVE UNIT 19, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ISAAC MOUELHI,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/2014. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA353951.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017145478
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
REPAIR NEAR ME .COM, 7259 WILLOUGHBY
AVE APT 5, LOS ANGELES, CA 90046. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: MATY AVIDAN, 7259 WIL-
LOUGHBY AVE APT 5, LOS ANGELES, CA 90046.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MATY AVIDAN, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354009.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017145512
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GORTDOID GAMES, 57 ESTHER ST, PASADE-
NA, CA 91103. Mailing address if different: N/A.
Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number:
C4010248. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
SCHNICKELFRITZ ENTERTAINMENT, 57 ES-
THER ST, PASADENA, CA 91103 (State of Incor-
poration/Organization: CALIFORNIA). This busi-
ness is conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: MATTHEW D. SCHULTHEIS,
PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 03/30/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354016.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146004
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
USED APPLE WORLD, 14650 PARTHENIA ST
,UNIT Y11, PANORAMA CITY, CA 91402. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: REZA SOHRABI, 14650
PARTHENIA ST , UNIT Y11, PANORAMA CITY,
CA 91402. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who declares
as true information which he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: REZA SOHRA-
BI, OWNER. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 05/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354101.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146128
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TEENY PATOOTIE, 1317 CENTURION AVENUE,
ROSEMEAD, CA 91770. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
TEENY PATOOTIE, LLC, 1317 CENTURION AV-
ENUE, ROSEMEAD, CA 91770 (State of Incorpo-
ration/Organization: CA). This business is conducted
by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MYRNA SALAZAR, PRESIDENT. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354113.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146230
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
DEVA RAM, 156 S TOPANGA CANYON BLVD,
TOPANGA, CA 90290. Mailing address if differ-
ent: POBOX 905, TOPANGA, CA 90290. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JEAN GABRIEL
TEZIER, 156 S TOPANGA CANYON BLVD, TO-
PANGA, CA 90290. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
JEAN GABRIEL TEZIER, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA354139.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146359
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HARTMAN BUSINESS SERVICES, 11438 KEN-
TUCKY AVE, WHITTIER, CA 90604. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: CYNTHIA HARTMAN, 11438
KENTUCKY AVE, WHITTIER, CA 90604. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: CYNTHIA HARTMAN, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354185.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146625
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LOZA INSPECTION SERVICES, 15130 CABELL
AVE, BELLFLOWER, CA 90706. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: JOEL LOZA, 15130 CABELL AVE, BELL-
FLOWER, CA 90706. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
JOEL LOZA, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354254.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
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2017146789
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RESTORE YOUR SCORE, 2203 WELLINGTON
ROAD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90016. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or
Organization Number: 201711410160. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: RESTORE YOUR
SCORE, LLC, 2203 WELLINGTON ROAD, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90016. This business is conducted
by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MARK BROWN, MANAGING MEMBER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/07/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354290.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147389
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE ONE UP GROUP, 1049 HAVENHURST DR.
UNIT #7, WEST HOLLYWOOD, CA 90046. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ONE UP ENTERTAINMENT
INC., 1049 HAVENHURST DR. UNIT #7, WEST
HOLLYWOOD, CA 90046 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
EYAL SIMKOVITS, CEO. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 06/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/07/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354424.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147631
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MAGIC HOUSE MUSIC, 6906 FISHBURN AVE,
BELL, CA 90201. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JOSE A
TOSCANO, 6906 FISHBURN AVE, BELL, CA
90201. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JOSE A TOSCANO,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/07/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354486.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147674
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
KYE INTIMATES, 843 4TH STREET #102, SANTA
MONICA, CA 90403. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: BON-
ITA CHEN, 843 4TH STREET #102, SANTA MON-
ICA, CA 90403. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: BONITA
CHEN, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/07/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354496.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146214
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RED UMBRELLA LLC, 1124 N. LA CIENEGA
BLVD. # 306, WEST HOLLYWOOD, CA 90069.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: RED UMBRELLA LLC, 1124
N. LA CIENEGA BLVD. #306, WEST HOLLY-
WOOD, CA 90069 (State of Incorporation/Organi-
zation: CA). This business is conducted by: LIMIT-
ED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CARLOS DEMENEZES, CFO. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA354511.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144338
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE SEAFOOD BAR, 1815 HAWTHORNE BLVD
UNIT #351, REDONDO BEACH, CA 90278. Mail-
ing address if different: 3228 VISTA TERRACE,
RIVERSIDE, CA 92503. Articles of Incorporation
or Organization Number: 201708210282. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ROYAL STAR FOOD
LLC, 3228 VISTA TERRACE, RIVERSIDE, CA
92503 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: LIMITED LIABILI-
TY COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: PISETH
UN, MANAGING MEMBER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 06/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354512.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147838
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PALM TREE, 2121 ROSECRANS AVE SUITE 2360,
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organiza-
tion Number: 201633410008. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: PALM TREE ADVISORS LLC,
2121 ROSECRANS AVE SUITE 2360, EL SEG-
UNDO, CA 90245 (State of Incorporation/Organi-
zation: CA). This business is conducted by: LIMIT-
ED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PARDIS NASSERI, PRESIDENT. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/07/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA354544.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147881
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HONEYBUNNYPOP, 2613 BORDER AVE, TOR-
RANCE, CA 90501. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: SEU-
LAH LEE, 2613 BORDER AVE, TORRANCE, CA
90501. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: SEULAH LEE, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/07/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354555.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148271
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
H2O GROUP, 19404 OPAL LANE, SANTA CLAR-
ITA, CA 91350. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: DANIEL
DENTON, 19404 OPAL LANE, SANTA CLARITA,
CA 91350, MARGARETH JENSEN, 19404 OPAL
LANE, SANTA CLARITA, CA 91350. This busi-

ness is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: DANIEL DENTON,
GENERAL PARTNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 09/2000. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/08/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354625.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148276
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LIFE OF LULUS, 2838 BUTTER CREEK DRIVE,
PASADENA, CA 91107. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MARCIA ANDERSON, 2838 BUTTER CREEK
DRIVE, PASADENA, CA 91107. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MARCIA ANDERSON, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA354626.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148501
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HOGGN, 14412 S WHITE ST, COMPTON, CA
90221. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LA SHON
HOWARD, 7795 MALACHITE, RANCHO CU-
CAMONGA, CA 91730. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: LA
SHON HOWARD, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 06/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354685.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148677
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NAZIRI LAW FIRM, 6303 OWENSMOUTH AVE-
NUE 10TH FLOOR, WOODLAND HILLS, CA
91367. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: VN LAW GROUP
P.C., 6303 OWENSMOUTH AVENUE 10TH
FLOOR, WOODLAND HILLS, CA 91367 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CALIFORNIA). This
business is conducted by: CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: VAHID NAZIRI, CEO.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 08/2015. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/08/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354707.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148783
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HERETOSAVEYOUALL, 4770 FRANKLIN AVE #3,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90027. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MAX BARSNESS, 4770 FRANKLIN AVE #3,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90027. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MAX BARSNESS, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
01/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354729.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148877
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SPARKLING COIN LAUNDRY, 11927 PICO
BLVD., LOS ANGELES, CA 90064. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or
Organization Number: 200414210027. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: GORDON III, LLC,
11927 PICO BLVD., LOS ANGELES, CA 90064
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This
business is conducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: STUART
GORDON, MANAGER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 04/2014. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/08/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354757.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148900
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
COMUNITY, 584 MATEO STREET, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90013. Mailing address if different: N/A.
Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number:
201617210257. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: COMUNITY, LLC, 2502 CLARK LANE #B,
REDONDO BEACH, CA 90278 (State of Incorpo-
ration/Organization: CA). This business is conducted
by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: SHANNON M SCOTT, MANAGER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
06/2016. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354761.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148927
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. RAINMAKER ENTERPRISE, 2. RAINMAKER
SYSTEMS, 1111 S. OXFORD AVE. APT 115, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90006. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
KYOUNG MI KWACK, 1111 S. OXFORD AVE APT
115, LOS ANGELES, CA 90006. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: KYOUNG MI KWACK, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business names listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354767.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149638
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. HAWKEYE CONSTRUCTION, 2. HAWKEYE
CONSTRUCTION SERVICES INC., 2961 1/2
SOUTH ST ANDREWS PL., LOS ANGELES, CA
90018. Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles
of Incorporation or Organization Number:
201624310239. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: HAWKEYE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
INC., 2961 1/2 SOUTH ST ANDREWS PL., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90018. This business is conducted
by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MELVIN TILLOTSON, PRESIDENT. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-

tious business names listed above on (date): 06/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/09/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354816.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149584
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MUNTEAN TRUCKING, 14903 RAYFIELD DR,
LA MIRADA, CA 90638. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
JOHN MUNTEAN, 14903 RAYFIELD DR, LA
MIRADA, CA 90638. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
JOHN MUNTEAN, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354817.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149583
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FIVE STAR AUTO DETAILING, 18639 VICTORY
BLVD, RESEDA, CA 91335. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ANGEL ARIAS, 18639 VICTORY BLVD, RE-
SEDA, CA 91335. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ANGEL
ARIAS, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354818.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149534
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
REDESIGN CONSULTING, 737 1/2 S. MANS-
FIELD AVE., LOS ANGELES, CA 90036. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ROYCE HAN/ REDESIGN
CONSULTING, 737 1/2 S. MANSFIELD AVE., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90036 (State of Incorporation/Or-
ganization: CA). This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ROYCE
HAN, PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 06/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354949.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149723
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. MEDIA EVENT NETWORK, 2. MEDIA AND
EVENT SERVICES, 2021 BROWNING BLVD, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90062. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
DENNIS RICCI WAFFORDD, 2021 BROWNING
BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90062, ELIZABETH
WAFFORD, 2021 BROWNING BLVD, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90062. This business is conducted
by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: DENNIS RICCI WAFFORDD, HUSBAND.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business names listed above
on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/09/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354984.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149902
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HEART PRINT HOUSE, 1334 DAILY CIRCLE,
GLENDALE, CA 91208. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
ESTER HODIKIAN, 1334 DAILY CIRCLE, GLEN-
DALE, CA 91208. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ESTER
HODIKIAN, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 07/2016. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA355015.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149942
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CHIQUIS BAKERY & SWEETS, 1021 N NOR-
MANDIE AVE APT 217, LOS ANGELES, CA 90029.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: MELANY MENDEZ, 1021
N NORMANDIE AVE APT 217, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90029. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MELANY
MENDEZ, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA355028.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150769
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
JOURNEYS MARTIAL ARTS ACADEMY, 415
WEST 6TH ST., SAN PEDRO, CA 90731. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ERICA ARVIZU-CLARK, 2039
LEWIS AVE, LONG BEACH, CA 90806. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ERICA ARVIZU-CLARK, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
03/2014. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA355048.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150771
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CHAMPIONS FIGHT LEAGUE, 415 WEST 6TH
ST., SAN PEDRO, CA 90731. Mailing address if
different: 2039 LEWIS AVE, LONG BEACH, CA
90806. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
ERICA ARVIZU-CLARK, 2039 LEWIS AVE, LONG
BEACH, CA 90806. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ERICA ARVIZU-CLARK, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 09/
2016. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-

ER. AAA355049.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150656
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GUS GUS TRANSPORT, 11912 ROSEGLEN ST,
EL MONTE, CA 91732. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
GUSTAVO ARMANDO VALLES, 11912 ROSE-
GLEN ST, EL MONTE, CA 91732. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: GUSTAVO ARMANDO VALLES, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/12/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA355050.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017151262
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LA REFRESQUERIA VERCOLORES MEXIGUAT,
11020 INEZ ST, WHITTIER, CA 90605. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: KARLA LORENA SOLORZA-
NO LUCANO, 11020 INEZ ST, WHITTIER, CA
90605. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: KARLA LORENA
SOLORZANO LUCANO, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA355051.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017133728
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
KS INVESTIGATIONS, 291 DEL AMO FASHION
SQ. SUITE 14666, TORRANCE, CA 90503. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: KEN SHANE, 291 DEL AMO
FASHION SQ. SUITE 14666, TORRANCE, CA
90503. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: KEN SHANE, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356745.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017151373
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: J
AND C TRUCK REPAIR, 1839 E 43RD ST, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90058. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
SANTOS DEL CARMEN BONILLA, 1839 E 43RD
ST, LOS ANGELES, CA 90058. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: SANTOS DEL CARMEN BONILLA, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/12/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356747.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150762
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
WESTLAKE PHARMACY, 2500 WILSHIRE BLVD.,
#101, LOS ANGELES, CA 90057. Mailing address
if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Orga-
nization Number: C1792992. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: WESTLAKE MEDICAL MAN-
AGEMENT, INC., 2500 WILSHIRE BLVD., #101,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90057 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CALIFORNIA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: DIANA BLUMKIN, PRESIDENT. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/01/1997. This statement was filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA356975.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150761
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SM MAINTENANCE INC, 12140 RANCHITO ST,
EL MONTE, CA 91732. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization
Number: C4000388. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: SM MAINTENANCE INC, 12140 RANCHI-
TO ST, EL MONTE, CA 91732 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CA). This business is conduct-
ed by: CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information which he or
she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ELIZABETH MATA, CEO. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 03/03/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA356976.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150760
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CASINO BOOKKEEPING & PAYROLL SERVIC-
ES, 18017 CHATSWORTH STREET #194, GRAN-
ADA HILLS, CA 91344. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MARIA ELETICIA CASINO, 18017 CHATSWORTH
STREET #194, GRANADA HILLS, CA 91344. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: MARIA ELETICIA CASINO,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/12/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356977.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150818
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
TRICOLOR ENGINEERING, 9646 GARVEY AVE
SUITE 205, SOUTH EL MONTE, CA 91733. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: YONGHUI CHEN, 312 N 3RD
STREET APT E, ALHAMBRA, CA 91801. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: YONGHUI CHEN, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA356978.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150819
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
WAY OF LIFE CAR CLUB, 1503 N. LAKE AVE.,
PASADENA, CA 91104. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
LOVELL D. JOHNSON, 1503 N. LAKE AVE., PAS-
ADENA, CA 91104, DEVIN D. HOWARD, 1503
N. LAKE AVE., PASADENA, CA 91104, KELVIN

BARRY, 1503 N. LAKE AVE., PASADENA, CA
91104. This business is conducted by: GENERAL
PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
LOVELL D. JOHNSON, PARTNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA356979.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017126525
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MOM'S TOUCH, 3435 WILSHIRE BLVD., SUITE
2050, LOS ANGELES, CA 90010. Mailing address
if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Orga-
nization Number: 3986417. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: HFS GLOBAL, INC., 3435
WILSHIRE BLVD. SUITE 2050, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90010 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ANDREW S. KIM, CFO.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/16/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
BD. Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA345692.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017127522
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ETHEREAL L.A., 1620 NAOMI AVE, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90021. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: SALTY
MFG, INC., 1620 S NAOMI AVE, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90021 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: OMAR MASRI, VICE
PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 10/2016. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/17/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345856.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017127641
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GARCIA CLEANING, 1816 W 6TH ST, LOS AN-
GERLES, CA 90057. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ELDA
SHETANY GARCIA, 718 1/2 E 40TH ST. PL., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90011, JONATHAN E PALUCHA,
38300 30TH ST., E. PALMDALE, CA 93550. This
business is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ELDA
SHETANY GARCIA, PARTNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/17/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/15/2017,
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA345897.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017128856
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CORNEJO PRODUCE, 614 N. SAN BENITO ST,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90033. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ANGEL CORNEJO, 614 N. SAN BENITO,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90033. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ANGEL CORNEJO, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
04/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/18/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
BD. Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA346172.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017129910
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LOS FELIZ FIXER UPPER, 1757 HILLHURST
AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90027. Mailing address
if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Orga-
nization Number: 3731910. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: LOS FELIZ SMOKE SHOP,
1757 N HILLHURST AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA
90027 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: LUSINE DALLAKYAN,
CEO. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 12/2014. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/19/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). BD. Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017,
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA346358.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017130377
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ART HOUSE JEWELRY, 531 MAIN ST. #507, EL
SEGUNDO, CA 90245. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
KELLY WOODSON, 531 MAIN ST. #507, EL SEG-
UNDO, CA 90245. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
KELLY WOODSON, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/19/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/15/2017,
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346482.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017130384
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
WOODSON LAW GROUP, 531 MAIN ST. #507,
EL SEGUNDO, CA 90245. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: KELLY WOODSON, 531 MAIN ST. #507, EL
SEGUNDO, CA 90245. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
KELLY WOODSON, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 04/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/19/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/15/2017,
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346483.

June 22, Start
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAMES STATEMENT

2017 152677
The following person(s) is (are) doing business as
1. DP PAINTING 2. DPS PAINTING AND MORE
2004 E. REDWOOD DRIVE, GLENDORA, CA
91741, LOS ANGELES COUNTY. Full name of
registrant(s) is (are) BIND ENTERPRISES INC.
2004 E. REDWOOD DRIVE, GLENDORA, CA
91741. This business is conducted by A
CORPORATION. The registrant(s) has begun to
transact business 04/2017 under the fictitious
business name listed herein. Signed: DALE PRAY,
CFO. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles on 06/13/17. NOTICE - THIS
FICTITIOUS NAME STATEMENT EXPIRES FIVE
YEARS FROM DATE IT WAS FILED FROM THE

OFFICE OF THE COUNTY CLERK. A NEW
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT MUST
BE FILED PRIOR TO THAT DATE.  The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in
violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (See Section 14411, et seq,
Business and Professional Code.) Publish: June
22, 29, July 6, 13, 2017, San Gabriel Valley
Examiner / / Ad #F400

CNBB251701SN FILE NO.2017139748
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EMPIRE OF STARS ; EMPIRE OF STARS COM &
RES 8255 FIRESTONE BLVD STEW 407
DOWNEY CA 90241.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) EMPIRE OF STARS COMMERCIAL AND
RESIDENTIAL REAL ESTATE SERVICES INC
8255 FIRESTONE BLVD STE 407 DOWNEY CA
90241. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 05/31/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 09/
2008. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing:  06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner    CNBB251701SN

CNBB251702SM FILE NO.2017151849
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KSF INTEGRITY 23582 JUBILEE LN DIAMOND
BAR CA 91765. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
KEVIN S LEE 23582 JUBILEE LN DIAMOND BAR
CA 91765. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251702SM

CNBB251703PS FILE NO.2017142669
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FRANK'S LAWNMOWER SHOP 8717 WOOD-
MAN AVE #D ARLETA CA 91331. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ARTURO MORA-RODRIGU-
EZ 8530 CEDROS AVE # 15 PANORAMA CITY
CA 91402. The business is conducted by:  AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251703PS

CNBB251704PS FILE NO.2017143530
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
WOK & GRILL ASIAN CUISINE 8401 VAN NUYS
BLVD UNIT 22 PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) JCH KITCHEN INC
15150 PARTHENIA ST #16 NORTH HILLS CA
91343. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251704PS

CNBB251705RM FILE NO.2017142803
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HAIR BOSS 1260 BLAKE AVE LOS ANGELES CA
90031. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LENA
REITZ 1260 BLAKE AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90031.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL .
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/1/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251705RM

CNBB251706RM FILE NO.2017143520
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CREDITORS SPECIALTY 6610 JUNIPER CREST
RD AGUA DULCE CA 91390. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) CHARLES V. STANLEY 6610
JUNIPER CREST RD AGUA DULCE CA 91390.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251706RM

CNBB251707ED FILE NO.2017142962
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SPRING HOUSE LA 7436 DEERING AVENUE
CANOGA PARK CA 91303.Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JOSE ANGUIANO 7436 DEERING
AVENUE CANOGA PARK CA 91303. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251707ED

CNBB251708ED FILE NO.2017143537
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PEOPLE'S CARE MEDICAL SUPPLY 10938
VANOWEN ST NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) PEOPLE'S CARE
MEDICAL SUPPLY INC 10938 VANOWEN ST
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 04/24/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251708ED

CNBB251709PS FILE NO.2017144949
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BURBANK HYPNOSIS 224 E OLIVE AE #216
BURBANK CA 91502. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) KELLIE LUPE-SMITH 6338 LONGRIDGE
AVE VALLEY GLEN CA 91401. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement

does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251709PS

CNBB251710PS FILE NO.2017145129
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DIAMOND BRIGHTWINDOW CLEANING 1601
N. SEPULVEDA BLVD PMB 724 MANHATTAN
BEACH CA 90266. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) DERRICK L. BROWN 1601 N. SEPULVEDA
BLVD PMB 724 MANHATTAN BEACH CA 90266.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner  CNBB251710PS

CNBB251711ED FILE NO.2017144360
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
TURBO TRUCKING 8816 TOBIAS AVE #28 VAN
NUYS CA 91402. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JULIO FLORES 8816 TOBIAS AVE #28 VAN
NUYS CA 91402.The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251711ED

CNBB251712ED FILE NO.20171145130
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AND WAFFLES 4141 LANKERSHIM BLVD
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91602. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MADDIES CORNER BIS-
TRO INC 4141 LANKERSHIM BLVD NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91602. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251712ED

CNBB251713ED FILE NO.2017144958
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PERFECT LINES RESTORATIONS 13222
RAYMER ST UNIT B NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA
91605. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JOEL
CERVANTES 23751 CANERWELL NEW HALL
CA 91321. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251713ED

CNBB251714ED FILE NO.2017145034
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MR. J'S SHIELDS 12859 VAN NUYS BLVD PA-
COIMA CA 91331. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JOSE ESPITIA 12859 VAN NUYS BLVD
PACOIMA CA 91331. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251714ED

CNBB251715NQ FILE NO.2017144590
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ABOVE & BEYONG CARPET CARE 15070 VIC-
TORY BLVD #104 VAN NUYS CA 91411. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) JAVIER CARRILLO
15070 VICTORY BLVD #104 VAN NUYS CA
91411. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251715NQ

CNBB251716EL FILE NO.2017144534
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SWAR818TATTOOS 17612 BALTAR ST
NORTHRIDGE CA 91325. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) THE APPENTICE INC 17612 BAHAR
ST NORTHRIDGE CA 91325. The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251716EL

CNBB271717EL FILE NO.2017144758
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
CORPORATE ADMINISTRATIVE TRAINING SER-
VICES 18434 COLLINS ST #11 TARZANA CA
91356. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) TENICIA
BENNETT 18434 COLLINS ST #11 TARZANA CA
91356.The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
05/17. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251717EL

CNBB251718EL FILE NO.2017144868
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GREEN PINEAPPLE WEAR 8520 SHERWOOD
DR #9 WEST HOLLYWOOD CA 90069. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MARKKARYAN LLC 8520
SHERWOOD DR #9 WEST HOLLYWOOD CA
90069. The business is conducted by: A LIMITED
LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/05/17. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
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AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB251755IF

CNBB251756IF FILE NO.2017146226
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MICHELLINE HENDERSON & WENDY ESPINO-
ZA HOMES 8680 ATLANTIC BLVD SOUTH GATE
CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
WENDY ESPINOZA 8680 ATLANTIC BLVD
SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251756IF

CNBB251757ET FILE NO.2017144188
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
MRD LANDSCAPING 5016 MAINE AVE BALD-
WIN PARK CA 91706. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) NILDA LAINEZ ; REYNA MARTINEZ 5016
MAINE AVE BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. The busi-
ness is conducted by: CO PARTNERS. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) 06/2017com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251757ET

CNBB251758JEN FILE NO.2017145061
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DAYFLOWERSSUN ;NEW BREED
ENTERTAINMENT;MANEMAN 2102 SANTA ANA
NORTH LOS ANGELES CA 90059. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) DAISY MARIE GILLIAM 2102
SANTA ANA NORTH LOS ANGELES CA 90059.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2015. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251758JEN

CNBB251759GM FILE NO.2017144812
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SK8NESE 1629 CHERRY AVE # 301 LONG
BEACH CA 90813. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) NAOYA MUKAI 1629 CHERRY AVE # 301
LONG BEACH 90813.The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251759GM

CNBB251760GM FILE NO.2017145181
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MGM AUTO REGISTRATION SERVICES 320 S.
FRESNO ST LOS ANGELES CA 90063. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) JOSE MANUEL GODOY
MANZANO 1067 DUNDAS ST LOS ANGELES
CA 90063. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing:  06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251760GM

CNBB2251761GM FILE NO.2017144983
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
CERVANTES TRANSPORT 3933 WALNUT AVE
LYNWOD CA 90262. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JOEL CERVANTES JIMENEZ 3933 WAL-
NUT AVE LYNWOOD CA 90262. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251761GM

CNBB251762GM FILE NO.2017144382
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ACCENT DESIGNS PLUS 1527 E. O. STREET
WILMINGTON CA 90744. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ACCENT DESIGNS PLUS INC 1527
E.O. STREET WILMINGTON CA 90744. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 02/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251762GM

CNBB251763TC FILE NO.2017145000
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SAGRADO CORAZON MARKET 3727 FIRE-
STONE BLVD SOUTH GATE CA 90280. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MANUEL CHAVEZ 3727
FIRESTONE BLVD SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251763TC

CNBB251764TC FILE NO.2017144304
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NICHOLAS TAX SOLUTIONS 5150 EAST CAN-
DLWOOD STREET # 18J LAKEWOOD CA 91766.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) NICHOLAS TAX
SOLUTIONS LLC 5150 EAST CANDLEWOOD
STREET #18J LAKEWOOD CA 91766. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who

declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 10/
2011. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB251764TC

CNBB251765TC FILE NO.2017144012
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GOLDEN GLOBAL AND CAPITAL INC 1767 WEST
VERNON AVE 1767 WEST VERNON AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90062. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SMART U. AKPULONU 1767 WEST VER-
NON 1767 WEST VERNON AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90062.  The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251765TC

CNBB251766TC FILE NO.2017144137
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: K
AND M MINI MARKET 1767 WEST VERNON AVE
LOS ANGELES CA 90062. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) SMART U. AKPULONU 1767 WEST
VERONON AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90062. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251766TC

CNBB251767TC FILE NO.2017143965
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JASSI'S FASHION & TAILORING 18377 PIONEER
BLVD ARTESIA CA 90701. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JASSI'S FASHION & TAILORING INC
18377 PIONEER BLVD ARTESIA CA 90701. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2012. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251767TC

CNBB251768MU FILE NO.2017144282
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
H&N MANAGEMENT 919 S BONNIE BRAE ST
APT 101 LOS ANGELES CA 90006. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) HUGO GONZALEZ-MUN-
GUIA 919 S BONNIE BRAE ST APT 101 LOS
ANGELES CA 90006. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251768MU

CNBB251769MU FILE NO.2017145081
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: JG
LOGISTICS 5023 E GAGE AVE BELL CA 90201.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JOSUE GAR-
CIA 5023 E GAGE AVE BELL CA 90201. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251769MU

CNBB251770MU FILE NO.2017145037
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FUTURE CELL 2023 W FLORENCE AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90047. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MAHMOOD HARATI 2023 W FLORENCE
AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90047. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251770MU

CNBB251771MU FILE NO.2017144253
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANGELICA'S MARKET 243 E 53RD ST LOS AN-
GELES CA 90011. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ANGELICA M BELLO 243 E 53RD ST LOS
ANGELES CA 90011. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17  The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251771MU

CNBB2251772MU FILE NO.201744244
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GARCIAS DISCOUNT STORE 6221 S MAIN ST
LOS ANGELES CA 90003. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) DELFINA M. CABRERA 6221 S MAIN
ST LOS ANGELES CA 90003. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB251772MU

CNBB251773MU FILE NO.2017144163
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
L&E CONSTRUCTION 4068 W. 105TH ST IN-
GLEWOOD CA 90304. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) LUIS ALBERTO AGUILAR MARTINEZ
4068 W 105TH ST INGLEWOOD CA 90304. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-

TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251773MU

CNBB251774MU FILE NO.2017144748
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FERBET & COMPANY 117 ½ EAST STREET LOS
ANGELES CA 90011. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) FRANKLIN FERNANDO BETANCOURT
SOTO ;TWYLA YAMILETH HERNANDEZ; JUAN
FERNADO BETANCOURT 117 ½ EAST 25TH
STREET LOS ANGELES CA 90011. The business
is conducted by: A  GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251774MU

CNBB251775MU FILE NO.2017143853
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LINK TRAVEL ;LOS ANGELES WEDDING CHAP-
EL 11035 LONG BEACH BLVD #3 LYNWOOD CA
90262. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ADRI-
ANA MABEL BERCIAN ; JOSE ROBERTO
MIRANDA BERCIAN 11035  LONG BEACH BLVD
#3 LYNWOOD CA 90262. The business is con-
ducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 07/2014. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB251775MU

CNBB251776MU FILE NO.2017143851
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LINK TRAVEL ;LOS ANGELES WEDDING CHAP-
EL 2511 E. CESAR CHAVEZ AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90033. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ADRIANA MABEL BERCIAN ; JOSE ROBERTO
MIRANDA BERCIAN 2511 E CESAR CHAVEZ
AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90033.  The business is
conducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 01/2002. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251776MU

CNBB251777MU FILE NO.2017143808
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LOYALTY TRANSPORTATION 5827 CLARA ST
BELL GARDENS CA 90201. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) PEDRO L. ZUNIGA 5827 CLARA
ST BELL GARDENS CA 90201. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB251777MU

CNBB251778MU FILE NO.2017144222
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MONTOYA'S MINI MARKET 6726 S SAN PEDRO
ST LOS ANGELES CA 90003. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ELIA CABRERA LEON 6726 S
SAN PEDRO ST LOS ANGELES CA 90003.  The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above 06/2017. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251778MU

CNBB251779IF FILE NO.2017145016
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
STELLAR; STELLAR CONSTRUCTION;STELLAR
CONSTRUCTION CONSULTING  6410
TRELAWNEY AVE TEMPLE CITY CA 91780. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) TIFFANYANLI ANLI
ATHENA LIN 6410 TRELAWNEY AVE TEMPLE
CITY CA 91780. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251779IF

CNBB251780IF FILE NO.2017144553
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KRB TRUCKING 8922 KAUFFMAN AVE SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
RAUL O. TORRES 8922 KAUFFMAN AVE SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05//2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 07/2011. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251780IF

CNBB251781IF FILE NO.2017144559
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: K &
C ALTA DENA DAIRY 14042 RAMONA BLVD
BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) PUNIT INVESTMENTS INC 14042
RAMONA BLVD BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. The
business is conducted by:  A CORPORATION.I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 12/1996. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251781IF

CNBB251782GM FILE NO.2017144606
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VELAZQUEZ TACOS 11037 FERINA ST APT #14
NORWALK CA 90650. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) GUSTAVO VELAZQUEZ 11037 FERINA
ST APT #14 NORWALK CA 90650. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-

tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251718EL

CNBB251719EL FILE NO.2017145131
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PICK A PARTI 13636 VENTURA BLVD # 173
SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) SHERE ERMILIO 13812 DAUNA
TERRACE SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on . NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251719EL

CNBB251720EL FILE NO.2017145128
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GRAFF RESTAURANT AND BANQUET 1109 N.
BRAND AVE GLENDALE CA 91202. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ASHOT BAGHDASARYAN
4020 W MAGNOLIA BLVD #F BURBANK CA
91505. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL . I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251720EL

CNBB251721OSCAR FILE NO.2017145133
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as the
) MAPLE PHARMACY 620 S GLENDALE AVE
SUITE J GLENDALE CA 91205. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) K & S HOFFMAN INC 620 S
GLENDALE AVE SUITE J GLENDALE CA 91205.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
05/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT  com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251721OSCAR

CNBB251722OSCAR FILE NO.2017145132
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: LC
MOBILE CAR WASH 31657 RIDGE ROUTE RD
APT # 103D CASTAIC CA 91384. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) LUCIO DE LA CRUZ CATA-
RINA 31657 RIDGE ROUTE RD APT #103D
CASTAIC CA 91384. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/05/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251722OSCAR

CNBB251723EL FILE NO.2017140896
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MERCHANT NATION ASSOCIATION ;NATION-
AL MERCHANT FOUNDATION 6400 LAUREL
CANYON BLVD SUITE 302A NORTH HOLLY-
WOOD CA 91606. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ELITE MANAGEMENT SOLUTIONS INC
6400 LAUREL CANYON BLVD 302 A NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/01/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB251723EL

CNBB251724EL FILE NO.2017143153
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CLARA STUDIOS 9121 SEPULVEDA BLVD # 209
NORTH HILLS CA 91343. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) HERBERT DIAZ FUENTES 911
SEPULVEDA BLVD #209 NORTH HILLS CA
91393;MALAK AS MANSOOUD 8851 BOLIN CIR
HUNTINGTON BEACH CA 92646. The business
is conducted by: A  GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251724EL

CNBB251725EL FILE NO.2017143319
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as;
NICOLE SQIRES LIFE COACH 7743 DUCOR
AVE WEST HILLS CA 91304.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) NICOLE SQUIRES 7743 DUCOR
AVE WEST HILLS CA 91304. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251725EL

CNBB251726EL FILE NO.2017142538
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PARTY SHOP AVENUE 14900 MAGNOLIA BLVD
# 57273 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91413. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) DEANDRA CRIS MON
14620 DICKENS ST #6 SHERMAN OAKS CA
91403. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT  commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB251726EL

CNBB251727EL FILE NO.2017143125
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business WEAR
NOYA 2912 CANADA BLVD GLENDALE CA
91208. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) NOEMI
KOUYOUMDJIAN 2912 CANADA BLVD GLEN-
DALE CA 91208. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section

14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251727EL

CNBB251728EL FILE NO.2017143154
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CLARA IDEA 9121 SEPULVEDA BLVD 3209
NORTH HILLS CA 91343. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) HERBERT DIAZ FUENTES 9121
SEPULVEDA BLVD #209 NORTH HILLS CA
91343. #The business is conducted by:  AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251728EL

CNBB251729NQ FILE NO.2017143384
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BACKYARD DREAMING; NADINE JOLIE
COURTNEY1337 18TH STREET #1 SANTA MON-
ICA CA 90404. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
TIER 4 SUPPORT INC 1337 18TH STREET 31
SANTA MONICA CA 90404.The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 09/09/2011. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer  CNBB251729NQ

CNBB251730OSCAR FILE NO.2017143519
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROYALTY EXTRACTS 710 1304 W 7TH ST APT
311 LOS ANGELES CA 90017.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ISAAC ADONAY ALVAREZ 1304
W 7TH ST APT 311 LOS ANGELES CA 90012.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
02/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251730OSCAR

CNBB251731RM FILE NO.2017146389
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
CALIFORNIA DRYWALL 23645 MEADAVRIDGE
DR UNIT 143 NEWHALL CA 91321. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ERNESTO ORELLANA 23645
MEADAVRIDGE DR UNIT 143 NEWHALL CA
91321. The business is conducted by: A INDIVID-
UAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251731RM

CNBB251732RM FILE NO.2017146392
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as) VK
LOGISTICS 4539 LONGRIDGE AVE SHERMAN
OAKS CA 91423. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ALEX LUNA 4539 LONGRIDGE AVE SHER-
MAN OAKS CA 91423. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/06/2016. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251732RM

CNBB251733ED FILE NO.2017146147
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as )
NEW PIPE PLUMBING AND ROOTER #2 7083
HOLLYWOOD BLVD #4007 LOS ANGELES CA
90028.The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 03/
06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing; 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251733ED

CNBB251734ED FILE NO.2017146505
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GRACE COURIERS 7508 NESTLE AVE RESE-
DA CA 91335. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
FELIPE R. HERRERA VIELMAN 7508 NESTLE
AVE RESEDA CA 91335.The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing:; 6/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251734ED

CNBB251735ED FILE NO.2017146533
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ADS4TRUCKS 8823 FENWICK STREET SUN-
LAND CA 91040. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ARMENAK SHAHBAZIAN 8823 FENWICK
STREET SUNLAND CA 91040. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251735ED

CNBB251736EL FILE NO.2017145846
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VIALOS PARTNERS 25707 RANCHO ADOBO
RD VALENCIA CA 91355. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JOSE FERNANDEZ ;MARIA FERNAN-
DEZ 25707 RANCHO ADOBO RD VALENCIA
CA 91355. The business is conducted by: A GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251736EL

CNBB251737EL FILE NO.2017146360
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:

L.A. MERCH 6600 W SUNSET BLVD LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90028. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
CRISTIAN TOVAR 2926 EL NIDO DR ALTADENA
CA 91001;DEREK CHESTNUT 4155 DUQUESNE
AVE CULVER CITY CA 90232.The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251737EL

CNBB251738OSCAR FILE NO.2017146357
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
QUALITY CLEANING SERVICES 14251 LORNE
ST PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) IGNACIO ROSAS ESCO-
BAR 14251 LORNE ST PANORAMA CITY CA
91402. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 05/
2012. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251738OSCAR

CNBB251739OSCAR FILE NO.2017146422
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VISIONARY LA 27010 KARNS CT APT # 61204
CANYON COUNTRY CA 91387. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) NASIM AHMADI 27010
KARNS CT APT 61204 CANYON COUNTRY CA
91387. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251739OSCAR

CNBB251740NQ FILE NO.2017146391
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as) E-
DRIVES 9600 GULLO AVE ARLETA CA 91331.Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) E-DRIVES INC
9600 GULLO AVE ARLETA CA 91331. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 04/19/17. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 San Gabriel Valley Exam-
iner     CNBB251740NQ

CNBB251741NQ FILE NO.2017145101
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TACO RANCH 9678 SUNLAND BLVD SHADOW
HILLS CA 91040. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) VLADIMIR STEFANOVIC 116 N. MARY-
LAND AVE GLENDALE CA 91206. The business
is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/05/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251741NQ

CNBB251742NQ FILE NO.2017145949
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: RH
CAPITAL PARTNERS 1305 CARLTON DR #H
GLENDALE CA 91205. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) RAZMIK HAKOBYAN 1305 CARLTON DR
#H GLENDALE CA 91205. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2011. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB251742NQ

CNBB251743NQ FILE NO.2017145902
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
POWER UP 13807 OXNARD ST APT #16 VAN
NUYS CA 91401. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) GARRY BRADLEY 13807 OXNARD ST APT
#16 VAN NUYS CA 91401. The business is con-
ducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251743NQ

CNBB251744AC FILE NO.2017146033
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CALIFORNIA LANDSCAPE COMPANY 618 W
RAYMOND ST COMPTON CA 90220. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MILTON CARLOS
MOSQUEDA 618 W RAYMOND ST COMPTON
CA 90220. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251744AC

CNBB251745AC FILE NO.2017146207
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: A.S
ACCOUNTING & BOOKKEPING SERVICE 9217
WASHBURN RD 310 DOWNEY CA 90242. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) SANDRA MARIZA
ARISMENDY ; FREDDY ARRUE SOBERANIS
9217 WASHBURN RD #10 DOWNEY CA 90242.
The business is conducted by: A MARRIED COU-
PLE. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB251745AC

CNBB251746AC FILE NO.2017146345
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
STEALTH ONE SECURITY SERVICES ; S.O.S.
SERVICES 626 S. WOODS AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90022. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)

MAIRO LEONARDO FLORES; JULIO CESAR
GONZALEZ CEBALLOS 626 S WOODS AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90022. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  NOT Commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB251746AC

CNBB251747TC FILE NO.2017146503
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as MC
TREATS 7081 MYRTLE AVE LONG BEACH CA
90805. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MARY-
CRUZ GALICIA 7081 MYRTLE AVE LONG BEACH
CA 90805. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251747TC

CNBB251748GM FILE NO.2017145782
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE SHOP & FLEET MAINTENANCE 1441 RANG-
ER DR COVINA CA 91722. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ALVARO GUTIERREZ 1208 ST.
GEORGE DR SAN DIMAS CA 91773. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN IDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/06/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251748GM

CNBB2251749DC FILE NO.2017146405
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as) A
ARAGON PRODUCE 8460 SAN ANTONIO AVE
SOUTH GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) HONORINA MATLALA SANCHEZ ;
ALONDRA ARAGON 8460 SAN ANTONIO AVE
SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The business is con-
ducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251749DC

CNBB 251750JL FILE NO.2017145420
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LOS CHILENOS ROAD SERVICE 790 W. OLIV-
ER ST SAN PEDRO CA 90731. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) SALVADOR DEL CARMEN
CASTRO ARAYA 790 W. OLIVER ST SAN PEDRO
CA 90731. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB251750JL

 CNBB251751JL FILE NO.2017145663
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MANTENIMIENTO VARIADO 4547 N. IRWIN-
DALE AVE COVINA CA 91722.  Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ADOLFO PEREZ CRUZ ;
JONATHAN CRUZ 4541 N. IRWINDALE AVE
COVINA CA 91722. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251751JL

CNBB251752MU FILE NO.2017145349
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TONERSTOCKS.COM 546 W COLORADO ST
#246 GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ERWIN HERNANDEZ 11736
SPINNING AVE HAWTHORNE CA 90250. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251752MU

CNBB251753MU FILE NO.2017145551
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
TAQUERIA LOS PAISANOS 753 E. HOLT AVE
POMONA CA 91767.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CRD INVESTMENT INC 753 E HOLT AVE
POMONA CA 91767. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 THE
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251753MU

CNBB251754MU FILE NO.2017146512
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GARVEY THERAPY 9611 GARVEY AVE #201A
SOUTH EL MONTE CA 91733. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) PHAN LE HUYNH 9611 GAVEY
AVE #201A SOUTH EL MONTE CA 91733.The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251754MU

CNBB251755IF FILE NO.2017146351
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: HG
CLEANING 808 S VERMONT AVE #222 LOS
ANGELES CA 90005. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) OSCAR GONZALEZ HERNANDEZ 808 S
VERMONT AVE #222 LOS ANGELES CA 90005.
The business is conducted by: A AN INDIVIDU-
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act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251782GM

CNBB2251783JL FILE NO.2017146768
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ADZ LOGISTICS 3816 ½ PINE AVE EL MONTE
CA 91731.; PO BOX 7415 ALHAMBRA CA
91802.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ALEJAN-
DRO DIAZ ZALDIVAR 3816 ½ PINE AVE EL
MONTE CA 91731. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251783JL

CNBB251784GM FILE NO.2017147929
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GIL'S GARDEN 13224 EARL AVE BALDWIN
PARK CA 91706. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) IRIS M. CERVANTES LOPEZ ; JOSE CE-
SAR RAMIREZ 13224  EARL AVE BALDWIN
PARK CA 91706. The business is conducted by: A
MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251784GM

CNBB251785JEN FILE NO.2017147195
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: H &
B'S FLOWERS 1624 E.68TH ST LOS ANGELES
CA 90001. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
HUGO ALEJANDRO SANCHEZ CHAVEZ ; BLAN-
CA MIREYA SEPULVEDA SAMBRANO 1624 E.
68TH ST LOS ANGELES CA 90001. The business
is conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNB251785JEN

CNBB251786AC FILE NO.2017147413
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TASTY DINING 301 W VALLEY BLVD STE 101
SAN GABRIEL CA 91776.  Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) YIJINTE INVESTMENT TRADE (USA)
INC 301 W VALLEY BLVD STE 101 SAN GABRI-
EL CA 91776. The business is conducted by: A
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/07/2017 The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251786AC

CNBB251787AC FILE NO.2017147452
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TASTY DINING 301 W VALLEY BLVD 101 SAN
GABRIEL CA 91776.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CALIFORNIA INVESTMENT REGIONAL
CENTER LLC 9911 VALLEY BLVD EL MONTE CA
91731. The business is conducted by: A LIMITED
LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 01/2012. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/
13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251787AC

CNBB251788IF FILE NO.2017147360
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HIGHTEC GE 3420 OLIVE ST APT B HUNTING-
TON PARK CA 90255. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) MIGUEL A AGUIRRE ESTUPINAN 3420
OLIVE ST APT B HUNTINGTON PARK CA 90255.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251788IF

CNBB251788IF FILE NO.2017147360
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
HIGH-TEC GE 3420 OLIVE ST APT B HUNTING-
TON PARK CA 90255. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) MIGUEL A AGUIRRE ESTUPINAN 3420
OLIVE ST APT B HUNTINGTON PARK CA 90255.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251788IF

CNBB251789IF FILE NO.2017147586
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
SKY MEDIA MARKETING & PRODUCTIONS
9040 TELEGRAPH ROAD SUITE 204 DOWNEY
CA 90240. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
JULIO MIDOLO ; ISRAEL JOSAFAT QUINTANIL-
LA 9040 TELEGRAPH ROAD SUITE 204
DOWNEY CA 90240. The business is conducted
by: A CO PARTNERS. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251789IF

CNBB251790IF FILE NO.2017147589
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BARREDA REAL ESTATE GROUP 9040 TELE-
GRAPH ROAD SUITE 204 DOWNEY CA 90240.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ARTHUR
NICHOLAS BARREDA 9040 TELEGRAPH ROAD
SUITE 204 DOWNEY CA 90240. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-

act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251790IF

CNBB251791DC FILE NO.2017147188
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
COOL ELECTROMECANIC 9260 PALM ST APT 3
BELLFLOWER CA 90706. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) CARLOS GERARDO GALLARDO-
ACUNA 9260 PALM ST APT 3 BELLFLOWER CA
90706. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251791DC

CNBB251792DC FILE NO.2017145586
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
IMPIRE ESTATES 7948 FLORENCE AVE
DOWNEY CA 90240. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SALAZAR GROUP INTERNATIONAL 7948
FLORENCE AVE DOWNEY CA 90240. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 01/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251792DC

CNBB251793DC FILE NO.2017147190
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GALLARDO PRODUCE 9260 PALM ST APT 3
BELLFLOWER CA 90706. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) CARLOS GERARDO GALLARDO-
ACUNA 9260 PALM ST APT 3 BELLFLOWER CA
90706.The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251793DC

CNBB251794MU FILE NO.2017147200
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: I &
E PAINTING 5741 SHULL ST BELL GARDENS
CA 90201. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MICHEL VARGAS GALINDO 5741 SHULL ST
BELL GARDENS CA 90201. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names
listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/
13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB251794MU

CNBB251795MU FILE NO.2017146942
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
COASTAL TAX SERVICES 661 W 31ST SAN
PEDRO CA 90731;10722 WRIGHT RD 19 SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
GLADIS MORENO MORALES 10722 WRIGHT
RD 19 SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB251795MU

CNBB251796PS FILE NO.2017148572
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
S.I.M TRANSPORTATION 6628 SEPULVEDA
BLVD APT #222 VAN NUYS CA 91411. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MARVEL BONILLA 6628
SEPULVEDA BLVD APT #222 VAN NUYS CA
91411. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251796PS

CNBB251797PS FILE NO.2017149172
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ONHOMELY 12955 RIVERSIDE DR 310 SHER-
MAN OAKS CA 91423. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) DATA E. COMMERCE INC 12955 RIVER-
SIDE DR SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251797PS

CNBB251798PS FILE NO.2017149173
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PRIVILEGE HOME REALTY
23241 VENTURA BLVD #219 WOODLAND HILLS
CA 91364.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DI
REAL ESTATE SERVICES INC 23241 VENTURA
BLVD#219 WOODLAND HILLS CA 91364 . The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB251798PS

CNBB251799RM FILE NO.2017149123
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CASE BUILDER MANAGEMENT SERVICES
15232 FOOTHILL BLVD #145 SYLMAR CA 91342.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) RAMONCITO
MENDOZA; EVELYN MENDOZA 15232 FOOT-
HILL BLVD # 145 SYLMAR CA 91342. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP . I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-

tious business name or names listed above on 01/
01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251799RM

CNBB2517100RM FILE NO.2017149124
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: A &
H SERVICES COMPANY 311 N BELMONT ST
UNIT 35 GLENDALE CA 91206. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are)The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP . I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 03/01/2016. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517100RM

CNBB2517101RM FILE NO.20171149122
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: J-
LYN CARE 2750 RIVERSIDE DRIVE APT #216
LOS ANGELES CA 90039. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) JOWILYN GIRON ; MARIELIERE AL-
CANTARA 2750 RIVESIDE DRIVE APT #216 LOS
ANGELES CA 90039. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517101RM

CNBB2517102RM FILE NO.2017149171
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MAYFAIR HOME HEALTH 6340 COLDWATER
CYN BLVD #208 NOHO CA 91606. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MAYFAIR HOME CARE SER-
VICES 6340 COLDWATER CYN BLVD # 208
NOHO HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. The business is
conducted by: A CORPORATION . I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 2005. NOTICE-The Ficti-
tious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517102RM

CNBB2517103RM FILE NO.2017148817
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LIVING 1-FIFTY INC ; THE UNDERGROUND
CHURCH;CONEKT-LA ART CENTER; CONEKT-
LA ART CENTER; LIFE 1 FIFTY CHURCH; LIFE
150 CHURCH; LIFE 150 CHURCH; STEP OF
HOPE;WORD IN MOTION 7624 VARNA AVE
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605;5416 FAIR AVE
# 8201 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91601. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) LIVING 1-FIFTY-
INC 7624 VARNA AVE N HOLLYWOOD CA 91605.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517103RM

CNBB2517104ED FILE NO.2017149174
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
YOUR OWN RULER ;YOR 25343 SILVER AS-
PEN WAY # 1127 VALENCIA CA 91381. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) KAUR MANINDER;
ZORAWAR SOHI 25343 SILVER ASPEN WAY #
1127 VALENCIA CA 91381. The business is con-
ducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/08/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517104ED

CNBB2517105ED FILE NO.2017149190
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THREADING BY MANDY 25343 SILVER ASPEN
WAY # 1127 VALENCIA CA 91381. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) KAUR MANINDER 25343
SILVER ASPEN WAY # 1127 VALENCIA CA
91381. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517105ED

CNBB2517106ED FILE NO.2017148918
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KATIE'S ACUPUNCTURE 625 N NIAGARA ST
BURBANK CA 91505. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) KATIE STAR 625 N NIAGARA ST BUR-
BANK CA 91505. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/08/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517106ED

CNBB2517107EL FILE NO.2017148928
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VIEW WINDOW & MIRROR HOME REPAIR 6650
BEEMAN AVE NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91606.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) CHRISTIAN
JOSEPH ANDINO 6650 BEEMAN AVE NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91606;MARIA R. ANDINO
11441 OXNARD ST 17 NORTH HOLLYWOOD
CA 91606. The business is conducted by: A GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517107EL

CNBB2517108EL FILE NO.2017149152
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MALIBU 3D VIRTUAL TOURS & PHTOGRAPHY
770 CHARLES ST MOORPARK CA 93021;770
CHARLES ST MOORPARK CA 93021. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are). The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This

statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 05/2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/
13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517108EL

CNBB2517109OSCAR FILE NO.2017149020
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ALLURE 7946 LOUISE AVE NORTHRIDGE CA
91325. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) VERA
LUCIA ALBANES 7946 LOUISE AVE
NORTHRIDGE CA 91325. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17  The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517109OSCAR

CNBB2517110NQ FILE NO.2017148558
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TAXFREE LA 9717 O'MELVENY ARLETA CA
91331. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JOSE
DIAZ 9717 O'MELVENY ARLETA CA 91331. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517110NQ

CNBB2517111NQ FILE NO.2017148993
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: HG
TOBACCO MART 99 C & UP 5401 S. FIGUEROA
ST #5 LOS ANGELES CA 90037. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) HAMADA ABDELAZIZ AHMED
ABDALLA ; MOHAMED MAHMOUD ABDEL MON-
EM 5401 S FIGUEROA ST LOS ANGELES CA
90037. The business is conducted by: CO PART-
NERS . I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 01/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517111NQ

CNBB2517112NQ FILE NO.2017148939
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KILIKIA MACHINERY 13749 VICTORY BLVD STE
#1-B VAN NUYS CA 91401.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) NARINE SARKISIAN 9025 WILL-
IS AVE #13 PANORAMA CA 91402. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOTcommenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on . NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing:06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517112NQ

CNBB2517113NQ FILE NO.2017148831
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROCHIE'S ;  ROCHIE; ROCHIE.COM; ROCH-
IES; ROCHIE'S ORIGINALS; ROCHIES.COM;
ROCHIESORGININALS.COM; THE GRAD
STORE;  THEGRADSTORE.COM 9514 RESEDA
BLVD SUITE 12 NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ROCHIE'S IN. 9514
RESEDA BLD SUITE 12 NORTHRIDGE CA 91324.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)  commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 09/1991. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517113NQ

CNBB2517114PS FILE NO.2017146937
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DONAR EXPRESS 463 W. MAPLE ST #7 GLEN-
DALE CA 91204. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) NORAIR VARDANIAN 463 W MAPLE ST #7
GLENDALE CA 91204. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 08/2013. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/
13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517114PS

CNBB2517115PS FILE NO.2017147218
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MARES INTERNATIONAL TRADE 5292 NEWCAS-
TLE AVE ENCINO CA 91316.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) MARCO SALAZAR; ESMERALDA
SALAZAR 5292 NEW CASTLE AVE ENCINO CA
91325. The business is conducted by: A GENER-
AL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517115PS

CNBB2517116PS FILE NO.2017147244
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
OUR VILLAGE PRESCHOOL ; MUSIC BOX PRE-
SCHOOL 720 SOUTH MAIN STREET BURBANK
CA 91506;11204 HORTENSE STREET WEST
TOLUCA LAKE CA 91602. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) OUR VILLAGE PRESCHOOL INC 11204
HORTENSE STREET WEST TOLUCA LAKE AVE
91602 . The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 07/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517116PS

CNBB2517117PS FILE NO.2017147872
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
IDEAL SERVICES 346 N. LOUISE ST #12 GLEN-
DALE CA 91206. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) HAUK TAHMAZYAN 346 N. LOUISE ST #12
GLENDALE CA 91206. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or

she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 12/2012. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/
13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517117PS

CNBB2517118RM FILE NO.2017147647
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MME GROUP 15826 VENTURA BLVD STE 224
ENCINO CA 91436. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MESROP SARGSYAN 15826 VENTURA
BLVD STE 224 ENCINO CA 91436. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517118RM

CNBB22517119RM FILE NO.2017147644
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MGC ; MARKETING GROUP CONSULTANTS
17000 BURBANK BLV #109 ENCINO CA 91316.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DARON
FORDHAM 17000 BURBANK BLVD #109 ENCI-
NO CA 91316. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517119RM

CNBB2517120RM FILE NO.2017147646
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KOBAYASHI MARTIAL ARTS ; UNITY MARTIAL
ARTS 6950 GLORIA AVE VAN NUYS CA
91406.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) OMAR A.
FLORES 6950 GLORIA AVE VAN NUYS CA
91406;ROSE ACEVEDO 17126 BIRCHER ST
GRANDA HILLS CA 91344;JASON ANCHETA
16566 HAYNES ST LAKE BALBOA CA 91406.
The business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517120RM

CNBB251721ED FILE NO.2017147110
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CORTEZ MASONRY 14642 DELANO ST #4 VAN
NUYS CA 91411.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ALBERTO CORTEZ BALTAZAR 14642 DEL-
ANO ST #4 VAN NUYS CA 91411. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517121ED

CNBB2517122EL FILE NO.2017147575
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: WC
WINDOWS AND DOORS 9830 CAYUGA AVE
PACOIMA CA 91331. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) WILFREDO CERON PALENCIA 9830 CA-
YUGA AVE PACOIMA CA 91331. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517122EL

CNBB2517123OSCAR FILE NO.2017147821
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: GJ
UNICONE 7756 BURNET AVE VAN NUYS CA
91405. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MOHA-
MAD ANOUTI; GAGIK GEVORGYAN 7756 BUR-
NET AVE VAN NUYS CA 91405. The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517123OCAR

CNBB2517124NQ FILE NO.2017147645
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
RESTORE TO CANVAS ; PHOTO GIFT
PRO;PHOTO RESTORATION ON CANVAS 11440
N. CHANDLER BLVD #600 NORTH HOLLY-
WOOD CA 91601. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) PHOTOFIXITPRO 11440 N. CHANDLER
BLVD #600 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91601.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2006. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517124NQ

CNBB2517125NQ FILE NO.2017147562
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: LA
HOME STAR STAGING & DESIGN 23314 VALE-
RIO STREET WEST HILLS CA 91304. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) DE ANNA MOYES 23314
VALERIO STREET WEST HILLS CA 91304. The
business is conducted by: DE ANNA MOYES
23314 VALERIO STREET WEST HILLS CA 91304.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517125NQ

CNBB2517126NQ FILE NO.2017147602
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: 343
WEST GAGE CORP ; M&M GAS STATION & MINI
MART 343 W. GAGE AVE LOS ANGELES CA
90003. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) 343
WEST GAGE CORP 632 S. ORANGE DR LOS
ANGELES CA 90036.The business is conducted

by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 12/07/2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/
13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517126NQ

CNBB2517127NQ FILE NO.2017147233
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CALIFORNIA LOVE TIMESHARES 11040 HES-
BY STREET #105 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA
91601. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DESTI-
NY K JACKSON 11040 HESBY STREET #105
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91601.  The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/07/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517127NQ

CNBB2517128DC FILE NO.2017150218
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SENIOR PLACEMENT CARE ONE WORLD
TRADE CENTER 8TH FLOOR LONG BEACH CA
90831. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) SENIOR
PLACEMENT CARE ONE WORLD TRADE CEN-
TER 8TH FLOOR LONG BEACH CA 90831. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 03/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517128DC

CNBB2517129JEN FILE NO.2017148875
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: GH
FINANCIAL GROUP 680 BREA CANYON RD
UNIT 188 WALNUT CA 91789. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) COCO WANG INC 680 BREA
CANYON RD 188 WALNUT CA 91789. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517129JEN

CNBB2517130JEN FILE NO.2017148366
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MOSEFAN 876 SUNSET PL DIAMOND BAR CA
91765;1249 S DIAMOND BAR BLVD #206 DIA-
MOND BAR CA 91765. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) WILFRED W LEE; SZU CHING FAN 876
SUNSET PL DIAMOND BAR CA 91765. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517130JEN

CNBB2517131AC FILE NO.2017148950
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANTOJITOS Y MARISCOS LA DONA 8926
NAOMI AVE SAN GABRIEL CA 91775.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ALICIA N SALMERON-
MONRREAL 8926 NAOMI AVE SAN GABRIEL
CA 91775. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517131AC

CNBB2517132AC FILE NO.2017148349
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CHENTES FASHION 16100 GARFIELD AVE STE
K PARAMOUNT CA 90723. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) BISENTE DIAZ 16100 GARFIELD
AVE STE K PARAMOUNT CA 90723. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517132AC

CNBB2517133AC FILE NO.2017148626
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
RAD AUTO PARTS 13534 UTICA ST WHITTIER
CA 90605.Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ZEFERINO BANUELOS NORIEGA 13534 UTI-
CA ST WHITTIER CA 90605. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517133AC

CNBB2517134AC FILE NO.2017148961
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TEDDY LYNN 743 S CARONDELET STREET # 8
LOS ANGELES CA 90057. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) SHERRIKA SHANAE LYNN ORR 743
S CARONDELET STREET #8 LOS ANGELES CA
90057. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above on
. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517134AC

CNBB2517135GM FILE NO.2017148580
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: LA
VIE NAILS & SPA 1120 S. DIAMOND BAR BLVD
DIAMOND BAR CA 91765. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) STEVEB CHIEM 11118 CORAL
ALOE AVE FOUNTAIN VALLEY CA 92708. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I

declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517135GM

CNBB2517136MU FILE NO.2017149017
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: E
TONER 5318 E. 2ND ST #773 LONG BEACH CA
90803. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) NOR-
RELL WALKER 5318 E. 2ND ST #773 LONG
BEACH CA 90803. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517136MU

CNBB2517137MU FILE NO.2017148459
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANCIENT YOGA STUDIO 8635 GREENLEAF AVE
STUDIO A WHITTIER CA 90602. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) TRUE NOURISHMENT INC
6744 GREENLEAF AVE WHITTIER CA 90602.The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517137MU

CNBB2517138MU FILE NO.2017148461
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FORKING GOOD ;FORKIN GOOD CAFÉ 6744
GREENVALLEY AVE WHITTIER CA 90601. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) TRUE NOURISH-
MENT INC 6744 GREENLEAF AVE WHITTIER
CA 90602.The business is conducted by: A COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517138MU

CNBB2517139MU FILE NO.2017148478
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: L.
ALONSO RODRIGUEZ TRUCKING 8362 DINS-
DALE ST DOWNEY CA 90240. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) LUIS ALONSO RODRIGUEZ;
RICARDO GUZMAN; JUAN PABLO GREEN 8362
DINSDALE ST DOWNEY CA 90240. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 02/
2007. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517139MU

CNBB22517140MU FILE NO.2017148643
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ADVANCED BOOKEEPING SOLUTIONS; ABS
1605 E ELIZABETH ST # 1009 PASADENA CA
91104. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) RICH-
ARD RAFFY AFSHARIAN ; AIDA AFSHARIAN
1605 E. ELIZABETH ST # 1009 PASADENA CA
91104. The business is conducted by: A MAR-
RIED COUPLE. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517140MU

CNBB2517141MU FILE NO.2017148673
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SIEMPRE VIVA; SALUD ETERNA;LA SOPA DE
MI ABUELA 3805 S SAN PEDRO LOS ANGELES
CA 90011.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MAR-
IA T GONZALEZ 3805 S SAN PEDRO LOS AN-
GELES CA 90011. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517141MU

CNBB2517142IF FILE NO.2017148851
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ADVANCED BUSINESS SYSTEMS 1040 W 23RD
ST APT 1 SAN PEDRO CA 90731.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) DENNIS MICHAEL AMBROSI-
NO 1040 W 23RD ST APT 1 SAN PEDRO CA
90731. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 07/
2000. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517142IF

CNBB2517143IF FILE NO.2017148834
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HOLLYWEED SERVICES 1029 W 12TH STREET
POMONA CA 91766. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) EDDIE DARDOON 1029 W 12TH STREET
POMONA CA 91766. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517143IF

CNBB2517144IF FILE NO.2017148441
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: AIL
STUDIO ;SAY HERO 167 NORTH SAN MARINO
AVE PASADENA CA 91107. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) CARLOS ART SEPULVEDA 167
NORTH SAN MARINO AVE PASADENA CA
91107. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
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was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517144IF

CNBB2517145IF FILE NO.2017149048
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VAPORSMOKE 1691 N. EASTERN AVENUE LOS
ANGELES CA 90063. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ISLAM BAHHUR 2100 E. KATELLA AVENUE
#521 ANAHEIM CA 92806. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517145IF

CNBB2517146IF FILE NO.2017148429
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ROGERS REJUVENATION AND COSMETIC
CENTER;ROGERS REGENERATIVE AND COS-
METIC CENTER 222 WEST EULALIA STREET
SUITE 309 GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) DAVID E. ROGERS, M.D. A
PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION 222 WEST
EULALIA STREET SUITE 309 GLENDALE CA
91204. The business is conducted by: A CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517146IF

CNBB2517147IF FILE NO.2017148427
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BEVERLY OAKS COSMETIC AND REGENERA-
TIVE CENTER 4910 VAN NUYS BLVD SUITE 306
SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) DAVID E. ROGERS, M.D. A PRO-
FESSIONAL CORPORATION 222 WEST EULAISA
STREET SUITE 309 GLENDALE CA 91204. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517147IF

CNBB2517148IF FILE NO.2017148766
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
OPTIMUM WEIGHT LOSS CENTER 1042 S SUS-
ANNA AVE WEST COVINA CA 91790. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) HECTOR OROZCO 1042
S SUSANNA AVE WEST COVINA CA 91790. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517148IF

CNBB2517149DC FILE NO.2017149113
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ADORE JEWERLY 622 AMERICANA WAY GLEN-
DALE CA 91210; 550 N. LYALL AVE WEST COV-
INA CA 91790.Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
FONNY WONG 550 N. LYALL AVE WEST COV-
INA CA 91790. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517149DC

CNBB2517150DC FILE NO.2017148750
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CCTV & ELECTRICAL INSTALLATIONS 7011
PLASKA AVE HUNTINGTON PARK CA 90255.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JOSE FRAN-
CISCO CHANCHAVAC. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517150DC

CNBB2517151TC FILE NO.2017148391
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE BIG BOSS AUTO DETAILING 1929 ARLING-
TON AVE APT 15 LOS ANGLES CA 90018. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517151TC

CNBB2517152TC FILE NO.2017148192
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EMS LOGISTICS 419 E 59TH ST LONG BEACH
CA 90805. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ESMER J PABITON 419 E 59TH ST LONG BEACH
CA 90805. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/08/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517152TC

CNBB2517153JL FILE NO.2017143136
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
YELLOW BECKY HALLOWEEN THINGS 1210
CARMELA LN LA HABRA CA 90631. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) CONSUELO J. GILL 1210
CARMELA LN LA HABRA CA 90631. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/02/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-

menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517153JL

CNBB2517154AC FILE NO.2017150013
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DIANA'S INSURANCE & TAX SERVICES 5730 E
BEVERLY BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90022. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) DIANNE GARCED
5730 E BEVERLY BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90022.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517154AC

CNBB2517155AC FILE NO.2017150391
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
JUGOS Y TORTAS LA TROPICANA 4455 MAINE
AVE BALWIN PARK CA 91706. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) VICTOR ALFONOS GARCIA
DIAZ 4455 MAINE AVE BALWIN PARK CA 91706.
The business is conducted by: AN INVIDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517155AC

CNBB2517156JEN FILE NO.2017149921
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
EXEMPLARS TUTORING SERVICE 23643 GOLD
RUSH DR DIAMOND BAR CA 91765;420
N.MCKINLEY STREET SUITE 111-518 CORONA
CA 92879. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are)JONATHAN P. PHAN 420 N. MCKINLEY
STREET SUITE 111-518 CORONA CA 92879. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 01/2014. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517156JEN

CNBB2517157TC FILE NO.2017149518
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CHAOKOH CUSINE 2486 E COLORADO BLV
PASADENA CA 91107. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) PARICHART SITTIKOSOLJIT 2486 E
COLORADO BLV PASADENA CA 91107. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517157TC

CNBB2517158IF FILE NO.2017149544
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: I
CRAFT COLLISION 2639 E. FOOTHILL BOULE-
VARD PASADENA CA 91107. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ASHORI INVESTMENT INC 2639
E FOOTHILL BOULEVARD PASADENA CA 91107.
The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517158IF

CNBB2517159IF FILE NO.2017149841
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SHOWA 3470 W 6TH ST STE 2A LOS ANGELES
CA 90020. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ARTHURSON FOOD INC 8529 SUVA STREET
DOWNEY CA 90240. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17  The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517159IF

CNBB2517160IF FILE NO.2017149878
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VILLA'S TAE KWON DO #3 2633 WHITTIER BLVD
LOS ANGELES CA 90023. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) CARLOS CANO OSORIO 2633 WHIT-
TIER BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90023. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 10/2012. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517160IF

CNBB2517161PS FILE NO.2017150155
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TACOS Y PAPAS 1403 W 11TH ST LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90015. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ISRAEL ALCANTARA FERNANDEZ DE LARA
1403 W 11TH ST LOS ANGELES CA 90015. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517161PS

CNBB2517162PS FILE NO.2017150153
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MGK WHOLESELLER 2669 GRIFFIN AVE #306
LOS ANGELES CA 90031. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) LIDA MANUKYAN 2669 GRIFFIN AVE
#306 LOS ANGELES CA 90031. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date

it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517162PS

CNBB2517163PS FILE NO.2017150264
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GENERAL KING MERCHANDISE 306 SOUTH
MEDIA DRIVE LOS ANGELES CA 90049. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) DANIEL TOOFER
306 SOUTH MEDIA DRIVE LOS ANGELES CA
90049; ZOHEIB MOHAMMED 22140 HEIDEMAR-
IE ST CHATSWORTH CA 91311. The business is
conducted by: JOINT VENTURE . I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517163PS

CNBB2517164ED FILE NO.2017149585
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
STEVE'S AUTO COLLISION CENTER 11577
SHELDON ST SUN VALLEY CA 91352. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) AUTO BODY RENEWAL
INC 824 OMAR ST GLENDALE CA 91202. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517164ED

CNBB2517165ED FILE NO.2017149608
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GDS AUTO 2325 5TH AVE APT #5 LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90018. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
GISEL DELFINA SALCEDO 2325 5TH AVE APT
#5 LOS ANGELES CA 90018. The business is
conducted by: AN INVIDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/09/17. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517165ED

CNBB2517166ED FILE NO.2017149693
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AMAZING THAI MASSAGE 23942 LYONS AVE
STE #108 SANTA CLARITA CA 91321. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) AMAZING THAI MAS-
SAGE AND SPA LLC 23942 LYONS AVE #108
SANTA CLARITA CA 91321. The business is con-
ducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517166ED

CNBB2517167ED FILE NO.2017147804
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AVILES SECURITY PATROL CO 14415 VOSE ST
APT 210 VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) NORMA L AVILES 14415
VOSE ST APT 210 VAN NUYS CA 91405. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 11/2001. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517167ED

CNBB2517168ED FILE NO.2017150057
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LAW OFFICES OF ARMAN TSATURYAN 4730
WOODMAN AVE SUITE 405 SHERMAN OAKS
CA 91423. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ARMAN TSATURYAN 8055 WILKINSON AVE
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517168ED

CNBB2517169ED FILE NO.2017150107
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
I.C.U. MUSIC COMMUNICATIONS 2330 W. 3RD
ST #2 LOS ANGELES CA 90057. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ERIK HANSEN 6137 ST.
CLAIR AVE NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91606.
The business is conducted by: A  LIMITED LIA-
BILITY COMPANY. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517169ED

CNBB2517170EL FILE NO.2017149582
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NEXGEN SOLAR 20251 VENTURA BLVD #B
WOODLAND HILLS CA 91364. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) POYA KHALED YAYHABIAN
20241 WELLS DR WOODLAND HILLS CA
91364;MATTHEW MICHAEL JONES 18553 SATI-
COY ST APT 10 RESEDA CA 91335. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517170EL

CNBB2517171EL FILE NO.2017149470
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SALINAS WINDOW CLEANING 14249 SHER-
MAN WAY APT # 21 VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) PUBLIO ANGEL
SALINAS 14249 SHERMAN WAY APT 21 VAN
NUYS CA 91405. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under

the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/09/17. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517171EL

CNBB2517172OSCAR FILE NO.2017149679
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PORTILLO LANDSCAPE 14687 RAYEN ST APT
14 PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JOSE TERESO PORTILLO
14687 RAYEN ST APT 14 PANORAMA CITY CA
91402. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517172OSCAR

CNBB2517173OSCAR FILE NO.2017150070
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PMC ELECTRIC 8123 WHITSETT AVE NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) PABLO MORALES CRUZ 8123 WHIT-
SETT AVE NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517173OSCAR

CNBB2517174OSCAR FILE NO.2017150325
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ZARHBA HK 7341 OAK PARK AVE VAN NUYS
CA 91406. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ZHORZH BASMADZHYAN 7341 OAK PARK AVE
VAN NUYS CA 91406. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 07/2013. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/
13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517174OSCAR

CNBB2517175NQ FILE NO.2017150141
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BEAUTY MASTER CLASSES 4050 FAIRWAY AVE
APT E STUDIO CITY CA 91604. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ERIK MCEWEN 4050 FAIR-
WAY AVE APT E STUDIO CITY CA 91604. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517175NQ

CNBB2517176NQ FILE NO.2017150345
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FOR MOVIE RENTALS ; HOLLYWOOD TV COPS
7255 INDEPENDENCE AVE #109 CANOGA PARK
CA 91303;7255 INDEPENDENCE AVE #109 CA-
NOGA PARK CA 91303. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) DAVID P HILL 7255 INDEPENDENCE
AVE #109 CANOGA PARK CA 91303. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/01/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517176NQ

CNBB2517177NQ FILE NO.2017149420
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FUTURE SOLAR LIGHTS 8830 WAKEFIELD AVE
PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) HOVHANNES KOJOYAN 8830
VAKEFIELD AVE PANORAMA CITY CA 91402.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL .
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517177NQ

CNBB2517178NQ FILE NO.2017149451
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE ERIK BIANO COMPANY 420 N LOUISE ST
APT 8 GLENDALE CA 91206. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ERIK BABAIANS 420 N. LOUISE
ST APT 8 GLENDALE CA 91206. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517178NQ

CNBB2517179NQ FILE NO.2017149552
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ELY'S PLUMBING 12552 VANOWEN ST NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ELISEO LOUIS YNIGUEZ III 12552
VANOWEN ST NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517179NQ

CNBB2517180NQ FILE NO.2017149752
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VALLEY CARE HOME SERVICES 207 N NOR-
MANDIE AVE APT #11 LOS ANGELES CA 90004.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MARIA CRISTI-
NA FRANCISCO 207 N NORMANDIE AVE APT
#11 LOS ANGELES CA 90004. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/09/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious

Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517180NQ

CNBB2517181NQ FILE NO.2017149854
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WEST BAY INSURANCE AGENCY N. WILSON
AVE APT 303 PASADENA CA 91106. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ERIC VOSKANIAN 168 N
WILSON AVE APT 303 PASADENA CA 91106.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 2015. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517181NQ

CNBB2517182JEN FILE NO.2017149917
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
RHEMA ENTERPRISES; EXCEL CHRISTINA
COLLEGE 1881 MOLINI AVE #1 SIGNAL HILL
CA 90755;PO BOX 88488 LOS ANGELES CA
9009. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DELORES
E TURNER 1881 MOLINO AVE APT 1 SIGNAL
HILL CA 90755. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/09/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517182JEN

CNBB2517183JEN FILE NO.2017151537
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LADIEXS TEE'S & THINGS 1444 W. 105TH LOS
ANGELES CA 90047. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) TAMMY LEE BROWN 1444 W. 105TH ST
LOS ANGELES CA 90047. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517183JEN

CNBB2517184JEN FILE NO.2017150946
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: 153
ACUPUNCTURE AND HERBS 2011 LOMITA
BLVD LOMITA CA 90717. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) YOU JOO KIM 24634 MAPLE AVE
HARBOR CITY CA 90710. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517184JEN

CNBB2517185AC FILE NO.2017151126
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AVOD SERVICES 1507 NEWVILLE AVE
DOWNEY CA 90241. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ALBERTO VALDES OTANO 10507
NEWVILLE AVE DOWNEY CA 90241. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517185AC

CNBB2517186AC FILE NO.2017151331
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
WHITTIER MEDICAL HOMECARE SUPPLY 12633
E WHITTIER BLVD WHITTIER CA 90602. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) WHITTIER MEDI-
CAL HOMECARE SUPPLY INC 12633 E WHITTI-
ER BLVD WHITTIER CA 90602. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517186AC

CNBB2517187MU FILE NO.2017150512
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HOODISH APOTHECARY ; HOODISH BOTANI-
CALS & HEALING;AKASHIC COSMIC CRE-
ATIONS ;ENCHANTED CRAFTS  3805 S SAN
PEDRO ST LOS ANGELES CA 90011. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ANA ISABEL GONZALEZ
217 W 55TH ST LOS ANGELES CA 90037. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517187MU

CNBB2517188MU FILE NO.2017150525
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PIPE PROS 407 W IMPERIAL HWY BREA CA
92821. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MAT-
THEW BIGOS 227 CORONADO LONG BEACH
CA 90803; PHIL MCLUSKY 407 W. IMPERIAL
HWY BREA 92821. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517188MU

CNBB2517189MU FILE NO.2017150522
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PIPE PROS 407 W IMPERIAL HWY H177  BREA
CA 92821. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
BIGOS INC 227 CORONADO LONG BEACH CA
90803. The business is conducted by: A  CORPO-
RATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above

on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517189MU

CNBB2517190MU FILE NO.2017150646
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: VIP
CUSTOM INSTALLATIONS 3595 PLATT AVENUE
LYNWOOD CA 90262;3595 PLATT AVENUE LYN-
WOOD CA 90262. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ARMANDO PALOMO 3595 PLATT AVENUE
LYNWOOD CA 90262. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/12/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251790MU

CNBB2517191MU FILE NO.2017150905
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BRIZUELA'S TRAILER REPAIR 914 VAIL AVE
MONTEBELLO CA 90640. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) BRIZUELA'S TRAILER REPAIR 914
VAIL AVE MONTEBELLO CA 90640. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517191MU

CNBB2517192MU FILE NO.2017151356
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AVILES MARKET 3052 W. 7TH ST LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90005. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
CORNELIO CASTREJON GOMEZ ; FRANCISCA
AVILEZ VARGAS CASTREJON 3052 W 7TH ST
LOS ANGELES CA 90005. The business is con-
ducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of
a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517192MU

CNBB2517193IF FILE NO.2017151316
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANGEL'S MOBILE AUTO SOLUTIONS 634
BELDEN AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90022. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MIGUEL ANGEL LOZA
GOMEZ 634 BELDEN AVE LOS ANGELES CA
90022. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517193IF

CNBB2517194IF FILE NO.2017150602
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GOLLEFI 2155 N BELLFLOWER BLVD SUITE139
LONG BEACH CA 90815. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ABRAHAM LLEFI 16227 EUCALYP-
TUS AVE 47 BELLFLOWER CA 90706; JOSE
ALEJANDRO GOMEZ VAZQUEZ 1906 E. FIRST
ST 2A LONG BEACH CA 90802.The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517194IF

CNBB2517195IF FILE NO.2017150733
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE PHENOMENAIL CLUB 1243 S ALVARADO
STREET UNIT C7 LOS ANGELES CA 90006. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) HUZ XU ; MANDY
TANG ; MINMING FENG 1243  S ALAVARADO
STREET UNIT C7 LOS ANGELES CA 90006;MIN-
MING FENG 1243 S ALVARADO STREET UNIT
C7 LOS ANGELES CA 90006. The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517195IF

CNBB2517196EL FILE NO.2017147845
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MAKE IT RACK 6433 TOPANGA CYN BLVD CA-
NOGA PARK CA 91303. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ALEXANDRE SAM MILGRAM 22101
ERWIN STREET APT # P321 WOODLAND HILLS
CA 91367. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2517196EL

CNBB2517197RM FILE NO.2017150167
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KIDS FORMAL-TOPANGA ;SOPHIA MAI 6600
TOPANGA CANYON BLVD #1070 CANOGA PARK
CA 91303;7050 SHOUP AVE # 161 CANOGA
PARK CA 91303. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) FIA MAIL, LLC 7050 SHOUP AVE # 161
CANOGA PARK CA 91303. The business is con-
ducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
09/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOTcom-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517197RM

CNBB2517198PS FILE NO.2017151499
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PATRICK HENRY PAVA PATRONS 17340 SAN
JOSE ST GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) PATRICK HENRY MAG-
NET PARENTS ASSOCIATION 17340 SAN JOSE
ST GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. The business is
conducted by: A  CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of

a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 02/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517198PS

CNBB2517199RM FILE NO.2017151375
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PLATINUM WINDOW TINTING 1027 N HACIEN-
DA CA 91744. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ARTAK MURADYAN 1060 RAYMOND AVE APT
208 GLENDALE CA 91201. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/29; 07/06 &
07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2517199RM

CNBB2517200RM FILE NO.2017151391
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NIKOO CONSTRUCTION 3016 E COLORADO
BLVD # 5818 PASADENA CA 91117. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MEHDI NICKOWEI 711 FAIR
OAKS AVE #L SOUTH PASADENA CA 91030.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517200RM

CNBB2517201ED FILE NO.2017151300
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
"ELISEO JUAREZ DESIGNER" 9926 TAMARACK
AVE PACOIMA CA 91331. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ELISEO APOLINAR JUAREZ 9926
TAMARACH AVE PACOIMA CA 91331. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517201ED

CNBB2517202ED FILE NO.2017151163
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: LA
'ERS APPAREL 5257 RADFORD AVE # 308 VAL-
LEY VILLAGE CA 91607. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) DERRICK GUIDRY 5257 RADFORD
AVE #308 VALLEY VILLAGE CA 91607. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22;
06/29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2517202ED

CNBB2517203ED  FILE NO.2017151097
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HOMEGAZERS 171 PIER AVE # 168 SANTA
MONICA CA 90405. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CHRISANN BRUNSMANN 171 PIER AVE #
168 SANTA MONICA CA 90405. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 22; 06/
29; 07/06 & 07/13/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2517203ED

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132057
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MINAH JAYY HAIR, 15537 FICUS ST, CHINO
HILLS, CA 91709. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JERIN
STAPLETON, 15537 FICUS ST, CHINO HILLS,
CA 91709. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JERIN
STAPLETON, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346830.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132449
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE MINI MART & SMOKE SHOP, 8762 S BROAD-
WAY AVENUE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90003. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: EUGENE JAMES, 8762 S
BROADWAY AVENUE, LOS ANGELES, CA
90003. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: EUGENE JAMES,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA348445.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132535
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LASHED AND WAXED LA, 3813 GRAND VIEW
BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90066. Mailing address
if different: 12032 HAVELOCK AVE, CULVER
CITY, CA 90230. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: GINA LAFLER, 12032 HAVELOCK AVE,
CULVER CITY, CA 90230. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: GINA LAFLER, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/23/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348459.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132576
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BEVERLY MUSE, 1135 SBEVERLY DRIVE UNIT
B, LOS ANGELES, CA 90035. Mailing address if
different: 3665 HUGHES AVE APT 103, LOS
ANGELES, AZ 90034. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: TRES CHIQUE INC, 3665
HUGHES AVE 103, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034.
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
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I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: RICHARD DOKUN-
MU, VICE PRESIDENT. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/23/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348466.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017132716
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ZAC HARTOG EVENTS, 16607 BIENVENEDA
PL, PACIFIC PALISADES, CA 90272. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or
Organization Number: 451559656. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: ZH PRODUCTIONS, INC,
16607 BIENVENEDA PL, PACIFIC PALISADES,
CA 90272. This business is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JAMES
HARTOG, CEO. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348509.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017133149
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HOLLY BELLA NAILS AND SPA, 18610 1/2 VEN-
TURA BLVD, TARZANA, CA 91356. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: P&H HB INC., 18610 1/2 VEN-
TURA BLVD, TARZANA, CA 91356 (State of In-
corporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: OLGA POGANY, CHIEF FINANCIAL
OFFICER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 4-4-17. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA348656.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017133997
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AMERICA ENVIOS, 23450 NEWHALL AVE SPC
83, NEWHALL, CA 91321. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: LETICIA ALFONSO, 24350 NEWHALL AVE
SPC 83, NEWHALL, CA 91321 (State of Incorpo-
ration/Organization: CA). This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
LETICIA ALFONSO, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348805.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017134155
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CLEMENTINE JACK'S, 3857 REVERE AVENUE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90039. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: BRANDON CHOE, 3857 REVERE AVENUE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90039. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: BRANDON CHOE, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/24/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA348840.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017134483
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SOUTH PASADENA CHIROPRACTIC WELL-
NESS CENTER, 1260 HUNTINGTON DRIVE
SUITE 101, SOUTH PASADENA, CA 91030. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ALAN ZEE, 1260 HUNTING-
TON DRIVE SUITE 101, SOUTH PASADENA, CA
91030. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ALAN ZEE, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 07/2009. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
05/24/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA349020.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017134495
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SAI'S TRADING CO, 712 FEATHERWOOD
DRIVE, DIAMOND BAR, CA 91765. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: SAI SHAMDASANI, 712 FEATH-
ERWOOD DRIVE, DIAMOND BAR, CA 91765.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: SAI SHAMDASANI,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA349025.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135310
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AN ORGANIZED HOME, 3758 ELM AVENUE,
LONG BEACH, CA 90807. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: KATHY DODDS, 3758A ELM AVENUE, LONG
BEACH, CA 90807. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
KATHY DODDS, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 03/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349114.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017135645
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CAL TIKI BAR, 4952 WHITTIER BLVD, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90022. Mailing address if different:
809 S DITMAN AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: BARTOLO
JUAREZ-MUNOZ, 809 S DITMAN AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90023. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
BARTOLO JUAREZ-MUNOZ, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/25/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-

thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA349170.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017136366
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. THE GUARDIANS PROJECT, 2. STEVEN GIL-
BERT MORRIS PRODUCTIONS, 11555 RIVER-
SIDE DR APT 4, NORTH HOLLYWOOD, CA
91603. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MARIO R. PRA-
DO, 11555 RIVERSIDE DR APT 4, NORTH HOL-
LYWOOD, CA 91603. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MARIO R. PRADO, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business names listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349330.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017136989
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HIGH-PROFILE NANNY AGENCY, 18413 DOM-
INO ST, TARZANA, CA 91335. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: HANYEH YASSI, 18413 DOMINO STREET,
TARZANA, CA 91335. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
HANYEH YASSI, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349470.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137747
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SPRING CLEANERS, 4856 W. PICO BLVD, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90019. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
GLORIA RODRIGUEZ, 5445 SIERRA VISTA AVE
#7, LOS ANGELES, CA 90038, CLIBERMAN
CENTENO, 5445 SIERRRA VISTA AVE #7, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90038. This business is conducted
by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CLIBERMAN CENTENO, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA350979.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017137883
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
JHR TRUCKING INC, 11312 EXCELSIOR DRIVE,
NORWALK, CA 90650. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
JHR TRUCKING INC, 11312 EXCELSIOR DRIVE,
NORWALK, CA 90650 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
JAY RIESE, PRESIDENT. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351011.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138252
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. B & G FURNITURE REFINISHING, 2. B & G
LUXURY CABINETS, 1437 VIRGINIA AVE., BALD-
WIN PARK, CA 91706. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
CESAR ECHEVERRIA ARANGO, 1437 VIRGIN-
IA AVE., BALDWIN PARK, CA 91706. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and cor-
rect. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: CESAR ECHEVERRIA ARAN-
GO, OWNER. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business names
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351089.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138630
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
STELLA & SONIA CO, 6550 YUCCA ST #113,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90028. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: STELLA HOLT, 6550 YUCCA ST #113, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90028, SONIA LEIGHTIN, 6550
YUCCA ST #113, LOS ANGELES, CA 90028.
This business is conducted by: GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: STELLA
HOLT, PARTNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351197.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138635
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ANDY SMOG TEST ONLY CENTER, 1027 E
ROUTE 66 UNIT A, GLENDORA, CA 91740. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ANDY L. XIE, 902 N ELEC-
TRIC AVE, ALHAMBRA, CA 91801. This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ANDY L. XIE, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351199.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138680
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ALOSTA SMOG TEST ONLY CENTER, 344 E
FOOTHILL BLVD UNIT C, POMONA, CA 91767.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: ANDY XIE, 902 N ELEC-
TRIC AVE, ALHAMBRA, CA 91801. This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ANDY XIE, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351210.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138709
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RYFLEKT, 10655 WILSHIRE BLVD #402, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90024. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:

ALEXSANDRA FARAHI, 10655 WILSHIRE BLVD
#402, LOS ANGELES, CA 90024. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ALEXSANDRA FARAHI, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351216.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017138750
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PERCEPTION CLOTHING, 7735 ATLANTIC AVE
SPC 56, CUDAHY, CA 90201. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MIGUEL BARRETO, 7735 ATLANTIC AVE
SPC 56, CUDAHY, CA 90201, ANGELES
MORQUECHO, 7735 ATLANTIC AVE SPC 56,
CUDAHY, CA 90201. This business is conducted
by: COPARTNERS. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MIGUEL BARRETO, PARTNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/30/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351223.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139002
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE FLORISTISTA, 5312 KESTER AVE #3, SHER-
MAN OAKS, CA 91411. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MARY KIRMO, 5312 KESTER AVE #3, SHER-
MAN OAKS, CA 91411. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MARY KIRMO, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351257.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139228
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HEAVEN'S MELODY BEAUTY LOUNGE, 14445
1/4 VENTURA BLVD, SHERMAN OAKS, CA
91423. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MARINE ARABA-
JYAN, 13812 VANOWEN ST. #101, VAN NUYS,
CA 91405. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MARINE
ARABAJYAN, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351290.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139602
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BEZINI, 16946 BURBANK BLVD., ENCINO, CA
91316. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: CHYNA JOHNSON,
16946 BURBANK BLVD. 204, ENCINO, CA 91316
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: CHYNA JOHNSON, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351377.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139974
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BYL LABS, 526 S ARDMORE AVE APT 221, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90020. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
BRANDON LEE, 526 S ARDMORE AVE APT 221,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90020. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: BRANDON LEE, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351486.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141006
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BACK IN MOTION PHYSICAL THERAPY, 1831
WILSHIRE BLVD, SANTA MONICA, CA 90403.
Mailing address if different: 2254 30TH ST APT E,
SANTA MONICA, CA 90405. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: JANET RUIZ, 2254 30TH ST
APT E, SANTA MONICA, CA 90405, MIGUEL
LABRADA, 3345 VIRGINIA AVE., SANTA MONI-
CA, CA 90404. This business is conducted by:
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JANET RUIZ, PARTNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 05/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/01/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351639.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142216
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FASHION DRY CLEANER SERVICE, 7337 BAL-
BOA BLVD, #5, VAN NUYS, CA 91406. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ZAMERUL I DULLA, 7337
BALBOA BLVD, UNIT 5, VAN NUYS, CA 91406.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ZAMERUL I DULLA,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351898.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142223
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MAYILYAN NURSING SERVICES, 4222 EDEN-
HURST AVENUE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90039.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: NELLI MAYILYAN, 4222
EDENHURST AVENUE, LOS ANGELES, CA
90039. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: NELLI MAYILYAN,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new

fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351901.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144829
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
JOE THE HANDYMAN, 15659 INDEX ST, GRAN-
ADA HILLS, CA 91344. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
JOSE FERNANDEZ, 15659 INDEX ST, GRANA-
DA HILLS, CA 91344. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
JOSE FERNANDEZ, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 2011.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352291.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139904
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SAP CONSTRUCTION ENTERPRISES, 9960
OWENSMOUTH AVE UNIT 34, CHATSWORTH,
CA 91311. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: SIAMAK REZ-
VANI, 9960 OWENSMOUTH AVE UNIT 34, CHAT-
SWORTH, CA 91311. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
SIAMAK REZVANI, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA353721.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143284
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ERIC SMIES VOICEOVER, 4247 W 182ND
STREET APT V, TORRANCE, CA 90504. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ERIC SMIES, 4247 W 182ND
STREET APT V, TORRANCE, CA 90504 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ERIC SMIES, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 06/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA353785.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143275
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. JAC, 2. JAC ARCHITECTURE, 3. JAC AR-
CHITECTURE PLANNING & MANAGEMENT,
23228 VIA FLORED, VALENCIA, CA 91355. Mail-
ing address if different: 23228 VIA FLORED, VA-
LENCIA, CA 91355. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: JOSHUA ABEL CARDENAS, 23228 VIA
FLORED, VALENCIA, CA 91355. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JOSHUA ABEL CARDENAS, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business names listed above
on (date): 06/2017. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/02/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA353790.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146197
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GOLDMARK AND CO., 10000 IMPERIAL HWY
APT A107, DOWNEY, CA 90242. Mailing address
if different: 14509 HAAS AVE, GARDENA, CA
90242. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MARK T. SMITH JR., 10000 IMPERIAL HWY APT
A107, DOWNEY, CA 90242. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MARK T. SMITH JR., OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
06/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354130.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146292
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LONG BEACH SHADES, 1070 LOMA AVE APT
206, LONG BEACH, CA 90804. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: CHRISTOPHER GROSS, 1070 LOMA AVE
APT 206, LONG BEACH, CA 90804, RICHARD
ENDAYA, 6671 TILLAMOOK AVE, WESTMIN-
STER, CA 92683. This business is conducted by:
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CHRISTOPHER GROSS, GENERAL
PARTNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354155.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146431
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SOTO BARBER SHOP, 1865 LINCOLN BL #6,
SANTA MONICA, CA 90405. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: FERNANDO SOTO, 10719 WOODBINE ST
#7, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: SOTO BARBER SHOP, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA354198.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146599
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
QUOTENBIND.COM, 800 WILSHIRE BLVD,
SUITE 1525, LOS ANGELES, CA 90017. Mailing
address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation
or Organization Number: 2622063. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: EXECUTIVE PERILS, INC.,
800 WILSHIRE BLVD, SUITE 1525, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90017. This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
PETER R TAFFAE, MANAGING MEMBER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
11/2011. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354245.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148631
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. SCHNEIDER SOLUTIONS, 2. SCHNEIDER
RESEARCH, 22412 NORMANDIE AVE UNIT B,
UNINCORPORATED, CA 90502. Mailing address
if different: P.O. BOX 554, TORRANCE, CA 90508.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: GRADY L.
SCHNEIDER, 22412 NORMANDIE AVE UNIT B,
UNINCORPORATED, CA 90502. This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: GRADY L. SCHNEIDER, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business names listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354697.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149395
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RAPIDO WIRELESS & MORE, 1134 S. WEST-
ERN AVE # A-5, LOS ANGELES, CA 90006. Mail-
ing address if different: 1121 W. 97 TH ST, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90044. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: REYNA RUIZ, 1121 W. 97 TH
ST, LOS ANGELES, CA 90044. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: REYNA RUIZ, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354911.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150114
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ROBIN L MUSIC, 22253 ERWIN ST, WOODLAND
HILLS, CA 91367. Mailing address if different:
P.O. BOX 17915, ENCINO, CA 91416. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ROBIN L LESTER,
22253 ERWIN ST, WOODLAND HILLS, CA 91367.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ROBIN L LESTER,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA355257.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150383
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
WELD-IT COMPANY, 4477 SHEILA STREET, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90023. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization
Number: 259394. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: SAM SCHAFFER INC., 4477 SHEILA ST.,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90023 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CALIFORNIA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: RAYMOND JOSEPH SCHAFFER, TREA-
SURER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 10/25/1956. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA355782.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150071
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LOVE OUR WAY, 24009 MOBILE STREET, WEST
HILLS, CA 91307. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: RYAN
RING, 24009 MOBILE STREET, WEST HILLS, CA
91307. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: RYAN RING, PRES-
IDENT. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356355.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146862
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GOLDENSEED MARKETING, 616 TULAROSA
DRIVE #7, LOS ANGELES, CA 90026. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: JAESON WILKINS, 616 TU-
LAROSA DRIVE #7, LOS ANGELES, CA 90026.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: JAESON WILKINS,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 02/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/07/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356366.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150588
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CARPE DIEM, 23401 PARKS SORRENTO #38,
CALABASAS, CA 91302. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
SOTA KIM, 23401 PARKS SORRENTO #38, CAL-
ABASAS, CA 91302. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
SOYA KIM, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 04/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/12/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA356779.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150684
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MY TOTAL FASHION, 23401 PARK SORRENTO
#38, CALABASAS, CA 91302. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: SOYA KIM, 23401 PARK SORRENTO #38,
CALABASAS, CA 91302. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: SOYA KIM, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 04/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA356801.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150758
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
COLLEGE NANNIES + SITTERS + TUTORS OF
BURBANK, CA, 803 N SPARKS ST, BURBANK,
CA 91506. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: TRIANGLE
GIRAFFE LLC, 803 N SPARKS ST, BURBANK,
CA 91506 (State of Incorporation/Organization:
CALIFORNIA). This business is conducted by:
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CYNTHIA SUTTLE, MEMBER. The regis-

trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA356823.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME 2017150910
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of
the fictitious business name(s): JUST40VIDEOS,
20832 VALERIO ST #18, WINNETKA, CA 91306.
The fictitious business name(s) referred to above
was filed on: 4/17/2015 in the County of Los An-
geles. Original File No. 2015103468. Full name of
Registrant(s): PAOLO PRANZO, 20832 VALERIO
ST #18, WINNETKA, CA 91306. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true, information which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PAOLO PRANZO, OWNER. This state-
ment was filed with the Los Angeles County Clerk
on 06/12/2017. Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356855.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017151288
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CARIOCA, 3042 E 3RD ST APT 21, LONG BEACH,
CA 90814. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MARIA EUGE-
NIA BORGES GODFREY, 3042 E 3RD ST APT
21, LONG BEACH, CA 90814. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MARIA EUGENIA BORGES GODFREY,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 04/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/12/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356962.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017151434
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
UNITED GENERATION, 5544 YOLANDA AVE
#308, TARZANA, CA 91356. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: NAGHMEH KOMEYZI, 5544 YOLANDA AVE
#308, TARZANA, CA 91356. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: NAGHMEH KOMEYZI, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
06/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/12/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA357026.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017151888
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
24/7 PET NANNY, 1809 PEYTON AVE #304,
BURBANK, CA 91504. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
CLARE HOVAN, 1809 PEYTON AVE #304, BUR-
BANK, CA 91504. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: CLARE
HOVAN, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 04/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357107.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017151944
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BUCKEYE CLEANING CENTER LOS ANGELES,
9830 BELL RANCH DR., SANTA FE SPRINGS,
CA 90670. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: BUCKEYE
INTERNATIONAL INC, 2700 WAGNER PLACE,
MARYLAND HEIGHTS, MO 63043 (State of In-
corporation/Organization: MO). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MARTY S. ONTKO, MANAGER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
12/1996. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/13/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA357111.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152120
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
COOL THINGS TO DO, 543 N MADISON AVE
#14, LOS ANGELES, CA 90004. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: STEVE SHKUNDA, 543 N MADISON AVE
#14, LOS ANGELES, CA 90004. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: STEVE SHKUNDA, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
04/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/13/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA357132.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152158
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PARSI JEWELRY, 1320 E. WASHINGTON BLVD
#6, PASADENA, CA 91104. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: BEHNOOSH NASSERZARE, 1320 E. WASH-
INGTON BLVD 6, PASADENA, CA 91104. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: BEHNOOSH NASSERZA-
RE, OWNER. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357139.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152164
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
H AND H INVESTMENTS, 8718 IMPERIAL HIGH-
WAY, DOWNEY, CA 90242. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: PAUL ELMAN, 325 W. 8TH STREET 408,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90014, HARLO KINDER LIM-
ITED PARTNERSHIP, 8718 IMPERIAL HIGHWAY,
DOWNEY, CA 90242. This business is conducted
by: LIMITED PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PAUL ELMAN, GENERAL PARTNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
08/2008. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/13/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA357141.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152221
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MED TRIBE, 22330 MEYLER ST #57, TOR-
RANCE, CA 90502. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: CHRIS-
TOPHER LEE GRADELESS, 22330 MEYLER ST

#57, TORRANCE, CA 90502. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CHRISTOPHER LEE GRADELESS,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357146.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152368
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AD BY CANDACE, 14709 VALLEYHEART DR,
SHERMAN OAKS, CA 91403. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: CANDACE TRINCHIERI, 14709 VALLEY-
HEART DR, SHERMAN OAKS, CA 91403. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: CANDACE TRINCHIERI,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357187.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152431
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RED DOOR REAL ESTATE SERVICES, 25862
RAMILLO WAY, VALENCIA, CA 91355. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: FIVALLER PRIETO, 25862
RAMILLO WAY, VALENCIA, CA 91355 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: FIVALLER PRIETO, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/13/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA357204.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152529
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CY INTERIORS, 4859 W SLAUSON AVE. # 184,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90056. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: COURTNEY YAMANISHI, 4859 W SLAU-
SON AVE #184, LOS ANGELES, CA 90056. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: COURTNEY YAMANISHI,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357223.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152623
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
25 PRODUCTIONS, 12765 MATTESON AVE APT
7, LOS ANGELES, CA 90066. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MORGAN VENTICINQUE, 12765 MATTESON
AVENUE APT 7, LOS ANGELES, CA 90066. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: MORGAN VENTICINQUE,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357245.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017153312
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FASHION FREELANCE SERVICES, 3380 VIN-
TON AVE. #208, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: MARAH MCMILLAN, 3380 VIN-
TON AVE. #208, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: MARAH MCMILLAN, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/14/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357320.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152856
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MOUNTAIN MANAGEMENT, STAR ROUTE 20,
MOUNT WATERMAN, CA 93544. Mailing address
if different: 34978 BUTTER FLY DR, YUCAIPA,
CA 92399. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MINH NGUYET S RUNDALL, 39478 BUTTER-
FLY DR, YUCAIPA, CA 39478, FREDRICK H.
RUNDALL, 39478 BUTTERFLY DR., YUCAIPA,
CA 92399. This business is conducted by: MAR-
RIED COUPLE. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MINH NGUYET S RUNDALL, WIFE. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/13/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA357376.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017153384
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ATOMIC MEDIA LAB, 5800 KANAN RD. #168,
AGOURA HILLS, CA 91301. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: PAUL NICHOLS, 5800 KANAN RD. #168,
AGOURA HILLS, CA 91301. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PAUL NICHOLS, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/14/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/
29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357454.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017153458
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MORECARE STAFFING AGENCY, 1716 W. 146TH
ST. #2, GARDENA, CA 90247. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: IFEANYICHUKWU HELLEN IKEANYI, 1716
W. 146TH ST. UNIT 2, GARDENA, CA 90247,
CHINYERE MAKUACHUKWU AGU, 1716 W.
146TH ST. UNIT 2, GARDENA, CA 90247. This
business is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: IFEANY-
ICHUKWU HELLEN IKEANYI, PARTNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/14/
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CITY OF COVINA
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

REGARDING ISSUANCE OF
MULTIFAMILY HOUSING REVENUE BONDS FOR

CIENEGA GARDENS APARTMENTS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that, at 7:30 p.m., or as soon thereafter as the matter can be heard, on
Tuesday, July 18, 2017, at the City Hall Council Chamber, 125 East College Street, Covina, California,
the City Council of the City of Covina (the "City") will conduct a public hearing as required by Section
147(f) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, at which it will hear and consider information concerning
a proposed plan of financing providing for the issuance by the California Statewide Communities
Development Authority of multifamily housing revenue bonds in one or more series issued from time to
time, including bonds issued to refund such revenue bonds in one or more series from time to time,
and at no time to exceed $60,000,000 in outstanding aggregate principal amount, to finance the acqui-
sition and rehabilitation of a 180-unit multifamily rental housing project located at 1211 North Lyman
Avenue, Covina, California.  The facilities are to be owned by Cienega Gardens Preservation Limited
Partnership (the "Borrower"), operated by Preservation Partners Management Group, Inc., and are
generally known as Cienega Gardens Apartments (the "Project").

Those wishing to comment on the proposed financing and the nature and location of the Project may
either appear in person at the public hearing or submit written comments, which must be received by
the City prior to the hearing.  Written comments should be sent to City of Covina, Covina City Hall, 125
East College Street, Covina, California 91723, Attention: City Clerk.

CITY CLERK
CITY OF COVINA

Publish in the San Gabriel Valley Examiner on June 29, 2017. #CF05

NOTICE INVITING BIDS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the City of Glendora, County of Los Angeles, California (hereinafter “City”)
will receive sealed bids in the Office of the City Clerk at 116 E. Foothill Boulevard, Glendora, California,
91741 until 10:00 a.m. on the 13th day of July, 2017, at which time all bids will be publicly opened and
read aloud in the City Council Chamber at the above address for:  La Fetra Patio Renovation, Plan No.
1222 (hereinafter “work”).

NO BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED AFTER THIS DATE AND TIME!

Each bid must be on a bid proposal furnished by the City.  The bid must conform and be responsive to
all the contract documents and bids will be accepted only from bidders who have obtained Plans and
Specifications from the City of Glendora and are registered with the City as a Plan Holder. Copies of bid
packet are now on file and open for public inspection in the Office of the City Clerk at the above address
and on the City’s website at www.ci.glendora.ca.us under Bid/RFP Opportunities.  For further information,
contact Civil Engineering Assistant, Ulises Benavente at (626) 914-8247.

The Contract Documents, including specifications, may be purchased at the Office of the City Clerk, 116
E. Foothill Boulevard, Glendora, California during the hours of 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday, holidays excepted, upon the payment of $40.00 per set and, if purchased by mail, an additional
$5.00 per set.

Each bid shall be accompanied by Bidder’s Security in an amount equal to at least ten (10) percent of
the bid amount, which security shall be lawful money of the United States of America and in one of the
following forms:  (i) cash, (ii) cashier’s check made payable to the City, (iii) certified check made payable
to the City, or (iv) bid bond executed by an admitted surety insurer and made payable to the City.  City Bid
Bond form must be used.

Pursuant to California Labor Code Section 1770 et seq., copies of the determination of the Director of
the Department of Industrial Relations of the general prevailing rate of per diem wages for each craft,
classification and type of workman needed to execute the work are on file in, and available to any
interested person on request, at the office of the City Engineer at 116 E. Foothill Boulevard, Glendora,
California, 91741, and are hereby incorporated herein and made a part hereof as though set forth in full.

No contractor or subcontractor may be listed on a bid proposal for a public works project (submitted on
or after March 1, 2015) unless registered with the Department of Industrial Relations pursuant to Labor
Code section 1725.5 [with limited exceptions from this requirement for bid purposes only under Labor
Code section 1771.1(a)].

No contractor or subcontractor may be awarded a contract for public work on a public works project
(awarded on or after April 1, 2015) unless registered with the Department of Industrial Relations pursuant
to Labor Code section 1725.5.

This project is subject to compliance monitoring and enforcement by the Department of Industrial
Relations.

Pursuant to California Civil Code Section 3248, the successful bidder shall furnish to the City at the time
of execution of the contract a payment bond in an amount equal to one hundred percent (100%) of the
contract price.  The successful bidder shall also furnish to the City at the time of execution of the contract
faithful performance bond in an amount equal to one hundred percent (100%) of the contract price.

Pursuant to California Public Contract Code Section 22300, substitution of eligible and equivalent
securities for any moneys withheld to insure performance under the contract for the work to be performed
will be permitted at the request and expense of the successful bidder, unless otherwise prohibited by
law. The City of Glendora reserves the right to reject any and all proposals, to waive any informalities in
any proposal and select the one that best meets the City’s needs.

Kathleen R. Sessman, MMC
City Clerk
City of Glendora
Publish in the San Gabriel Valley Examiner on June 29th & July 6th, 2017. #GF10

CITY OF COVINA
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Planning Commission of the City of Covina will conduct a
PUBLIC HEARING in the City Hall Council Chamber, 125 East College Street, Covina, on Tuesday,
July 11, 2017 at 7:00 p.m., to consider the following:

“AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COVINA, CALIFORNIA,
DELETING EXISTING MEDICAL MARIJUANA REGULATIONS AND REPLACING
THEM WITH A NEW CHAPTER 17.84 THAT WILL BE ADDED TO TITLE 17 OF
THE COVINA MUNICIPAL CODE TO PROHIBIT COMMERCIAL MARIJUANA AC-
TIVITY (BOTH MEDICAL AND NON-MEDICAL), AND OUTDOOR MARIJUANA CUL-
TIVATION, AND TO ESTABLISH REASONABLE REGULATIONS REGARDING IN-
DOOR MARIJUANA CULTIVATION, AND MAKING A FINDING OF EXEMPTION
FROM CEQA UNDER SECTION 15061(B)(3) OF THE CEQA GUIDELINES”

Under the provisions of the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA), this Zoning Code Amend-
ment is exempt from environmental review because it is not considered a project, and the Zoning
Code Amendment proposes no activity that may have a significant effect on the environment and will
not cause a direct physical change in the environment or reasonably foreseeable indirect physical
change in the environment.

We solicit any information and/or data that any citizen wishes to input concerning these applications.
All interested citizens are invited to attend the PUBLIC HEARING, where all opinions may be ex-
pressed.

If you challenge the proposed action in court, you may be limited to raising only those issues that you
or someone else raised at the PUBLIC HEARING described in this notice or in written correspon-
dence delivered to the City Clerk or to the Planning Commission at or prior to the PUBLIC HEARING.

Further information may be obtained from the City of Covina Community Development Department,
Planning Division at (626) 384-5450.

ALAN CARTER
CITY PLANNER

NOTE: ACCESS TO THE CITY COUNCIL CHAMBER IS FROM THE NORTH SIDE OF THE MAIN
CITY HALL BUILDING VIA THE COURTYARD.

Publish in the San Gabriel Valley Examiner on June 29, 2017. #CF06

NOTICE TO COVINA CITIZENS
REGARDING ADOPTED ORDINANCE

On June 20, 2017, the Covina City Council adopted the following Ordinance:

Ordinance 17-07

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF COVINA, CALIFORNIA, AMENDING SECTION 17.64.150 OF
CHAPTER 17.64 (SITE PLAN REVIEW) OF TITLE 17 (ZONING) AND SECTION 16.08.160 OF
CHAPTER 16.08 (TENTATIVE MAPS) OF TITLE 16 (SUBDIVISIONS) OF THE COVINA MUNICIPAL
CODE CONCERNING TIME LIMITS FOR CONSTRUCTION OF APPROVED SITE PLANS AND THE
EXTENSION OF TIME FOR TENTATIVE MAPS, AND MAKING A DETERMINATION OF EXEMPTION
UNDER CEQA

A certified copy of the full text of the ordinance is posted in the City Clerk's office located at 125 East
College Street, Covina, California.

/s/Mary Lou Walczak, Elected City Clerk

Publish in the San Gabriel Valley Examiner on June 29, 2017. #CF07

2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA357476.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017153922
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: GENTLE GENIUS
PUBLIC RELATIONS, 6500 YUCCA STREET SUITE 230, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90028. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: KANETRA KING, 6500 YUCCA ST., SUITE
230, LOS ANGELES, CA 90028. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information which he
or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: KANETRA
KING, FOUNDER + CEO / OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): DECEMBER 1, 2016. This statement was filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/14/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name
statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017,
07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357574.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017154095
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: COMMON SPACE
BREWERY, 3411 WEST EL SEGUNDO BOULEVARD, HAW-
THORNE, CA 90250. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: HAMMACK STREET VENTURES
LLC, 11773 HAMMACK STREET, CULVER CITY, CA 90230 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is conducted by: LIM-
ITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: DAVID CHILDRESS, MANAGING MEMBER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/14/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name
statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017,
07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357594.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017154674
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: SOUL GANSTER,
11545 PRAGER AVE, SYLMAR, CA 91342. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: FRANCHESCA
RAMIREZ, 11545 PRAGER AVE, SYLMAR, CA 91342. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: FRANCHESCA RAMIREZ, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/15/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name
statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017,
07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357761.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017154893
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. ON-CALL E-
FILING, 2. AAA E-FILING, 3. AAA E-FILING.COM, 4. AAA-E-FILING,
5. AAA-E-FILING.COM, 1875 CENTURY PARK EAST, STE. H, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90067. Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of
Incorporation or Organization Number: 3102466. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ON-CALL ATTORNEY AND MESSENGER SER-
VICES INC., 1875 CENTURY PARK EAST, STE. H, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90067 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: DAVID AZEMA, PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business names listed above
on (date): 06/2017. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/15/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not
of itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business name
in violation of the rights of another under federal, state, or common
law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357794.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017154938
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 94AUDIO, 7518
PURDY AVE #A, BELL GARDENS, CA 90201. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ANTHONY
SOLIS, 7518 PURDY AVE #A, BELL GARDENS, CA 90201. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: ANTHONY SOLIS, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/15/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/

2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA357799.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017155040
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: PASADENA BUB-
BLEBALL, 999 E. VALLEY BLVD., UNIT 54, ALHAMBRA, CA 91801.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: DAVID VERDUGO, 999 E. VALLEY BLVD., UNIT 54, ALHAM-
BRA, CA 91801. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: DAVID VERDUGO, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 06/01/2016. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/
15/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA357822.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017155214
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: RAINBOW REIKI
WELLNESS, 34754 ELLENAN AVENUE, ACTON, CA 93510. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MICHELE D HOTOVEC, 34754 ELLENAN AVENUE, ACTON, CA
93510. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MICHELE D HOTOVEC, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/15/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA357856.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017155535
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. DITSY A BRIT-
ISH CRAFT BOUTIQUE, 2. DITSY BAGS, 42259 CAMDEN WAY,
LANCASTER, CA 93536. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: KIRSTY MICHELLE HUDDLESTONE,
42259 CAMDEN WAY, LANCASTER, CA 93536. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: KIRSTY MICHELLE HUDDLESTONE, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): 03/2015. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/15/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA357905.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156429
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. GREEN LIFE
DELIVERY, 2. GREEN MIND DELIVERY, 3. GREAT GREEN DE-
LIVERY, 4. GREEN TIME DELIVERY, 2616 GREENMEADOW RD
APT #3, LAKEWOOD, CA 90712. Mailing address if different: N/A.
Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number: 201511110209. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: NDW GLOBAL SOLUTIONS,
LLC, 2616 GREENMEADOW RD APT #3, LAKEWOOD, CA 90712
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is conduct-
ed by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: NICHOLAS D. WEBER, MANAGING MEMBER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness names listed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358003.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156011
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: TAPIAS BEND-
INGS, 7114 EL SELINDA AVE APT B, BELL GARDENS, CA 90201.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: JULIO C TAPIA BARBOSA, 7114 EL SELINDA AVE APT B, BELL
GARDENS, CA 90201, BLANA AIDEE SANDOVAL, 7114 EL SELIN-
DA AVE APT B, BELL GARDENS, CA 90201. This business is
conducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: JULIO C. TAPIA BARBOSA, PARTNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358005.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017154730
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. GREAT SMOKY,
2. M.E. JEANS, 1015 WALL STREET STE 111, LOS ANGELES, CA
90015. Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or
Organization Number: C3373969. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: FULL & WELL FASHION CO., LTD, 1015 WALL STREET STE
111, LOS ANGELES, CA 90015 (State of Incorporation/Organization:
CALIFORNIA). This business is conducted by: CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: HANBIN LI, PRESIDENT. The
registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness names listed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358006.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF FICTITIOUS BUSI-
NESS NAME 2017155956
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of the fictitious
business name(s): TOP KIDS ACADEMY, 600 E. GRAND AVE.,
SAN GABRIEL, CA 91776. The fictitious business name(s) referred
to above was filed on: 2/20/2014 in the County of Los Angeles.
Original File No. 2014044972. Full name of Registrant(s): TOP KIDS,
LLC, 2600 NEW AVE., ROSEMEAD, CA 91770 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CA). This business is conducted by: LIMITED
LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true, information
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
MONIQUE YIP, PRESIDENT. This statement was filed with the Los
Angeles County Clerk on 06/16/2017. Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA358007.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017155946
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: TOP KIDS ACAD-
EMY, 600 E. GRAND AVE., SAN GABRIEL, CA 91776. Mailing
address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization
Number: C4034093. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: HAMP-
TON HERITAGE CORP, 600 E. GRAND AVE., SAN GABRIEL, CA
91776 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MONIQUE YIP, PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or common law (see
Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL
VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA358018.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017155465
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: WILD BLUE COM-
MUNICATIONS, 24009 MOBILE ST, WEST HILLS, CA 91307, WEST
HILLS, CA 91307. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: RYAN RING, 24009 MOBILE ST, WEST HILLS,
CA 91307. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: RYAN RING, PRESIDENT/OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/15/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358025.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017155947
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. BOEN HOME
IMPROVEMENT, 2. BOEN CABINET, 17115 GALE AVE, CITY OF
INDUSTRY, CA 91745. Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of
Incorporation or Organization Number: C3702660. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: BOEN US CONSULTING GROUP, INC., 17115
GALE AVE, CITY OF INDUSTRY, CA 91745 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: CALIFORNIA). This business is conducted by: COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: LIN YANG, CFO. The
registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness names listed above on (date): 06/01/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358028.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156226
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: IDEAL SOLU-
TIONS INSURANCE SERVICES, 1155 S GRAND AVE, GLENDO-
RA, CA 91740. Mailing address if different: 863 E LEADORA AVE,
GLENDORA, CA 91741. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
IDEAL INSURANCE PARTNERS, 1155 S GRAND AVE, GLENDO-
RA, CA 91740 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This busi-
ness is conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: STEVEN C WELKER, PRESIDENT. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 01/2008. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358073.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156237
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: ONE DOSE EDI-
BLES, 612 S FLOWER ST 905, LOS ANGELES, CA 90017. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
CATHERINE ELIZABETH SHAW, 612 S FLOWER ST 905, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90017 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: CATHERINE ELIZABETH SHAW, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious

business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358078.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156442
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: NUTRA TECH,
16510 LA SALLE AVE., GARDENA, CA 90247. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: PAUL S. YOO,
16510 LA SALLE AVE., GARDENA, CA 90247. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PAUL S. YOO, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or common law (see
Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL
VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA358119.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156572
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: RICHARD EMERY
PRODUCTIONS, 5756 ALDAMA ST #3, LOS ANGELES, CA 90042.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: RICHARD EMERY, 5756 ALDAMA ST #3, LOS ANGELES, CA
90042. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: RICHARD EMERY, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358165.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156643
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: LML WORKS, 4454
WEST 59TH STREET, LOS ANGELES, CA 90043. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LAURENCE
MAURICE HALL, 4454 WEST 59TH STREET, LOS ANGELES, CA
90043. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: LAURENCE MAURICE HALL, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 01/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358184.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156676
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: THE BURGER
JOINT, 18303 STUDEBAKER ROAD, CERRITOS, CA 90703. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization
Number: 3197775. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MCKEN-
NA MOTORS CERRITOS, INC., 18303 STUDEBAKER ROAD, CER-
RITOS, CA 90703. This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: DANIEL J. MCKENNA III,
PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/A. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/16/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et
seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA358189.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF FICTITIOUS BUSI-
NESS NAME 2017157261
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of the fictitious
business name(s): FASHION CLEANERS, 23756 LYONS AVE, NE-
WHALL, CA 91321-. The fictitious business name(s) referred to
above was filed on: 4-26-2016 in the County of Los Angeles. Original
File No. 2016101720. Full name of Registrant(s): ZAMERUL I. DUL-
LA, 23756 LYONS AVE, NEWHALL, CA 91321, FATEMA K. DULLA,
23756 LYONS AVE, NEWHALL, CA 91321. This business is con-
ducted by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true,
information which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ZAMERUL I. DULLA, OWNER. This statement was filed
with the Los Angeles County Clerk on 06/19/2017. Publish: 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA359678.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017156626
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 433 MIDVALE
APARTMENTS, 11661 SAN VICENTE BLVD #510, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90049. Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation
or Organization Number: 201513810432. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: 433 MIDVALE, LLC, 11661 SAN VICENTE BLVD
#510, LOS ANGELES, CA 90049 (State of Incorporation/Organiza-
tion: DELAWARE), MIDVALE INVESTORS, LLC, 11661 SAN VICE-
NTE BLVD #510, LOS ANGELES, CA 90049 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: DELAWARE), DARLINGTON INVESTORS GP, LLC,
11661 SAN VICENTE BLVD #510, LOS ANGELES, CA 90049 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: DELAWARE). This business is con-
ducted by: COPARTNERS. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: STEVEN K. FOWLKES, MANAGING MEMBER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA359753.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017158721
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: LOLO BEAUTY
COSMETICS, 1050 S FLOWER ST. #325, LOS ANGELES, CA 90015.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: NICOLE LOPEZ MOLINA, 1050 S. FLOWER ST. #325, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90015. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A

registrant who declares as true information which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: NICOLE LOPEZ MOLINA,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): 02/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/20/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et
seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/
2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAM-
INER. AAA359869.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017158620
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: FLOWER MAS-
SAGE 1, 14345 CLARK AVE, BELLFLOWER, CA 90706. Mailing
address if different: 316 W. HELLMAN AVE, MONTEREY PARK, CA
91754. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: SHUNXING WENG,
316 W. HELLMAN AVE, MONTEREY PARK, CA 91754. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: SHUNXING WENG, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 06/2017. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not
of itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business name
in violation of the rights of another under federal, state, or common
law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359870.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017158618
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: SIAM WALA THAI
MASSAGE, 24433 HAWTHORNE BLVD., TORRANCE, CA 90505.
Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organi-
zation Number: C4024312. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
SIAM WALA INC, 24433 HAWTHORNE BLVD., TORRANCE, CA
90505 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: KAROONLAK INTONGKAM, PRESIDENT. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name
statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017,
07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359871.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017158619
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: HAVEN LAW, 1230
ROSECRANS AVENUE SUITE 300, MANHATTAN BEACH, CA 90266.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: PETER T. HAVEN, 1230 ROSECRANS AVENUE SUITE 300,
MANHATTAN BEACH, CA 90266. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information which he
or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: PETER T.
HAVEN, OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on (date): 01/01/
2017. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or common law (see
Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL
VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359872.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017158842
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: BIG 3 COLLECTI-
BLES-DOWNEY, 10221 OLD RIVER SCHOOL RD, DOWNEY, CA
90242. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: JENNIFER OROZCO, 932 WEST SPRUCE ST, COMPTON,
CA 90220. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JENNIFER OROZCO, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name listed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA359873.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017159253
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: DARK 8 CUSTOM
DESIGN, 1300 S SANTEE ST SUITE 206, LOS ANGELES, CA
90015. Mailing address if different: 1300 S SANTEE ST SUITE 206,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90015. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
SANDRA LUZ LOPEZ CUADRAS, 3645 1/2 E 1ST STREET APT A,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90063. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: SANDRA LUZ LOPEZ
CUADRAS, OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed above on (date): 06/
2017. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or common law (see
Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL
VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359874.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017157209
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: RAINBOW DO-
NUTS & ICE CREAM, 10397 LONG BEACH BLVD, LYNWOOD, CA
90262. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: SIVMENG HOEUNG, 9838 FLAMINGO AVE, FOUNTAIN
VALLEY, CA 92708. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which he or she knows to
be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: SIVMENG HOEUNG, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 06/01/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/
19/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA359875.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017157211
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: POMONA POSI-
TIVE STEPS, 324 PALOMA DR, POMONA, CA 91767. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization Num-
ber: C2240779. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: GENE CARE
INC, 4657 ELLENITA AVENUE, TARZANA, CA 91356 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CALIFORNIA). This business is conduct-
ed by: CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true informa-
tion which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ELIZABETH GODLEWSKA, PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business name listed above
on (date): 02/10/2012. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/19/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the date it was filed in
the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business name
statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017,
07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359876.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017157210
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: KCAJ ENTER-
PRISES, INC, 4435 3/4 W SLAUSON AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA
90043. Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or
Organization Number: C4031508. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: KCAJ ENTERPRISES, INC, 4435 3/4 W SLAUSON AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90043 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This
business is conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: KAFARRAH CHAVARRIA, PRESIDENT. The
registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/19/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA359877.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017159255
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. PHOENIX KAI-
ZEN ENTERPRISES, 2. PHOENIX INTERIORS, 962 E. 35TH ST,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90011. Mailing address if different: PO BOX
6247, LONG BEACH, CA 90806. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: JESUS ROSAS DELGADO, 962 E. 35TH ST, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90011. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JESUS ROSAS DELGADO, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business names listed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA359878.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017159235
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: TASTEBUDDS 5.0,
1529 ALAMITOS AVE., LONG BEACH, CA 90813. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LYNNA CHHUN,
1529 ALAMITOS AVE., LONG BEACH, CA 90813, CHANTRA KHAK,
5829 HAZELBROOK AVE, LAKEWOOD, CA 90712. This business is
conducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: LYNNA CHHUN, PARTNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA359879.

June 29, Start
STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT

OF USE OF FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME
2017153999

The following person(s) has/have abandoned the use of the fictitious
business name: B E ENGINEERING, 141 S. NINTH AVE #B, LA
PUENTE, CA 91746. The fictitious business name referred to above
was filed on 01/16/15 in the county of Los Angeles. Full name of
registrant(s) is (are) ELIAS MOLINA, 1040 N LEAF AVE., COVINA,
CA 91722. The business is conducted by an INDIVIDUAL. Signed:
ELIAS MOLINA, OWNER. This statement is filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/17. File No. 2015013765.
Publish: June 29, July 6, 13, 20, 2017, San Gabriel Valley Exam-
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SUMMONS
(CITACIÓN JUDICIAL)

NOTICE TO DEFENDANT:
(AVISO AL DEMANDADO):
ROBERT TAYLOR DOOLEY

YOU ARE BEING SUED BY PLAINTIFF:
(LO ESTA DEMANDANDO EL DEMANDANTE):
MICHAEL CONWAY

NOTICE! You have been sued. The court may decide against you without your being heard unless you
respond within 30 days. Read the information below.

You have 30 CALENDAR DAYS after this summons and legal papers are served on you to file a
written response at this court and have a copy served on the plaintiff. A letter or phone call will not protect
you. Your written response must be in proper legal form if you want the court to hear your case. There
may be a court form that you can use for your response. You can find these court forms and more
information at the California Courts

Online Self-Help Center (www.courtinfo.ca.gov/selfhelp), your county law library, or the courthouse
nearest you. If you cannot pay the filing fee, ask the court clerk for a fee waiver form. If you do not file your
response on time, you may lose the case by default, and your wages, money, and property may be taken
without further warning from the court.

There are other legal requirements. You may want to call an attorney right away. If you do not know an
attorney, you may want to call an attorney referral service. If you cannot afford an attorney, you may be
eligible for free legal services from a nonprofit legal services program. You can locate these nonprofit
groups at the California Legal Services Web site (www.lawhelpcalifornia.org), the California Courts
Online Self-Help Center (www.courtinfo.ca.gov/selfhelp), or by contacting your local court or county bar
association. NOTE: The court has a statutory lien for waived fees and costs on any settlement or
arbitration award of $10,000 or more in a civil case. The court’s lien must be paid before the court will
dismiss the case.
¡AVISO! Lo han demandado. Si no responde dentro de 30 dias, la corte puede decidir en su contra sin
escuchar su version. Lea la informacion a continuacion.

Tiene 30 DIAS DE CALENDARIO despues de que le entreguen esta citacion y papeles legales para
presentar una respuesta por escrito en esta corte y hacer que se entregue una copia al demandante.
Una carta o una llamada telefonica no lo protegen. Su respuesta por escrito tiene que estar en formato
legal correcto si desea que procesen su caso en la corte. Es posible que haya un formulario que usted
pueda usar para su respuesta. Puede encontrar estos formularios de la corte y mas informacion en el
Centro de Ayuda de las Cortes de California (www.sucorte.ca.gov), en la biblioteca de leyes de su
condado o en la corte que le quede mas cerca. Si no puede pagar la cuota de presentacion, pida al
secretario de la corte que le de un formulario de exencion de pago de cuotas. Si no presenta su
respuesta a tiempo, puede perder el caso por incumplimiento y la corte le podra quitar su sueldo,
dinero y bienes sin mis advertencia.

Hay otros requisitos legales. Es recomendable que liame a un abogado inmediatamente. Si no
conoce a un abogado, puede llamar a un servicio de remision a abogados. Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible que cumpla con los requisitos para obtener servicios legales gratuitos de un
programa de servicios legales sin fines de lucro. Puede encontrar estos grupos sin fines de lucro en el
sitio web de California Legal Services, (www.lawhelpcalifornia.org), en el Centro de Ayuda de las Cortes
de California, (www.sucorte.ca.gov) o poniendose en contacto con la corte o el colegio de abogados
locales. AVISO: Por ley, la corte tiene derecho a reclamar las cuotas y los costos exentos por imponer
un gravamen sobre cualquier recuperacion de $10,000 o mas de valor recibida mediante un acuerdo
o una concesion de arbitraje en un caso de derecho civil. Tiena que pagar el gravamen de la corte
antes de que la corte pueda desechar el caso.

The name and address of the court are (El nombre y dirección de la corte son):
SUPERIOR COURT OF CALIFORNIA – SANTA ANA
700 CIVIL CENTER DRIVE
SANTA ANA, CA
CASE NUMBER (NÚMERO DE CASO): 30-2016-00875866

The name, address, and telephone number of the petitioner’s attorney, or the petitioner without an
attorney, is: (El nombre, dirección y número de teléfono del abogado del demandante, o del demandante
si no tiene abogado, es):
Michael Conway, 611 Lombardy Lane, Laguna Beach, CA 92651, (949) 933-4619

Date (Fecha): September 20, 2016  Clerk by (Secretario) Jennifer Garcia, Deputy (Asistente)
Published in the San Gabriel Valley Examiner June 15, June 22, June 29, July 6, 2017.

NOTICE OF PETITION TO ADMINISTER ESTATE
(Probate – Decedents’ Estates)

NOTICE OF PETITION TO ADMINISTER ESTATE OF JOHN LAU Also Known As HSIUNG-CHAO LIU Also
Known As CHAO-HSIUNG LIU
CASE NO. BP170819

ESTATE OF: JOHN LAU Also Known As HSIUNG-CHAO LIU Also Known As CHAO-HSIUNG LIU, DECEDENT
To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, and contingent creditors and persons who may be otherwise
interested in the will or estate, or both, of JOHN LAU Also Known As HSIUNG-CHAO LIU Also Known As
CHAO-HSIUNG LIU
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has been filed by CALVIN LAU in the Superior Court of California, County of
LOS ANGELES.
The Petition for Probate requests that CALVIN LAU be appointed as personal representative to
administer the estate of the decedent.
The petition requests authority to administer the estate under the Independent Administration of Estates
Act. (This authority will allow the personal representative to take many actions without obtaining court
approval. Before taking certain very important actions, however, the personal representative will be
required to give notice to interested persons unless they have waived notice or have consented to the
proposed action.) The independent administration authority will be granted unless an interested person
files an objection to the petition and shows good cause why the court should not grant the authority.
A hearing on the petition will be held in this court as follows: JULY 19, 2017 at 8:30 AM in Dept. 9 at the
SUPERIOR COURT OF CALIFORNIA, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, 111 NORTH HILL STREET, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90012, CENTRAL DISTRICT, STANLEY MOSK COURTHOUSE.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting of the petition, you should appear at the hearing and state your objections
or file written objections with the court before the hearing. Your appearance may be in person or by your
attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a CONTINGENT CREDITOR OF THE DECEDENT,   you must file your claim with
the court and mail a copy to the personal representative appointed by the court within the later of either
( 1) four months from the date of first issuance of letters to a general personal representative, as
defined in section 58(b) of the  California Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a notice under section 9052 of the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal authority may affect your rights as a creditor. You may want to
consult with an attorney knowledgeable in California law.
You may examine the file kept by the court. If you are a person interested in the estate, you may file with
the court a Request for Special Notice (form DE-154) of the filing of an inventory and appraisal of the
estate assets or of any petition or account as provided in Probate Code section 1250. A Request for
Special Notice form is available from the court clerk.

Petitioner:
Calvin Lau
3036 Del Mar Avenue
Rosemead, CA 91770
(626) 224-7597

Publish in the San Gabriel Valley Examiner on June 22, 29, July 6, 2017

NOTICE OF PETITION TO ADMINISTER ESTATE
(Probate – Decedents’ Estates)

NOTICE OF PETITION TO ADMINISTER ESTATE OF SHARON CLARE SCHUBERT
CASE NO. 17STPB05104

ESTATE OF: SHARON CLARE SCHUBERT, DECEDENT
To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, and contingent creditors and persons who may be otherwise
interested in the will or estate, or both, of SHARON CLARE SCHUBERT
A PETITION FOR PROBATE has been filed by KRISANDRA S LEE in the Superior Court of California,
County of LOS ANGELES.
The Petition for Probate requests that KRISANDRA S LEE be appointed as personal representative
to administer the estate of the decedent.
The petition requests authority to administer the estate under the Independent Administration of
Estates Act. (This authority will allow the personal representative to take many actions without
obtaining court approval. Before taking certain very important actions, however, the personal
representative will be required to give notice to interested persons unless they have waived notice or
have consented to the proposed action.) The independent administration authority will be granted
unless an interested person files an objection to the petition and shows good cause why the court
should not grant the authority.
A hearing on the petition will be held in this court as follows: JULY 13, 2017 at 8:30 AM in Dept. 99
at the SUPERIOR COURT OF CALIFORNIA, COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES, 111 NORTH HILL STREET,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90012.
IF YOU OBJECT to the granting of the petition, you should appear at the hearing and state your
objections or file written objections with the court before the hearing. Your appearance may be in
person or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a CONTINGENT CREDITOR OF THE DECEDENT,   you must file your claim
with the court and mail a copy to the personal representative appointed by the court within the later of
either ( 1) four months from the date of first issuance of letters to a general personal representative,
as defined in section 58(b) of the  California Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from the date of mailing or
personal delivery to you of a notice under section 9052 of the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal authority may affect your rights as a creditor. You may want to
consult with an attorney knowledgeable in California law.
You may examine the file kept by the court. If you are a person interested in the estate, you may file
with the court a Request for Special Notice (form DE-154) of the filing of an inventory and appraisal of
the estate assets or of any petition or account as provided in Probate Code section 1250. A Request
for Special Notice form is available from the court clerk.

Petitioner:
Krisandra S Lee
1007 Sutter Creek Way
Brentwood, CA 94513
(925) 382-3853

Publish in the San Gabriel Valley Examiner on June 22, 29, July 6, 2017

iner / / Ad #F500

CNBB261701NQ FILE NO.2017150801
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: VALERIA CUSTOM FINISHER 18823 NAPA
ST NORTHRIDGE CA 91324.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MAR-
THA TERESA HIDALGO MARTINEZ 18823 NAPA ST NORTHRIDGE
CA 91324. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be

filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261701NQ

CNBB261702NQ FILE NO.2017151111
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: ROMAN MUSIC 352 W CHEVY CHASE DR
APT C GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ROMAN BABKHANYAN 352 W CHEVY CHASE DR APT C GLEN-
DALE CA 91204. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County

Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have)  commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2010. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261702NQ

CNBB261703NQ FILE NO.2017151198
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: SO. CAL DECKS 9800 VESPER AVE UNIT
78 PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MICHAEL R. NIETO 9800 VESPER AVE UNIT 78 PANORAMA CITY
CA 91402. The business is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261703NQ

CNBB261704TC FILE NO.2017152597
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as DEJA PARIS 1365 N GRAND OAKS AVE
PASADENA CA 91104. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) YOHAN TEX
INC 1365 N GRAND OAKS AVE PASADENA CA 91104. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261704TC

CNBB261705TC FILE NO.2017151291
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: SAAVEDRA AUTOMOTIVE SPECIALTIES
220 E LIME AVE MONROVIA CA 91016. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CHRISTIAN SAAVEDRA 220 E LIME AVE MONROVIA CA 91016.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/12/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261705TC

CNBB261706JEN FILE NO.2017152512
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: SMOKIN BBQ 5958 S. VAN NESS AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90047. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) CHRISTO-
PHER FLOWERS 10033 WISNER AVE MISSION HILLS CA 91345.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261706JEN

CNBB261707JEN FILE NO.2017152763
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as:
PINE TREE CARPET CLEANING 19904 RAINBOW WAY CERRITOS
CA 90703.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) KUN SIK YOUN 19904
RAINBOW WAY CERRITOS CA 90703. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above on 05/2004. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession
Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261707JEN

CNBB261708GM FILE NO.2017152153
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: L'ARC GIFT SHOP 1779 E ROUTE 66
GLENDORA CA 91740. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) RAFI AVA-
KIAN ;RITA P AVAKIAN ; ARPY JEIRIAN HAMBARIAN 1779 E ROUTE
66 GLENDORA CA 91740. The business is conducted by: A  GENER-
AL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession
Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261708GM

CNBB261709IF FILE NO.2017151689
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: TAQUERIA AMECA 747 S ATLANTIC BLVD
EAST LOS ANGELES CA 90022. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
DAVILA FOODS INC 747 S ATLANTIC BLVD EAST LOS ANGELES CA
90022. The business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 09/2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261709IF

CNBB261710JL FILE NO.2017152730
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: DK AUTO DEALER 13516 TELEGRAPH RD
STE N WHITTIER CA 90605. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DOANE
HAONG KIEM 2227 N STRATHMORE LANE ROSEMEAD CA 91770.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261710JL

CNBB261711JL FILE NO.2017151658
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as JFK 111 W. VICTORIA ST LONG BEACH CA
90805. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) D & A UNLIMITED , INC 111
W. VICTORIA ST LONG BEACH CA 90805.The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession
Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261711JL

CNBB261712JL FILE NO.2017151659
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: 18K 111 W. VICTORIA ST LONG BEACH CA
90805. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) D & A UNLIMITED INC 111 W.
VICTORIA ST LONG BEACH CA 90805. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession
Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261712JL

CNBB261713JL FILE NO.2017151981
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as:
28 L.A. 3705 S METTLER STREET 2ND FLOOR STE B LOS ANGELES
CA 90011. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LAZARO MARTINEZ
VILLANUEVA 3705 S METTLER  STREET  2ND FLOOR STE B LOS
ANGELES CA 90011. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261713JL

CNBB261714JL FILE NO.2017152312
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: REJUVA MEDICA 12099 W WASHINGTON
BLVD STE 400 LOS ANGELES CA 90066. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SANA MEDICAL GROUP INC 12099 W WASHINGTON BLVD
STE 400 LOS ANGELES CA 90066.The business is conducted by: A
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession

Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261714JL

CNBB261715MU FILE NO.2017152701
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: DATA MARKETING MANAGEMENT ; DMM
2321 WALL ST LOS ANGELES CA 90011;115 W 4TH ST # 209 LONG
BEACH CA 90802. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ANICASIO
MUNOZ 2321 WALL ST LOS ANGELES CA 90011. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261715MU

CNBB261716MU FILE NO.2017152505
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: ROUTE 42 SMOGS 3382 FIRESTONE
BLVD UNIT B SOUTH GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) JONATHAN MUNOZ CASILLAS 864 E. 75TH ST LOS ANGELES
CA 90001. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261716MU

CNBB261717MU FILE NO.2017152707
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as) INOVA PHOTOGRAPHY 502 W. HELLMAN
AVE MONTEREY PARK CA 91754. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
FRANZ MACIAS 502 W. HELLMAN AVE MONTEREY PARK CA
91754.The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261717MU

CNBB261718MU FILE NO.2017152534
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: PRO MANAGEMENT 365; REALTY 365 283
E. HOLT AVE POMONA CA 91767. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
JAWAD AFZAL 283 E. HOLT AVE POMONA CA 91767. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/17. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261718MU

CNBB261719MU FILE NO.2017152579
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: GV TRANSPORTATION 16603 FORMY DR
LA MIRADA CA 90638. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) GILBERTO
VITERI ORTIZ 16003 FORMBY DR LA MIRADA CA 90638. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or names listed above on
. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261719MU

CNBB261720DC FILE NO.2017152514
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: WEST COAST COMFORT HVAC SOLU-
TIONS 15808 ALGECIRAS DRIVE LA MIRADA CA 90638. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) WEST COAST COMFORT SOLUTIONS INC
15808 ALGECIRAS DR LA MIRADA CA 90638. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION . I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261720DC

CNBB261721DC FILE NO.2017151865
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as the ) ARMOR COAT 10920 AMERY AVE
SOUTH GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) JOSE
SEGURA 10920 AMERY AVE SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names listed above on 04/
1993. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261721DC

CNBB261722MU FILE NO.2017151885
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: MI LINDO MICHOACAN CATERING SER-
VICES INC 2537 CASPIAN AVE LONG BEACH CA 90810. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) MI LINDO MICHOACAN CATERING SERVIC-
ES INC 2537 CASPIAN AVE LONG BEACH CA 90810. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261722MU

CNBB261723AC FILE NO.2017151937
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: R&B AUTO BODY SHOP 11211 ROSWELL
AVE POMONA CA 91766;328 BARHILL AVE POMONA CA 91766. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ADRIANA P. BELTRAN ; VICTOR ROD-
RIGUEZ 328 BARHILL AVE POMONA CA 91766. The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17
The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261723AC

CNBB261724AC FILE NO.2017132842
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: STRAY CAT 62 W UNION ST PASADENA
CA 91103. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) SARASA INC 62 W
UNION ST PASADENA CA 91103. The business is conducted by: A
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 05/23/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession
Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261724AC

CNBB261725AC FILE NO.2017152531
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as; DK BEAUTY SALON 1056 N WESTERN
AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90029. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MARIA CATALINA CLEMENTE FLORES; DANIELA CARMEN PERAL-
TA 1056 N WESTERN AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90029. The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP.I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17
The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251725EL

CNBB261726PS FILE NO.2017152254
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: CARNICERIA EL COMPADRE 8432 SUN-
LAND BLVD 8434 SUNLAND BLVD SUNLAND CA 91352;523 JUSTIN
AVENUE APT B GLENDALE CA 91201.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SALCEDO'S LLC 523 JUSTIN AVENUE APT B GLENDALE CA
91201. The business is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPA-
NY. I declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261726PS

CNBB261727  FILE NO.2017151947
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business SOCIAL GUERILLAS 1701 WABASSO WAY
GLENDALE CA 91208. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) TUNA CRATE
LLC 1701 WABASSA WAY GLENDALE CA 91208. The business is
conducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who

declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261727

CNBB261728ED FILE NO.2017152203
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: FASHION NAIL SPA 9301 TAMPA AVE #71
NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ANH KIM
NGUYEN ;KELLENE PHU; HANG THUY VU 9301 TAMPA AVE #71
NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. The business is conducted by:  A GENER-
AL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession
Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261728ED

CNBB261729ED FILE NO.2017152256
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: AA APPRAISERS 345 N KENWOOD ST
APT 105 GLENDALE CA 91206. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ARMEN ALEKSANYAN 345 N KENWOOD ST 105 GLENDALE CA
91206.The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner CNBB261729ED

CNBB261730ED FILE NO.2017152588
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: VIDAL RESTAURANT DETAILING 8421
VENTURA CNYN AVE #3 PANORAMA CITY CA 91402. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ALVARO I PICHE; SANDRA NATHALY VIDAL
DURAN 8421 VENTURA CNYN AVE #3 PANORAMA CITY CA 91402.
The business is conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261730ED

CNBB261731EL FILE NO.2017152833
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as) QUICK STOP NOW 14817 SYLVAN ST APT
#6 VAN NUYS CA 91411. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DESIREE
A ELLIOTT 148147 SYLVAN ST APT #6 VAN NUYS CA 91411. The
business is conducted by: A INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County 06/
13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261731EL

CNBB261732EL FILE NO.2017152811
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as) NATIONAL STAFFING 11856 BALBOA BLVD
#410 GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
NOELLE L. KING 11856 BALBOA BLVD 410 GRANADA HILLS CA
91344. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2016. The registrant (s) has (have) com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 04/1988. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261732EL

CNBB261733EL FILE NO.2017152878
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as ) WERNER LOPEZ CONSTRUCTION 18523
BASSETT ST RESEDA CA 91335. The business is conducted by: A
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017.
The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed above on. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or
common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession
Code) First filing; 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB261733EL

CNBB261734EL FILE NO.2017152510
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: SIDING FORSALECOM 14753. 5 OXNARD
ST VAN NUYS CA 91411 . Full name of registrant (s) is (are) BUILD
GREEN INC 39560 ARMFIELD AVE PALMDALE CA 93551. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and
Profession Code) First filing:; 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261734EL

CNBB261735EL FILE NO.2017151701
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: SKYNET COMMUNICATIONS 16931 LOS
ALIMOS ST GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SKYNET COMMUNICATIONS INC 16931 LOS ALIMOS ST GRAN-
ADA HILLS CA 91344. The business is conducted by: A CORPORA-
TION. I declare that all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information, which he or she knows to
be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 02/19/2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in
violation of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261735EL

CNBB261736NQ FILE NO.2017152504
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: U' PICK101 S MAIN ST POMONA CA 91766.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) OMID REZA MORADI 101 S MAIN ST
POMONA CA 91766. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation
of the rights of another under Federal, State, or common law (See
section 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261736NQ

CNBB261737NQ FILE NO.2017152068
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: URIBE BRO'S TRUCKING 11120 ARMINTA
ST APT 104 SUN VALLEY CA 91352. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ISIDRO URIBE LOMELI 11120 ARMINTA ST APT 104 SUN VALLEY
CA 91352.The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)  com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 2009. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261737NQ

CNBB261738OSCAR FILE NO.2017155684
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as) SOS LOCKSMITH 24/7 833 OCEAN AVE #
302 SANTA MONICA CA 90403. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
TAMIR ZALDENBERG 833 OCEAN AVE #302 SANTA MONICA CA
90403. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261738OSCAR

CNBB261739OSCAR FILE NO.2017155685
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The following person (s)
is (are) doing business as: PRO LOCKSMITH 24/7 21500 BURBANK
BLVD #102 WOODLAND HILLS CA 91367. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) OFIR DANIEL ZAIDENBERG 21500 BURBANK HILLS CA
91367. The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights of
another under Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411 at
seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261739OSCAR
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AVE LONG BEACH CA 90806.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) KOLA HOTEL ASSOCIATION LLC
150 ALAMITOS AVE LONG BEACH CA 90806.
The business is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABIL-
ITY COMPANY. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have)  commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2010. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261749TC

CNBB 261750TC FILE NO.2017153221
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CAL-MEX BUTCHER'S CORNER ; METRO MA-
NILA MEAT; AZTIG GRILL 13922 RAMONA BLVD
BALWIN PARK CA 91706. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) HERA RAMOS 13922 RAMONA BLVD
BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above 12/2016. NOTICE-The Ficti-
tious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB261750TC

 CNBB261751AC FILE NO.2017153533
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SALVADOR HANDYMAN SERVICES 670 MOUL-
TON AVE #1 LOS ANGELES CA 90031.  Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) GUILLERMO SAL-
VADOR RIQUIAC 670 MOULTON AVE #1 LOS
ANGELES CA 90031. The business is conducted
by: GUILLERMO SALVADOR RIQUIAC 670
MOULTON AVE #1 LOS ANGELES CA 90031. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261751AC

CNBB261752AC FILE NO.2017153405
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ELITE EVENTS & FLOWERS DESIGN 4811 S.
WESTERN AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90062. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ELI CASTILLO 938
S. ARMORE AVE # 305 LOS ANGELES CA 90006.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261752AC

CNBB261753AC FILE NO.2017147253
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
PRECISION REMOVABLE 2918 BLANFORD
DRIVE ROWALAND HEIGHTS CA 91748.Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) CHERIE LEUNG
2918 BLANDFORD DRIVE ROWLAND HEIGHTS
CA 91748. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 THE San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261753AC

CNBB261754AC FILE NO.2017154147
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MOTOR CITY AUTO WRECKING 750 N MIS-
SION RD LOS ANGELES CA 90033. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MARCELINO ANTONIO
GUERRA 750 N MISSION RD LOS ANGELES
CA 90033.The business is conducted by: AN IN-
DIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 01/
1996. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261754AC

CNBB261755MU FILE NO.2017153223
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: EL
COCHO PRODUCE 800 MCGARRY ST STE 5
LOS ANGELES CA 90021. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) EL COCHO PRODUCE INC 800 MC-
GARY ST STE 5 LOS ANGELES CA 90021. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261755MU

CNBB261756MU FILE NO.2017153225
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CALIFORNIA FRESH PRODUCE 800 MCGAR-
RY ST STE 5 LOS ANGELES CA 90021. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) EL COCHO PRO-
DUCE INC 800 MCGARRY ST STE 5 LOS AN-
GELES CA 90021. The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261756MU

CNBB261757RM FILE NO.2017153683
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
ENERGY GREEN BUILDERS 6914 CANBY AVE
#105 RESEDA CA 91335. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ALL CITY WINDOWS AND DOORS
INC 6914 CANBY AVE #105 RESEDA CA 91335.
The business is conducted by: CO PARTNERS. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 04/14/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261757RM

CNBB261758RM FILE NO.2017153547
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
COMPLEXION CONNECTION CENTER; COM-
PLEXION CONNECTION 22259 HAMLIN STREET

WOODLAN HILLS CA 91303. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) DANIELLE SMITH 22259 HAMLIN
STREET WOODLAND HILLS CA 91303. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/201. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261758

CNBB261759ED FILE NO.2017153684
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: J V
HANDYMAN SERVICE 147 W. ACACIA AVE #152
GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) JAVIER VERGARA 147 W. ACACIA AVE
#152 GLENDALE CA 91204.The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/14/2017. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB261759ED

CNBB261760ED FILE NO.2017153983
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: Z &
H CONSTRUCTION 3900 SAN FERNANDO RD
# 1406 GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ARTAVAZO HOVHANNISYAN 3900
SAN FERNANDO RD # 1406 GLENDALE CA
91204. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 03/
01/2010. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261760ED

CNBB261761MU FILE NO.2017153397
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as C.V.
TRANSPORTATION 7101 E. ROSECRANS AVE
#186 PARAMOUNT CA 90723. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) CELIA VILLANUEVA 7101 E.
ROSECRANS AVE #186 PARAMOUNT CA 90723.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261761MU

CNBB261762JL FILE NO.2017153437
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: TPI
EXPRESS 11674 HARVARD DR NORWALK CA
90650. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) FERMIN
HUGO MARTINEZ CRUZ 11674 HARVARD DR
NORWALK CA 90650. The business is conducted
by: AN INVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261762JL

CNBB261763ED FILE NO.2017154311
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: S &
T TRUCKING  8667 HERRICK ST SUN VALLEY
CA 91352. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
AVETIS GREYAN 8667 HERRICK ST SUN VAL-
LEY CA 91352. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/14/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261763ED

CNBB261764ED FILE NO.2017154309
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LOS FELIZ CAFÉ 3207 LOS FELIZ BLVD LOS
ANGELES CA 90039. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) AM BEST FOOD INC 3207 LOS FELIZ BLVD
LOS ANGELES CA 90039.The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 01/09/2009. NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261764ED

CNBB261765OSCAR FILE NO.2017154054
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: T
MOVING 14639 LIMEDALE ST PANORAMA CITY
CA 91402. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
TIGRAN PETROSYAN 14639 LIMEDALE ST PAN-
ORAMA CITY CA 91402. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB261765OSCAR

CNBB261766OSCAR FILE NO.2017154195
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FRANK'S AUTO REPAIR 26524 RUETHER AVE
# 507 SANTA CLARITA CA 91350. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) FRANCISCO IBARRA 19031
LONE ROCK ST CANYON COUNTRY CA 91351.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)  commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 12/01/16. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261766OSCAR

CNBB261767EL FILE NO.2017153298
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MERRY MAIDS 283,290,321,352 8857 WOOD-
MAN AVE ARLETA CA 91331. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) HOUSECLEANING PROFES-
SIONALS INC 8857 WOODMAN AVE ARLETA
CA 91331. The business is conducted by: A COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who

declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 01/
01/2003. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261767EL

CNBB261768EL FILE NO.2017153511
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
RMRM TRUCKING 5300 NEWCASTLE AVE #9
ENCINO CA 91316. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ANA MIRZA CAMACHO 5300 NEWCASTLE
AVE #9 ENCINO CA 91316. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261768EL

CNBB261769EL FILE NO.2017153404
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: TIN
TIN BRINCOLIN 19000 PARTHENIA ST APT 4
NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) GRANADOS ZUNIGA NUBIA; ZUNI-
GA MANUEL 19000 PARTHENIA ST APT 4
NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. The business is con-
ducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261769EL

CNBB 2561770EL FILE NO.2017154123
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MICHOACANA A PEDIR DE BOCA ICE CREAM
SHOP 19760 SHERAM WAY WINNETKA CA
91306. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) RAUL
RODRIGUEZ ARELLANO 9526 OAKDALE AVE
CHATSWORTH CA 91311. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261770EL

CNBB261771NQ FILE NO.2017153891
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ONE LOVE MEDIA 25876 THE OLD RD #210
STEVENSON RANCH CA 91381. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) DEVON GLENN; MIE GLENN
25104 GLASGOW DR STEVENSON RANCH CA
91381. The business is conducted by: A MAR-
RIED COUPLE . I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261771NQ

CNBB261772NQ FILE NO.2017153311
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: S-
FAST SERVICES 5452 LINDLEY AVE APT #104
ENCINO CA 91316. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SHARONA FRIZIAN 5452 LINDLEY AVE
#104 ENCINO CA 91316. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261772NQ

CNBB261773NQ FILE NO.2017153518
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
ARMAN TILE 12300 FOOTHILL BLVD SYLMAR
CA 91342. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ASHOT NAZARYAN 1018 THOMPSON AVE #F
GLENDALE CA 91201. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 02/25/2008. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261773NQ

CNBB261774NQ FILE NO.2017153648
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DLM XPRESS 4606 PARK GRANADA #11 CALA-
BASAS CA 91302. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) DENIS A RALLAS 4606 PARK GRANADA
#11 CALABASAS CA 91302. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261774NQ

CNBB261775NQ FILE NO.2017153663
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TARZANA WELLNESS PHARMACY 18840 VEN-
TURA BLVD ATE 120 TARZANA CA 91356.Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) RX PHARMACEUTI-
CAL INC 18840 VENTURA BLVD STE 120 TAR-
ZANA CA 91356. The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 05/14/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261775NQ

CNBB261776NQ FILE NO.2017154081
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SUICIDE TRUCKING 11469 VANPORT AVE LAKE
VIEW TERRACE CA 91342. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) JUAN GUTIERREZ 11469 VAN-
PORT AVE LAKE VIEW TERRANCE CA 91342.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/

14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261776NQ

CNBB261777NQ FILE NO.2017154146
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ALL GREAT FURNITURE  5834 SERRANO AVE
WOODLAND HILLS CA 91367. Full name of reg-
istrant (s) is (are) RAHMIN VAZIRI 5834 SERRA-
NO AVE WOODLAND HILLS CA 91367. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261777NQ

CNBB261778OSCAR FILE NO.2017155678
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: A
ABSOLUTE RICARDO'S BARBER SHOP SA-
LONS AND SUPPLY BY RDGUEZ 7048 OWENS-
MOUTH AVE CANOGA PARK CA 91303. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) GERMAN ROD-
RIGUEZ 7048 OWENSMOUTH AVE CANOGA
PARK CA 91303.  The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL . I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
01/2008. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261778OSCAR

CNBB261779OSCAR FILE NO.2017155676
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: A
AABSOLUTE BBARBERS V.I.P. BARBER SUP-
PLY BOUTIQUE & SALONS BY RDGUEZ NO.
#1 7046 OWENSMOUTH AVE CANOGA PARK
CA 91303. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
GERMAN RODRIGUEZ 7046 OWENSMOUTH
CANOGA PARK CA 91303. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 02/2011. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB261779OSCAR

CNBB261780OSCAR FILE NO.2017155722
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HBCU SCHOLAR ;HBCU SHOLARS 9720 VAL-
JEAN AVENUE NORTH HILLS CA 91343. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) MARSEL WATTS
9720 VALJEAN AVENUE NORTH HILLS CA 91343.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
15//2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261780OSCAR

CNBB261781OSCAR FILE NO.2017155715
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KNEXUZ 333 NORTH ALEXANDRIA AVENUE
LOS ANGELES CA 90004. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) M COOPER 333 NORTH ALEXAN-
DRIA AVENUE LOS ANGELES  CA 90004. The
business is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL.I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261781OSCAR

CNBB261782RM FILE NO.2017154809
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MOTION STATE STUDIOS 550 DEEP VALLEY
DRIVE STE 241 ROLLING HILLS ESTATES CA
91423;4915 COLDWATER CYN AVE #5 SHER-
MAN OAKS CA 91423. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) BREEONNA FIAMENGO 4915 COLDWA-
TER CYN AVE #5 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261782RM

CNBB261783RM FILE NO.2017154808
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KEAGA BUSINESS SERVICES 303 N JACKSON
ST APT 112 GLENDALE CA 91206. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) GARINEH MALEK STEPA-
NIANS 303 N JACKSON ST APT 112 GLENDALE
CA 91206;ADRINEH MALEK STEPANIANS 1805
HILLSIDE DR GLENDALE CA 91208;ANAHID
MALEK STEPANIANS  303 N JACKSON ST APT
112 GLENDALE CA 91206;KATHERINE MALEK
STEPANIANS 377 E CALIFORNIA AVE GLEN-
DALE CA 91203. The business is conducted by: A
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names
listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261786RM

CNBB261784RM FILE NO.2017155452
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TLR SERVICES 13014 SHERMAN WAY #23
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ANNA GOLOVCHENKO 13014
SHERMAN WAY #23 NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA
91605. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 01/
01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261784RM

CNBB261785ED FILE NO.2017154537
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GOLDEN PICTURES 410 SO CENTRAL AVE
GLENDALE CA 91204. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) SARMEN PARIA 410 SO. CENTRAL AVE

GLENDALE CA 91204. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNB261785ED

CNBB261786ED FILE NO.2017154625
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FASHION NAIL SPA 9301 TAMPA AVE #71
NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) KIM ANH NGUYEN ; HANG VU 9301
TAMPA AVE #71 NORTHRIDGE CA 91324. The
business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/15/2017 The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261786ED

CNBB261787ED FILE NO.2017154897
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENTHAP-
PY DOG GROOMING #2 7621 WOODLAKE AVE-
NUE WEST HILLS CA 91304;16201 VICTORY
BLVD VAN NUYS CA 91406.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) YOJANA N ZAPATA 16201 VIC-
TORY BLVD VAN NUYS CA 91406. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB261787ED

CNBB261788ED FILE NO.2017154935
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HAPPY DOG GROOMING 16201 VICTORY BLVD
VAN NUYS CA 91406;16201 VICTORY BLVD
VAN NUYS CA 91406. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) YOJANA N ZAPATA 16201 VICTORY BLVD
VAN NUYS CA 91406. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261788ED

CNBB261789ED FILE NO.2017155498
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
URBAN X AWARDS 8508 NOBLE AVE NORTH
HILLS CA 91343. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SHAREE NICOLE CALDWELL 8508 NO-
BLE AVE NORTH HILLS CA 91343. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261789ED

CNBB261790NQ FILE NO.2017155355
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
MAMORIMARU ;YUKIMON 5046 ½ ECHO
STREET LOS ANGELES CA 90042. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) YUKI GALLEMORE 5046 ½
ECHO STREET LOS ANGELES CA 90042. The
business is conducted by: AN INDVIDUAL. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261790NQ

CNBB261791EL FILE NO.2017154726
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
RED'S DRIVE THRU 127 W. FOOTHILL BLVD
MONROVIA CA 91016. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) ABEL SHAMIRYAN 116 W. MAPLE APT #5
GLENDALE CA 91204. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261791EL

CNBB261792JEN FILE NO.2017155744
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
LUX BANQUET HALL 1000 70TH ST LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90044; 532 W. 80TH ST LOS ANGELES
CA 90044. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
HEBERTH ANTONIO AMAYA CORNEJO 532 W.
80TH ST LOS ANGELES CA 90044. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261792JEN

CNBB261793TC FILE NO.2017155244
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
THE NEW KINGDOM 9901 PARAMOUNT BLVD
SUITE 214 DOWNEY CA 90241;21342 MONETA
AVE CARSON CA 90745. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) EMINOLA ELIZABETH ESPINOZA 9901
PARAMOUNT BLVD SUTE 214 DOWNEY CA
90241. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261793TC

CNBB261794GM FILE NO.2017153799
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ALFA Y OMEGA TV MULTIMEDIA 9900 LAKE-
WOOD BLVD SUITE 208 DOWNEY CA 90240.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ROBERTO
HERNANDEZ SANTIAGO; NORMAND ESTRA-
DA 9900 LAKEWOOD BLVD SUITE 208 DOWNEY
CA 90240.The business is conducted by: A GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-

tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261794GM

CNBB261795AC FILE NO.2017155135
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: BE
YOU BE FEARLESS 8925 MENLO AVE LOS
ANGELES CA 90044. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) EDWIN ENRIQUE NUNEZ GONZALEZ 8925
MENLO AVE LOS ANGELES CA 90044. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/15/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261795AC

CNBB261796DC FILE NO.2017154525
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BETTER VALUE PHARMACY 2707 E VALLEY
BLVD #100 WEST COVINA CA 91792. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) PACIFIC HEALTHCARE
INC 2271 W MALVERN AVE # 368 FULLERTON
CA 92833. The business is conducted by: A COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261796DC

CNBB261797MU FILE NO.2017155359
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as) LA
COCINA DE MARIA 13963 ALONDRA BLVD
SANTA FE SPRIGNS CA 90670; 12709 LONG-
WORTH AVE NORWALK CA 90650. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MARIA TERESA LUQUIN ;
ANTONIO LUQUIN CASTANEDA 13963 ALON-
DRA BLVD SANTA FE SPRINGS CA 90670. The
business is conducted by: A MARRIED COUPLE.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 08/2006. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261797MU

CNBB261798MU FILE NO.2017154499
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DISTRIBUIDORA PROMESA LATINA 715 w. 80th
ST LOS ANGELES CA 90044. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) SANDRA C. CERNA PEREZ 715
W. 80TH ST LOS ANGELES CA 90044. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/15/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261798MU

CNBB261799IF FILE NO.2017154650
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BUTTERY POPCORN CO. 1737 BALDWIN
PLACE MONTEBELLO CA 90640.Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) MITCHELL C. TAKAO IDA
1737 BALDWIN PLACE MONTEBELLO CA 90640.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261799IF

CNBB2617100JEN FILE NO.2017155571
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
UNDERDAWG SPORTS & APPAREL 14752
CRENSHAW BLVD UNIT 505 GARDENA CA
90249. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) PIER
JOHNSON-BRUCE 14752 CRENSHAW BLVD
UNIT 505 GARDENA CA 90249. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/15/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2015. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617100JEN

CNBB2617101AC FILE NO.2017156912
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
YESHUA'S TRUCKING 7850 BELLFLOWER
DRIVE BUENA PARK CA 90620. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ERICK W OSORIO SAL-
GUERO 7850 BELLFLOWER DRIVE BUENA
PARK CA 90620.The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDAUL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 01/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617101AC

CNBB2617102TC FILE NO.2017155832
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GLOBAL OCEAN AND LAND CONSTRUCTORS
7100 HAYVENHURST AVE #PH-C VAN NUYS
CA 91406. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MICHAEL DAVIED KEYES 7100 HAYVENHURST
AVE #PH-C VAN NUYS CA 91406. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/08/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 01/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617102TC

CNBB2617103MU FILE NO.2017155765
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: FC
LOGISTICS ;VISADAN ENTERPRISES 15909 S.
VERMONT AVE #234 PARAMOUNT CA 90723.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) GEORGE AN-
THONY FUCHS 15909 S VERMONT AVE #234
PARAMOUNT CA 90723. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all

CNBB261740OSCAR FILE NO.2017152879
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
CCS COMPLETE CLEANING SERVICES 21310
COMMUNITY ST CANOGA PARK CA 91304. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ERICK RUBEN
TEODORO-LEYVA 21310 COMMUNITY ST CA-
NOGA PARK CA 91304. The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/13/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB251740NQ

CNBB261741ERIKA FILE NO.2017154259
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HANYBRI ENTERPRISE 15801 JAYPOST RD
VICTORVILLE CA 92394. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) MARCELO OMAR MACLI 15801  JAY-
POST RD VICTORVILLE CA 92394. The business
is conducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB261741ERIKA

CNBB261742ERIKA FILE NO.2017154317
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DIVINE PAINTING 1816 E. 126TH ST COMPTON
CA 90222. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
FRANCISO JASSO 1816 E. 126TH ST COMP-
TON CA 90222. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261742ERIKA

CNBB261743DC FILE NO.2017153542
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
MEDRESPONSE ;AMBULNZ 1059 E BEDMAR
STREET CARSON CA 90746. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) AMBULNZ HEALTH LLC 763
RALEIGH STREET WOODMERE NY 11598. The
business is conducted by:  A LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 Gabriel Val-
ley Examiner     CNBB261743DC

CNBB261744DC FILE NO.2017153634
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
$1DOLLAR PLUS MARKET 15749 BELLFLOW-
ER BLVD BELLFLOWER CA 90706;526 W VER-
MONT AVE # APT 206 ANAHEIM CA 92805. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ALFREDO NAVAR-
RO 526 W VERMONT AVE #APT 206 ANAHEIM A
92805. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261744DC

CNBB261745JEN FILE NO.2017154261
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VOICE ON DESIGN 220 ANITA DR PASADENA
CA 91105. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) KEI-
TH EDMUND DWYER 220 ANITA DR PASADE-
NA CA 91105. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261745JEN

CNBB261746GM FILE NO.2017153813
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
INDUSTRIAL RESOURCES INC 800 ALPHA ST
DUARTE CA 91010.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) INTERNATIONAL TRADE AND TECHONOL-
OGY 800 ALPHA ST DUARTE CA 91010. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)  NOT Com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB261746GM

CNBB261747IF FILE NO.2017153232
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
EXPRESS MOBILE TECHNICIANS 655 W COR-
REGIDOR ST APT B COMPTON CA 90220. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) SERGIO BARAJAS
655 W CORREGIDOR ST APT B COMPTON CA
90220. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/14/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB261747IF

CNBB261748IF FILE NO.2017154155
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LEYVO LASHES 140 N. ORANGE AVE CITY OF
INDUSTRY CA 91744. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) SHIRLEY VOONG 140 N ORANGE AVE
CITY OF INDUSTRY CA 91744. The business is
conducted by: AN IDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/14/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB261748IF

CNBB261749TC FILE NO.2017154204
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as)
ECONOLODGE 3624 E. PACIFIC COAST HIGH-
WAY LONG BEACH CA 90804;150 ALAMITOS
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information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617103MU

CNBB2617104MU FILE NO.2017156876
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TONY'S BURGERS 107 E ALONDRA BLVD
COMPTON CA 90220.  Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) TONY'S BURGERS, INC 107 E. ALON-
DRA BLVD COMPTON CA 90220. The business
is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 11/2012. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617104MU

CNBB2617105IF FILE NO.2017156205
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: JIN
LU INSURANCE AGENCY 13708 MONTEREY
AVE BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JIN LU 13708 MONTEREY
AVE BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing:  06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617105IF

CNBB2617106IF FILE NO.2017156385
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MANNY G. CARWASH SERVICE 12102 208TH
ST LAKEWOOD CA 90715. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) J MANUEL GUARDADO ALVA-
RADO; JUAN GUARDADO 12102 208TH ST LAKE-
WOOD CA 90715. The business is conducted by:
A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617106IF

CNBB2617107DC FILE NO.2017156535
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HONEY DONUTS & TERIYAKI 500 N AZUSA
AVE STE 105 WEST COVINA CA 91791.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) THAVY SOK 500 N AZUSA
AVE STE 105 WEST COVINA CA 91791. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617107DC

CNBB2617108DC FILE NO.2017156719
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HENRY'S AUTO MECHANIC 4566 VALLEY BLVD
LOS ANGELES CA 90032. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ENRIQUE ANIMAS HUERTA ;ABIGAIL
OSORIO 4566 VALLEY BLVD LOS ANGELES CA
90032.The business is conducted by: A GENER-
AL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617108DC

CNBB2617109JL FILE NO.2017156615
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CENTURY GRID ANALYTICS; CGA-NATIONAL
451 SOUTH ALDENVILLE AVE COVINA CA
91723. Full name of registrant (s) is (are). The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617109JL

CNBB2617110JL FILE NO.2017156039
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
LADY'S FASHION 4709 WHITTIER BLVD BASE-
MENT LEVAL LOS ANGELES CA 90022. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) GABRIEL  FLORES SAN-
DOVAL 4709 WHITTIER BLVD LOS ANGELES
CA 90022. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617110JL

CNBB2617111JL FILE NO.2017156196
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DIRECTO A MI PAIS 1601 S VERMONT AVE
SUITE 101 LOS ANGELES CA 90006.Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) CECILIA NANCY VASQU-
EZ VASQUEZ 1550 W 59TH PL LOS ANGELES
CA 90047.The business is conducted by: AN IN-
DIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2011. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617111JL

CNBB2617112JL FILE NO.2017156177
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THAI EAGLE ROX 4601 YORK BLVD LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90041. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MUSHROOM N&G 4601 YORK BLVD LOS AN-
GELES CA 90041.The business is conducted by:
A CORPORATION . I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-

les County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617112JL

CNBB2617113JL FILE NO.2017156553
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CANDY'S 99C 606 E. ROSECRANS AVE #A EAST
RANCHO DOMINGUEZ CA 90221. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) CANDELARIA PREDIADO
606 E. ROSECRANS AVE #A EAST RANCHO
DOMINGUEZ CA 90221 . The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 01/2008 . NOTICE-The
Fictitious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617113JL

CNBB2617114JL FILE NO.2017156555
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TAQUERIA ZAVALA #5 518 E. ROSECRANS BLVD
COMPTON CA 90221. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) CANDELARIA PRECIADO 518 E. ROSE-
CRANS AVE COMPTON CA 90221. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 02/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617114JL

CNBB2617115JOEY FILE NO.2017156037
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BELMONT NAILS 5305 E 2ND ST UNIT #102
LONG BEACH CA 90803. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) THY THY TRAN 9611 CENTRAL AVE
GARDEN GROVE CA 92844. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617115JOEY

CNBB2617116SN FILE NO.2017157731
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: AP
CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 142 N. AZUSA AVE
AZUSA CA 91702. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ALBERTO PACHECO 142 N AZUSA AVE
AZUSA CA 91702. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/19/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617116SN

CNBB2617117PS FILE NO.2017156029
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
OCEANVIEW BEAUTY SPA 11961 VENICE BLVD
LOS ANGELES CA 90066. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) AUGUSTO ROJAS MD INC 11961
VENICE BLVD LOS ANGELES CA 90066. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 07/
15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617117PS

CNBB2617118RM FILE NO.2017156359
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: TA
TRANSPORT 11414  HATTERAS ST APT 302
NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91601. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) TAGUHI AVETISYAN 11414
HATERAS ST APT 302 NORTH HOLLYWOOD
CA 91601. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617118RM

CNBB2617119RM FILE NO.2017155053
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CASA BLANCA PHARMACYS 13654  VICTORY
BLVD # 443 VAN NUYS  CA 91401. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) RONNIE ROY KUGLER 13654
VICTORY BLVD #443 VAN NUYS CA 91401. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617119RM

CNBB2617120ED FILE NO.2017156255
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TRUSTED BRAIN ; TYRANNY INK
MUSIC;RESEARCH WORKS ; DOILY MUSIC;
TYRANT MICHAEL'S MUSIC;EMOTIONAL
COATHHANGER RECORDS ; TYRANTS IN
THERAPY 6303 ATOLL AVE VALLEY VIEW CA
91401. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) MICHA-
EL ALAN JAYE ; ABIGAIL KANTER JAYE ; ABIG-
AIL KANTER JAYE 6303 ATOLL AVE VALLEY
GLEN CA 91401. The business is conducted by:
A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 06/29/1990. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617120ED

CNBB2617121ED FILE NO.2017156571
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: GP
AUTO REPAIR 10677 SAN FERNANDO RD UNIT
#4 PACOIMA CA 91331.Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) GEORGE ALBETO PEREZ 14511 ½
BRAND BLVD SAN FERNANDO CA 91340. The
business is conducted by: AN INVIDUAL. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with

the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/16/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617121ED

CNBB2617122EL FILE NO.2017155874
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GRAVITY FINANCIAL SERVICES 930 E BIR-
MINGHAM RD BURBANK CA 91504. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) CHRISTOPHER AZIZIAN
930 E BIRMINGHAM RD BURBANK CA 91505.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617122EL

CNBB2617123EL FILE NO.2017156201
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ELOISA'S CLEANING SERVICES 11128 EL DO-
RADO AVE PACOIMA CA 91331. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ELOISA JACOBO 11128 EL
DORADO AVE PACOIMA CA 91331. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617123EL

CNBB2617124EL FILE NO.2017156486
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
YAZO ENTERPRISES 4714 ORION AVE APT 4
SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) MATTHEW YALDEZIAN 4714
ORION AVE APT 4 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91403.
The business is conducted by: AN INVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617124EL

CNBB2617125OSCAR FILE NO.2017156202
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AFFODABLE DREAM KITCHEN 21133 VICTO-
RY BL SUIT 201 CANOGA PARK CA 91303. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) HOME ENERGY
SAVING INC 21133 VICTORY BL SUIT 201 CAN-
OGA PARK CA 91303. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617125OSCAR

CNBB2617126NQ FILE NO.2017156837
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
E.B.S CONSULTING 5145 ETIWANDA AVE TAR-
ZANA CA 91356. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) EYAI BEN SHIUSH 5145 ETIWANDA AVE
TARZANA CA 91356. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617126NQ

CNBB2617127NQ FILE NO.2017130116
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
GENTREA ENTERPRISES 9819 REGENT ST APT
#3 LOS ANGELES CA 90024. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ANNA JAE LLAVE 9819 REGENT
ST APT #3 LOS ANGELES CA 90034. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/19/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 2012. NOTICE-
The Fictitious Name Statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617127NQ

CNBB2617128NQ FILE NO.2017156580
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PRINCESS ANNIK MONIERE 19330 LORNE
STREET RESEDA CA 91335. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) ANET MORADKHANIAN ;
GHASEM SHARIFI 19330 LORNE STREET RE-
SEDA CA 91335. The business is conducted by:
A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617128NQ

CNBB2617129NQ FILE NO.2017155970
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BEST PARKING SERVICE 14817 SHERMAN WAY
UNIT 2 VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) MARCO BARBOSA SOUTO 2060
WEST ADAMS BLVD 1 LOS ANGELES CA 90018.
The business is conducted by: A AN INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB2617129NQ

CNBB2617130 FILE NO.2017158244
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
APPLIANCE TECHIE 4625 SYLMAR AVE #204
SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) EGOR SHEVTSOV 4625 SYL-
MAR AVE #204 SHERMAN OAKS CA 91423. The
business is conducted by: A AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious

business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617130NQ

CNBB2617131OZZY FILE NO.2017159008
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CHATO'S TRUCKING ;LOZA TRUCKING 13502
WHITTIER BLVD SUITE H-410 WHITTIER CA
90605. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) CHATO'S
TRUCKING INC 13502 WHITTIER BLVD SUITE
H-410 WHITTIER CA 90605. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617131OZZY

CNBB2617132JEN FILE NO.2017159675
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PHO PALACE 861 N SPRING ST #103 LOS AN-
GELES CA 90012.Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) UNITED WYN SERVICES INC 861 N.
SPRING ST #103 LOS ANGELES CA 90012. The
business is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
20/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617132JEN

CNBB2617133JEN FILE NO.2017147971
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: 8
CHAPARRITA 6607 ATLANTIC AVE #5 BELL CA
90201. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) SIMON
SANCHEZ-JIMENEZ 2943 BROADWAY ST WAL-
NUT PARK CA 90255. The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/07/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing:  06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617133JEN

CNBB2617134JEN FILE NO.2017159030
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FAVELA MOTORS 4111 INDEPENCE AVE SOUTH
GATE CA 90280. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
JOAQUIN FAVELA RAMOS 4111 INDEPENCE
AVE SOUTH GATE CA 90280. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617134JEN

CNBB2617135GM FILE NO.2017159045
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AYEE. 5556 N DONNA BETH AVE AZUSA CA
91702. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) PEDRO
TAPIA JR 5556 N DONNA BETH AVE AZUSA CA
91702. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 06/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617135GM

CNBB2617136JL FILE NO.2017158512
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
VENICE  TEST ONLY 4980 VENICE BLVD UNIT
C LOS ANGELES CA 90019. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) LUIS E PARADA SARAVIA 4980
VENICE BLVD UNIT C LOS ANGELES CA 90019.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
20/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617136JL

CNBB2617137JL FILE NO.2017158950
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PRIVATE PARTY RESTAURANTS 111 N ATLAN-
TIC BLVD # 349 MONTEREY PARK 91754. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) XINXIN RESTAU-
RANT CORPORATION 3372 GABRIEL DR CHI-
NO HILLS CA 91709. The business is conducted
by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) commenced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617137JL

CNBB2617138JL FILE NO.2017158883
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ELECTRIC POWER SERVICES 1440 E PUENTE
STREET COVINA CA 91724. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) GLENN COLLEY 1440 E PUENTE
STREET COVINA CA 91724. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617138JL

CNBB2617139AC FILE NO.2017158885
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ADVANSTAR AUTO ELECTRIC 12317 MAGNO-
LIA ST EL MONTE CA 91732. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) GREGORIO MENDOZA HER-
NANDEZ 3040 ½ WALNUT GROVE AVE ROSE-
MEAD CA 91770. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 02/2012. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious

Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617139AC

CNBB2617140AC FILE NO.2017159657
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PINE HILLS NURSERY 1191 EAST LAS TUNAS
DRIVE SAN GABRIEL CA 91776 ; 14376 MERCED
AVE BALDWIN PARK CA 91706. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) FRANCISCO HUIZAR MA-
GALLANES 14376 MERCED AVE BALDWIN PARK
CA 91706. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617140AC

CNBB2617141AC FILE NO.2017159483
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: CQ
NAILS AND SKINCARE ;CQ LASH AND BLAD-
ING 3814 ½ OCEANVIEW BLVD MONTROSE
CA 91020. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
DIANA N HUYNH 3814 ½ OCEANVIEW BLVD
MONTROSE CA 91020. The business is conduct-
ed by: A AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617141AC

CNBB2617142DC FILE NO.2017158515
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FLAAS 9712 HOMSTEAD ST PICO RIVERA CA
90660. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) FELIPE
REGALADO VILLALOBOS 9712 HOMSTEAD ST
PICO RIVERA CA 90660. The business is con-
ducted by: A AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617142DC

CNBB2617143LISA FILE NO.2017163639
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ASIA SHOPPING ONLINE 6418 WALKER AVE
#A BELL CA 90201. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) NADER  SS NASSER 6418 WALKER AVE
#A BELL CA 90201. The business is conducted
by: A AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information, which he or
she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on 06/23/2017. The registrant (s)
has (have) NOT commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617143LISA

CNBB2617144DC FILE NO.2017158865
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FIESTA EYEBROW THREADING SALON 2667
E. FLORENCE AVE SUITE E-2 HUNTINGTON
PARK CA 90255. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MUNA SHRESTHA GUMANJU ; SRIJANA
DAHAL POKHREL 18031 ARLINE AVE APT 7
ARTESIA CA 90701. The business is conducted
by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have)  commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617144DC

CNBB2617145 FILE NO.2017158909
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CASCADE PRECISION 141 S NINTH AVE #B LA
PUENTE CA 91746. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MARTIN LUGO 1736 E 61ST ST LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90001. The business is conducted by: AN
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617145

CNBB2617146IF FILE NO.2017159667
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SIKEIRO'S BARBER SHOP 12857 HAWTHORNE
BLVD HAWTHORNE CA 90250; 3505 MICHIGAN
AVE APT C SOUTH GATE CA 90280. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JOSE PAZOS JARAMILLO
3505 MICHIGAN AVE APT C SOUTH GATE CA
90280. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above on
07/2008. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617146IF

CNBB2617147IF FILE NO.2017158635
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
MASSAGE SPA 107 S VERMONT AVE LOS AN-
GELES CA 90004. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) MEI ZHANG 1508 ABBOT AVE #A SAN GAB-
RIEL CA 91776. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617147IF

CNBB2617148ED FILE NO.2017159556
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NORTH HILLS FAMILY DENTAL 8719 WOOD-
LEY AVE SUITE B NORTH HILLS CA 91343. Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) RAZAVI DENTAL
CORPORATION 8719 WOODLEY AVE SUITE B
NORTH HILLS CA 91343. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 06/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in

this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617148ED

CNBB2617149ED FILE NO.2017159153
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ONDEMAND AUTOBROKERS 5658 SEPULVE-
DA BLVD #214 VAN NUYS CA 91411. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) GARO DAGHLARIAN
17326 TIARA STREET ENCINO CA 91316. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
20/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617149ED

CNBB2617150EL FILE NO.2017159082
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: R &
S SMOG CHECK 7551 LAKERSHIEM BLVD UNIT
C NORTH HOLLYWOOD CA 91605. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) AGUSTIN JAIME RICO ;
ALEJANDRO RICO 6714 IRVINE AVE 4 NORTH
HOLLYWOOD CA 91606. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617150EL

CNBB2617151EL FILE NO.2017159341
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TAER BEAUTY SALON 10065 LINDEN AVEA APT
4 GLENDALE CA 91201.Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ARSEN AHRAONYAN 1065 LINDEN
AE APT 4 GLENDALE CA 91201. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617151EL

CNBB2617152EL FILE NO.2017159343
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CALIFORNIA STARS LIMOUSINE 217 S ARNAZ
DRIVE BEVERLYHILLS CA 90211. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ROMAN KHEGAY 217 S
ARNAZ DRIVE APT #104 BEVERLY HILLS CA
90211. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617152EL

CNBB2617153EL FILE NO.2017159616
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
THE 2-4 UNIT SPECIALISTS ; ELIZABETH
STREET REAL ESTATE 630 N GLENOAKS BLVD
BURBANK CA 91502. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) ELIZABETH JAN MADDOX 414 E VALEN-
CIA AVE # 305 BURBANK CA 91501. The busi-
ness is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation, which he or she knows to be false, is guilty
of a crime.) This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/
2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 05/10/2016. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617153EL

CNBB2617154NQ FILE NO.2017125000
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AIMG-SAN FERNANDO VALLEY 11001 RUFFNER
AVENUE GRANADA HILLS CA 91344. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ALBERT T. MATINAO 11001
RUFFNER AVENUE GRANADA HILLS CA 91344.
The business is conducted by: A AN INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/15/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB2617154NQ

CNBB2617155NQ FILE NO.2017159298
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
HELIUM LIFE 1812 W BURBANK BLVD # 724
BURBANK CA 91506. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) MINH PHO 1812 W BURBANK BLVD #
724 BURBANK CA 91506. The business is con-
ducted by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/20/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617155NQ

CNBB2617156RM FILE NO.2017159437
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: OB
DOORS 5953 HILLVIEW PARK AVE VAN NUYS
CA 91401. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
OSHRI BENAIM 5333 AGNES AVE #3 VALLEY
VILLAGE CA 91607. The business is conducted
by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617156RM

CNBB2617157LD FILE NO.2017160818
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
NIKA G PHYSICAL THERAPY 1757 6TH STREET
LA VERNE CA 91750. Full name of registrant (s)
is (are) NIKA GHASSEMIKIA 1757 6TH STREET
LA VERNE CA 91750. The business is conducted
by:  AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/21/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First

filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617157LD

CNBB2617158JEN FILE NO.2017160264
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DOMINIC 5877 COMPTON AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90001. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
PRINT JR INC 5877 COMPTON AVE LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90001. The business is conducted by: A
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/21/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617158JEN

CNBB2617159JEN FILE NO.2017160241
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:  MO
DOO 18414 E. COLIMA RD UNIT Z ROWLAND
HEIGHTS CA 91748. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) COCOOK LLC 18414 E. COLIMA RD UNIT
Z ROWLAND HEIGHT CA 91748. The business
is conducted by: A LIMITE LIABILITY COMPANY.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing:  06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Val-
ley Examiner     CNBB2617159JEN

CNBB2617160IF FILE NO.2017160082
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PPT ENTERPRISE 2321 FINDLAY AVE
MONTEREY PARK CA 91754. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) PHIILP PINGON TSE 2321 FID-
LAY AVE MONTEREY PARK CA 91754. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A LIMITE LIABILITY COM-
PANY. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617160IF

CNBB2617161IF FILE NO.2017160500
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
BANGKOK CREPES 5550 ANGELUS AVE SAN
GABRIEL CA 91776;PO BOX 2181 SAN GABRI-
EL CA 91778.Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MONTRE LIWIRUN ; NICHAPAT CHAISIN 5550
ANGELUS AVE SAN GABRIEL CA 91776. The
business is conducted by: A  MARRIED COU-
PLE. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information, which he or she knows to be
false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on 06/21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on.
NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business
Name Statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Business
Name in violation of the rights of another under
Federal, State, or common law (See section 14411
at seq. Business and Profession Code) First filing:
06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel
Valley Examiner     CNBB2617161IF

CNBB2617162IF FILE NO.201716118
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:  AC
LA 11451 MCLAREN ST NORWALK CA 90650.Full
name of registrant (s) is (are) ANDREW CARDE-
NAS 11451 MCLAREN ST NORWALK CA 90650.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing:  06/
29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Val-
ley Examiner     CNBB2617162IF

CNBB2617163MU FILE NO.2017160317
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
IKIGAI; THE RACE FORMULA 2627 BARLETT
AVE ROSEMEAD CA 91770. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) CHO ROM HAM 2627 BARLETT
AVE ROSEMEAD CA 91170. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/21/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617163MU

CNBB2617164MU FILE NO.2017160831
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
AESTHETIC 5770 MELROSE AVE LOS ANGE-
LES CA 90039. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
AESTHETIC SPACE INC 5770 MELROSE AVE
LOS ANGELES CA 90039. The business is con-
ducted by: A CORPORATION. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/21/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617164MU

CNBB2617165DC FILE NO.2017159961
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
REVA BROW SHAPES ; ISHA EYEBROW
THREADING 15218 HAWTHORNE BLVD LAWN-
DALE CA 90260. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) SABITRA BHATTA 15218 HAWTHORNE
BLVD LAWNDALE CA 90260. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/21/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 05/2017. NOTICE-The Fic-
titious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617165DC

CNBB2617166AC FILE NO.2017160046
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SERVICE FIRST DENT REPAIR 8003 COLLEGE
AVE WHITTIER CA 90650. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) DANIEL PETER BRESLER 8003 COL-
LEGE AVE WHITTIER CA 90605. The business is
conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/21/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617166AC

CNBB2617167EL FILE NO.2017160741
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FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
DONTFRONT 1724 PEYTON AVE APT D BUR-
BANK CA 91504. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ERNESTO VALLE ARROYO 1724 PEYTON
AVE APT D BURBANK CA 91504 ; ISAIS ESTE-
VAN -LARA VILLEGAS 1630 W 3RD ST APT 414
LOS ANGELES CA 90017. The business is con-
ducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/21/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) NOT commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious
Name Statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the County Clerk. A
new Fictitious Business Name Statement must be
filed before that time. The filing of this statement
does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a Fictitious Business Name in violation of the
rights of another under Federal, State, or common
law (See section 14411 at seq. Business and Pro-
fession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 &
07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617167EL

CNBB2617168ED FILE NO.2017156030
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as B-
CLEAR 11024 BALBOA BLVD # 760 GRANADA
HILLS CA 91344. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) FREDY VIRGILIO PIMENTEL; DIANA IVON
BALCARCEL 11024 BALBOA BLVD # 760 GRAN-
ADA HILLS CA 91344. The business is conducted
by: A MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 06/16/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names
listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617168ED

CNBB2617169NQ FILE NO.2017160405
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as CA
ENERGY LEADERS 5550 TOPANGA CANYON
BLVD STE 280 WOODLAND HILLS CA 91367.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) SMITH AND
SMITH REALTY AND INVESTMENTS INC 5550
TOPANGA CANYON BLVD STE 280 WOODLAND
HILLS CA 91362. The business is conducted by:
A  CORPORATION. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/21/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617169NQ

CNBB2617170NQ FILE NO.2017160971
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as
INTERNATIONAL  AUTO SHIPPING 18601 HAT-
TERAS ST # 154 TARZANA CA 91356. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) GEORGE GERMAN 18601
HATTERAS ST # 154 TARZANA CA 91356. The
business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL . I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617170NQ

CNBB2617171NQ FILE NO.2017156068
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PLAYING SPECIAL 8054 SUNLAN BLVD APT
202 SUN VALLEY CA 91352. Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) DESTINY MELTON 8054 SAN-
BAND BLVD APT 202  SUN VALLEY CA 91352.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617171NQ

CNBB2617172NQ FILE NO.2017156441
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:  A
M DOORS & WINDOWS 5431 RUSSELL AVE
APT #12 HOLLYWOOD CA 90027. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) ARTUR MARITROSYAN 5431
RUSSELL AVE APT #12 HOLLYWOOD CA 90027.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617172NQ

CNBB2617173CH FILE NO.2017159323
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
FERNANDO JIMENEZ & ASSOCIATES, INC.
20651 GOLDEN SPRINGS DRIVE #332 WAL-
NUT CA 91789 Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
FERNANDO JIMENEZ & ASSOCIATES, INC.
20651 GOLDEN SPRINGS DRIVE # 332 WAL-
NUT CA 91789. The business is conducted by: A
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/20/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 08/2014. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617173 CH

CNBB2617174 FILE NO.2017145549
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
S&F DYE 2252 E 37TH ST VERNON CA 90058
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) TRIMS BUT-
TONS & DYE, INC 2252 E. 37TH ST VERNON
CA 90058. The business is conducted by: A COR-
PORATION. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/06/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 11/
2012. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617174LD

CNBB2617175LD FILE NO.2017162322
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CALIFORNIA ELECTRONICS COLLECTION
13620  IMPERIAL HWY UNIT 8 SANTA FE
SPRINGS CA 90670. Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) CALIFORNIA ELECTRONICS COLLEC-
TION, LLC. The business is conducted by: A LIM-
ITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 06/22/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name or names listed
above on 05/2017 . NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617175LD

CNBB2617176AC FILE NO.2017158025

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA CLEANING & SER-
VICES 25W 52ND ST LONG BEACH CA 90805.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) CHRISTIAN
GUTIERREZ RODRIGUEZ 25W 52ND ST LONG
BEACH CA 90808 . The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/19/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on 08/2016. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name State-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious
Business Name Statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious
Business Name in violation of the rights of anoth-
er under Federal, State, or common law (See sec-
tion 14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code)
First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The
San Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617176AC

CNBB2617177IF FILE NO.2017157711
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANGELICAS RECYCLING 608 EAST 89TH ST
LOS ANGELES CA 90002; 8902 AVALON BLVD
LOS ANGELES CA 90003. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) ANGELICA MARIBEL VILLANUEVA
15943 NINYA AVE MORENO VALLEY CA 92551.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 08/2014. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17  The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617177IF

CNBB2617178IF FILE NO.2017157254
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
A.R.CONSTRUCTION14035 BECKNER ST LA
PUENTE CA 91746 Full name of registrant (s) is
(are) ARNOLD RUIZ 14035 BECKNER ST LA
PUENTE CA 91746.The business is conducted
by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/19/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617178IF

CNBB2617179DC FILE NO.2017157733
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
TACOS Y GUISADOES EL CHARRO 10024
SOUTH FIGUERO ST LOS ANGELES CA 90003.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) RICARDO PA-
TINO ESTRADA ;NOE LIZARRAGA 10024 SOUTH
FIGUEROA ST LOS ANGELES CA 90003.The
business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/19/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617179DC

CNBB2617180 FILE NO.2017158044
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
KUSH COMPANY;KUSH CO 10831 SYLVA AVE
PORTER RANCH CA 91326;10831 SYLVIA AVE
PORTER RANCH CA 91326.Full name of regis-
trant (s) is (are) BOGDAN TARCEA 10831 SYLVA
AVE PORTER RANCH CA 91326. The business
is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information,
which he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a
crime.) This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/19/2017. The
registrant (s) has (have) commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name or
names listed above on 2006. NOTICE-The Ficti-
tious Name Statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the County
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name Statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a Fictitious Business Name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under Federal, State,
or common law (See section 14411 at seq. Busi-
ness and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/
06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Ex-
aminer     CNBB2617180NQ

CNBB2617181NQ FILE NO.2017155888
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
CARBON DESIGN AUTO SPORTS 13999 ASTO-
RIA ST APT E102 SYLMAR CA 91342. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) ANSELMO VENTURA ;
JOEL VENTURA 13999 ASTORIA STREET APT
E102 SYLMAR CA 91342. The business is con-
ducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
16/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617181NQ

CNBB2617182RM FILE NO.2017160356
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
ANGEL HOSPICE SERVICE 14958 SHERMAN
WAY UNIT D112 VAN NUYS CA 91405. Full name
of registrant (s) is (are) KARINE ABELYAN 14958
SHERMAN WAY UNIT D112 VAN NUYS CA
91405. The business is conducted by: AN INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
NOT commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617182RM

CNBB2617183RM FILE NO.2017160715
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
DILIGENT CAPITAL INVESTMENTS
6730 BALBOA BLVD LAKE BALBOA CA 91406
.Full name of registrant (s) is (are) DENEE BUS-
BY 6730 BALBOA BLVD LAKE BALBOA CA 91406.
The business is conducted by: A GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 04/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617183RM

CNBB2617184PS FILE NO.2017160573
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: WB
BUILDERS 345 N FULLER AVE LOS ANGELES
CA 90036.Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
MICHAEL WATTENBARGER 345 N FULLER AV-
ENUE LOS ANGELES CA 90036. The business is
conducted by: A GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
21/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617184PS

CNBB2617185TC FILE NO.2017162229
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:

RMD POOLS 1515 ALDEA DR MOTEBELLO CA
90640. Full name of registrant (s) is (are) ROD-
OLFO JESUS PONCE 1515 ALDEA DR MONTE-
BELLO CA 90640. The business is conducted by:
AN INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information, which he or she
knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on 06/22/2017. The registrant (s) has
(have) NOT commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name or names listed above
on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617185TC

CNBB2617186JL FILE NO.2017162662
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: SC
AUTOMOTIVE WOLD 7905 VAN NUYS BLVD.
UITE 10 VN NUYS CA 914025. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) SC AUTOMOTIVE WORLS,
LLC 7905 VAN NUYS BLVD SUITE 10 VAN NUYS
CA 91402. The business is conducted by: A LIM-
ITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information, which
he or she knows to be false, is guilty of a crime.)
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on 06/22/2017. The registrant
(s) has (have) NOT commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or names
listed above on. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name
Statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the County Clerk. A new
Fictitious Business Name Statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
Fictitious Business Name in violation of the rights
of another under Federal, State, or common law
(See section 14411 at seq. Business and Profes-
sion Code) First filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/
20/17 The San Gabriel Valley Examiner
CNBB2617186JL

CNBB2617187 FILE NO.2017162151
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
W.O.O. BEAUTY CAN LAST 2675 ADRIATIC AVE
LONG BEACH CA 90810. Full name of registrant
(s) is (are) MARIA ANGELA SANTOS CANLAS
2675 ADRIATIC AVE LONG BEACH CA 90810.
The business is conducted by: AN INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) NOT com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name or names listed above on. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617187JL

CNBB2617188JL FILE NO.2017162439
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as:
PACIFIC AUTO SALES & REPAIR 340 N. PACIF-
IC AVE SAN PEDRO CA 90731. Full name of
registrant (s) is (are) JAHANGIR ESTEVA 340 N.
PACIFIC AVE SAN PEDRO CA 90731. The busi-
ness is conducted by: A CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 07/2008. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617188JL

CNBB2617189JL FILE NO.2017162090
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: NU
BELL MOTEL 4808 E. FLORENCE AVE. BELL
CA. 90201. Full name of registrant (s) is (are)
ANNA,LLC. 407 S. SAN GEBRIEL BLVD. SUITE
B SAN GABRIEL CA 91776. The business is con-
ducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information, which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on 06/
22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have) commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name or names listed above on 06/2017. NO-
TICE-The Fictitious Name Statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name
Statement must be filed before that time. The
filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a Fictitious Business Name
in violation of the rights of another under Federal,
State, or common law (See section 14411 at seq.
Business and Profession Code) First filing: 06/ 29;
07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San Gabriel Valley
Examiner     CNBB2617189JL

CNBB2617190AC  FILE NO.2017161591
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT The
following person (s) is (are) doing business as: LG
QUALITY CARE MANAGEMENT GROUP 13601
E WHITTIER BLVD. STE 303 WHITTIER CA 90605.
Full name of registrant (s) is (are) LG QUALITY
CARE MANAGEMENT GROUP, LCC 13502 WHIT-
TIER BLVD STE 303 WHITTIER CA 90605. The
business is conducted by: A LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY . I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information, which he or she knows
to be false, is guilty of a crime.) This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on 06/22/2017. The registrant (s) has (have)
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed above on 02/
2017. NOTICE-The Fictitious Name Statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a Fictitious Busi-
ness Name in violation of the rights of another
under Federal, State, or common law (See section
14411 at seq. Business and Profession Code) First
filing: 06/ 29; 07/06; 07/13 & 07/20/17 The San
Gabriel Valley Examiner     CNBB2617190AC

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017139229
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. SAJ VENDING, 2. JORDAN VENDING, 1215
LEIGHTON AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90037. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: RANDY DAVIES, 1215 LEIGH-
TON, LOS ANGELES, CA 90037. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: RANDY DAVIES, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business names listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/31/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351291.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017140956
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
Q & K PROPERTIES, 3134 VINELAND AVENUE,
BALDWIN PARK, CA 91706. Mailing address if
different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organi-
zation Number: 201705810405. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: STONEWOOD Q PROP-
ERTIES LLC, 3134 VINELAND AVE, BALDWIN
PARK, CA 91706 (State of Incorporation/Organi-
zation: CA). This business is conducted by: LIMIT-
ED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: QUYNH C BUI, MANAGING MEMBER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/01/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351620.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141274
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GEMINI SERVICES, 13023 LONGWORTH AVE-
NUE, NORWALK, CA 90650. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ALMA DALIA VILLANUEVA, 13023 LONG-
WORTH AVENUE, NORWALK, CA 90650. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ALMA DALIA VILLANUEVA,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-

LEY EXAMINER. AAA351692.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141276
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
JLR MOTOR SPORTS, 5623 CECILIA ST, BELL
GARDENS, CA 90201. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
JOSE LUIS RAMIREZ AGUILAR, 5623 CECILIA
ST, BELL GARDENS, CA 90201. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JOSE LUIS RAMIREZ AGUILAR, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351693.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141290
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CHOCOLAT ET MACARON, 2011 SAWTELLE
BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90025. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: DES BEAUX REVES ENTERPRISE, 1423
17TH ST FRNT, SANTA MONICA, CA 90404 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: NATALIA IZAWA, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/01/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351698.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017141838
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
YOGA IN THE HOOD, 254 N. MARKET ST C144,
INGLEWOOD, CA 90301. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MIA SYKES, 254 N. MARKET ST C144, IN-
GLEWOOD, CA 90301. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MIA
SYKES, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 01/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/01/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351844.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142114
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
QUINTERO AUTO BODY, 936 S DITMAN AVE-
NUE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: JOSE LUIS RAMIREZ QUINTERO, 936 S
DITMAN AVENUE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: JOSE LUIS RAMIREZ
QUINTERO, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351880.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142116
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
EDMONSON CONCRETE CORING & CUTTING,
806 ARCADIA AVE # 1, ARCADIA, CA 91007.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: HAROLD BERNARD ED-
MONSON, 806 ARCADIA AVE # 1, ARCADIA,
CA 91007. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: HAROLD
BERNARD EDMONSON, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351881.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142118
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RALPH'S MOTOR SPORT, 5611 VIA CORONA
AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90022. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: RALPH MONTES, 5611 VIA CORONA AVE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90022. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: RALPH MONTES, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA351882.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142120
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ADOFO ARENAS, 6153 PALA AVE, MAYWOOD,
CA 90270. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: CRISTIAN D.
MACIEL, 6153 PALA AVE, MAYWOOD, CA 90270.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: CRISTIAN D. MACIEL,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA351883.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142122
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SERVICES CASTILLO, 9611 ALEXANDER AVE
#J, SOUTH GATE, CA 90280. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: OLIVER DANAIL MEDA CASTILLO, 9611
ALEXANDER AVE #J, SOUTH GATE, CA 90280.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: OLIVER DANAIL MEDA
CASTILLO, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA351884.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142124
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MAGIC SOLUTIONS, 1572 E VERNON AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90011. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JOSE
A LAGUNA SANTILLAN, 1572 E VERNON AVE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90011. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JOSE A LAGUNA SANTILLAN, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/

2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351885.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142126
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MENO'S COLLISION, 7315 TEGNER DRIVE,
ROSEMEAD, CA 91773. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
IVAN MONTELLANO IBARRA, 7315 TEGNER
DRIVE, ROSEMEAD, CA 91770. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: IVAN MONTELLANO IBARRA, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351886.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017142244
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ACERO SERVICES, 9948 RAMONA ST # 12A,
BELLFLOWER, CA 90706. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: LUIS ACERO GONZALEZ, 9948 RAMONA
ST # 12A, BELLFLOWER, CA 90706. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: LUIS ACERO GONZALEZ, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA351902.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144258
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SEPULVEDA BARBER SHOP AND BEAUTY
SALON, 548 E SEPULVEDA BLVD STE C, CAR-
SON, CA 90745. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MONICA
GONZALEZ, 2517 E ADAMS ST, LONG BEACH,
CA 90810. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MONICA
GONZALEZ, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 03/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352121.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144618
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
3E YOGA & THERAPY, 7028 GREENLEAF AVE.
SUITE S, WHITTIER, CA 90602. Mailing address
if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Orga-
nization Number: 4023486. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: 3E YOGA & THERAPY, INC.,
7028 GREENLEAF AVE. STE S, WHITTIER, CA
90602 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: SURAJ KRISHNA
DEVRAJ, PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352216.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144700
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. SUPREME CLEANING & MAINTENANCE SER-
VICE, 2. SC&MS, 3. SUPREME SUPPLIES, 37824
5TH ST EAST SUITE A1, PALMDALE, CA 93350.
Mailing address if different: 39816 9TH ST EAST,
PALMDALE, CA 93550. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: MARIA RUTH REYES NIE-
TO, 38916 9TH ST EAST, PALMDALE, CA 93550.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MARIA RUTH REYES
NIETO, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA352249.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143257
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LIGAYA KARGO, 1537 E. CARSON ST. UNIT
218, CARSON, CA 90745. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ROLAND ABILO, 1160 N. CONWELL AVE.
#404, COVINA, CA 91722. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ROLAND ABILO, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): AUG.
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA353804.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017143649
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
VICTORY IN HIS NAME, 13603 RUSSELL ST,
WHITTIER, CA 90602. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MOSES ALAN ALCALA, 13603 RUSSELL ST,
WHITTIER, CA 90602, RYAN MACALUSO, 13603
RUSSELL, WHITTIER, CA 90602. This business
is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MOSES ALAN ALCA-
LA, GENERAL PARTNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/02/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA353870.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017144919
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BISHOP'S PAINTING, 663 PARKWOOD LANE,
POMONA, CA 91767. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JA-
COB BISHOP, 663 PARKWOOD, POMONS, CA
91767. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JACOB BISHOP,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 09/2015. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/05/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA353896.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017145475
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SWEET LIFE JOURNEY, 1820 GRANT AVE #1,
REDONDO BEACH, CA 90278. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: EMILY ESTRELLER YUNCKER, 1820 GRANT
AVE #1, REDONDO BEACH, CA 90278, RUS-
SELL YUNCKER, 1820 GRANT AVE #1, REDON-
DO BEACH, CA 90278. This business is conduct-
ed by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: EMILY ESTRELLER YUNCKER, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 05/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354008.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017145786
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. EL LABRADOR MAGAZINE ROMPIENDO
FRONTERAS, 2. EL LABRADOR CUPONES Y
OFERTAS, 3. HOLLYWOOD INTERNATIONAL
STUDIOS, 10505 SAN FERNANDO ROAD, PA-
COIMA, CA 91331. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ARIS-
TIDES JESUS CANIZALES, 10505 SAN FERNAN-
DO ROAD, PACOIMA, CA 91331, HENRY
CANIZALES, 10505 SAN FERNADO ROAD, PA-
COIMA, CA 91331. This business is conducted
by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ARISTIDES JESUS CANIZALES, GEN-
ERAL PARTNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): N/A. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/06/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354057.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146043
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MICHELL'S BOUTIQUE, 4022 BEVERLY BLVD,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90004. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: SILVIA SANTIZO, 1205 W. 82ND ST, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90044. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
SILVIA SANTIZO, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 01/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354104.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146173
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NADJA HOYER-BOOTH PRODUCTIONS, 6731
LELAND WAY #208, LOS ANGELES, CA 90028.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: NADJA HOYER-BOOTH,
6731 LELAND WAY #208, LOS ANGELES, CA
90028. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: NADJA HOYER-
BOOTH, PRESIDENT/OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354122.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146327
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. ET / NOIR, 2. ET //NOIR, 3. ET /NOIR, 4. ET |
NOIR, 5. ET |NOIR, 6. ET NOIR, 7. ET NOIR
DESIGNS, 8. ET NOIRDESIGNS, 9. ET/ NOIR,
10. ET// NOIR, 11. ET//NOIR, 12. ET/NOIR, 13.
ET_NOIR, 14. ET| NOIR, 15. ET|NOIR, 16. ET-
NOIR, 17. ETNOIR DESIGNS, 18. ETNOIRDE-
SIGNS, 329 SOUTH LAMER ST., BURBANK, CA
91506. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: GUILLERMO ES-
TUARDO GROSJEAN, 329 SOUTH LAMER ST.,
BURBANK, CA 91506 (State of Incorporation/Or-
ganization: CA), ALPANA BABU PRAJAPATI, 329
SOUTH LAMER ST., BURBANK, CA 91506 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: GUILLERMO ESTUARDO
GROSJEAN, HUSBAND. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business names listed above on (date): 06/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/06/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354165.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146681
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MASTER PAINTERS, 1517 STANFORD STREET,
SANTA MONICA, CA 90404. Mailing address if
different: 1517 STANFORD STREET, SANTA
MONICA, CA 90404. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: JONATHAN VAUGHN, 1517 STANFORD
STREET, SANTA MONICA, CA 90404. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JONATHAN VAUGHN, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/07/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA354274.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146830
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. DOS, 2. MOONKIDS, 11278 DUNCAN AVE.,
LYNWOOD, CA 90262. Mailing address if differ-
ent: 8223 DE PALMA ST., DOWNEY, CA 90241.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: NALLELY
GONZALEZ, 8223 DE PALMA ST., DOWNEY, CA
90241, EDWIN GONZALEZ, 11278 DUNCAN
AVE., LYNWOOD, CA 90262. This business is
conducted by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: NALLELY GONZALEZ, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business names listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/07/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354301.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017146910
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 4
SEASONS PAINTING, 3801 3RD AVE., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90008. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
SUK DO PARK, 3801 3RD AVE., LOS ANGELES,
CA 90008. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: SUK DO
PARK, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 03/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/07/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354307.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147061
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NEW CENTURY TRANSPORTATION, 4010 PRIN-
CETON STREET, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: PABLO GARCIA, 4010
PRINCETON STREET, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: PABLO GARCIA, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/07/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354342.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147132
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LINDA'S CLEANING SERVICES, 251 E AVE Q10,
PALMDALE, CA 93550. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
HERMELINDA JACOBO GARCIA, 251 E AVE Q10,
PALMDALE, CA 93550. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
HERMELINDA JACOBO GARCIA, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/07/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354361.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147345
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CLETOS ANIMATION, 6652 FERGUSON DR.,
CITY OF COMMERCE, CA 90022. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: JOSE M. SALAS, 6652 FER-
GUSON DR., CITY OF COMMERCE, CA 90022,
JUAN M. SALAS, 2719 GLENN AVE., LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90023. This business is conducted
by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JOSE M. SALAS, GENERAL PARTNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 06/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/07/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354411.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148807
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HAKUHOTO PHOTOGRAPHY, 114 E LIVE OAK
STREET UNIT C, SAN GABRIEL, CA 91776. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: DINESH SHILPAKAR, 114 E
LIVE OAK STREET UNIT C, SAN GABRIEL, CA
91776. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: DINESH SHILPA-
KAR, OWNER. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 05/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/08/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354734.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148869
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SOCALABSTRACT, 426 S. SEPULVEDA BLVD,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90049. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: NICK TORCHIA, 426 S. SEPULVEDA BLVD
#102, LOS ANGELES, CA 90049. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: NICK TORCHIA, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 06/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA354754.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148933
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BRAVEN AGENCY, 2991 CHESTNUT AVE 100
W BROADWAY, LONG BEACH, CA 90806. Mail-
ing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ROBERT MARTINEZ, 2991
CHESTNUT AVE, LONG BEACH, CA 90806. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ROBERT MARTINEZ, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 09/2016. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/08/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA354769.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017148606
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
C&K DELICIAS, 3034 1/2 WABASH AVE., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90063. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
CARLOS E. MOZO, 3034 1/2 WABASH AVE.,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90063, KARLA HERNAN-
DEZ, 3034 1/2 WABASH AVE., LOS ANGELES,
CA 90063. This business is conducted by: GEN-
ERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information which he or
she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
CARLOS E. MOZO, PARTNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/08/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354809.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149158
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. WESTLINE PROPERTIES, 2. TD PACIFIC IN-
VESTMENTS, 2605 MIDVALE AVE., LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90064. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: TIMOTHY
G JARNOT, 2605 MIDVALE AVE., LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90064. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: TIMOTHY
G JARNOT, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): 03/2012. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/08/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354856.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149405
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. MYO MY THERAPY SERVICES, 2. MYO MY
THERAPY, 2194 TERREBONNE AVE., SAN DI-
MAS, CA 91773. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LINDA M.
DESALVIO, 2194 TERREBONNE AVE., SAN DI-
MAS, CA 91773. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: LINDA M.
DESALVIO, OWNER. The registrant commenced
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to transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): N/A. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA354913.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149976
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PROMOBRAIN, 235 E BROADWAY STE 211,
LONG BEACH, CA 90802. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: IDEAS IN A DAY, LLC, 235 E BROADWEAY
STE 211, LONG BEACH, CA 90802 (State of In-
corporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: STUART T. TAKEHA-
RA, PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 02/2015. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA355039.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149985
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE KRAVINGS GROUP, 235 E BROADWAY
STE 211, LONG BEACH, CA 90802. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or
Organization Number: 201412910133. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MARK TINGE VEN-
TURES, LLC, 235 E BROADWAY STE 211, LONG
BEACH, CA 90802 (State of Incorporation/Organi-
zation: CA). This business is conducted by: LIMIT-
ED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: STUART T. TAKEHARA, PRESIDENT. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/09/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA355041.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149994
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
COOL TOOLS COOL DEALS, 14729 LOZANO
DR, BALDWIN PARK, CA 91706. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: PON VINCENT POSAVATDY, 14729 LOZ-
ANO DR, BALDWIN PARK, CA 91706, TAMMY
POSAVATDY, 14729 LOZANO DR, BALDWIN
PARK, CA 91706. This business is conducted by:
MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
PON VINCENT POSAVATDY, HUSBAND. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/09/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA355045.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150112
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PAUL WEDEL GENERAL CONTRACTOR, 1760
S. CARMELIA AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90025.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: PAUL WEDEL, 1760 S.
CARMELINA AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90025.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: PAUL WEDEL, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 08/2008. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA355554.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150168
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LANESANE, 28628 IRON VILLAGE DRIVE, VA-
LENCIA, CA 91354. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: COL-
LIN LANE, 28628 IRON VILLAGE DRIVE, VA-
LENCIA, CA 91354. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
COLLIN LANE, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA355972.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017149766
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CH COATINGS, 132 PICTORIAL ST, PALMDALE,
CA 93550. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: CHARLES
DAVID HERRERA JR, 132 PICTORIAL ST., PALM-
DALE, CA 93550. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: CHARLES
DAVID HERRERA JR, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/09/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA356423.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150452
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HWANG HAE DOH, 11746 ARTESIA BLVD, AR-
TESIA, CA 90701-. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: HEIDI
CHUN KIM, 1436 MESA VERDE, FULLERTON,
CA 92833, SCOTT JIM KIM, 1436 MESA VERDE,
FULLERTON, CA 92833. This business is con-
ducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: HEIDI CHUN KIM, PART-
NER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 07/11/2012. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/12/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA356751.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017150648
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THR.D STUDIO, 257 SOUTH SPRING STREET
2B, LOS ANGELES, CA 90012. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: GARET CADE AMMERMAN, 257 SOUTH
SPRING STREET 2B, LOS ANGELES, CA 90012.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: GARET CADE AM-
MERMAN, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 5/1/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/12/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business

and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA356789.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017151230
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FRESH OUTLOOK TUTORS, 6716 ZUMIREZ DR,
MALIBU, CA 90265. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
JONATHAN MATTHEW SPRIK, 6716 ZUMIREZ
DR, MALIBU, CA 90265. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JONATHAN MATTHEW SPRIK, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 04-01-2017. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/12/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA356947.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152045
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. THE EX BOUTIQUE, 2. EX | THE BOX, 3. BABY
| THE BOX, 8315 VALECREST DR, SUN VALLEY,
CA 91352. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LILIT ABGARY-
AN, 8315 VALECREST DR, SUN VALLEY, CA
91352. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: LILIT ABGARYAN,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business names list-
ed above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357124.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017152699
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SIMPLE IPHONE REPAIR, 3571 ATLANTIC ST,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90023. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: 3571 ATLANTIC ST APT 1, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90023. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: ENRIQUE CANDELAS III, 3571 ATLAN-
TIC ST APT 1, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023, SA-
MANTHA HELENA CANDELAS, 3571 ATLANTIC
ST APT 1, LOS ANGELES, CA 90023. This busi-
ness is conducted by: MARRIED COUPLE. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: ENRIQUE CANDELAS
III, HUSBAND. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 01/2017. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/13/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357263.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017153243
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
DEL GARRAF, 7850 MELROSE AVE, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90046. Mailing address if different: 2725
SANTIAGO RD. #B, FULLERTON, CA 92835.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JACAVO
MUNOZ, 2725 SANTIAGO RD #B, FULLERTON,
CA 92835. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JACAVO
MUNOZ, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 06/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/14/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357305.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017153561
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MORALES PLASTERING, 15318 SPINNING AV,
GARDENA, CA 90249. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MARTIN MORALES AGUILAR, 15318 SPINNING
AV, GARDENA, CA 90249. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MARTIN MORALES AGUILAR, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 02/2001. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/14/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA357502.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017154529
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
YOUTIFIED, 858 25TH STREET, SANTA MONI-
CA, CA 90403. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: RONA
RODRIG, 858 25TH STREET, SANTA MONICA,
CA 90403, JULIE ANN GLASSMAN, 11937 FOX-
BORO DRIVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90049. This
business is conducted by: GENERAL PARTNER-
SHIP. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: RONA
RODRIG, PARTNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 03/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/15/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357690.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017154031
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
EVERGREEN ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULT-
ANTS, 12729 MCGEE DRIVE, WHITTIER, CA
90602. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: EDWARD AGUI-
LAR, 12729 MCGEE DRIVE, WHITTIER, CA
90602. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDU-
AL. I declare that all information in this statement
is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false
is guilty of a crime.) Signed: EDWARD AGUILAR,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/14/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357749.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017155094
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
INDUSTRY HAIR STUDIO, 21743 AVALON BLVD,
CARSON, CA 90745. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: TARIK
PERRYMAN, 10962 SPINNING AVE, INGLE-
WOOD, CA 90303 (State of Incorporation/Organi-
zation: CA), ARIANNE BROWN, 10962 SPIN-
NING, INGLEWOOD, CA 90303 (State of Incor-
poration/Organization: CA). This business is con-
ducted by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: ARIANNE BROWN, PART-
NER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/15/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA357832.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017155212
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AULII, 1145 ELDEN AVE, APT 10, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90006. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MASAKO

HIROTA, 1145 ELDEN AVE, APT 10, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90006. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MASAKO
HIROTA, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 06/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/15/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA357855.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017156027
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MOMENTARY MASTER, 37460 30TH ST EAST,
PALMDALE, CA 93550. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
EMMANUEL JIMENEZ, 37460 30TH ST EAST,
PALMDALE, CA 93550. This business is conduct-
ed by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
EMMANUEL JIMENEZ, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 06/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA358031.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017156059
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
IVY NAILS & SPA, 10255 COLIMA RD #L, WHIT-
TIER, CA 90604. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MYLE
PHAM, 8603 BOYSON ST, DOWNEY, CA 90242.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MYLE PHAM, OWN-
ER. The registrant commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): 06/2017. This statement was
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/16/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA358041.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017156363
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SAGE TRANSITION, 8701 W OLYMPIC BLVD,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90035. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: 357 S ELM DRIVE #1, BEVERLY HILLS,
CA 90212. Articles of Incorporation or Organiza-
tion Number: 201506110325. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: DAISY HOUSE LLC, 8701 W
OLYMPIC BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90035 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY.
I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: KATY HILL, CEO. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA358102.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017156627
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
GAUCHO MALAMBO, 9034 TAMPA AVE,
NORTHRIDGE, CA 91324. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: 9001 OWENSMOUTH AVE. UNIT 20, CA-
NOGA PARK, CA 91304. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: MALAMBO, 9034 TAMPA AVE.,
NORTHRIDGE, CA 91324 (State of Incorpora-
tion/Organization: CA). This business is conduct-
ed by: CORPORATION. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information which he or
she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
CLAUDIA GENNARO, PRESIDENT. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/16/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA358180.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017154664
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
PADRES UNIDOS POR EL AUTISMO, 2800 E
56TH WAY, LONG BEACH, CA 90805. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: CESILIA ORTIZ-BARAJAS,
2800 E 56TH WAY, LONG BEACH, CA 90805,
MARILU CARRILLO, 250 E MARKER ST, LONG
BEACH, CA 90805. This business is conducted
by: GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CESILIA ORTIZ-BARAJAS, PARTNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): 06/2011. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/15/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA358508.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017157234
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FAYE CALIFORNIA, 1860 N FULLER AVE #312,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90046. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MERLIN GUMM, 1860 N FULLER AVE.#312,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90046. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MERLIN GUMM, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/19/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359671.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017157683
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LA INVESTMENT PROPERTIES, 4085 ALLA RD,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90066. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: JOHN DEGIACOMI, 4085 ALLA RD, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90066. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
JOHN DEGIACOMI, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 05/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/19/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359767.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017157924
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
IMPACT BRAND MANAGEMENT, 147 E HOLLY
ST 303, PASADENA, CA 91103. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: FACUNDO TANGONA, 147 E HOLLY ST
303, PASADENA, CA 91103. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: FACUNDO TANGONA, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
06/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/19/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-

ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA359833.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017158156
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RCM DISABILITY, 535 N. BRAND BLVD STE
503, GLENDALE, CA 91203. Mailing address if
different: 91203, , . The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: CHARETA MANUKYAN, 5040 BOSTON
AVE, GLENDALE, CA 91214. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CHARETA MANUKYAN, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
05/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/19/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA359890.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017158179
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ALPHA RECYCLING, 13314 SATICOY ST,
NORTH HOLLYWOOD, CA 91605. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation or
Organization Number: 3369769. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: RESOURCE SERVICES
ALLIANCE, INC., 13314 SATICOY ST, NORTH
HOLLYWOOD, CA 91605 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
BAMBOO TSENG, CFO. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 01/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/19/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359900.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017158551
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
RADIO FORTUNE TELLER, 909 N. SAN VICE-
NTE BLVD. UNIT 104, WEST HOLLYWOOD, CA
90069. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ADAM LASALLE,
909 N. SAN VICENTE BLVD. UNIT 104, WEST
HOLLYWOOD, CA 90069. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: ADAM LASALLE, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 01/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA359965.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017158596
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MY EASY PERIOD, 17732 SWEETGUM LANE,
SANTA CLARITA, CA 91387. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: RED BLOSSOM GROUP LLC, 17732 SWEET-
GUM LANE, SANTA CLARITA, CA 91387. This
business is conducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ERIC A.
RUFFAT, MANAGING MEMBER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359973.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017158716
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MLZ ENTERPRISES, 19248 PARTHENIA ST #7,
NORTHRIDGE, CA 91324. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: MARIA L. ARATA, 19248 PARTHENIA ST #7,
NORTHRIDGE, CA 91324, JOSEFINA CONS,
19248 PARTHENIA ST #7, NORTHRIDGE, CA
91324, ROSA MARIA BURGOS-CONS, 19248
PARTHENIA ST #7, NORTHRIDGE, CA 91324.
This business is conducted by: GENERAL PART-
NERSHIP. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MARIA L.
ARATA, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA359988.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017158823
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LEAFY LOVE, 10301 OTIS ST APT A, SOUTH
GATE, CA 90280. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JAC-
QUELINE ALTINKAYA, 10301 OTIS ST APT A,
SOUTH GATE, CA 90280. This business is con-
ducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JACQUELINE ALTINKAYA, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
01/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360008.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017159070
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MALATESTA LAW, 2029 CENTURY PARK EAST,
SUITE 400, LOS ANGELES, CA 90067. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: ANDREW J. MALATESTA, 2029
CENTURY PARK EAST, SUITE 400, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90067. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ANDREW
J. MALATESTA, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA360056.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017159084
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. HALLAIRE ENTERPRISE, 2. HAIR ALL OVER,
3. MY PARADOCS, 8605 SANTA MONICA BLVD.
#53254, WEST HOLLYWOOD, CA 90069. Mailing
address if different: PO BOX 5070, BELLFLOW-
ER, CA 90707. Articles of Incorporation or Organi-
zation Number: 2017159103070. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: HALLAIRE ENTERPRISE
L.L.C., 8605 SANTA MONICA BLVD. #53254,
WEST HOLLYWOOD, CA 90069 (State of Incor-
poration/Organization: CA). This business is con-
ducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: LATARAH HALL, CEO.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business names listed above
on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date)
06/20/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed
in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious
business name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).

Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360059.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017159497
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BEVERLY HILLS WINE CLUB, 8950 WEST OLYM-
PIC BLVD SUITE 596, BEVERLY HILLS, CA 90211.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: JASON PATE, 860 HAR-
RINGTON ROAD, GLENDALE, CA 91207. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty
of a crime.) Signed: JASON PATE, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
01/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360174.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017159568
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
AMERICAN ARCOLOGIES, 3330 S. CANFIELD
SUITE 8, LOS ANGELES, CA 90034. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: DAVIDSON & COMPANY LLC,
3330 S. CANFIELD AVENUE SUITE 8, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90034. This business is conducted
by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PETER DAVIDSON, CEO. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA360203.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017159686
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
STRENGTH HEAL WITHIN, 4025 W. 135TH ST.
#A, HAWTHORNE, CA 90250. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: GRACIELA VASQUEZ, 4025 W. 135TH ST.
#A, HAWTHORNE, CA 90250, LORENA GONZA-
LEZ, 1206 N. WEXHAM WAY, INGLEWOOD, CA
90302. This business is conducted by: GENERAL
PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
GRACIELA VASQUEZ, PARTNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): 06/
2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360220.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017159745
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
JESUSA N. ROMERO,MD, 3100 E. FLORENCE
AVENUE SUITE 5, HUNTINGTON PARK, CA
90255. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JESUSA N. ROME-
RO, M.D., A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION,
3100 E. FLORENCE AVENUE SUITE 5, HUN-
TINGTON PARK, CA 90255. This business is con-
ducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JESUSA N ROMERO, PRESIDENT. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
03/1990. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/20/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360227.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017159918
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
KING WEB DESIGN, 5042 SAWTELLE BLVD,
CULVER CITY, CA 90230. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: LIAM KING, 5042 SAWTELLE BLVD, CUL-
VER CITY, CA 90230. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
LIAM KING, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/21/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA360266.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017160864
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
ALLURE HAIR NAIL&SPA, 7621 GREENLEAF
AVE, WHITTIER, CA 90602. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: THU TRANG LUONG, 9851 OMA PLACE,
GARDEN GROVE, CA 92840. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: THU TRANG LUONG, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date):
06/2017. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/21/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360463.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017161453
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
NINO'S GLASS, 5059 ALDAMA ST., LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90042. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: PORFIRIO
RAMOS PEREZ, 5059 ALDAMA ST., LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90042. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: PORFIR-
IO RAMOS PEREZ, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 12/12/2016.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/22/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA360578.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017161877
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SLAVA TRANSPORTATION, 7344 RANCHITO
AVE, VAN NUYS, CA 91405. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: VYACHESLAR KARASYOV, 7344 RANCHI-
TO AVE, VAN NUYS, CA 91405. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: VYACHESLAR KARASYOV, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/22/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360638.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017161918
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
THE GREEN YOGI, 3504 HIGHLAND AVE, MAN-
HATTAN BEACH, CA 90266. Mailing address if
different: 4136 MCCONNELL BLVD, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90066. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: HAPPY & TASTY, LLC, 4136 MCCON-
NELL BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90066 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business is
conducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I

declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: OLIVIER MILHOMME,
MANAGER. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): 10/2016. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/22/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk.
A new fictitious business name statement must
be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of
the rights of another under federal, state, or com-
mon law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/
2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA360648.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017162081
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
KITTY'S KITCHEN, 6601 3RD AVENUE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90043. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
KITTY F. POATES, 6601 3RD AVENUE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90043. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
KITTY F. POATES, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 06/22/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years
from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA360689.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017162204
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CASA RAFAELA MEXICAN RESTAURANT, 7448
RESEDA BLVD, RESEDA, CA 91335. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: YOLANDA MEZA, 13800 OS-
BORNE ST, ARLETA, CA 91331. This business is
conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: YOLANDA MEZA, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/22/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA360715.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017162451
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. RAMBLING RONNIE, 2. RAMBLING RONNIE
PRODUCTIONS, 6228 ORANGE ST 5, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90048. Mailing address if different:
P.O. BOX 480153, LOS ANGELES, CA 90048. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MERVYN COLE,
6228 ORANGE ST. 5, LOS ANGELES, CA 90048.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MERVYN COLE, CEO/
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business names list-
ed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/22/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA360783.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017163505
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CAMPING HACKS 101, 13938 BRIGHTWELL
AVE., PARAMOUNT, CA 90723. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: JESUS ABEL MENDOZA, 13938 BRIGHT-
WELL AVE., PARAMOUNT, CA 90723. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: JESUS ABEL MENDOZA, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/23/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360955.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017163525
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
INNOVARE, 7721 PACIFIC BLVD, HUNTINGTON
PARK, CA 90255. Mailing address if different: N/
A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: EMMA
HAYDEE GONZALEZ, 12269 DOWNEY AVE,
DOWNEY, CA 90242. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
EMMA HAYDEE GONZALEZ, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the
fictitious business name listed above on (date): N/
A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk
of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/23/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office
of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411
et seq. Business and Professions Code). Publish:
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA360956.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017162895
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
HARPER 323, 7046 HOLLYWOOD BLVD. APT.
#703, LOS ANGELES, CA 90028. Mailing address
if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: KARINA SULZER, 1225 S VERMONT AVE.
#507, LOS ANGELES, CA 90006, HAGOB BEDI-
RIAN, 1021 N HARPER AVE. #1, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90046. This business is conducted by:
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: KARINA SULZER, GENERAL PARTNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/23/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA360957.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017163657
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
SW GROUP, 642 S MCDONNELL AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90022. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
SHERLOCK WHEELOCK, 642 S MCDONNELL
AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90022. This business is
conducted by: LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true
information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: SHERLOCK WHEE-
LOCK, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business
name listed above on (date): 01/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/23/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA361025.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017163887
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BUSYSQUARE, 138 N. BRAND BLVD, GLEN-
DALE, CA 91203. Mailing address if different:
PMB 11221, GLENDALE, CA 91226. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: BARTOLOMEW
CASTELO, 138 N. BRAND BLVD, GLENDALE,
CA 91203. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: BARTO-
LOMEW CASTELO, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 12/2005.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/23/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-

tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA361029.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017147349
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
READY TO DECLUTTER, 3313 BUTLER AVE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90066. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: ZOE ODERBERG, 3313 BUTLER AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90066. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ZOE ODERBERG, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 7/11/2012.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/07/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA361031.

STATEMENT OF ABANDONMENT OF USE OF
FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME 2017164006
The following person(s) has abandoned the use of
the fictitious business name(s): DAZZLE N SASS,
18558 ROSCOE BLVD #311, NORTHRIDGE, CA
91324. The fictitious business name(s) referred to
above was filed on: 10/12/16 in the County of Los
Angeles. Original File No. 2016249197. Full name
of Registrant(s): MIREY QUBROSI, 18558
ROSCOE BLVD #311, NORTHRIDGE, CA 91324.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true
and correct. (A registrant who declares as true,
information which he or she knows to be false, is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: MIREY QUBROSI,
INDIVIDUAL/ OWNER. This statement was filed
with the Los Angeles County Clerk on 06/26/2017.
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA362484.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017164123
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. MAYA GUATEMALA TRANSPORTES, 2. TRANS-
PORTES MAYA GUATEMALA, 418 E. ARBOR
VITAE ST., INGLEWOOD, CA 90301. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: EMMA HAYDEE GONZALEZ,
12269 DOWNEY AVE., DOWNEY, CA 90242,
JOSE A. MARTINEZ, 12269 DOWNEY AVE.,
DOWNEY, CA 90242. This business is conducted
by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: EMMA HAYDEE GONZALEZ, WIFE. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business names listed above on
(date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/26/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement
expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious busi-
ness name statement must be filed before that
time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another
under federal, state, or common law (see Section
14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMIN-
ER. AAA362592.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017164842
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
BLACKWINGFALCON ENTERPRISES, 1256
WEST 79TH STREET, LOS ANGELES, CA 90044.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: JOSEPH LEVI CURTIS,
JR., 1256 WEST 79TH STREET, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90044. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who de-
clares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JOSEPH
LEVI CURTIS, JR., OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 06/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/26/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA362593.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017164613
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. LOOKSBYLAUREL, 2. LOOKS BY LAUREL,
222 W. FOOTHILL BLVD, CLAREMONT, CA
91711. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: LAUREL GUAD-
ERRAMA, 222 W. FOOTHILL BLVD, CLARE-
MONT, CA 91711. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this
statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: LAUREL
GUADERRAMA, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business names listed above on (date): 01/2014.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/26/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA362594.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017164959
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
MG RELOCATIONS, 13154 VANOWEN ST APT
D, NORTH HOLLYWOOD, CA 91605. Mailing
address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: MARIO RAFAEL GARCIA
GONZALEZ, 13154 VANOWEN ST APT D,
NORTH HOLLYWOOD, CA 91605. This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: MARIO RAFAEL GARCIA GONZALEZ,
OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on
(Date) 06/26/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name
statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does
not of itself authorize the use in this state of a
fictitious business name in violation of the rights
of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Profes-
sions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VAL-
LEY EXAMINER. AAA362690.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017164076
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
1. BOGA BOGA, 2. ORGANIC SEVEN, 3. OR-
GANIC7, 3701 STOCKER STREET #206, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90008. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
STACEE LEE, 3006 STOCKER PLACE #3, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90008. This business is conducted
by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
STACEE LEE, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business
names listed above on (date): N/A. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 06/26/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county
clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation
of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA362798.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017164075
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
FORTUNE AUTO SALES, 20120 PASEO DEL
PRADO UNIT E, WALNUT, CA 91789. Mailing
address if different: N/A. Articles of Incorporation
or Organization Number: C3734626. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: FAS MOTOR-
SPORTS, INC., 20120 PASEO DEL PRADO UNIT
E, WALNUT, CA 91789 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: CA). This business is conducted by:
CORPORATION. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
DEXTON W GOH, CEO. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 03/2015.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/26/2017. NO-
TICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of
this statement does not of itself authorize the use
in this state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business
and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/
06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GAB-
RIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA362815.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT
2017164074
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
CHECA MY ART, 3401 GIBSON PLACE, RE-
DONDO BEACH, CA 90278. Mailing address if
different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/
are: LAURA MARIE CHECA, 3401 GIBSON
PLACE, REDONDO BEACH, CA 90278. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which
he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: LAURA MARIE CHECA, OWNER. The
registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
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N/A. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/26/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A
new fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA362825.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017164121
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: FAST
AND TRUST TRANSPORTATION, 5776 PARKCREST
DR, LA VERNE, CA 91750. Mailing address if different:
N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number:
C3997188. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: 7X7
INTERNATIONAL INC, 5776 PARKCREST DR, LA VER-
NE, CA 91750 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA).
This business is conducted by: CORPORATION. I de-
clare that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: CHIENYU LU, PRESIDENT. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 06/26/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time. The filing
of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation of the
rights of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions
Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/
20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA362836.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017165512
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: THE
URBAN WAREHOUSE, 759 S. ATLANTIC BLVD., LOS
ANGELES, CA 90022. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MARIA P. RAM-
BLAZ, 3039 BOULDER ST., LOS ANGELES, CA 90063
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MARIA P. RAM-
BLAZ, OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed above
on (date): 05/2010. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/27/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA362847.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017165431
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1.
CRYP-TIC, 2. /KRIPTIK/, 5638 1/4 EDGEMAR AVE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90043. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: PARKER
HARWOOD, 5638 1/4 EDGEMAR AVE, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90043. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL.
I declare that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PARKER HARWOOD, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business names listed above on (date): N/A. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 06/27/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a fictitious business name in
violation of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017, 07/20/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EX-
AMINER. AAA362856.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017165335
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: PHILIP
COMPLETE AUTO, 5776 PARKCREST DR, LA VERNE,
CA 91750. Mailing address if different: N/A. Articles of
Incorporation or Organization Number: C3997188. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: 7X7 INTERNATION-
AL INC, 5776 PARKCREST DR, LA VERNE, CA 91750
(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: CORPORATION. I declare that all in-
formation in this statement is true and correct. (A regis-
trant who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: CHIENYU
LU, PRESIDENT. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed above
on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 06/27/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017, 07/20/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA362861.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017129286
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: LITTLE
BUDDY FILMS, 5535 WESTLAWN AVE. #331, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90066. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JUSTIN COHEN,
5535 WESTLAWN AVE. #331, LOS ANGELES, CA 90066

(State of Incorporation/Organization: CA). This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JUSTIN CO-
HEN, OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed above
on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the County
Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/18/2017.
NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires five
years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). BD.
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346261.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017129400
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: CEN-
TRO APOSTOLICO MARANATHA, 13957 VAN NESS
AVENUE, GARDENA, CA 90249. Mailing address if dif-
ferent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ED-
UARDO JOSE PINTO, 13957 VAN NESS AVENUE,
GARDENA, CA 90249. This business is conducted by:
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: EDUARDO JOSE
PINTO, OWNER. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed above
on (date): 04/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/18/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code).
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346286.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017130302
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: MEN-
DEZ MAINTENANCE SERVICES, 1631 7TH AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90019. Mailing address if different: N/A.
Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number:
201710310449. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MENDEZ RESTAURANT CLEANING LLC, 1631 7TH
AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90019 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: CA). This business is conducted by: LIMIT-
ED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JUAN ALBERTO
MENDEZ, CEO. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed above
on (date): 04/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/19/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). BD.
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346458.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017130311
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: MEN-
DEZ RESTAURANT CLEANING, LLC, 1631 7TH AVE,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90019. Mailing address if different:
N/A. Articles of Incorporation or Organization Number:
201710310449. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are:
MENDEZ RESTAURANT CLEANING LLC, 1631 7TH
AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90019 (State of Incorporation/
Organization: CA). This business is conducted by: LIMIT-
ED LIABILITY COMPANY. I declare that all information
in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: JUAN ALBERTO
MENDEZ, CEO. The registrant commenced to transact
business under the fictitious business name listed above
on (date): 04/2017. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/19/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). BD.
Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346460.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017131008
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: ALE-
JANDRA'S SALON, 3302 N BROADWAY, LOS ANGE-
LES, CA 90031. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: JULIO MIGUEL
FLORES MARTINEZ, 2222 PARKSIDE AVE APT 203,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90031, ARACELI ALEJANDRINA
PLASCENCIA NIETO, 2222 PARKSIDE AV APT 203,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90031. This business is conducted
by: MARRIED COUPLE. I declare that all information in
this statement is true and correct. (A registrant who
declares as true information which he or she knows to be
false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ARACELI ALEJAND-
RINA PLASCENCIA NIETO, OWNER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 02/2015. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/22/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under federal,

state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Busi-
ness and Professions Code). Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/
22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL
VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346566.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017131370
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. NU-
WISE, 2. BELLICOSE ATHLETICS, 1030 OAKHORNE
DR, HARBOR CITY, CA 90710. Mailing address if differ-
ent: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: RA-
MON JAUREGUI, 1030 OAKHONRE DR., HARBOR
CITY, CA 90710. This business is conducted by: INDI-
VIDUAL. I declare that all information in this statement is
true and correct. (A registrant who declares as true infor-
mation which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a
crime.) Signed: RAMON JAUREGUI, OWNER. The reg-
istrant commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business names listed above on (date): 04/2017.
This statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los
Angeles County on (Date) 05/22/2017. NOTICE: This
fictitious name statement expires five years from the
date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Busi-
ness and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/15/2017,
06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA346645.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017130455
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: MOVI-
ENDO CON MAGO, 44715 RUTHRON AVE, LANCAST-
ER, CA 93536. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ELSA HALVORSEN, 44715
RUTHRON AVE, LANCASTER, CA 93536. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A reg-
istrant who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ELSA
HALVORSEN, OWNER. The registrant commenced to
transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/
19/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of
the county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the
rights of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions
Code). BD. Publish: 06/15/2017, 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA348136.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017132171
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: MER-
CY'S CAKES IN CUPS, 8726 MAPLE ST, BELLFLOW-
ER, CA 90706. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: MERCEDES BUMPUS,
8726 MAPLE ST, BELLFLOWER, CA 90706. This busi-
ness is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all
information in this statement is true and correct. (A reg-
istrant who declares as true information which he or she
knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: MER-
CEDES BUMPUS, OWNER. The registrant commenced
to transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/
23/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of
the county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the
rights of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions
Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA346847.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017132290
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: EYE
BARBERSHOP, 4874 WEST ADAMS BLVD, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90016. Mailing address if different: N/A. The
full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: ISAIAS LOPEZ, 521
S POMELO AVE APT D, MONTEREY PARK, CA 91755.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which he or
she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
ISAIAS LOPEZ, OWNER. The registrant commenced to

transact business under the fictitious business name
listed above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/
23/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed in the office of
the county clerk. A new fictitious business name state-
ment must be filed before that time. The filing of this
statement does not of itself authorize the use in this
state of a fictitious business name in violation of the
rights of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions
Code). Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/
13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA346859.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017132922
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: BRAD-
FORD ENTERTAINMENT MANAGEMENT GROUP, 2602
IMPERIAL HWY SUITE B, HAWTHORNE, CA 90250.
Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s) of
registrant(s) is/are: BRENDA BRADFORD, 2602 IMPE-
RIAL HWY SUITE B, HAWTHORNE, CA 90250. This
business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that
all information in this statement is true and correct. (A
registrant who declares as true information which he or
she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
BRENDA BRADFORD, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name listed above on (date): N/A. This statement
was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles County
on (Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it was filed in the
office of the county clerk. A new fictitious business
name statement must be filed before that time. The filing
of this statement does not of itself authorize the use in
this state of a fictitious business name in violation of the
rights of another under federal, state, or common law
(see Section 14411 et seq. Business and Professions
Code). BD. Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017,
07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER.
AAA348567.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017132995
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: LIA-
BELLA, 11826 KILLIMORE AVENUE, PORTER RANCH,
CA 91326. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: BONITO CLOTHING INC,
11826 KILLIMORE AVENUE, PORTER RANCH, CA
91326. This business is conducted by: CORPORATION.
I declare that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: PERKASH SADHWANI, OWNER. The regis-
trant commenced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name listed above on (date): N/A. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Busi-
ness and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/22/2017,
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348579.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017133174
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: MY
ONE AND ONLY EVENTS, 12025 VOSE ST, NORTH
HOLLYWOOD, CA 91605. Mailing address if different:
N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: INA C.
GONZALEZ, 1317 N. KENWOOD ST., BURBANK, CA
91605. This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I
declare that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: INA C. GONZALEZ, ONWER. The registrant
commenced to transact business under the fictitious
business name listed above on (date): 4/01/17. This
statement was filed with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on (Date) 05/23/2017. NOTICE: This ficti-
tious name statement expires five years from the date
it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A new
fictitious business name statement must be filed before
that time. The filing of this statement does not of itself
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious business
name in violation of the rights of another under federal,
state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Busi-
ness and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/22/2017,
06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRI-
EL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348665.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017133789

The following person(s) is/are doing business as: 1. LA/
RD, 2. LOS ANGELES RESTORATION DESIGN, 941 N
HOBART BLVD, LOS ANGELES, CA 90029. Mailing ad-
dress if different: N/A. The full name(s) of registrant(s)
is/are: JOSUE REYES, 941 N HOBART BLVD, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90029. This business is conducted by:
INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all information in this state-
ment is true and correct. (A registrant who declares as
true information which he or she knows to be false is
guilty of a crime.) Signed: JOSUE REYES, OWNER.
The registrant commenced to transact business under
the fictitious business names listed above on (date): 08/
2016. This statement was filed with the County Clerk of
Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A
new fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348751.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017134398
The following person(s) is/are doing business as:
LINSCOTT,NGDO-NPO, 4064 BRIGHTON AVE, LOS
ANGELES, CA 90062. Mailing address if different: N/A.
The full name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: VICTOR MASIVI,
7288 SILVERWOOD DR, EASTVALE, CA 92880 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA), JEAN BOSCO NZEM-
BA KANDA, 4831 LINSCOTT PL # 1, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90016 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA),
PASCAL ZOLA KIDIMBU, 14640 ARIZONA ST, FON-
TANA, CA 92336 (State of Incorporation/Organization:
CA), MARIE NZUNZI MASALULA, 1583 N FAIR OAKS,
PASADENA, CA 91103 (State of Incorporation/Organiza-
tion: CA), RIGAUD PAUL LUZOLO MBASANI, 4064
BRIGHTON AVE, LOS ANGELES, CA 90062 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA), GAUTHIER KAKU, 2703
ORCHARD AVE # 2, LOS ANGELES, CA 90007 (State
of Incorporation/Organization: CA), VERONIQUE NDE-
VOKELE KAKU, 3425 VIRGINIA RD, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90016 (State of Incorporation/Organization: CA),
FRANCOIS NGOMA MELEKI, 3877 COCO AVE # 1,
LOS ANGELES, CA 90016 (State of Incorporation/Orga-
nization: CA), OMER LUZOLO LUZOMBE, 628 DAISY
AVE # 327, LONG BEACH, CA 90802 (State of Incorpo-
ration/Organization: CA), DON MATONDO KIBUNZI, 1005
N CENTER AVE # 3212, ONTARIO, CA 91764 (State of
Incorporation/Organization: CA), HELENE LUNKEBA
TEZO, 3653 OVERLAND AVE # 13, LOS ANGELES, CA
90034. This business is conducted by: UNINCORPO-
RATED ASSOCIATION OTHER THAN A PARTNERSHIP.
I declare that all information in this statement is true and
correct. (A registrant who declares as true information
which he or she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.)
Signed: RIGAUD PAUL LUZOLO MBASANI, SECRE-
TARY. The registrant commenced to transact business
under the fictitious business name listed above on (date):
01/2015. This statement was filed with the County Clerk

of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/24/2017. NOTICE:
This fictitious name statement expires five years from
the date it was filed in the office of the county clerk. A
new fictitious business name statement must be filed
before that time. The filing of this statement does not of
itself authorize the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of another under
federal, state, or common law (see Section 14411 et seq.
Business and Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/22/
2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN
GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA348988.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017135076
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: MAID
TO SHINE, 1746 W 126TH STREET, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90047. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full
name(s) of registrant(s) is/are: TIFFANY Y. WALKER,
1746 W 126TH STREET, LOS ANGELES, CA 90047.
This business is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare
that all information in this statement is true and correct.
(A registrant who declares as true information which he or
she knows to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed:
TIFFANY Y. WALKER, OWNER. The registrant com-
menced to transact business under the fictitious busi-
ness name listed above on (date): 05/2017. This state-
ment was filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles
County on (Date) 05/25/2017. NOTICE: This fictitious
name statement expires five years from the date it was
filed in the office of the county clerk. A new fictitious
business name statement must be filed before that time.
The filing of this statement does not of itself authorize
the use in this state of a fictitious business name in
violation of the rights of another under federal, state, or
common law (see Section 14411 et seq. Business and
Professions Code). BD. Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017,
07/06/2017, 07/13/2017. THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY
EXAMINER. AAA349084.

FICTITIOUS BUSINESS NAME STATEMENT 2017137047
The following person(s) is/are doing business as: GLIT-
TER TIPS, 1525 PIZARRO ST, LOS ANGELES, CA
90026. Mailing address if different: N/A. The full name(s)
of registrant(s) is/are: ALEJANDRO JIMENEZ, 1525
PIZARRO ST, LOS ANGELES, CA 90026. This business
is conducted by: INDIVIDUAL. I declare that all informa-
tion in this statement is true and correct. (A registrant
who declares as true information which he or she knows
to be false is guilty of a crime.) Signed: ALEJANDRO
JIMENEZ, OWNER. The registrant commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business name listed
above on (date): N/A. This statement was filed with the
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on (Date) 05/26/
2017. NOTICE: This fictitious name statement expires
five years from the date it was filed in the office of the
county clerk. A new fictitious business name statement
must be filed before that time. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in this state of
a fictitious business name in violation of the rights of
another under federal, state, or common law (see Sec-
tion 14411 et seq. Business and Professions Code). BD.
Publish: 06/22/2017, 06/29/2017, 07/06/2017, 07/13/2017.
THE SAN GABRIEL VALLEY EXAMINER. AAA349480.

• Legal Notices • Legal Notices • Legal Notices • Legal Notices •

Taking care of a family mem-
ber who is aging or ill can be
tough—but you don’t have to do
it alone. Just ask actor Danny
Trejo, who stars in a new PSA
(public service advertisements)
campaign supporting male
caregivers.

“I’ve helped care for a friend
of mine who had cancer, so I
know how hard it can be,” ex-
plained Trejo.

The Facts: Men Are Providing
Care, Too

Men represent 40 percent of
the more than 40 million unpaid
family caregivers in the U.S., rep-
resenting 16 million sons, hus-
bands and friends caring for an
adult loved one in need.

Men are doing more than just
managing finances or running er-
rands. Sixty-three percent of
male caregivers are the primary
caregiver for their loved one, ac-
cording to AARP, the nation’s
largest nonprofit, nonpartisan
organization dedicated to em-
powering Americans age 50 and
older. Many of these male
caregivers help their loved ones
with personal care such as eating,
bathing and dressing, as well as
medical and nursing tasks. More
than half find it difficult to help

How Some Of The Toughest Guys
On The Planet Can Get Help
Caring For The Ones They Love

loved ones with these intimate
care needs and feel unprepared.

To help family caregivers,
AARP and the Ad Council
launched the Caregiver Assis-
tance Campaign, directing people
to free caregiving resources at
aarp.org/caregiving. The latest
PSAs are specifically targeted to
men, because they are less likely
to see themselves as caregivers
or to reach out for help.

Celebrating the inner strength
of caregivers, the TV ads feature
Danny Trejo, an actor known for
his “tough guy” persona. While
Trejo performs feats of strength
and daring, a caregiver performs
acts of care for his father, such
as preparing dinner and helping
him shave. In a twist, Trejo praises
the caregiver as “the toughest guy
on the planet.” The PSAs feature
the tagline “caregiving is tougher
than tough” and remind
caregivers that they can find help
and support.

“Caring for someone else is
one of the toughest jobs there is,”
said Danny Trejo. “There’s no
shame in getting some help if
that’s what you need to stay
strong.”

The majority of caregivers (60
percent) juggle their caregiving

responsibilities with a full- or
part-time job, and that percent-
age is even higher for men. Jug-
gling work and caregiving re-
sponsibilities can be highly
stressful, putting caregivers at
risk for depression, anxiety, and
heart disease. A few quick tips to
help caregivers in this role in-
clude:

• Falling victim to a scam
could be a sign that a loved one
needs support. Help them sort
mail and throw out obvious scam
threats.

• Create a daily caregiving
checklist and check off items
daily. You’ll stay on-task and com-
municate more easily with oth-
ers involved in your loved one’s
care.

• To ease stress and save time,
do caregiving prep like selecting
clothes or preparing food and
medicines the night before.

• Caregiving brings many chal-
lenges but also many joys. Take
time to savor the joyful, reward-
ing moments.

For free caregiving resources,
including practical Care Guides
tailored to specific topics and
challenges, visit www.aarp.org/
caregiving or call (877) 333-
5885. (NAPSI)

They get shoved in pockets
and run through the laundry.
Jammed in and spit out of
vending machines. And
grasped by many hands as they
make their way across the
United States.

Dollar bills take a beating. In
fact, the average life span for a
$1 in circulation is only 5.8
years, according to the Federal
Reserve. Compare that to a $50
bill, which circulates for 8.5
years, or the $100 bill, which
hangs around almost three
times as long as the humble
single.

Nevertheless, your hard-
working dollars could be work-
ing even harder for you. That’s
the idea behind an online bank-
ing and investing financial ser-
vices company’s “Hardest
Working Dollar” campaign. An
anonymous shopper will travel
the country, spending 7,500 of
the hardest-working dollars in
mom-and-pop shops, cafes,
and other locations in 15 U.S.
cities.

Once in circulation, the value
of these George Washingtons
could increase. Some will be
worth $100, others will be val-
ued at $5,000 and one will be
particularly prized: It will be

Check Your Dollars: You Could
Have A $1 Bill Worth $10,000

worth $10,000. Consumers can
visit www.allyhardestworking-
dollar.com and enter the serial
numbers of their singles to see
if theirs is eligible to win.

“The Hardest Working Dol-
lar campaign is a continuation
of our efforts to ‘Do It Right’
for our customers and all con-
sumers by encouraging them to
think about their money differ-
ently,” explains Ally Chief Mar-
keting and Public Relations
Officer, Andrea Riley.

The company will also cel-
ebrate hard-at-work individuals
in key markets across the US.
Costumed George Washingtons
will thank employees on their
way to work, show their ap-
preciation for hardworking first
responders, and honor dedi-
cated volunteers at nonprofit
organizations.

Ultimately, every consumer
has the ability to make any $1
bill the hardest-working dollar.
A new investing product, Ally
Invest, offers several conve-
nient online options for putting
your money to work, includ-
ing low-cost trading for inves-
tors looking to trade stocks,
options, bonds and ETFs them-
selves, as well as managed port-
folios, which are professionally

designed, continually moni-
tored and rebalanced automati-
cally, for those who prefer a
hands-off approach to their fi-
nances. Together, investing
combined with the bank’s great
FDIC-insured savings rate is
designed to help consumers
make their money work harder.

“We believe being an ally for
our customers’ financial well-
being means encouraging
people to focus on the prod-
ucts and services that will im-
prove their financial lives for
the long run,” says Diane
Morais, president of Consumer
& Commercial Banking Prod-
ucts at Ally Bank, Member
FDIC. “By saving at a higher
rate of interest, using a cash-
back credit card and investing
with affordable fees, people
have the opportunity to make
their dollars work harder.”

The “Hardest Working Dol-
lar” sweepstakes kicks off the
week of June 5 and runs
through July 31.

For further information, visit
www.allyhardestworking-
dollar.com and follow the
hashtag #hardestworkingdollar
on Twitter and Facebook.
(NAPSI)
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